Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 1
DISTRICT ONE (1) ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong Rentals, [Beatrice Concrete| Lyman Richey | Marxsen Sand & | Overland Sand | Westover Rock &
& SURFACING GRAVEL LLC Co. Corporation Gravel and Gravel Sand, Inc.
Line Number / Description Unit of Qty Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure | Ordered
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL .
1 S-55G/0LD REST AREA TN 2600 |$ 18.84/TON $ 15.00 No Bid $ 19.93
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL .
2 HWY 136 MP 173 TN 1200 ($ 14.65/TON $ 18.00 No Bid $ 22.20
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL )
3 |EAST JCT 15 AND 92 TN 550 $ 21.10/TON $ 1157 | $ 10.00 No Bid
DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL . .
4 JCT 8 AND 65 W EDGE OF PAWNEE CITY TN 1000 No Bid $21.79 No Bid $ 19.70

Payment Terms 0 Net30 00 0 30 100 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 20 45 per ITB 30 As ordered
Comments

No Bid

K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

NE Dept of Roads

5175 OF

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 3
DISTRICT THREE (3) - ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong | Emme Sand ;’l’é?]ae” “gaaz(j? Matto Sand |Overland Sand and
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC | & Gravel y & Gravel Gravel
Corporation Gravel
. I Unit of Qty Lo Lo oo Lo S oo
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure | Ordered
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
5 |IMIW JCT 22 & 81 MM 88 TN 5050 No Bid $ 11.75 No Bid
NW COLUMBUS
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
6 SCHUYLER YARD E 22ND & H STREET TN 1400 No Bid $ 13.08| $ 15.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
7 1 MI E MADISON HWY 32 MM 36.5 TN 300 No Bid $ 14.72 $ 15.65 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
8 |1 MI NW JUCT 30 & 56 E SIDE MM 33.8 ™ 1200 No Bid o 15 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
9 2 MI N OF JCT 91 & 57 E SIDE MM2 TN 3000 No Bid $ 1512 $ 17.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
10 13MI N JCT 9 & 15 W SIDE MM 128 TN 1500 No Bid $ 16.29| $ 16.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
11 |1 MI' W MADISON HWY 32 TN 4000 No Bid $ 14.72 $ 15.65 No Bid
MM 33.2
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
12 [1/4 MIW OF JCT 81 & 91 TN 4000 No Bid $ 13.46 $ 16.94 No Bid
MM 89
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
13 HWY JCT 32 & 45 RP 18 TN 2000 No Bid $ 17.95( $ 17.24 $ 18.58 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
14 HWY 59 JCT 59 & 121 TN 1100 No Bid $ 16.50 $ 19.36 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
15 HWY 57 mp 15.8 TN 2000 No Bid $ 15.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
16 HWY 35 MP 22.5 TN 1000 No Bid $ 20.40 $ 1850 $ 17.43 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
17 HWY 81 MP 165 TN 1500 No Bid $ 19.56 $ 15.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . . . . . .
18 HWY 9 MP 19.5 TN 1200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
19 |HWY 35 RP 68.1 1MIW TN 4000 No Bid $ 25.65 No Bid
DAKOTA CITY
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
20 [HWY 20 RP 415.5 TN 600 No Bid $ 23.08 $ 23.00 No Bid
7 Ml E JACKSON
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
21 [HWY 51 RP 23.6 TN 2200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 MI E BANCROFT
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . . . . . .
22 JCT 75 & 51 AT DECATUR TN 2200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

NE Dept of Roads

5175 OF

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 3
DISTRICT THREE (3) - ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong | Emme Sand ;’l’é?]ae” '\garxds‘? Matto Sand [Overland Sand and
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC | & Gravel y an & Gravel Gravel
Corporation Gravel
. I Unit of Qty U Lo oo Lo S oo
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure | Ordered
D-3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
23 [HWY 77 RP 167 TN 6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 MI S WINNEBAGO
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
24 [HWY 32 RP 101 TN 2245 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Ml W TEKAMAH
25 \[/)vli;l(—l\?EAs,ZAF?DR COAT GRAVEL TN 2728 No Bid $ 23.25 $ 1850 $ 19.04 No Bid
26 [ R e ™ | 2315 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
27 |CONCORD MP 0 TN 547 No Bid $ 20.00 No Bid
JCT 116 & S26B
28 3,IASF:—T3INAGRT|\:ID?\IRYiggT GRAVEL TN 1728 No Bid $ 20.10 $ 22.00( $ 21.44 No Bid
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 100 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 20 45 Per ITB 30
Comments
No Bid
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Armstong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel




Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads
DISTRICT 4

T Foun Ao con e whorow | | e Toomeson] ST R Tropeoca] D7 | et |mereenal S | e [ TR o
Gravel Gravel LLC Corporation Gravel Gravel Gravel Co. Inc.
Line Number / Description MUer;\i;l‘J)rfe Orgged Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
20 [Py 4 ARMIOR COAT SRAVEL ™ 2000 No Bid $ 1150 No Bid $ 1111
30 [P A on ™ 1000 No Bid $ 1675 No Bid $ 1315
a1 [P O ey ™ 500{ No Bid $ 1854 $ 1425 No Bid $ 1349
a2 [P O L v ™ 1000{ No Bid $ 1515 $ 1667 NoBid $ 12,00
33 [P O LLE ™ 1000 No Bid $ 1675 $ 1515 $ 1533 NoBid $ 1333
3 R o e e ST ™ 500 No Bid NoBid |$ 1080|$ 1660 $ 13.48
a5 [ e ™ 550 No Bid $ 1066)$ 1250 $  14.00 NoBid
36 P i e R L ™ 500 No Bid $ 1400 $  11.34| NoBid
37 P T ING SRAVEL ™ 100{  No Bid $ 1499)$ 13.00 $ 1169
ag o] § DEICING GRAVEL ™ 600 No Bid $ 840 No Bid $  7.40
a0 QST A DS GRAVEL ™ s00| NoBid |$ 1029 $  10.43 $ 12.83 $ 990
a0 QST 4 PEICIG GRAVEL ™ 300 No Bid $ 1318 $ 1100 No Bid $  10.90
a1 [R5 DEICING RAVEL ™ 500 NoBid | $ 9.79 $ 835 $ 827
4 |1 DEICPS SRAVEL ™ 300 NoBid |$  14.09 $  10.65 $ 1499 NoBid $ 1065
PR AV SHATNGS ™ 1000, NoBid | $ 9.93 $ 893 $ 1499 $ 1239
P R on ™ 1000{ No Bid $ 835 $ 954
4 P RO R ™ 4800 No Bid $ 850 No Bid $ 800
4 P O PAUL ™ 500 NoBid | $ 9.98 $ 867 $ 882 $  12.39
AT P e AUL ™ 500 NoBid | $ 9.99 $ 970 $ 965 $  12.77 $  10.00
a8 P R e g01 ™ 1200{ No Bid $  10.00 No Bid $ 1014
a9 [P R eLEy ™ 1200 No Bid $  13.26 $ 1075 No Bid $ 1050
B0 [P R AL CITY ™ 1000 NoBid | $ 8.69 $ 798
B P e R KVILLE ™ 2800 NoBid |$  1158|$ 16.11 $  11.80 $ 1333 NoBid $ 1065
52 [P O R o ey ™ 1400 NoBid |$  1414|$ 17.04 $ 1045 $  16.00 NoBid $ 1037
58 P L ™ 680 NoBid | $ 9.99| $ 1222 $ 10.20 $ 1365 $ 1226 NoBid
B P O R INGS ™ 400 NoBid |8 9.79 $ 1052 $  14.40| NoBid
BB [P PORT ™ 7000 NoBid |$ 1459 $ 1529 $ 1800 NoBid
B P 1 e ERIOR ™ 7000 $ 1590 $ 1619 $ 1769 No Bid
57 [Py 2o A ™ 1430| $ 1900| $  13.94 $ 1435 $  16.66| NoBid
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 Net 40 0 30 0 30 30 Net 30 100 30 0 30 100 30 0
Delivery Days ARO 30 10 45 10 30 As required 45 Per ITB 30 30 10 60 45 As needed
Addendum
Comments #1 & #2
received
No Bid
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Armstrong Rentals, LLC

K4 Trucking LLC

Opening Date: January 6, 201¢



Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 5
Overland ——
DISTRICT FIVE (5)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong | Jeffres Sand [Kembel Sand sandand | Paulsen. Inc Contractors inc Simon Western Elmer Wolfe
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel & Gravel Gravel ! "| DBA Ogallala Contractors |Materials Inc.
Ready Mix
. . Unit of Unit of o oo oo oo o oo oo oo oo
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure | Measure
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
58 CRAWFORD MAINT YARD TN 2500 No Bid No Bid $ 25.06 | $ 22.95
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
59 17 MI N RUSHVILLE HWY 87 RP 72 TN 1000 No Bid No Bid NB $ 30.76
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
60 3 MI E LAKESIDE HWY 87 RP 72 TN 1000 No Bid $ 26.10 No Bid $ 25441 $ 25.67
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
61 8 MI N ALLIANCE HWY 2 RP 76 TN 3000 No Bid $ 30.25 No Bid $ 2180 | $ 21.03
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
62 HWY 29 RP 36 TN 4000 No Bid No Bid $ 1729 $ 17.21
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
63 HWY 71 RP 90 TN 3000 No Bid No Bid $ 16.55 | $ 17.15
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
64 HWY 92 RP 20 TN 1000 No Bid No Bid $ 1338 | $ 13.80
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
65 OSHKOSH YARD TN 2000 No Bid No Bid $ 2320 | $ 18.55 NB $ 25.83
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
66 BRIDGEPORT MAINT YARD TN 4000 No Bid No Bid $ 1766 | $ 17.68
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
67 HWY 385 RP 56 TN 2000 No Bid No Bid $ 2031 | $ 21.38
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
68 DALTON SITE HWY 385 RP 52 TN 1000 No Bid No Bid $ 21.04| $ 22.35
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
69 SIDNEY W HWY 30 RP 55 TN 2000 No Bid No Bid $ 2525 | $ 2531
DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
70 KIMBALL YARD TN 2000 No Bid No Bid $ 1951 $ 19.67
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
71 3 Ml W CHADRON JCT 20 & 385 TN 1000 No Bid $ 16.16 No Bid NB $ 19.49
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
72 CRAWFORD MAINT YARD TN 2500 No Bid $ 12.99 No Bid $ 1875 $ 17.50
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
73 HARRISON MAINT YARD TN 2000 No Bid $ 11.31 No Bid $ 1763 | $ 15.65
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
74 GORDON MAINT YARD TN 2000 No Bid $ 18.01 No Bid NB $ 23.63
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
75 HEMINGFEORD MAINT YARD TN 1000 No Bid $ 11.28 No Bid $ 16.16 | $ 1479 | $ 29.65
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 5
Overland ——
DISTRICT FIVE (5)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong | Jeffres Sand [Kembel Sand sandand | Paulsen. Inc Contractors inc Simon Western Elmer Wolfe
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel & Gravel Gravel ! "| DBA Ogallala Contractors |Materials Inc.
Ready Mix
. . Unit of Unit of o oo oo oo oo oo oo oo o
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure | Measure
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
76 ALLIANCE MAINT YARD TN 2000 No Bid $ 11.00 No Bid $ 1394 ( $ 1465 $ 25.00
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
77 OSHKOSH YARD TN 1000 No Bid $ 16.76 No Bid $ 17.08 | $ 18.80 NB $ 18.92
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
78 BRIDGEPORT MAINT YARD TN 3000 No Bid $ 10.29 No Bid $ 1096 | $ 12.23
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
79 GERING YARD TN 1500 No Bid $ 6.60 No Bid $ 6.98 | $ 8.24
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
80 DALTIN SITE HWY 385 RP 52 TN 1000 No Bid $ 13.28 No Bid $ 1468 $ 16.50
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
81 SIDNEY W HWY 30 RP 55 TN 3000 No Bid $ 15.48 No Bid $ 1855 | $ 19.35
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
82 KIMBALL YARD TN 2000 No Bid $ 11.90 No Bid $ 1425 ( $ 14.22
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
83 HARRISBURG YARD HWY 71 RP 39 TN 4000 No Bid $ 9.46 No Bid $ 9.25| $ 11.94
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 Net 30 100 30 0 30 100 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 As required | As needed 30 60 Per ITB 30
Line 74: *read
Comments Gordon Addendum
#1 and #2
No Bid
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Armstong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC

Overland Sand and Gravel




Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 6
Overland Overton S
DISTRICT SIX (6)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong |Jeffries Sand L &L Gravel| Sand and oo || s, s Pine Bluffs | Contractorsinc | T & F Sand & Ulrich Gravel Inc. Western
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel " Gravel DBA Ogalala Gravel, Inc. Materials Inc.
Gravel Gravel Co. -
Ready Mix
Line Number / Description Unit of Qly Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure | Ordered
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
84 OCONTO TN 1000 No Bid No Bid $ 13.75( $ 15.28
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
85 BROKEN BOW WEST TN 500 No Bid No Bid $ 14.09( $ 13.87
86 25§L6E¢RMOR COAT GRAVEL TN 500 No Bid No Bid $ 13.98( $ 16.23 $ 15.78| $ 16.00
87 DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL TN 2500 No Bid No Bid $ 10.24| $ 12.89

LEXINGTON HWY 283 MP 55 BLEND 1
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL " .
88 STAPELTON W HWY 92 RP 225 ™ 600 No Bid No Bid $ 20.55 $ 14.95
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
TYRON E HWY 92 RP 205

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
ARTHUR N HWY 61 RP 126

DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL " .
91 HYANNIS W HWY 2 RP 144 ™ 600 No Bid $ 22.00 No Bid - $ 26.43
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL " .
92 MULLEN W HWY 2 RP 184 ™ 600 No Bid $ 19.57 No Bid -
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
THEDFORD N HWY 83 RP 151
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL " .
94 COMSTOCK SUPR 21C ™ 1200 No Bid $ 12.50 No Bid $ 14.58 $ 14.50

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

8!

©

™ 600 No Bid No Bid $ 20.93 $ 15.30

9

S

™ 600 No Bid No Bid $ 20.96 $ 18.55

9.

@

™ 1000 No Bid $ 14.36 No Bid -

95 | BROKEN BOW ™ 500 No Bid NoBid [$ 1074[$  10.80

96 255TL6E$E'C'NG GRAVEL ™ 500 No Bid NoBid |[$ 11.09|$ 1276 $ 11.49

97 2§J§LBE|C|NG GRAVEL ™ 500 No Bid No Bid $ 1315 $ 12.14
98 glx-\sl_TLiv?/ilvc ING GRAVEL ™ 250 No Bid NoBid |[$ 11.09|$ 1389

99 B'CSS,ST%E'C'NG GRAVEL ™ 500 No Bid NoBid |[$ 1024|$ 1228

D o s om T e
101 RSL_\GT?E%N&SSAVEL ™ 1000 No Bid No Bid $ 1048 $ 7.05
102 RSL_\GT?E%N&SSAVEL ™ 1000 No Bid No Bid $ 1048 $ 7.05
103 2552?_“‘2"'0”;?2‘2’3?%\’& ™ 750 No Bid No Bid $  1041|$  31.00

104 gsg}i"(‘v'g‘g@%"\gﬁﬁg\gﬁ" ™ 1500 No Bid NoBid [$ 1050|$  1050| $  28.00 Tiebreaker
105 2@23’ g\ﬁ?g’g GRAVEL ™ 750 No Bid NoBid |[$ 1069|$ 1262|$  30.00 $ 11.49

106 g‘gc‘)’:’v'?g Zﬁvg ;’ZAVEL ™ 750 No Bid NoBid |$ 964 $ 1128/ $ 3100

108 [PIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ™ 2000 No Bid No Bid $  1048|$ 1800 $ 19.05 $ 10.75

DICKENS HWY 23 MP 57
109 gg;Limz‘sz\;gsg\/JEé ™ 3000 No Bid No Bid $ 9.68| $ 9.00| $ 12.49
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
ROSCOE HWY 30 MP 136

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
GOTHENBURG SITE 630 BLEND 1
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

12| EXINGTON HWY 283 MP 55 BLEND 1 ™ 1300 No Bid NoBid |$  788|$ 1000[$ 2400

11

o

™ 3000 No Bid No Bid $ 9.68| $ 10.00( $ 13.43 $ 10.92

11

=

™ 1300 No Bid No Bid $ 1050 $ 20.00

113 g#%ﬁﬁgﬁiorm?zg\g%mo ™ 660 No Bid $ T0i2'07 No Bid - $ 21.00 $ 1141
114 g#%iﬁgﬁiomﬁzg\g%ln ™ 660 No Bid $ T0i1'77 No Bid - $ 20.00 $ 11.38
115 g#%iﬁgﬁiomﬁzg\g%lm ™ 660 No Bid $ T°i1,57 No Bid - $ 20.00 $ 11.25
116 g#%iﬁgﬁwwi?«?zv% 225 ™ 330 No Bid No Bid $ 13.92| $ 23.00 $ 11.00
117 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ™ 1300 No Bid No Bid $ 1365| $ 20.00 $ 10.75

TRYON E HWY 92 RP 225

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL " .
118 ARTHUR E HWY 92 RP 175 SITE 621 ™ 660 No Bid No Bid $ 16.22| $ 16.00( $ 21.86
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL " .
119 ARTHUR N HWY 61 RP 126 SITE 619 ™ 660 No Bid No Bid $ 1460 $ 14.00( $ 20.93

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

120 [, 07 UR N WHY 61 RP 131 SITE 616 ™ 660 No Bid No Bid $ 1550($ 1500 $ 20.93
121 EYS/ATNGNYSI\\/‘\/DERS?V&V(\;/‘SIZV:; 144 ™ 660 NoBd |s 1925|°® TDiS,SO No Bid - $  18.00| $ 24.68
122 a'j[&n’wzwxii‘\l\;i"swlg 604 ™ 660 NoBd |s  1500[® Toi"f’o No Bid - $ 2200
123 a'j[&n’wzwxii‘\l\gi"swlg 605 ™ 990 NoBd |s  1500[® Toi‘mo No Bid - $ 2400
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF

NE Dept of Roads

Page 8 of 11

DISTRICT 6
Overland Overton S
DISTRICT SIX (6)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong |Jeffries Sand L &L Gravel| Sand and s | et bm Pine Bluffs | Contractorsinc | T & F Sand & Ulrich Gravel Inc. Western
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel " Gravel DBA Ogalala Gravel, Inc. Materials Inc.
Gravel Gravel Co. -
Ready Mix
Line Number / Description Unit of Qly Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure | Ordered
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 Net 30 100 30 0 30 100 30 0 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 10 30 10 60 45 as needed 30
Addendum
Comments #1 & #2
received
No Bid

Armstrong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel

Opening Date: January 6, 2016



Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads
DISTRICT 7

Ed Broodfoot &|

DISTRICT SEVEN (7)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong | Brads Sand DeWeese Sons Sand & Lakeside Sand| Mid-Nebraska | Overland Sand| Overton Sand EeulEem, s T&F Sand & Western Materials
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| and Gravel |Sand & Gravel Gravel & Gravel LLC | Aggregate Inc.| and Gravel |and Gravel Co. B Gravel, Inc. INC.
. . Unitof | Qty . P . P P L Lo Lo P L L
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure | Ordered
124 DIST'7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ™ 2000 No Bid $ 12.25 No Bid

HWY 6 MP 181 W EDGE MINDEN
DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
125 HWY 6 MP 157 W HOLDREGE N 1000 No Bid No Bid $ 12.24 $ 13.19
DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
126 ALMA YARD N 1000 No Bid No Bid $ 14.00 $ 15.88
DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
JWY 18 R-1 S CITY LIMITS CURTIS
DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
128 HWY 136 RP 9.4-4 W OF OXFORD N 1800 No Bid $ 34.00 No Bid $ 14.04 - $ 16.05
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
129 HWY 6 MP 181 W EDGE OF MINDEN N 1320 No Bid $ 9.98( $ 9.26 $ 10.99 No Bid -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

HWY 23 W EDGE OF HOLDREGE
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
131 HWY 136 1 MI E OF ORLEANS N 1320 No Bid $ 9.89 $ 33.25 No Bid $ 10.70 - $ 12.99

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

12

N

N 1600 No Bid $ 28.00 No Bid $ 15.93 $ 16.70

13

S

N 1360 No Bid $ 11.85 No Bid $ 8.50 - $ 8.45

132 HWY 34 RP 10 ™ 575 No Bid $ 12.67 $ 16.75 No Bid -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
133 HWY 61 RP 24 ™ 575 No Bid $ 12.33 $ 15.00 No Bid -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
134 HWY 35 RP 34 ™ 575 No Bid $ 10.50 $ 13.00 No Bid -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
135 HWY 61 RP 74 ™ 575 No Bid $ 27.00 No Bid $ 9.99
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
136 HWY 6 RP 58 ™ 575 No Bid $ 11.50 No Bid $ 13.80
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
137 HWY 23 RP 13 ™ 575 No Bid $ 27.00 No Bid $ 13.53
DIST 7 SURFACING GRAVEL . .
138 HWY 23 RP 132 W CITY LIMITS ELWOOD ™ 2500 No Bid No Bid $ 8.08| $ 8.69
Payment Terms 0 Net 0 30 Net 40 0 30 N/A 100 30 0 30 100 30 0 - 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 30 10 45 15 30 30 10 60 45 30
Line 133 -
Dundy/Chase Co.
line
Line 135 - 12 SO.
Comments Ogallala
Line 136 - East
Palisade
Line 137 - 5mi W
Grant
LOWEST

No Bid
Armstrong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 8
DISTRICT EIGHT (8)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong %%;icgf E'ﬁ‘g:‘;;”d Emme Sand |Jeffries Sand g;’:(;'i’:; Ulrich Gravel
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC LLC LLC. & Gravel |& Gravel Inc. Gravel Inc.
Line Number / Description MUe[;i;L?rfe Qty Ordered| Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
139 Blg:; Zssl\’\fg;Rcool\fLVC\;lsAZ\éEL RP 215 TN 1900 No Bid $ 10.80 | $ 13.25 No Bid
140 Blg:; BBC'I'?'IMIEOORNCI?VI?II(CJTQ\F/’EZIES) TN 2500 No Bid $ 1246 | $ 1125 | $ 11.30 No Bid
141 ?3ISIJI—I ?IVAE:\:AF\I)EP?EORA.OrI\CI;ECV\‘/(E]I:Z TN 400 No Bid $ 12.60 $ 12.85 No Bid
142 ?LS\(1L?)I§W$§R(I:DOAT GRAVEL TN 2000 No Bid $ 11.00 No Bid $ 13.80
143 gbsgvs;ihgo\{iggAT GRAVEL TN 1000 No Bid $ 9.75 No Bid $ 11.00
144 ?I?I’ar\f’ g?\ég?cggﬁr GRAVEL TN 1800 No Bid $ 10.55 No Bid $ 11.10
145 gLs;TiQFTMh%?( (L:g’\'?; GRAVEL TN 1000 No Bid $ 1246 | $ 12.85 No Bid $ 13.33
146 SLSI_LIB\I‘ﬁEIIECING GRAVEL TN 2500 No Bid $ 1290 | $ 17.46 $ 12.50 No Bid
147 25[1)—5 DEICING GRAVEL TN 1000 No Bid $ 2022 |$ 22.01 $ 17.90 No Bid
148 ’?AIES;;SE:\‘CING GRAVEL TN 2000 No Bid $ 2525 | $ 25.25 $ 22.25 No Bid
149 SLSI;'NBC[I;EEK\ISDGRAVEL TN 500 No Bid $ 855 | $ 8.55 No Bid
150 R_II_SKT’\?S%I?\LCYIZSDGRAVEL TN 1500 No Bid $ 6.27 No Bid
151 gﬁ;if&ﬁ;ge GRAVEL TN 1000 No Bid $ 8.68 | $ 7.95 No Bid
152 R:S;v%ggﬁ'\#isgﬁ\ﬁ\l{'zo RP 242 TN 2000 No Bid $ 11.02 $ 8.50 No Bid
153 SLSI;—INBGD\/EI:EC\II\?\?ACF;{?)AD-YVI\EII\_( 183 RP 213 TN 1000 No Bid $ 12.70 $ 9.00 No Bid
154 \?IASL1I—5ﬁ1¥\IIII\I'\I‘EDROW GRAVEL TN 1200 No Bid $ 1250 | $ 16.46 No Bid
155 ’?AIES;;'\\:IVAEDROW GRAVEL TN 1200 No Bid $ 2185 | $ 24.25 $ 23.10 No Bid
156 gll.ls.; §OV7W\‘2DI\|:IOI;A»/A$EIIA\I\QEOLN TN 2450 No Bid $ 5.51 No Bid
157 gbsgvsgl\_lll_N'\a)&?_\XNiRAVEL TN 2100 No Bid $ 7.75 No Bid $ 8.52
158 gLSgTi|¥\¢$$A$>?x§ERAVEL TN 1400 No Bid $ 9.26 No Bid $ 9.82
159 gIAS;—S?E'\I/'\'II'";‘-![\)I\?\g\QISiE’A]\./SE)L TN 600 No Bid $ 9.00 | $ 7.92 $ 13.00 No Bid
160 SLSI;—INBGVY/IIIESVRSV\O/YGEI:\;EFI’-ZIG TN 600 No Bid $ 1250 | $ 11.98 $ 17.00 No Bid
161 B:ESVEF?OV:IRI'INzS\IC\)(Wl;R:F\’/EIZ_ TN 600 No Bid $ 9.32 $ 17.00 No Bid
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 100 30 60 100 30 Net 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 15 45 20 As required 30 as needed
Comments
No Bid
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Armstrong Rentals, LLC

K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel

Tiebreaker

Opening Date: January 6, 2016



5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016

Buyer: Rita Schwabe
NE Dept of Roads
OPTIONAL LINES

Simon
D &L SAND | Ed Broodfoot Mancsen Overland | Overton Sand | Pine Bluffs | Contractors Westover
ALTERNATE LOCATIONS- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong | Brad Sand and Elkhorn Sand | Emme Sand & | Hooker Bros | Jeffries Sand Matteo Sand Simon | Ulrich Gravel
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC Gravel &GRAVEL | &Sons& g GravelLLC Gravel  |Sand & Gravel| & Gravel Inc, | b &L Gravel | Sand& | T 7| Sandand | and Gravel | Gravel & Exc | incDBA | ooy aciors Inc. Rock & Sand,
L Gravel Gravel Gravel Co Inc Ogallala Inc.
Ready Mix
Line Number / Description N:‘;"a‘;;’r'e UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice | UnitPrice
(OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON S .15Per 17 per ton 18 per 0.19 per Ton 15 per ton
62| ARMOR COAT ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ No Bid $ 015 7on mile $ 018 | 15/Ton/mi S 005 e Nogid ton/mile 1o Tonmile |y ® 014 | mie
(OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON s .15Per 18 per 0.19 per Ton 15 per ton
163 | DEICING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ No Bid $ 015 \ron mile $ 0.18 |.15/Ton/mi s 01 No Bid ton/mile 19 Tonmile |, e $ 014 | e
(GPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON
S .15Per 18 per 15 per ton
164 |WINDROW GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ NoBid |07 tonmie |$ 015 s 0203 [EEN s 0.18 [ A5/Ton/mi No Bid e |14x2sTon |.19 Ton mike s o1a |8
(OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON S 15Per 18 per 15 per ton
165 |SURFACING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ No Bid Ton mile 1/ Ton/mi NoBid ton/mile ® 014 Imie
Payment Terms 0 Net30 0 30 100 30 0 30 060 100 30 030 Net 30 100 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 30 15 %5 5 20 10 As required 10 Per T8 30 10 PerITB | as needed | as needed
Line 165- 1
Ton Ton read
Comments z:vam‘ﬁ "r:"“_ (Addendum #1
$.13 per Ton and #2
mile
No Bid

Armstrong Rentals, LLC

K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel

Invalid Bid
Elmer Wolfe - Incomplete Bid
G3 Enterprises - Late Bid
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