
Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award Partial Award

Li
ne

 
# Polyethylene Can Liners All American Poly Calico Industries, Inc. Central Poly-Bag 

Corp
Disposensave - 
Dispose 'N Save

Egan Supply 
Company

Ferguson Enterprises 
Inc

Interboro Packaging 
Corporation Jiffy Supply National Everything 

Wholesale
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

23” X 17" X 48”, 4 MIL., 
LINEAR LOW DENSITY CS  $                      21.62  $                      22.24  $                      17.80  $                      41.82  No Bid  $                      14.24  $                      36.78  $                      31.44 

Packs / Units per Case: 50 50 50 100 100 100 50
Cost per Pack / Unit:  $                    0.4324  $                    0.4448  $                      0.356  $                      41.82  $                  14.2400  $                    0.3678 $                    .63
Pack (Flat or Roll):  Flat  Flat  Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

Brand Name:  All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Aluf  XL-Plastics  ELKAY 

Item #:  404840-AAP  9911148sp  CP2317484M  DPS231748-4  NO BID  INT-231748-Exh  XL-231748  EK-EPC84101 
Capacity in Gallons:  40 to 45 40-44 40-45 40-45 Gallons 40-45 40-45 Gallon 45 GALLON
Dimensions:  23x17x48  23x17x48  23x17x48  23"x17"x48"  23"x17"x48"  23x17x48  40"x48" 
Thickness:  4 mil  4.0 mil  4 mil  4 Mil  4 Mil.  4 mil  4 Mil 
Net Case Weight: 25 25.6 25.6# 51.20# 51.20 Nominal 51.2 lbs 25.6
Weight Load in Pounds:  75-100 75 80 190 190 75

Recycled and Post Consumer Content: 80% 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer

30% Recycled, 10% 
post consumer Min 50%

7-10 GALLON, 15” X 9" X 24”, .5 MIL., CLEAR,
LINEAR LOW DENSITY CS  $                      17.26  $                      22.82  $                      22.90  $                      21.48  $                        8.40  $                      13.82  $                      10.18  $                        15.3  $                      13.20 

500 1000 1000 1,000 10/50 500 1,000 500 500
 $                    0.0345  $                  0.02282  $                    0.0229  $                      21.48  $                    0.0168  $                      13.82  $                  10.1800  $                    0.0306 $                 .0264

 Flat  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 242409-AAP 9940286  CP15924N.5  DPS15924-5  P2410XC 112078 INT-15924-L XL-15x9x24CL H4823HC
 7 to 10 7 to 10 7-10 7-10 Gallons 10 7-10 GAL 7-10 7-10 Gallon 7-10 GAL

 15x9x24  15x9x24  15x9x24  15"x9"x24"  24x23  24x23  15"x9"x24"  15x9x24  24x23 
Thickness:  .9 mil  0.5 mil  .5 mil  .50 Mil  .35 mil  .55 mil  .5 Mil  .5 mil  .55 MIL 

17 19.2 19.2# 19.20# 7.0 lbs 10.12 20.17 Nominal 9.6 lbs 10.1
15-May 15 10-20 30 15 lbs N/A 30 15

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min 50%

7-10 GALLON, 24” X 24”, .5 MIL., CLEAR, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      17.26  $                      22.82  $                      22.95  $                      21.24  $                        8.40  $                      13.82  $                      10.18  $                        11.6  $                      13.20 

500 1000 1000 1,000 10/50 500 1,000 500 500
 $                    0.0345  $                  0.02282  $                      0.023  $                      21.24  $                    0.0168  $                  13.8200  $                  10.1800 $               ,0232  $                    0.0264 

 Flat  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

 242409-AAP 9940286  CP2424C.5  DPS2424-5  P2410XC 112078 INT-2424-L CRC23M H4823HC
 7 to 10 7 to 10 7-10 24"x24" -.50 Mil 10 7-10 GAL 7-10 7-10 Gallon 7-10 GAL
 24x24  24x24  24x24  7-10 Gallons 24x33  24x23  24"x24"  24x23  24x23 

Thickness:  .9 mil  0.5 mil  .5 mil  7-10 Gallons  .35 mil  .55 mil  .5 Mil  .45 mil  .55 MIL 
17 19.2 19.2# 19.20# 7.0 lbs 10.12 20.17 Nominal 7.9 lbs 10.1

15-May 15 10-20 30 15 lbs N/A 30 20

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

7-10 GALLON, 24” X 24”, .5 MIL., NATURAL, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      17.26  $                      22.82  $                      23.40  $                      21.68  $                        8.97  $                      13.82  $                      10.48  $                        11.6  $                      13.20 

500 1000 1000 1000 10/50 500 1,000 500 500
 $                    0.0345  $                  0.02282  $                    0.0234  $                      21.68  $                    0.0179  $                      13.82  $                  10.4800  $                    0.0232  $                    0.0264 

 Flat  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

 242409-AAP 9940286  CP2424N.5  DPS2424-5  P2420ZXC 112076 INT-2424-L CRC23M H4823HC
 7 to 10 7 to 10 7-10 7-10 Gallons 10 7-10 GAL 7-10 7-10 Gallon 7-10 GAL
 24x24  24x24  24x24  24"x24"  24x33  24x23  24"x24"  24x23  24x23 

Thickness:  .9 mil  0.5 mil  .5 mil  .50 Mil  .35 mil  .55 mil  .5 Mil  .45 mil  .55 MIL 
17 19.2 19.2# 19.20# 7.0 lbs 10.12 20.17 Nominal 7.9 lbs 10.1

15-May 15 10-20 30 15 lbs N/A 30 20

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

1

Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

4

3

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:

Dimensions:

Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:

Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Net Case Weight:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Packs / Units per Case:

Capacity in Gallons:

2

Dimensions:

Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award Partial Award

All American Poly Calico Industries, Inc. Central Poly-Bag 
Corp

Disposensave - 
Dispose 'N Save

Egan Supply 
Company

Ferguson Enterprises 
Inc

Interboro Packaging 
Corporation Jiffy Supply National Everything 

Wholesale
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

7-10 GALLON, 24” X 24”, .5 MIL., BLACK, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      17.26  $                      22.82  $                      22.90  $                      21.72  $                        8.40  $                      13.82  $                        9.90  $                        11.6  $                      13.20 

500 1000 1000 1,000 10/50 500 1,000 500 500
 $                    0.0345  $                  0.02282  $                    0.0229  $                      21.72  $                    0.0168  $                      13.82  $                        9.90 $                .0232  $                    0.0264 

 Flat  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

 242409-AAP 9940315  CP2424K.5  DPS2424-5  B72410XK 112076 INT-2424-L CRB23M H4823HK
 7 to 10 7 to 10 7-10 7-10 Gallons 10 7-10 GAL 7-10 7-10 Gallon 7-10 GAL
 24x24  24x24  24x24  24"x24"  24x23  24x23  24"x24"  24x23  24x23 

Thickness:  .9 mil  0.5 mil  .5 mil  .50 Mil  Roll  .55 mil  .5 Mil  .45 mil  .55 MIL 
17 19.2 19.2# 19.20 7.0 lbs 10.12 20.17 7.9 lbs 10.1

15-May 15 10-20 30 15 lbs N/A 30 20

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

20–30 GALLON, 30” X 37”, 2 MIL., BLACK, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      16.77  $                      30.83  $                      11.30  $                      29.98  $                      12.86  $                      27.49  $                      20.32  $                        26.9  $                      12.17 

150 250 100 250 10/10 200 250 250 100
 $                    0.1118  $                  0.12332  $                      0.113  $                      29.98  $                    0.1286  $                      27.49  $                      20.32  $                    0.1076  $                    0.1217 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 303720-AAP  9910232D  CP3037K2  DPS3037-2  Custom-1 192254 INT-3037-Exh XL-30x37BL X6639PK
 20 to 30 20-30 20-30 20-30 Gallons 30 gal 20-30 GAL 20-30 20-30 Gallon 20-33 GAL 1.3 MIL
 30x37  30x37  30x37  30"x37"  30x37  30x36  30"x37"  30x37  33x39 

Thickness:  2mil  2.0 mil  2 mil  2 Mil  2 mil  2.0 mil  2 Mil  2 mil  33x39 
22 37 14.8 37.00# 15.3 lbs 28.9 37# Nominal 37 lbs 11.2

25-50 45 40 105 90 lbs N/A 105 45

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer up to 70% UP TO 70% P.I. 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min 50%

33 GALLON, 33” X 39”, 1.3 MIL., BLACK, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      14.87  $                        24.2  $                        9.20  $                      22.68  $                      13.28  $                      16.59  $                      17.32  $                      21.45  $                      12.17 

150 250 100 250 25/6 (10/15) 250 250 100
 $                    0.0991  $                    0.0968  $                      0.092  $                      22.68  $                    0.0885  $                      16.59  $                  17.3200  $                    0.0858  $                    0.1217 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 333913-AAP 9911437 CP3339K1.3  DPS-3339-13  EC333912K 112376 INT-3339-X-Hvy XL-33x39BL X6639PK
33 33 33 33 Gallons 33 33 33 33 Gallon 33 GAL

 33x39  33x39  33x39  33"x39"  33x39  33x39  33"x39"  33x39  33x39 
Thickness:  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 Mil  1.35 mil  1.3 Mil  1.3 mil  1.3 MIL 

16 27.9 11.2 27.89# 16 lbs 17.37 27.89 Nominal 27.89 lbs 11.2
15-30 40 40 95 70 lbs N/A 95 40

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer up to 70% UP TO 70% P.I. 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min 50%

33 GALLON, 33” X 40”, 1.3 MIL., CLEAR, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      17.14  $                      29.64  $                      10.95  $                      28.24  $                      14.13  $                      30.22  $                      22.74  $                      26.45  $                      15.55 

150 250 100 250 5/25 (10/25) 250 250 100
 $                    0.1143  $                  0.11856  $                        0.11  $                      28.24  $                    0.1130  $                      30.22  $                      22.74  $                    0.1058  $                      0.155 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 334013-AAP 9910301 CP3340C1.3  DPS3340-13  P4040XC 112062 INT-3340-XH XL-33x40CL H7658TC
33 33 33 33 Gallon 33 33 33 33 Gallon 38 X 58 .90 MIL

 33x40  33x40  33x40  33"x40"  33x39  33x39  33"x40"  33x40  33-60 GAL 
Thickness:  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 Mil  1.3 mil  1.10 mil  1.3 Mil  1.3 mil  33-60 GAL 

17 28.6 11.44 28.60# 14.5 lbs 23.6 28.60 Nominal 28.6 lbs 13.2
15-30 40 40 95 75 lbs N/A 95 40

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min 50%

Li
ne

 # Polyethylene Can Liners

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

8

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

7

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

6

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:

5

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award Partial Award

All American Poly Calico Industries, Inc. Central Poly-Bag 
Corp

Disposensave - 
Dispose 'N Save

Egan Supply 
Company

Ferguson Enterprises 
Inc

Interboro Packaging 
Corporation Jiffy Supply National Everything 

Wholesale
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

33 GALLON, 33” X 40”, 1.3 MIL., NATURAL, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      17.14  $                      29.64  $                      10.70  $                      27.34  $                      14.13  $                      16.48  $                      18.32  $                      26.45  $                      15.39 

150 250 100 250 5/25 100 250 250 100
 $                    0.1143  $                  0.11856  $                      0.107  $                      27.34  $                    0.1130  $                      16.48  $                      18.32  $                    0.1058  $                    0.1539 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 334013-AAP 9910301 CP3340N1.3  DPS3340-13  P4040XC 143261 INT-3340-Heavy XL33x40N H7658TC
33 33 33 33 Gallons 33 33 33 33 Gallon 33-60 GAL

 33x40  33x40  33x40  33"x40"  33x39  33x39  33"x40"  33x40  38x58 
Thickness:  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 Mil  1.3 mil  1.50 mil  1.3 Mil  1.3 mil  .90 MIL 

17 28.6 11.44 28.60# 14.5 lbs 12.87 28.60 Nominal 28.6 lbs 13.2
15-30 40 40 95 75 lbs N/A 95 40

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min 50%

33 GALLON RECYCLED, 33” X 39”, 1.5 MIL., BLACK, 
LINEAR LOW DENSITY CS  $                      15.44  $                      27.74  $                        9.20  $                      26.32  $                      11.05  $                      12.27  $                      17.94  $                        23.8  $                      12.30 

150 250 100 250 10/10 100 250 200 100
 $                    0.1029  $                  0.11096  $                      0.092  $                      26.32  $                    0.1105  $                      12.27  $                    17.940  $                      0.119  $                      0.123 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 333915-AAP 9910755 CP3339K1.5R  DPS3339-15  EC333915K 128208 INT-3339-X-Hvy XL-33x39x0015BL X6639PK
33 33 33 33 Gallon 33 33 33 33 Gallon 33 GAL

 33x39  33x39  33x39  33"x39"  33x39  33x39  33"x39"  33x39  33x39 
Thickness:  1.5 mil  1.5 mil  1.5 mil  1.5 Mil  1.5 mil  1.60 mil  1.5 Mil  1.5 mil  1.5 MIL 

19 32.2 12.87 32.18# 13.4 lbs 13.73 17.94 Nominal 32.18 lbs 11.2
25-35 42 40 95 80 N/A 95 42 lbs

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer up to 70% UP TO 70% P.I. 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min 50%

40-45 GALLON, 40” X 48”, 2 MIL., CLEAR, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      23.02  $                      31.42  $                      18.90  $                      24.98  $                      13.38  $                        29.5  $                      13.32  $                      28.34  $                      33.89 

100 125 100 100 5/10 100 100 125 100
 $                    0.2302  $                  0.28014  $                      0.189  $                      24.98  $                    0.2676  $                        29.5  $                      13.32  $                      0.226  $                    0.3389 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 404820-AAP  9911021D  CP4048C2  DPS4048-2  Custom-2 114999 INT-4048-XH XL-40x48CL H7658QC
40 to 45 40-45 40-45 40-45 Gallons 45 40-45 4045 40-45 Gallon 40-55 GAL
 40x48  40x48  40x48  40"x48"  40x48  40x48  40"x48"  40x48  38x58 

Thickness:  2 mil  2.0 mil  2 mil  2 Mil  2.0 mil  1.80 mil  2 Mil  2 mil  2.0 mil 
25 32 25.6# 25.60# 26.1 23.04 25.60 Nominal 32 lbs 29.4

40-55 55 40 120 95 N/A 120 55

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer min50%

40-45 GALLON, 40” X 48”, 2 MIL., WHITE, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      24.17  $                      34.33  $                      35.65  $                      26.84  $                      13.38  $                      12.24  $                      28.34 

100 125 100 100 5/10 100 125
 $                    0.2417  $                    0.2728  $                        0.36  $                      26.84  $                    0.2676  $                      12.24  $                      0.226 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt Plastics  Aluf  XL-Plastics  SEE BID LIST 2 

FOR OPTION 
 404820-AAP 9910468 CP4048W2  DPS4048-2  Custom-3  NO BID  INT-4048-X-Hvy  XL-40x48WH 

40 to 45 40-45 40-45 40-45 Gallon 45 4045 40-45 Gallon
 40x48  40x48  40x48  40"x48"  40x48  40"x48"  40x48 

Thickness:  2 mil  2.0 mil  2 mil  2 Mil  2.0 mil  2 Mil  2 mil 
25 32 25.6# 25.60# 26.1 25.60 Nominal 32 lbs

40-55 55 40 120 95 120 55

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min50%

Li
ne

 # Polyethylene Can Liners

Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

12

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:

Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

11

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

10

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:

9

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award Partial Award

All American Poly Calico Industries, Inc. Central Poly-Bag 
Corp

Disposensave - 
Dispose 'N Save

Egan Supply 
Company

Ferguson Enterprises 
Inc

Interboro Packaging 
Corporation Jiffy Supply National Everything 

Wholesale
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

40-45 GALLON, 40” X 48”, 2 MIL., NATURAL, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      23.02  $                      31.42  $                      23.90  $                      24.98  $                      11.21  $                        29.5  $                      13.24  $                      28.34  $                      15.39 

100 125 100 100 5/10 100 100 125 100
 $                    0.2302  $                  0.28014  $                      0.239  $                      24.98  $                    0.2242  $                        29.5  $                      13.24  $                      0.226  $                        0.15 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 404820-AAP  9911021D  CP4048N2  DPS4048-2  P4855XC 114999 INT-4048-XH XL-40x48N H7658TC
40 to 45 40-45 40-45 40-45 Gallon 45 40-45 40-45 40-45 Gallon 40-45 GAL
 40x48  40x48  40x48  40"x48"  40x48  40x48  40"x48  40x48  38x58 

Thickness:  2 mil  2.0 mil  2 mil  2 Mil  1.8 mil  1.80 mil  2 Mil  2 mil  .90 MIL 
25 32 25.6# 25.60# 11.6 23.04 25.60 Nominal 32 lbs 13.2

40-55 55 40 120 90 N/A 120 55

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min50%

40-45 GALLON, 40” X 48”, 2 MIL., BLACK, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      20.49  $                      27.05  $                      14.80  $                      20.84  $                      21.07  $                      21.09  $                      12.48  $                           23  $                      25.83 

100 125 100 100 10/10 (10/10) 100 125 100
 $                    0.2049  $                    0.2164  $                      0.148  $                      20.84  $                    0.2107  $                      21.09  $                      12.48  $                      0.184  $                    0.2583 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 404820-AAP 9910766 CP4048K2  DPS4048-2  EC404620K 112382 INT-4048-XH XL-40x48BL X8046QK
40 to 45 40-45 40-45 40-45 Gallon 45 40-45 40-45 40-45 Gallon 40-45 GAL
 40x48  40x48  40x48  40"x48"  40x46  40x46  40"x48"  40x48  40x46 

Thickness:  2 mil  2.0 mil  2 mil  2 Mil  2.0 mil  1.80 mil  2 Mil  2 mil  2 MIL 
25 32 25.6# 25.60 25.1 lbs 22.08 25.60 Nominal 32 lbs 24.53

40-55 55 40 120 90 lbs N/A 120 55

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer up to 70% UP TO 70% P.I. 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min50%

55 GALLON, 36” X 58”, 3 MIL., BLACK, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      16.09  $                      17.94  $                      25.80  $                      33.72  $                      18.14  $                      18.94  $                      18.68  $                        16.8  $                      23.68 

50 50 100 100 5/10 (5/10) 100 40 100
 $                    0.3218  $                      0.389  $                      0.258  $                      33.72  $                    0.3628  $                      18.94  $                      18.68  $                      0.422  $                    0.2368 

 Flat  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

 365830-AAP 9911605 CP3658K3  DPS3658-3  Custom-4 138309 INT-3658-Super Exh BC3860-3B X7658AK
55 55 55 55 Gallon 60 55 55 60 Gallon 55 GAL

 36x58  36x58  36x58  36"x58"  36x58  38x58  36"x58"  36x58  38x58 
Thickness:  3 mil  3.0 mil  3 mil  3 Mil  3.0 mil  2.70 mil  3 Mil  3 mil  1.5 MIL 

20 20.9 41.7 41.76# 21.38 19.84 41.76 Nominal 16.1 lbs 22.04
55-75 75 40-50 150 95 N/A 150 150

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer up to 70% UP TO 70% P.I. 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer up to 50%

56 GALLON, 42.5” X 47”, 1.3 MIL., CLEAR, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      17.29  $                        17.7  $                      34.93  $                      16.98  $                      17.91  $                      22.43  $                      11.74  $                      17.21  $                      15.55 

100 100 100 100 10/10 (10/10) 100 100 100
 $                    0.1729  $                    0.1765  $                        0.35  $                      16.98  $                    0.1791  $                      22.43  $                      11.74 ..1721  $                    0.1555 

 Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 434713-AAP 9910662 CP47N1.3  DPS42547-13  P4940XC 193162 INT-42547-Heavy XL42.5x47 H7658TC
56 56 56 56 Gallon 56 56 56 56 Gallon 56 GAL

 42.5x47  42.5x47  42.5x47  42.5"x47"  42.5x48  42.5x48  42.5"x47"  42.5x47  38x58 
Thickness:  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 Mil  1.3 mil  1.30 mil  1.3 Mil  1.30 mil  .90 MIL 

17 17.3 17.3# 17.31# 18.2 17.68 17.31 Nominal 17.31 lbs 13.2
20-35 40 20 95 75 N/A 95 40

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min50%

Li
ne

 # Polyethylene Can Liners

Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

16

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:

Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

15

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

14

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:

13

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:
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Statewide
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Partial Award Partial Award

All American Poly Calico Industries, Inc. Central Poly-Bag 
Corp

Disposensave - 
Dispose 'N Save

Egan Supply 
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Inc

Interboro Packaging 
Corporation Jiffy Supply National Everything 

Wholesale
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

56 GALLON, 42.5” X 47”, 1.3 MIL., BLACK, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                      15.39  $                      14.94  $                      12.10  $                      14.24  $                      13.87  $                      15.32  $                      11.18  $                      13.99  $                      21.77 

100 100 100 100 10/10 (10/10) 100 100 100
 $                    0.1539  $                    0.1573  $                      0.121  $                      14.24  $                    0.1387  $                      15.32  $                      11.18  $                      0.139  $                      0.217 

 Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 424713-AAP 9911438 CP47K1.3  DPS42547-13  EC434712K 181830 INT-42547-Heavy XL-42.5x47BL X8646AK
56 56 56 56 Gallon 56 56 56 56 Gallon 56 GAL

 42.5x47  42.5x47  42.5x47  42.5"x47"  43x47  43x47  42.5"x47"  42.5x47  43x46 
Thickness:  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 mil  1.3 Mil  1.2 mil  1.20 mil  1.3 Mil  1.30 mil  1.5 MIL 

17 17.3 17.3# 17.31# 16.7 16.1 17.31 Nominal 17.31 lbs 19.8
20-35 40 20 95 70 N/A 95 40

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer up to 70% UP TO 70% P.I. 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min50%

60 GALLON, 38” X 58”, .95 MIL., BLACK, LINEAR LOW 
DENSITY CS  $                        13.2  $                      12.43  $                      12.40  $                      26.24  $                      14.13  $                        17.2  $                      19.34  $                        13.6  $                      24.18 

100 100 100 200 10/10 (10/10) 200 100 100
 $                      0.132  $                    0.1323  $                      0.124  $                      26.24  $                    0.1413  $                        17.2  $                      19.34  $                      0.136  $                    0.2418 

 Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 385810-AAP 9940225 CP3858K.4  DPS3858-95  B76530XK 193177 INT-3858-Hvy XL-38x58BL X7658AK
60 60 60 60 Gallon 60 60 60 60 Gallon 60 GAL

 38x58  38x58  38x58  38"x58"  38x58  38x58 38"x58"  38x58 38x58
Thickness:  .95 mil  0.95 mil  .95 mil  .95 Mil  0.95 mil  0.95 mil .95 Mil  .95 mil 1.5 MIL

14 14 13.96 27.92# 14.5 13.96  27.92 Nominal 13.96 lbs 22.0
25-Oct 40 50 85 65 N/A 85 40

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min50%

60 GALLON RECYCLED, 38” X 58”, 1.5 MIL., BLACK, 
LINEAR LOW DENSITY CS  $                      17.63  $                      18.94  $                      14.20  $                      17.98  $                      18.95  $                        17.2  $                      15.18  $                        17.2  $                      23.19 

100 100 100 100 10/10 (10/10) 100 100 100
 $                    0.1763  $                    0.1928  $                      0.142  $                      17.98  $                    0.1895  $                        17.2  $                      15.18  $                      0.172  $                    0.2319 

 Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Flat  Flat 

 All American Poly  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  XL-Plastics  HERITAGE BAG 

 385815-AAP 9911130 CP3858K1.5  DPS3858-15  EC385815K 112378 INT-3858-Super Exh XL-38x58x0015BL X7658AK
60 60 60 60 Gallon 60 60 60 60 Gallon 60 GAL

 38x58  38x58  38x58  38"x58"  38x58  38x58  38"x58"  38x58  38x58 
Thickness:  1.5 mil  1.5 mil  1.5 mil  1.5 Mil  1.5 mil  1.35 mil  1.5 Mil  1,5 mil  1.5 MIL 

22 22 22.04# 22.04# 22.6 19.84 22.04 Nominal 22.04 lbs 22.0
25-35 45 50 100 80 N/A 85 45

80 30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer up to 70% UP TO 70% P.I. 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer Min50%

7-10 GALLON, 24” X 24”, 6 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                      11.44  $                        9.60  $                      10.20  $                      10.68  $                        12.3  $                      11.72  $                      11.49  $                      11.81 

1000 1000 1,000 20/50 (20/50) 1,000 1000 1000/CS
 $                  0.01144  $                        0.01  $                      10.20  $                    0.0107  $                        12.3  $                      11.72  $                  0.01149  $                  0.01181 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9930390 CP2424N6  DPS2424-6  MR24249MC 114923 INT-2424-Reg HCR24LC Z4824RN R01
7 to 10 7-10 7-10 Gallon 10 7-10 GAL 7-10 7-10 Gallon 7-10 GAL
 24x24  24x24  24"x24"  24x24  24x24  24"x24"  24x24  24x24 

Thickness:  6 micron  6 mic  6 Microns  6 mic  6 mic  6 Mic  6 mic  6 MIC 
9.4 9.34# 7.91# 4.6 lb 9.34 9.49 Nominal 8.6 lbs 9.4
10 10 20 15 lb N/A 20 10

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

Li
ne

 # Polyethylene Can Liners

Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

20

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:

19

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

18

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

17

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide
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All American Poly Calico Industries, Inc. Central Poly-Bag 
Corp

Disposensave - 
Dispose 'N Save

Egan Supply 
Company

Ferguson Enterprises 
Inc

Interboro Packaging 
Corporation Jiffy Supply National Everything 

Wholesale
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

7-10 GALLON CORELESS, 24” X 24”, 8 MICRONS, CLEAR, 
HIGH DENSITY CS  $                      13.94  $                      11.30  $                      14.24  $                      14.14  $                      16.41  $                      10.18  $                      13.45  $                      16.32 

1000 1000 1,000 20/50 (20/50) 1,000 1000 1000/CS
 $                  0.01394  $                      0.113  $                      14.24  $                    0.0141  $                      16.41  $                      10.18  $                  0.01329  $                  0.01632 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Alf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9970080 CP2424N8  DPS2424-8  MR24240MC 112098 INT-2424-L HCR24MC Z4824LN R01
7 to 10 7-10 7-10 Gallons 10 7-10 GAL 7-10 7-10 Gallon 7-10 GAL
 24x24  24x24  24"x24"  24x24  24x24  24"x24"  24x24  24x24 

Thickness:  8 micron  8 mic  8 Microns  8 mic  8 mic  8 Mic  8 mic  8 MIC 
12.5 12.5# 12.26# 12.8 12.46 12.26 Nominal 10.1 lbs 12.5
25 10 25 20 N/A 25 20

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

12-16 GALLON, 24” X 33”, 11 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                      12.64  $                      12.40  $                      25.48  $                      12.91  $                      29.29  $                      13.72  $                        14.5  $                      21.96 

500 500 1,000 20/25 1000 1,000 500 1000/CS
 $                  0.02528  $                      0.025  $                      25.48  $                    0.0258  $                      29.29  $                      13.72  $                      0.029  $                  0.02196 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Alf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9930667 CP2433N11  DPS2433-11  Custom-5 112290 INT-2433-L HCR243311 Z4833LN R01
12 to 16 12-16 12-16 Gallons 16 12-16 GAL 12-16 12-16 Gallon 12-16 GAL
 24x33  24x33  24"x33"  24x33  24x33  24"x33"  24x33  24x33 

Thickness:  11 micron  11 mic  11 Microns  12 mic  11 mic  11 Mic  11 mic  11 MIC 
11.8 11.7# 23.38# 12.28 23.55 10.88 Nominal 11.2 lbs 17.2
30 15 30 15 N/A 30 40

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

12-16 GALLON, 24” X 33”, 8 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                      14.84  $                      13.80  $                      19.24  $                      19.43  $                      22.56  $                      19.45  $                      21.96 

1000 1000 1,000 20/50 (20/50) 1,000 1000 1000/CS
 $                  0.01484  $                      0.014  $                      19.24  $                    0.0194  $                      22.56  $                  0.01945  $                  0.02196 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat/Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Auf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9970005 CP2433N8  DPS2433-8  MR24330MC 112156 INT-2433-L HCR33MC Z4833LN R01
12 to 16 12-16 12-16 Gallons 16 12-16 GAL 12-16 12-16 Gallon 12-16 GAL
 24x33  24x33  24"x33"  24x33  24x33  24"x33"  24x33  24x33 

Thickness:  8 micron  8 mic  8 Microns  8 mic  8 mic  8 Mic  8 mic  8 MIC 
17.2 17.1# 16.86# 17.4 17.13 15.6 lbs 17.2
25 10 25 20 N/A 20

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

20-30 GALLON, 30” X 37”, 10 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                      15.44  $                      13.60  $                      15.82  $                      15.03  $                      18.66  $                      13.98  $                      16.15  $                      17.23 

500 500 500 20/25 (20/25) 300 500 500/CS
 $                  0.03088  $                      0.027  $                      15.82  $                    0.0301  $                      18.66  $                      13.98  $                    0.0323  $                  0.03446 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9970012 CP3037N10  DPS3037-10  MR30371MC 114927 INT-3037-Reg HCR33/10C Z6037MN R01
20 - 30 20-30 20-30 Gallon 30 20-30 20-30 20-30 Gallon 20-30 GAL
 30x37  30x37  30"x37"  30x37  30x37  30"x37"  30x37  30x37 

Thickness:  10 micron  10 mic  10 Micron  10 mic  10 mic  10 Mic 10 mic  10 MIC 
15 15# 14.86# 15.4 lb 15 14.68 Nominal  12.6 lbs 15.1
40 10 30 30 N/A 30 30

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post cons 10%

Li
ne

 # Polyethylene Can Liners

Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

24

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:

Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

23

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

22

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:

21

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
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Wholesale
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

20-30 GALLON CORELESS, 30” X 37”, 10 MICRONS, 
CLEAR, HIGH DENSITY CS  $                      15.44  $                      13.30  $                      15.34  $                      15.03  $                      18.66  $                      13.82  $                      16.15  $                      16.88 

500 500 500 20/25 (20/50) 500 500 500/CS
 $                  0.03088  $                      0.027  $                      15.34  $                    0.0301  $                      18.66  $                      13.82  $                    0.0323  $                  0.03376 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll 

0  Calico Industries, 
Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9970012 CP3037N10R  DPS3037-10  MR30371MC 114927 INT-3037-Reg HCR33/10C Z6037MN R01
20-30 20-30 20-30 Gallon 30 20-30 20-30 20-30 Gallon 20-30 GAL
 30x37  30x37 30"x37" 30x37 30x37 30"x37" 30x37 30x37

Thickness:  10 micron  10 mic  10 Microns  10 mic  10 mic  10 Mic  10 mic  10 MIC 
15 15# 14.86# 15.4 15 14.86 Nominal 12.6 lbs 15.1
40 10 30 30 N/A 30 30

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

33 GALLON, 33” X 40”, 14 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                      25.99  $                      18.90  $                      25.48  $                      10.70  $                      27.44  $                      17.48  $                      27.45  $                      13.95 

500 500 500 10/25 (20/25) 500 500 250/CS
 $                  0.05198  $                        0.04  $                      25.48  $                    0.0428  $                      27.44  $                      17.48  $                    0.1372  $                    0.0558 

Roll Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9930279 CP3340N14  DPS3340-14  MR33402MC 112102 INT-3340-Med SON334014C Z6640HN R01
33 33 33 Gallon 33 33 33 33 Gallon 33 GAL

 33x40  33x40  33"x40"  33x40  33x40  33"x40"  33x40  33x40 
Thickness:  14 micron  14 mic  14 Microns  12 mic  13 mic  14 mic  14 MIC 

25 24.9# 24.93# 11.1 23.2 24.93 Nominal 22.4 lbs 12.5
50 15 50 45 N/A 50 55

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer
33 GALLON, 33” X 40”, 17 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                      15.18  $                      14.40  $                      30.98  $                      14.13  $                      16.88  $                      20.82  $                      17.15  $                      17.18 

250 500 500 10/25 (10/25) 500 250 250/CS
 $                  0.07536  $                      0.029  $                      30.98  $                    0.0561  $                      16.88  $                      20.82  $                    0.0686  $                  0.06872 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9930668 CP3340N17  DPS3340-17  MR33403MC 114935 INT-3340-Med HCR40XC Z6640XN R01
33 33 33 Gallon 33 33 33 33 Gallon 33 GAL

 33x40  33x40  33"x40"  33x40  33x40  33"x40"  33x40  33x40 
Thickness:  17 micron  17 mic  17 Microns  16 mic  16 mic  17 mic  17 MIC 

15.2 30.3# 30.36# 14.5 14.27 30.36 Nominal 12..9 lbs 15.2
65 15 75 75 N/A 75 70

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

40-45 GALLON CORELESS, 40” X 48”, 16 MICRONS, 
BLACK, HIGH DENSITY CS  $                      17.94  $                      17.90  $                      21.24  $                      20.59  $                      24.56  $                      16.34  $                      23.19  $                      23.31 

250 250 250 10/25 (10/25) 250 250 250/CS
 $                    0.0792  $                      0.072  $                      21.24  $                    0.0824  $                      24.56  $                      16.34  $                    0.0927  $                  0.09324 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9970117 CP4048K16  DPS4048-16  MR40483MK 112104 INT-4048-H HCR48XC Z8048VK R01
40-45 40-45 40-45 Gallon 45 40-45 40-45 40-45 Gallon 40-45 GAL
 40x48  40x48  40"x48"  40x48 48x48 40"x48" 40x48 40x48

Thickness:  16 micron  16 mic  16 Micron  16 mic  16 mic  16 Mic  16 mic  16 MIC 
20.8 20.8# 20.76# 20.9 20.76 20.76 Nominal 18.7 lbs 21
75 15 75 75 N/A 75 75

30% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer

Li
ne

 # Polyethylene Can Liners

Capacity in Gallons:
28

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:

Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Item #:

Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

27

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:

26

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

25

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:
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Wholesale
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

55 GALLON, 38” X 60”, 17 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                      21.15  $                      17.30  $                      21.24  $                      19.57  $                      16.48  $                      21.99  $                      24.43 

200 200 200 8/25 200 200 200/CS
 $                  0.10575  $                        0.09  $                      21.24  $                    0.0979  $                      16.48  $                      0.109  $                      0.117 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Flat/Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

 9970040R  CP3860N17  DPS3860-17  MR38603MC  NO BID  INT-3860-H  HCR62XC  Z7660XN R01 
55 55 55 Gallon 60 55 55 Gallon 60 GAL

 38x60  38x60  38"x60"  38x60  38"x60"  38x58  38x60 
Thickness:  17 micron  17 mic  17 Micron  16 mic  17 Mic  17 mic  17 MIC 

21 20.9# 20.98# 19.9 20.98 Nominal 17.7 lbs 21
70 30 75 75 75 75

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

55 GALLON, 38” X 60”, 22 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                        20.9  $                      18.30  $                      27.98  $                      20.39  $                      24.06  $                      18.72  $                      21.99  $                      23.43 

150 150 200 10/15 (6/25) 200 150 200/CS
 $                  0.15086  $                      0.122  $                      27.98  $                    0.1359  $                      24.06  $                      18.72  $                    0.1466  $                      0.117 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat/Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

9970042 CP3860N22  DPS3860-22  MR38604MC 114950 INT-3860-X-Hby HCR625STC Z7660XN R01
55 55 55 Gallon 60 55 55 55 Gallon 55 GAL

 38x60  38x60  38"x60"  38x60  38x60  38"x60"  38x58  38x60 
Thickness:  22 micron  22 mic  22 Microns  22 mic  22 mic  22 Mic  17 mic  17 MIC 

20.4 20.3# 27.24# 20.7 20.34 27.24 Nominal 17.7 lbs 21.1
75 30 100 85 N/A 100 90

10% - 10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

56 GALLON, 43” X 48”, 17 MICRONS, CLEAR, HIGH 
DENSITY CS  $                      19.51  $                      17.30  $                      19.24  $                      17.75  $                      22.44  $                      13.32  $                      21.99  $                      21.20 

200 200 200 8x25 (8/25) 200 200 200/CS
 $                  0.11065  $                        0.09  $                      19.24  $                    0.0888  $                      22.44  $                  13.3200 $                   ,109  $                      0.106 

 Roll  Roll  Flat or Roll  Roll  Roll  Flat/Roll  Roll  Roll 
 Calico Industries, 

Inc.  Central Poly  Aluf Plastics  Pitt  PITT PLASTICS  Aluf  Colonial Bag  HERITAGE BAG 

 9970057R  CP4348N17  DPS4348-17  MR43483MC 114944 INT-4348-Med HCR47XC Z8648XN R01
56 56 56 Gallon 56 56 56 56 Gallon 56 GAL

 43x48  43x48  43"x48"  43x48  43x48  43"x48"  43x48  43x48 
Thickness:  17 micron  17 mic  17 Micron  16 mic  17 mic  17 Mic  17 mic  17 MIC 

19 19# 18.99# 18 18.97 18.99 16.5 lbs 19.1
70 20 100 75 N/A 75 75

10% -10% 10% & 10% 30% Recycled, 10% 
Post consumer 0% N/A 30% Recycled, 10% 

post consumer 10%

Li
ne

 # Polyethylene Can Liners

Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Brand Name:

Brand Name:

Item #:

Item #:

Net Case Weight:
Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Pack (Flat or Roll):

Weight Load in Pounds:

Recycled and Post Consumer Content:

31

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:

30

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Capacity in Gallons:

29

Packs / Units per Case:
Cost per Pack / Unit:
Pack (Flat or Roll):

Brand Name:

Item #:
Capacity in Gallons:
Dimensions:

Net Case Weight:
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

32  YES  YES  YES  YES  YES  YES  YES  YES  YES 
% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

33 10 20% 5%  See Attached 
Letter 50% 35% 50% 50 50%

34 HIGH DENSITY - Polyethylene Can Liners 20% 5%  See Attached 
Letter 50% 35% 50% 50 50%

1 10 Net 20 0 Net 30 0 30 0 0 30 0 30 0 20 0 Net 21
15-20 15 15 Bus 7-10 7 5-7 7-10 1-5

 Lines 2, 3, 4, 5 - 
*24x24 in MIL Non-

Existent 

*National Everything Wholesale bid 2 lines 1-5, 8, 9, 14, 16, 17, 26, 27, 29 and 31 are not 
in compliance with request.

NOTES

*Disposensave-Dispose 'N Save line 20 is not in compliance with request.

*Egan Supply Company lines 2-5, 8, 9, 14, 17, 20, 26, 27, 29 and 31 are not in compliance 
with request.

*Ferguson Enterprises Inc lines 2-6, 8, 9, 14, 17, 19, and 25-28 are not in compliance with 
request.

*Interboro Packaging lines 10 and 22 are not in compliance with request.

*Jiffy Supply lines 3-5, 21 and 23-31 are not in compliance with request.

*National Everything Wholesale bid 1 lines 1-6, 8-11, 13-16, 22, and 30 are not in 
compliance with request. 

Vendor can block availability of certain non-core items if requested by 
the State Purchasing Bureau (i e furniture office supplies):

LINEAR LOW DENSITY - Polyethylene Can Liners

Non-Core Items

Non-Core Items

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award
National Everything 

Wholesale
Unit Price

 $                      31.44 

50/CS
 $                        0.63 

 Flat 

 ELKAY 

 EK-EPC84101 
45 GALLONS

 40"X48" 
 4 Mil 
51.2

 $                        8.55 

500/CS
 $                      0.017 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

P2410XC
7-10 GAL

 24x23 
 .35 MIL 

6.44

 $                        9.13 

250/CS
 $                      0.037 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

P2420ZXC
7-10 GAL

 24x23 
 0.75 MIL 

6.9

 $                        9.13 

250
 $                      0.037 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

P2420ZXC
7-10 GAL

 24x23 
 0.75 MIL 

6.9
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award
National Everything 

Wholesale
Unit Price

 $                        8.55 

500/CS
 $                      0.017 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

B72410XK
7-10 GAL

 24x24 
 .35 MIL 

6.7

 $                      12.31 

100/CS
 $                    0.1231 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

E30372M
20-30 GAL

 30x37 
 2 MIL 
14.8

 $                      10.19 

100/CS
 $                    0.0968 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

E333913M
33 GAL
 33x39 
 1.3 MIL 

11.2

 $                      14.38 

125/CS
 $                      0.115 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTICS 

P4040XC
33 GAL
 33x39 
 1.3 MIL 

14
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award
National Everything 

Wholesale
Unit Price

 $                      14.23 

125/CS
 $                  0.11384 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

P4040XC
33 GAL
 33x39 
 1.3 MIL 

14

 $                      11.24 

100/CS
 $                    0.1124 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

EC333915K
33 GAL
 33x39 
 1.5 MIL 
12.87

 $                      13.33 

50/CS
 $                      0.266 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

P40482M
40-45 GAL

 40x48 
 2.0 MIL 

12.8

 $                      13.62 

50/CS
 $                    0.2724 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

 W40482M 
40-45 GAL

 40x48 
 2.0 MIL 

12.8
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award
National Everything 

Wholesale
Unit Price

 $                      11.29 

50/CS
 $                    0.2258 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

P4855XC
40-45 GAL

 40x48 
 1.80 MIL 

11.52

 $                      21.22 

100/CS
 $                    0.1808 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

EC404620K
40-45 GAL

 40x46 
 2 MIL 
24.53

 $                      18.08 

100/CS
 $                    0.1808 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

E36583M
55 GAL
 36x58 
 3 MIL 
41.76

 $                      13.35 

100/cs
 $                    0.1335 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

P4930XC
56 GAL
 4.5x48 
 .95 MIL 

13
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award
National Everything 

Wholesale
Unit Price

 $                      13.35 

100/CS
 $                    0.1335 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

EC434712K
56 GAL
 43x47 
 1.2 MIL 

16.2

 $                      14.38 

100/CS
 $                    0.1438 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

B76530XK
60 GAL
38x58

.95 MIL
14

 $                      19.09 

100/CS
 $                    0.1909 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

EC385815K
60 GAL
 38x58 
 1.5 MIL 
22.04

 $                      10.65 

1000/CS
 $                  0.01065 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR24240MC
7-10 GAL

 24x24 
 6 MIC 

9.4
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award
National Everything 

Wholesale
Unit Price

 $                      14.39 

1000/CS
 $                  0.01864 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR24240MC
7-10 GAL

 24x24 
 8 MIC 
12.52

 $                      12.86 

500/CS
 $                  0.02572 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR243311C
12-16 gal

 24x33 
 11 MIC 

12

 $                      19.36 

1000/CS
 $                  0.01936 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR24330MC
12-16 GAL

 24x33 
 8 MIC 
17.2

 $                      15.31 

500/CS
 $                  0.03062 

Roll

PITT PLASTIC

MR30371MC
20-30 GAL

30x37
10 MIC

15.1
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award
National Everything 

Wholesale
Unit Price

 $                      14.99 

500/CS
 $                  0.02998 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR30371MC
20-30 GAL

30x37
 10 MIC 

15.1

 $                      10.67 

250/CS
 $                  0.04268 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR33402MC
33 GAL
 33x40 
 12 MIC 

11

 $                      14.38 

250/CS
 $                  0.05752 

Roll

PITT PLASTIC

MR33403MC
33 GAL
33x40
16 MIC

14.4

 $                      19.70 

250
 $                    0.0788 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR40483MK
40-45 GAL

40x48
 16 MIC 

20.9
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Partial Award
National Everything 

Wholesale
Unit Price

 $                      19.51 

200/CS
 $                  0.09755 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

 MR38603MC 
55 GAL
 38x60 
 16 MIC 

20

 $                      20.54 

150/CS
 $                    0.1369 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR38604MC
55 GAL
 38x60 
 22 MIC 

20.4

 $                      17.69 

200/CS
 $                    0.0884 

 Roll 

 PITT PLASTIC 

MR43483MC
56 GAL
 43x48 
 16 MIC 

18
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Buyer:  Christie Kelly 5157 OF REBID
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/28/16

Please Enter 
"Yes" or "No"

 YES 
% OF DISCOUNT 
OFF REMAINDER 

OF CATALOG

50%

50%

0 Net 21
1-5

 Lines 2, 3, 4, 5 - 
*24x24 in MIL Non-

Existent 

No Bids

WasteZero
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