
Buyer: Annette Walton 5029 OF
Dept of Roads

Opening Date: June 1, 2015

Description Qty UOM Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 4' FLEXIBLE DELINEATOR POST
ONE SIDED 7,000 EA  $  26.00  $       182,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   22.32 $156,240.00  $    19.54 $136,780.00

2 4' FLEXIBLE DELINEATOR POST
TWO SIDED 3,000 EA  $  26.50  $         79,500.00  N/B  N/B  $   24.23 $72,690.00  $    21.15 $63,450.00

3 5' FLEXIBLE DELINEATOR POST
ONE SIDED 500 EA  $  29.00  $         14,500.00  N/B  N/B  $   24.22 $12,110.00  $    21.69 $10,845.00

4 5' FLEXIBLE DELINEATOR POST 
TWO SIDED 500 EA  $  30.00  $         15,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   26.13 $13,065.00  $    23.30 $11,650.00

5 6' FLEXIBLE DELINEATOR POST
ONE SIDED 500 EA  $  36.00  $         18,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   26.12 $13,060.00  $    23.63 $11,815.00

6 6' FLEXIBLE DELINEATOR POST
TWO SIDED 500 EA  $  37.00  $         18,500.00  N/B  N/B  $   28.03 $14,015.00  $    25.23 $12,615.00

7
TYPE II FLEXIBLE OBJECT 
MARKER
OM-2 ONE SIDED

13,764 EA  $  38.50  $       529,914.00  N/B  N/B  $   40.88 $562,672.32  $    32.51 $447,467.64

8
TYPE II FLEXIBLE OBJECT 
MARKER
OM-2 TWO SIDED

7,568 EA  $  39.95  $       302,341.60  N/B  N/B  $   60.03 $454,307.04  $    39.12 $296,060.16

9 TYPE III FLEXIBLE OBJECT
MARKER OM- 3L ONE SIDED 10,688 EA  $  49.95  $       533,865.60  N/B  N/B  $   73.99 $790,805.12  $    61.89 $661,480.32

10 TYPE III FLEXIBLE OBJECT
MARKER OM-3R TWO SIDED 11,243 EA  $  49.95  $       561,587.85  N/B  N/B  $   73.99 $831,869.57  $    61.89 $695,829.27

11 TYPE III FLEXIBLE OBJECT
MARKER OM-3LR TWO SIDED 22 EA  $  66.00  $           1,452.00  N/B  N/B  $ 128.37 $2,824.14  $    97.88 $2,153.36

12 SHORT FLAT MOUNT GUARDRAIL
DELINEATOR ONE SIDED 2,000 EA  $    9.00  $         18,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   11.98 $23,960.00  $    10.13 $20,260.00

13 SHORT FLAT MOUNT GUARDRAIL
DELINEATOR TWO SIDED 6,000 EA  $  10.00  $         60,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   12.77 $76,620.00  $    10.81 $64,860.00

14 TALL FLAT MOUNT GUARDRAIL
DELINEATOR ONE SIDED 500 EA  $  11.00  $           5,500.00  N/B  N/B  $   13.74 $6,870.00  $    12.10 $6,050.00

15 TALL FLAT MOUNT GUARDRAIL
DELINEATOR TWO SIDED 500 EA  $  12.00  $           6,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   14.55 $7,275.00  $    12.78 $6,390.00

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Shur-Tite ProductsJ & A Traffic Products Midwest Service and 
Sales Co

IMPACT RECOVERY 
SYSTEMS, INC.

Li
ne

 # Flexible Delineators and Object Markers
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16 SHORT CABLE BARRIER
DELINEATOR ONE SIDED 1,000 EA  $    9.00  $           9,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   16.62 $16,620.00  $    13.45 $13,450.00

17 SHORT CABLE BARRIER
DELINEATOR TWO SIDED 1,000 EA  $  10.00  $         10,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   17.42 $17,420.00  $    14.13 $14,130.00

18 TALL CABLE BARRIER
DELINEATOR ONE SIDED 500 EA  $  11.00  $           5,500.00  N/B  N/B  $   18.06 $9,030.00  $    15.42 $7,710.00

19 TALL CABLE BARRIER
DELINEATOR TWO SIDED 500 EA  $  12.00  $           6,000.00  N/B  N/B  $   18.86 $9,430.00  $    16.10 $8,050.00

20 CONCRETE BARRIER 
DELINEATOR ONE SIDED 4,000 EA  NO BID  N/B  N/B  $   11.66 $46,640.00  $      9.80 $39,200.00

21 CONCRETE BARRIER 
DELINEATOR TWO SIDED 5,000 EA  NO BID  N/B  N/B  $   12.47 $62,350.00  $    10.48 $52,400.00

22 2" SQUARE POST DRIVER HEAD
W/1-18" SHANK 200 EA  NO BID  $217.00  $        43,400.00  $ 203.80 $40,760.00  $  183.51 $36,702.00

23 2" SQUARE POST DRIVER 
SLIDE HAMMER 200 EA  NO BID  $463.00  $        92,600.00  $ 226.55 $45,310.00  $  205.66 $41,132.00

$512.85 $    2,376,661.05 $680.00 $      136,000.00 1,106.79 $3,285,943.19 $942.20 $2,660,479.75
0% 30

4545
-% 30 0%

4545
0% 0

Total

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
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Spec. Line 1. 
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK48BR2-1Y or 1W
Spec. Line 2.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be
DK48BR2-2Y or 2W
Spec. Line 3.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK60BR2-1Y or 1W
Spec. Line 4.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK60BR2-2Y or 2W
Spec. Line 5.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK72BR2-1Y or 1W
Spec. Line 6.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK72BR2-2Y or 2W

Spec. Line 22.A.
DS6112LRDC17500LR
Bidding xcessories squared 
product
1 1/8"x6" shank - 
DS61125LR
2" CAP DC175200LR
Products are currently being 
used by NDOR
Spec. Line 23.
A. MD-30-LR
B. DC175200LR
Bidding xcessories squared 
product
Slide Hammer - MD-30-LR
2" CAP DC175200LR
Products are currently being 
used by NDOR 

Spec. Line 1. 
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK48BR2-1Y or 1W
Spec. Line 2.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be
DK48BR2-2Y or 2W
Spec. Line 3.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK60BR2-1Y or 1W
Spec. Line 4.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK60BR2-2Y or 2W
Spec. Line 5.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK72BR2-1Y or 1W
Spec. Line 6.
The Shur-Tite part 
number for this item 
should be 
DK72BR2-2Y or 2W

Comments Spec. Line 12.D.
GRD1-19-hy1 
Impact Recovery Systems, 
Inc.
Spec. Line 13.D.
GRD1-19-HW1-HW1
Impact Recovery Systems, 
Inc.
Spec. Line 16.D.
GRD2-19-HY1
Impact Recovery Systems, 
Inc.
Spec. Line 17.D.
GRD2-19-HW1-HY1
Impact Recovery Systems, 
Inc.
Spec. Line 18.D.
GRD2-35-HY1
Impact Recovery Systems, 
Inc.
Spec. Line 19.D.
GRD2-35-HW1-HY1
Spec. Line 20.  NO BID
Spec. Line 21. NO BID
Spec. Line 22. NO BID
Spec. Line 23. NO BID
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