
Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 4896 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/17/15

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-3 
NIOBRARA YARD 
JCT HWY 12 & 14 

NORTH SIDE

 $ 2,000.0000 TN No Bid NB  $             24.14  $      48,280.00 

2

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-3 
JCT HWY 14 & 84 

NW SIDE

 $ 1,350.0000 TN No Bid NB  $             25.71  $      34,708.50 

3

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-3 
JCT HWY 14 & 20 

SW SIDE  

 $ 2,600.0000 TN No Bid NB  $             28.13  $      73,138.00 

4

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-3 

NELIGH YARD 
910 E HWY 275 

NELIGH NE 68756 

 $ 2,000.0000 TN No Bid NB  $             30.56  $      61,120.00 

5

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-3 
HWY 59 MP 48.1 

SCALE AREA 

 $ 1,550.0000 TN No Bid NB  $             26.57  $      41,183.50 

6

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-3 

HWY 15 MP 
195.92 LEFT SIDE 

 $ 1,000.0000 TN No Bid NB  $             24.71  $      24,710.00 

7

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-3 
HWY 12 MP 227.3 

RIGHT SIDE 

 $ 1,900.0000 TN No Bid NB  $             26.42  $      50,198.00 

Li
ne

 # Chip Seal (Ledge Rock) Aggregate Spencer Quarries Inc.K 4 Trucking LLCHILLS MATERIALS COMPANY

PARTIAL AWARDPARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD
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8

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-3 

LAUREL YARD 
214 HWY 20 N 

LAUREL NE 
68745 

 $ 1,500.0000 TN No Bid  $                  -    $             27.42  $      41,130.00 

9

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-5 
JCT 20 & 385 3MI 
W OF CHADRON 

 $ 2,000.0000 TN  $             30.68  $      61,360.00  $             41.12  $      82,240.00  $             54.75  $    109,500.00 

10

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-5 
HWY 2 MP 76 8MI 
N OF ALLIANCE 

 $ 1,300.0000 TN  $             40.90  $      53,170.00  $             38.36  $      49,868.00  $             57.25  $      74,425.00 

11

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-6 
OGALLALA YARD 

307 EAST D ST 
SO OGALLALA NE 

69153

 $ 2,000.0000 TN No Bid  $             47.58  $      95,160.00  $             56.75  $    113,500.00 

12

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-8 
JCT 20 & 275 AT 

SCALES  

 $ 1,700.0000 TN No Bid N.B.  $             31.87  $      54,179.00 

13

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-8 
ATKINSON YARD 

504 NO 
CARBERRY ST 
ATKINSON NE 

68713 

 $ 3,000.0000 TN No Bid N.B.  $             32.33  $      96,990.00 
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14

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-8 
BURWELL YARD 
SO JCT N-11 & 

N-91 82403 
STATE HWY 11 
BURWELL NE 

68823 

 $ 1,000.0000 TN No Bid N.B.  $             36.50  $      36,500.00 

15

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-8 
BARTLETT YARD 
1 BLOCK W OF 

JCT HWY 281 210 
RANDOLPH ST 
BARTLETT NE 

68622

 $ 1,000.0000 TN No Bid N.B.  $             36.50  $      36,500.00 

16

CHIP SEAL 
LEDGE ROCK D-8 

HWY 281 N OF 
SPENCER 

 $ 1,300.0000 TN No Bid N.B.  $             26.33  $      34,229.00 

17

PRICE PER MILE 
FOR ALTERNATE 

DELIVERY 
LOCATIONS

 $ 1,000.0000 TN No Bid  $           0.1475  $           147.50  $               0.14  $           140.00 

$             71.58 $    114,530.00 $           127.21 $    227,415.50 $           546.08 $    930,431.00 
0 N30

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

45 30
0 0

** Per Specifications

**
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