
Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 4894 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/12/15

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 CRS-2P DIST 1 4449.0000 TN No Bid  $    485.00  $   2,157,765.00 No Bid  $           447.07  $   1,989,014.43 
2 CRS-2P DIST 3 7863.0000 TN No Bid  $    562.21  $   4,420,657.23 No Bid  $           428.52  $   3,369,452.76 
3 CRS-2P DIST 4 5792.0000 TN No Bid  $    452.00  $   2,617,984.00 No Bid  $           482.63  $   2,795,392.96 
4 CRS-2P DIST 6 4632.0000 TN No Bid  $    477.00  $   2,209,464.00 No Bid  $           496.72  $   2,300,807.04 
5 CRS-2P DIST 8 1790.0000 TN No Bid  $    494.00  $      884,260.00 No Bid  $           456.44  $      817,027.60 

6 CRS-2P PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           445.00  $        44,945.00 

7 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
PLANT PICK UP 51.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           395.00  $        20,145.00 

8 CRS-2VHL DIST 7 1885.0000 TN  $     514.00  $968,890.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           575.70  $   1,085,194.50 

9 CRS-2VHL 
PLANT PICK UP 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           525.00  $        53,025.00 

10 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 1 498.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           261.61  $      130,281.78 

11 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 3 52.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           251.28  $        13,066.56 

12 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 5 26.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           319.40  $          8,304.40 

13 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 6 363.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           291.03  $      105,643.89 

14 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 7 214.0000 TN No Bid No Bid  $           299.65  $        64,125.10 

15 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 8 777.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           270.42  $      210,116.34 

16 CSS-1H 50/50 
PLANT PICK UP 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           235.00  $        23,735.00 

17 CSS-1H 75/25 
DIST 8 400.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           399.66  $      159,864.00 

18 CSS-1H 75/25 
PLANT PICK UP 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           365.00  $        36,865.00 

19 CSS-1H 
STRAIGHT DIST 5 77.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           550.40  $        42,380.80 

20 CSS-1H 
STRAIGHT DIST 7 178.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           527.51  $        93,896.78 

HILLS MATERIALS 
COMPANYFlint Hills Resources, LP

Li
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Material Jebro, Inc.Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, 
Inc.

PARTIAL AWARD
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Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 4894 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/12/15

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

HILLS MATERIALS 
COMPANYFlint Hills Resources, LP

Li
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Material Jebro, Inc.Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, 
Inc.

21
CSS-1H 

STRAIGHT 
PLANT PICK UP

101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           460.00  $        46,460.00 

22 HFE-150 DIST 3 151.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           466.99  $        70,515.49 
23 HFE-150 DIST 5 2613.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid  $     534.70  $ 1,397,171.10  $           493.44  $   1,289,358.72 
24 HFE-150 DIST 7 26.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           517.26  $        13,448.76 
25 HFE-150 DIST 8 26.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           482.17  $        12,536.42 

26 HFE-150 PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           450.00  $        45,450.00 

27 HFE-300 DIST 4 1485.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           487.48  $      723,907.80 
28 HFE-300 DIST 5 26.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid  $     634.88  $      16,506.88  $           508.08  $        13,210.08 
29 HFE-300 DIST 6 2243.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           510.14  $   1,144,244.02 
30 HFE-300 DIST 7 660.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           509.81  $      336,474.60 
31 HFE-300 DIST 8 203.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           494.86  $      100,456.58 

32 HFE-300 PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           470.00  $        47,470.00 

33 HFE-1000 DIST 4 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           494.32  $        49,926.32 
34 HFE-1000 DIST 5 51.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid  $     655.88  $      33,449.88  $           528.08  $        26,932.08 
35 HFE-1000 DIST 6 51.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           520.97  $        26,569.47 
36 HFE-1000 DIST 7 51.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           534.26  $        27,247.26 
37 HFE-1000 DIST 8 884.0000 TN No Bid No Bid  $           502.54  $      444,245.36 

38 HFE-1000 PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           490.00  $        49,490.00 

39 MC-250 DIST 4 80.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           742.94  $        59,435.20 
40 MC-250 DIST 6 105.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           763.85  $        80,204.25 
41 MC-250 DIST 8 130.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           738.14  $        95,958.20 

42 MC-250 PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $           720.00  $        72,720.00 

43 DEMURRAGE 1.0000 HR  $       70.00  $         70.00  $      75.00  $               75.00 No Bid  $           160.00  $             160.00 
 $     584.00 $968,960.00 $ 2,545.21 $ 12,290,205.23  $  1,825.46 $ 1,447,127.86 $      20,068.37 $ 18,139,704.55 

1
0 30

Line 43: $70/hour

1

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

1
Net 45

Total

**
0 N30

**Per Specifications 
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Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 4894 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/12/15

Description Qty UOM
1 CRS-2P DIST 1 4449.0000 TN
2 CRS-2P DIST 3 7863.0000 TN
3 CRS-2P DIST 4 5792.0000 TN
4 CRS-2P DIST 6 4632.0000 TN
5 CRS-2P DIST 8 1790.0000 TN

6 CRS-2P PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN

7 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
PLANT PICK UP 51.0000 TN

8 CRS-2VHL DIST 7 1885.0000 TN

9 CRS-2VHL 
PLANT PICK UP 101.0000 TN

10 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 1 498.0000 TN

11 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 3 52.0000 TN

12 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 5 26.0000 TN

13 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 6 363.0000 TN

14 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 7 214.0000 TN

15 CSS-1H 50/50 
DIST 8 777.0000 TN

16 CSS-1H 50/50 
PLANT PICK UP 101.0000 TN

17 CSS-1H 75/25 
DIST 8 400.0000 TN

18 CSS-1H 75/25 
PLANT PICK UP 101.0000 TN

19 CSS-1H 
STRAIGHT DIST 5 77.0000 TN

20 CSS-1H 
STRAIGHT DIST 7 178.0000 TN

Li
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Material

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
No Bid No Bid  $                  -    $           585.00  $ 2,602,665.00 
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $           420.00  $      21,420.00 $                  -   

 $           499.72  $    941,972.20  $           492.00  $    927,420.00 $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           262.40  $    130,675.20  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           256.51  $      13,338.52  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           322.12  $        8,375.12  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           367.90  $    133,547.70  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           308.14  $      65,941.96  $           304.00  $      65,056.00 $                  -   

 $           272.00  $    211,344.00  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           350.00  $      35,350.00  $           270.00  $      27,270.00 $                  -   

 $           367.26  $    146,904.00  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           400.00  $      40,400.00  $           405.00  $      40,905.00 $                  -   

 $           520.00  $      40,040.00  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           461.40  $      82,129.20  $           455.00  $      80,990.00 $                  -   

Martin Resource Management 
Corp. DBA Monarch Oil

Simon Contractors DBA 
Mountain States

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Vance Brothers, Inc

Page 3 of 4



Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 4894 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/12/15

Description Qty UOMLi
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Material

21
CSS-1H 

STRAIGHT 
PLANT PICK UP

101.0000 TN

22 HFE-150 DIST 3 151.0000 TN
23 HFE-150 DIST 5 2613.0000 TN
24 HFE-150 DIST 7 26.0000 TN
25 HFE-150 DIST 8 26.0000 TN

26 HFE-150 PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN

27 HFE-300 DIST 4 1485.0000 TN
28 HFE-300 DIST 5 26.0000 TN
29 HFE-300 DIST 6 2243.0000 TN
30 HFE-300 DIST 7 660.0000 TN
31 HFE-300 DIST 8 203.0000 TN

32 HFE-300 PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN

33 HFE-1000 DIST 4 101.0000 TN
34 HFE-1000 DIST 5 51.0000 TN
35 HFE-1000 DIST 6 51.0000 TN
36 HFE-1000 DIST 7 51.0000 TN
37 HFE-1000 DIST 8 884.0000 TN

38 HFE-1000 PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN

39 MC-250 DIST 4 80.0000 TN
40 MC-250 DIST 6 105.0000 TN
41 MC-250 DIST 8 130.0000 TN

42 MC-250 PLANT 
PICK UP 101.0000 TN

43 DEMURRAGE 1.0000 HR

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Martin Resource Management 
Corp. DBA Monarch Oil

Simon Contractors DBA 
Mountain States Vance Brothers, Inc

 $           480.00  $      48,480.00  $           430.00  $      43,430.00 $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   
No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

No Bid No Bid  $                  -   $                  -   

 $           195.00  $           195.00  $           115.00  $           115.00 $                  -   
$        5,062.45 $ 1,898,692.90 $        2,891.00  $ 1,206,606.00 $           585.00 $ 2,602,665.00 

0 30
per spec

0 30
per spec

N/A
2
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