
Buyer: Dianna Gilliland Revised 
4807 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 09/23/2014

Primary 
Award

Alternate 
Secondary 

Award

E85 Award Secondary 
Award

Anderson 
Ford

Gene Steffy 
Chrysler 
Center

Husker Auto 
Group, Inc.

Performance 
Dodge

Performance 
Toyota-Scion 

of LaVista

Sid Dillon 
Chev Buick

Superior 
Honda

QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
 $   17,417.00  $   18,953.00  $17,850.00

+ $177.00 
steel spare 

tire
 = $18,027.00 

 $    18,244.00  $    20,045.84  $   17,730.00  $   21,399.00 

Ford Chrysler Chevrolet Chrysler Toyota 2014.5 Chevrolet Honda
Fusion 200 Malibu Fleet 200 Camry Malibu Accord

POG,100A,S UFCH41/
Limited

Malibu-1GB69-
Base LS

LX' 'UFCE41' LE IGB69,L$,
1FL

2015, 
CR2F3FEW,

LX

2.5L 2.4L I4 LKW-2.5L 4 
Cylinder

2.4L I4 2.5L 4 2.5L 2.4L I4

22 city/34 
highway

23/36 C25/36H 24-35 25/35 25 city-36 hwy 24C/34H/
27 Comb

90-120 90/120 35/125 90-120 30 40-90 90-120/days

 N/A  $   21,044.00  NA  $    18,244.00  No Bid 
3.6L V6 2.4 L I4 FFV
Chrysler Chrysler

200 200
UFFL41/

AWD
LX' 'UFCE41'

19/32 24-35
90/120 90-120

 $     2,995.00  $     2,091.00 
ADD 

 NA  NA  STD  N/A  N/A 

1.5L Ecoboost  3.6L V6 2.5L 4

4  N/A  N/A  NA NA  N/A N/A N/ABench front seat, heavy duty.

1

Specify Engine Size:

Engine:

EA

Delivery time after receipt of order 
(number/days):

Delivery time after receipt of order 
(number/days):
E85 COMPACT 4 DOOR SEDAN
Engine:
Make:

1

Series, Code, Trim Level:

3

Model:

2

Li
ne

 #

Description

2015 or Current Production Year Compact 4 Door 
Sedan

COMPACT 4 DOOR SEDAN

Make:
Model:

1

EPA:

EA

Series, Code, Trim Level:

EPA:

BID OPTION LIST
Engine (other).
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland Revised 
4807 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 09/23/2014

Primary 
Award

Alternate 
Secondary 

Award

E85 Award Secondary 
Award

Anderson 
Ford

Gene Steffy 
Chrysler 
Center

Husker Auto 
Group, Inc.

Performance 
Dodge

Performance 
Toyota-Scion 

of LaVista

Sid Dillon 
Chev Buick

Superior 
Honda

QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 #

Description

2015 or Current Production Year Compact 4 Door 
Sedan

5  N/A  Bucket Only  NA NA  N/A N/A N/A
6  N/A  $        950.00  $       427.00

Buckets 
 NA  STD  N/A  N/A 

7 std  STD std STD STD  $        180.00 STD

8  N/A  N/A  $        217.00  N/A  N/A   $        228.00  N/A 
9  $        195.00  $        150.00  $        159.00  $         160.00  $         441.00  $          83.00 N/A (included 

w/key)
10 std 

see attach.
 N/C NC-

see attached
SEE 

ATTACHED
STD see attached STD

11  $       395.00
see attach 

 N/App NA SEE 
ATTACHED

STD see attached N/A

12  N/A $    6,192.00 
ADD

 NA  NO BID  N/A  N/A  N/A 

13  $        395.00  $        100.00  $       499.00
Dealer 

 N/A  STD
BACK UP 
CAMERA 

 $        395.00  $       729.00
(backup 

camera std) 
14  std  $        300.00  std  STD  STD  $        180.00  STD 

15  $        125.00  $        150.00  $          67.00  $           60.00  $         110.00  $          83.00  $        110.00 

 $     2,995.00  $     2,840.00  NC   NO BID  STD  $     1,056.00
(non mfr 
warranty) 

5/100,000
Ford Premium 

Care

 5/100,000 
$100 

Deductible 

5/100,000
 Power Train

5/60,000  8/100,000 

Split front seat, heavy duty.

Full-size spare tire (rim can be steel).

Stability traction control system (if not available as 
standard equipment).

Standard Paint- Attach list and Identify as No Additional 
Cost Paints.

Power heavy duty split front seats.

Additional fob if equipped with keyless remote entry.

AWD - All Wheel Drive, if available from factory.

State: YEARS: __________ MILES: __________

 Call for 
Options 

Keyless Remote Entry -  Shall include two (2) fully 
functional keys and fobs to enter and operate the 
vehicle.

Extra Cost Paint- Attach list and Identify as Extra Cost 
Paints.

16

Additonal fully functional key that enters and operates 
the vehicle.

Reverse sensing system.

Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer.
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Opening Date: 09/23/2014

Primary 
Award

Alternate 
Secondary 

Award

E85 Award Secondary 
Award

Anderson 
Ford

Gene Steffy 
Chrysler 
Center

Husker Auto 
Group, Inc.

Performance 
Dodge

Performance 
Toyota-Scion 

of LaVista

Sid Dillon 
Chev Buick

Superior 
Honda

QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 #

Description

2015 or Current Production Year Compact 4 Door 
Sedan

17  $        295.00  $        500.00  $        500.00  $         400.00  STD  $        400.00  1.25/mile 
from Lincoln 

18  $        295.00  $        275.00  $        197.00  NO BID  $         243.00  $        228.00  $        269.00 

19  std 
Drivers 

 $       375.00
each seat 

 std  NO BID  STD  $       397.00
Driver-Power 

 N/A 

0/30  0/30 0/15 0 0/30 0/30 none
90-120 90-120 35-125 30 40-90 90-120

Alternate Award Explanation: The Secondary contract awarded to Sid Dillon Chev Buick has been 
canceled.  An Alternate Secondary contract has been awarded to the next lowest bidder, Husker Auto 
Group.  

Due to the build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles may consist of a Primary Award which is 
awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications, and a Secondary Award which may be 
awarded to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model meeting specifications.

Delivery days ARO:
Comments:

Protective vinyl body molding: dealer installed if not 
standard equipment.
Lumbar support front seats: if not standard equipment.

Payment Terms:

Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln area. 
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment 
outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would 
be for vehicles bought by political entities  and other 
Divisions of Government.
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