
Buyer:  Christie Kelly 4784 OF 
Health and Human Services

Opening Date:  09/09/14

Description Qty UOM  Unit Price  Ext. Price 
Brand and 

Model Number 
Bid

 Unit Price  Ext. Price 
Brand and 

Model Number 
Bid

 Unit Price  Ext. Price 
Brand and 

Model Number 
Bid

Towel, 24” x 50” minimum, 10.5# 
minimum per dozen 86/14 
 cotton/poly, cam border, solid 
pastel colors in white, blue and/or 
green.

550 DZ  No Bid No Bid  $          29.75  $   16,362.50 Tabb BT308  No Bid  No Bid 

2

Towel, hand 16” x 27” minimum, 
3# minimum per dozen minimum, 
86/14 cotton/poly minimum, solid 
pastel colors in white, blue and/or 
green. 

100 DZ  No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Washcloth, 12” x 12”, 1# minimum 
per dozen, 100% cotton, cam 
border, white.

6000 DZ
 $0.46

$5.52 per 
DZ 

 $   33,120.00 46894100  $            3.25  $   19,500.00 Tabb WC520  $            2.59  $   15,540.00 UMI121210

Utility Towel/Bar Mop, 14-17" X 17-
20", 100 % cotton, white with or 
without colored center stripe.

50 DZ
  $0.43

$5.16 per 
DZ  

 $        258.00 40792403  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Leak-proof Laundry Bag, 30” x 40”, 
drawstring closure, tapered 
waterproof bag is meant to handle 
wet linen, solid colors in white, 
blue, green and/or yellow.  Must 
withstand institutional laundering.

24 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

6

Laundry Bag, 200 denier nylon, 30” 
x 40”, drawstring closure, solid 
colors in white, blue, green and/or 
yellow. Must withstand institutional 
laundering.

24 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Pillowcase, 42" x 34", thread count 
minimum 180, 55/45 cotton/poly 
minimum, crease resistant, solid 
pastel colors in white, blue and/or 
green.

20 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  $          10.95  $        219.00 Tabb PC195  No Bid  No Bid 

LAUNDRY BAGS:

PILLOWCASES:

UTILITY TOWEL/BAR MOP:

WASHCLOTHS:

5

7

TOWELS:

Line 
#

Institutional Dry Goods and Household Products

1

3

4

AWARD
Standard Textile Company Inc. Tabb Textile Co. Inc. AWARD

Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.
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Mattress Pad, 36” x 76”, fitted, 13.5 
oz. per sq. yard, 50/50  cotton/poly 
minimum, whip-stitched edges, 
unbleached.

2 DZ
  $8.92

$107.04 per 
DZ  

 $        214.08 55072121  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

9

Mattress Pad, 36” x 80” fitted, 
50/50 cotton/poly blend top and 
bottom, quilted, 5 oz. fill per sq. yd. 
12” elastic skirt, white. 

10 DZ
  $8.92

$107.04 per 
DZ  

 $     1,070.40 55072121  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

10

Mattress Pad, 39” x 75”, fitted, 
50/50 cotton/poly blend top and 
bottom, quilted, 5 oz. fill per sq. yd. 
12” elastic skirt, white

10 DZ
  $8.92

$107.04 per 
DZ  

 $     1,070.40 55072121  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Fitted Infiknit Sheet, manufactured 
by Fazal Textile or equivalent, 
jersey knit fitted bottom sheet or 
equivalent, 36” x 84” x 12”, 55/45 
cotton/poly minimum, not less than 
24 oz., white. 

10 DZ
  $6.36

$76.32 per 
DZ  

 $        763.20 07251500  No Bid  No Bid  $          74.19  $        741.90 UMISknitted24

12

Fitted bottom sheet, 36” x 80” x 9”, 
50/50 cotton/poly, thread count 
minimum 180, 1.1# minimum, solid 
pastel colors in white, blue and/or 
green.

11 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Sheet, flat, 66" x 108", 50/50 
cotton/poly minimum, thread count, 
minimum 180, 1.3# minimum, solid 
pastel colors in white, blue and/or 
green.

10 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  $          57.00  $        570.00 Tabb PS175  No Bid  No Bid 

Draw sheet, thread count minimum 
180, 54" x 72", 55/45 cotton/poly, 
white.

74 DZ
  $4.15

$49.80 per 
DZ  

 $     3,685.20 03941102  No Bid  No Bid  $          36.54  $     2,703.96 UMISP5472

DRAW SHEET:

FITTED BOTTOM SHEETS:

MATTRESS PADS:

8

FLAT SHEETS:

11

13

14
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Standard breathable patient 
positioner standard, 40” x 68-72”, 
50/50 cotton/poly minimum, twill 
surface with breathable taffeta 
backing, white with backing in any 
color.

5 DZ
  $10.27

$123.24 per 
DZ  

 $        616.20 26390000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

16

Bariatric breathable patient 
positioner standard, 47” x 72”, 
50/50 cotton/poly minimum, twill 
surface with breathable taffeta 
backing, white with backing in any 
color.

2 DZ
  $10.27

$123.24 per 
DZ  

 $        246.48 26390000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Bedspread, fitted, 68-70” wide, x 
110” long (finished 
measurements), 36” centers with 
9” foot drop and approximately 14-
16” side drops, wavy diamond cam 
pattern, 5 oz. fill, no cording, white 
poly/cotton lining (no seams), ½” 
single-needle hem, solid colors in 
white, blue, brown and/or green.

20 EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

  $21.22
$254.64 per 

DZ  
 $   10,185.60 32090100

(white) 

  $25.49
$305.88 per 

DZ  
 $   12,235.20 32090138

(blue) 

  $23.23
$278.76 per 

DZ  
 $   11,150.40 32090177

(green)

19

Bedspread, 
Dreamcord™/Cannacord™ or 
equivalent, ribbed style spread, 76” 
x 110”, 55/45 cotton/poly, 2.25#, 
solid colors in white, blue and/or 
green.

15 DZ
  $17.15

$205.80 per 
DZ  

 $     3,087.00 32183100  
32183135  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

BEDSPREADS FOR HOSPITAL SIZE BEDS:

18

Bedspread, throw, 68-70” wide x 
110 long (finished measurements), 
wavy diamond cam pattern, 5 oz. 
fill, no cording, white poly/cotton 
lining (no seams), ½” single needle 
hem, solid colors in white, blue, 
brown and/or green.

40 EA

15

PATIENT POSITIONER:

 No Bid  No Bid 

17

 No Bid  No Bid 
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  $17.26
$207.12 per 

DZ  
 $     4,142.40 78470400

(white)

  $19.38
$232.56 per 

DZ  
        4,651.20 78470430

(blue)

  $18.81
$225.72 per 

DZ  
 $     4,514.40 78470300

(white)

  $21.36
$256.32 per 

DZ  
 $     5,126.40  78470330

(blue)

Bath Blanket, 70-72” x 90”, 82-88% 
cotton, 12-18% polyester, white.   30 DZ

  $10.68
$128.16 per 

DZ  
 $     3,844.80 80060111  No Bid  No Bid  $          50.23  $     1,506.90 UMIBBathB14

Patient Gown, 55/45 cotton/poly, 
EZ tie, unisex colors and patterns, 
sizes small to 2XL.

25 DZ
  $5.75

$69.00 per 
DZ  

 $     1,725.00 74GG2460  No Bid  No Bid  $          65.28  $     1,632.00 UMI 89-1

24
Patient Gown, 55/45 cotton/poly, 
EZ tie, unisex colors and patterns, 
sizes 3XL to 10XL.

5 DZ
  $8.96

$107.52 per 
DZ  

 $        537.60 74549730  No Bid  No Bid  $        159.12  $        795.60 UMI 89-1

Washable Terry Cloth Skimmer 
Slipper, closed toe, cushioned 
sole, ribbed plastic bottom, 
Women’s sizes small-XL (5 ½-9 
½), solid pastel colors in white, 
blue and/or pink.  

12 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          57.51  $        690.12 UMI4049L

26

Terry Cloth Espadrille Slipper, 
closed-toe, cushioned soles, 
plastic ribbed bottom, Men’s sizes 
small-XL (7-13), solid dark colors 
in blue, black and/or brown.

12 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          57.51  $        690.12 UMI4049M

GOWNS:

SLIPPERS:

BATH BLANKET:

20 DZ  No Bid    

22

23

Woven Spread Blanket, 74” x 96”, 
55/45 cotton/poly, 3.5#, minimum, 
solid colors in white, blue and/or 
green.

20 DZ

SPREAD BLANKETS FOR HOSPITAL SIZE BEDS:

20
 No Bid No Bid

 No Bid 

Woven Spread Blanket, 74” x 108”, 
55/45 cotton/poly, 4# minimum, 
solid colors in white, blue and/or 
green.

25

21  No Bid  No Bid    

No Bid No Bid 
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Slipper Socks. Double-Imprinted 
on smooth side of terry cloth fabric 
with comfort cuff. Pillow Paws or 
equivalent, washable, Adult sizes 5-
7, XL 7 1/2-10, XXL 10 ½+, 
assorted solid colors.

500 PR  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

28

Slipper Socks. Double-Imprinted 
on smooth side of terry cloth fabric 
with comfort cuff. Pillow Paws or 
equivalent, washable, Adult 
Bariatric XXXL, assorted solid 
colors.

96 PR  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

29

Men's ankle sock, Fruit of the 
Loom M4595WX-L1 or equivalent, 
85% cotton, 15% poly or nylon, 1% 
spandex, 1% other fiber, reinforced 
heel and toe, smooth toe seam, 
men’s shoe sizes 10-13, white.

60 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          15.40  $        924.00 Fruit of the 
Loom

30

Men's ankle sock, Fruit of the 
Loom M4595WX-L1 or equivalent, 
85% cotton, 15% poly or nylon, 1% 
spandex, 1% other fiber, reinforced 
heel and toe, smooth toe seam, 
men’s shoe sizes 14-16, white.

20 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          17.44  $        348.80 Fruit of the 
Loom

31

Women's crew athletic sock, Fruit 
of the Loom F8095W6 or 
equivalent 85% cotton, 13% 
polyester, 1% spandex, 1% other 
fiber, reinforced heal and toe, sizes 
9-11, white.

20 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          15.24  $        304.80 Fruit of the 
Loom

32

Women's crew athletic sock, Fruit 
of the Loom F8095W6 or 
equivalent 85% cotton, 13% 
polyester, 1% spandex, 1% other 
fiber, reinforced heal and toe, sizes 
10-12, white.

20 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          17.26  $        345.20 Fruit of the 
Loom

SOCKS:

27
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33

Women's ankle athletic sock, Fruit 
of the Loom F4086W6 or 
equivalent 81% cotton, 16% 
polyester, 1% Spandex, 1% other 
fiber, sizes 9-11, white.

30 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          11.77  $        353.10 Fruit of the 
Loom

34

Women's ankle athletic sock, Fruit 
of the Loom F4086W6 or 
equivalent 81% cotton, 16% 
polyester, 1% Spandex, 1% other 
fiber, sizes 10-12, white.

30 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          16.07  $        482.10 Fruit of the 
Loom

35

Fruit of the Loom M1218WX or 
equivalent, Tube Sock, over-the-
calf, snug ankle leg bands, 81% 
cotton, 17% polyester, 1% 
spandex, 1% other fiber, one size 
fits all, white.

16 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          13.65  $        218.40 Fruit of the 
Loom

Men's Basic Brief, 100% cotton, 
sizes small - XL, white. 60 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          10.40  $        624.00 UMI 331-0

37 Men's Basic Brief, 100% cotton, 
sizes small-2XL-6XL, white. 12 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          18.20  $        218.40 UMI 331-0

38 Women's Briefs, 100% cotton, 
sizes 6-10, white. 60 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $            8.40  $        504.00 UMI 300-1

39 Women's Briefs, 100% cotton, 
sizes 11-14 white. 12 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $            8.40  $        100.80 UMI 300-1

Curtain, Shower, Encompass 
49003-064 or equivalent, 10 gauge 
suede vinyl, 72” x 72” minimum, 
smooth inside for easy run-off, 
magnetic weighted bottom with 
standard grommets and no mesh, 
white.

5 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Pillow, Reusable, Comfort Care™ 
or equivalent , 19” x 25”, 20 oz., 
anti-microbial ticking fabric cover, 
not plastic.

12 DZ
  $4.95

$59.40 per 
DZ  

 $        712.80 93200100  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

BRIEFS:
36

40

41

SHOWER CURTAIN:

PILLOWS:
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#
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42

Disposable Pillow 18-19”x 24-25” 
Non-woven Ticking, 15-16 oz., 
100% polyester fiberfill, white. 40 DZ

  $4.27
$51.24 per 

DZ  
 $     2,049.60 93177100  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

43

Pillow Protector, vinyl, 3 gauge, 
standard size 21” x 27”, pure vinyl, 
flame retardant, allergy proof and 
dust proof, rustproof zipper.

12 DZ
  $11.61

$139.32 per 
DZ  

 $     1,671.84 57541100  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Fitted, Patient Safety Sheet, 
HealthMesh™ or equivalent, no 
choke safety fabric or equivalent, 
no elastic, twin, 36” x 81” x 12”, 
60/40 cotton/poly, white and super-
fast colors.

6 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

45

Flat, Patient Safety Sheet, 
HealthMesh™ or equivalent, no-
choke safety fabric or equivalent, 
twin, 36” x 81” x 12”, 60/40 
cotton/poly, white or super-fast 
colors.

6 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Under pad Sofnit™ 200 or 
equivalent, reusable, 32” x 36”, 
55/45 cotton/poly, impermeable 
barrier, durable twill face fabric 
offers stain resistance and high 
heat resistance during drying.

10 DZ
  $7.47

$89.64 per 
DZ  

 $        896.40 59792000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

47

Under pad, M.I.P™. DermaCare or 
equivalent, reusable, 33” x 36”, 
100% polyester, round corners, 
bonded ultra-thin pad, brushed 
backing, impermeable barrier.

50 DZ
  $8.50

$102.00 per
DZ  

 $     5,100.00 59782100  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

UNDERPADS:

SHEETS-NO-CHOKE:

44

46
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E-MAX Pressure Redistribution 
Mattress, Moonlight Slumber or 
equivalent, 36” x 80” x 6”, 4-way 
stretch top cover. Top layer of 
visco-elastic foam with firm side 
rails for added protection and can 
be rotated head to foot. 

20 EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

49

E-MAX Pressure Redistribution 
Mattress, Moonlight Slumber or 
equivalent, 36” x 84” x 6”, 4-way 
stretch top cover. Top layer of 
visco-elastic foam with firm side 
rails for added protection and can 
be rotated head to foot. 

30 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

50

Theratech™ 7500 Mattress or 
equivalent, 36” x 80” x 7” visco-
elastic memory foam top layer with 
five anatomically designed zones, 
independent load bearing cells 
help redistribute pressure, stretch 
cover stretches in all directions to 
reduce friction and shear. Weight 
capacity 450 pounds. 

15 EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

51

Theratech™ 7500RE (raised edge) 
Mattress or equivalent, 36” x 80” x 
7” visco-elastic memory foam top 
layer with five anatomically 
designed zones, independent load 
bearing cells help redistribute 
pressure, stretch cover stretches in 
all directions to reduce friction and 
shear. Weight capacity 450 
pounds.

5 EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

MATTRESSES:

48
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52

Rest-Q™ Pressure Redistribution 
Mattress, 35” x 84” x 7” vapor 
proof – shear reducing top cover, 
highly resilient top cushion, upper 
torso support, pressure 
redistribution centerline, extra 
support beneath hips, firm base 
layer, heel suspension system with 
ultra-firm perimeter support.

10 EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

53

Rest-Q™ SE (secure edge) 
Pressure Redistribution Mattress, 
35” x 84” x 7” vapor proof – shear 
reducing top cover, highly resilient 
top cushion, upper torso support, 
pressure redistribution centerline, 
extra support beneath hips, firm 
base layer, heel suspension 
system with ultra-firm perimeter 
support.

10 EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Gown, Precaution, size Large, 
100% polyester, sweep 56-60”, 
center back length 43- 45", Yellow. 3 DZ

  $5.84
$70.08 per 

DZ  
 $        210.24 66100591  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

55

Gown, Precaution, size XL, 100% 
polyester, sweep 59-62", center 
back length 43-45", Yellow. 1 DZ

  $6.03
$72.36 per 

DZ  
 $          72.36 66100491  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Adult Clothing Protector, 20-22” x 
38-42”, 100% Cotton terry, EZ-Tie, 
stripe and/or pattern acceptable.  
No solid colors.

20 DZ
  $3.47

$41.64 per 
DZ  

 $        832.80 97111330  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

CLOTHING PROTECTOR:

54

56

GOWNS:
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#
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Bib Apron three pockets, one size, 
65 /35 poly/cotton, three divided 
pockets, adjustable neck strap on 
bib apron, Scotchguard soil 
release finish, reinforced side ties, 
machine washable, colorfast, won’t 
wrinkle or shrink. Solid colors in 
white, blue, black and/or brown.

15 DZ
  $7.63

$91.56 per 
DZ  

 $     1,373.40 83003326 
83003586  No Bid  No Bid  $          69.42  $     1,041.30 UMI 92-7

Spit Sock Hood, one size fits all, 
lightweight material, elastic neck, 
individually packaged, disposable, 
white or tan.

22 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Rubbermaid Commercial Hygen 
Microfiber Flat Mop or equivalent, 
18" pads chlorine-stable, One per 
Room Concept, high grade micro-
denier fiber with built-in 
Antimicrobial Product Protection.

30 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

60

Rubbermaid Commercial Hygen 
Quick-Connect Wet/Dry Frame or 
equivalent, to accommodate 18" 
Mop, ribbed-frame design, heavy-
duty, hardened aluminum, hard-
coat annodization.

5 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

61

Rubbermaid Commercial Hygen 
Quick-Connect Flat Mop Handle or 
equivalent, telescopic handle and 
easy-grip ergo handle to 
accommodate 18" flat mop frame.

5 DZ  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

MOPS:

BIB APRON:

SPLIT SOCK HOOD:

57

58

59
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Brand and 
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Bid

 Unit Price  Ext. Price 
Brand and 

Model Number 
Bid

 Unit Price  Ext. Price 
Brand and 

Model Number 
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Line 
#
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 Yes

____X____ 

 No

________ 

 Yes

____X____ 

 No

________ 

 Yes

____X____ 

 No

________ 

 Yes

________ 

 No

____X____ 

 Yes

____X____ 

 No

________ 

 Yes

____X____ 

 No

________ 

$     3,693.12 $ 115,163.40 $        100.95  $   36,651.50 $        725.82 $   29,765.50 

BID COMPLIANCE:

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

62

Read these specifications carefully.  Any and all 
exceptions to these specifications must be written on 
or attached to quotation request.   Any 
noncompliance may void your quotation. Non-
compliance to any single specification can void your 
bid.  

63
Vendor can block availability of certain non-core 
items if requested by State Purchasing Bureau (i.e., 
furniture, office supplies).

64

NON-CORE ITEMS:

CLEANING:

BEDDING AND DRY GOODS:

NON-CORE ITEMS:

0
CLOTHING AND FOOTWEAR:
PATIENT CARE:

0
0

% OF DISCOUNT OFF REMAINDER OF CATALOG

Note:  Standard Textile Company, Inc., bid "each" instead of "dozen".
Lines 1, 7 and 13-No Award will be made.
Line 14-Low bid did not meet specs, sample sent was 52/48 cotton/poly.
Line 22-Low bid not selected due to excessive shrinkage after being laundered.

30%
30%
30%
30%

Line 1 - dz (white only)
Line 3 - dz

Line 7 - dz (white only)
Line 13 - dz (white only)

No Catalog available, however, facilities may 
request a quote at any time.  

Samples sent under separate cover.
Line 64 - *off regular retail price

 www.umidirect.com

 Net   30 
3030

0
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