
Buyer:  Christie Kelly 4661 OF Rebid

Department of Roads
Opening Date:  05/02/14

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

NEBRASKA CITY YARD
2100 CY  $            48.60  $   102,060.00  $            59.00  $   123,900.00 

2
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

SEWARD YARD
750 CY  $            57.25  $     42,937.50  $            57.50  $     43,125.00 

3
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

WAHOO WEST 79 & 92 JCT
700 CY  $            56.17  $     39,319.00  $            57.50  $     40,250.00 

4
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

DAVID CITY HWY 92 MM 420
1250 CY  $            59.60  $     74,500.00  $            57.50  $     71,875.00 

5
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

GREENWOOD YARD
950 CY  $            54.30  $     51,585.00  $            57.50  $     54,625.00 

6
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

JOHNSON YARD HWY 105
1300 CY  $            48.10  $     62,530.00  $            59.00  $     76,700.00 

7
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

WEST JCT 4 & 50
1500 CY  $            48.60  $     72,900.00  $            59.00  $     88,500.00 

8
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 33 MM 3.3
440 CY  $            55.80  $     24,552.00  $            57.50  $     25,300.00 

9
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 15 MM 12.1
2890 CY  $            53.25  $   153,892.50  $            57.50  $   166,175.00 

10
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 15 MM 24
3380 CY  $            53.25  $   179,985.00  $            57.50  $   194,350.00 

11
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 136 MM 173
1330 CY  $            52.95  $     70,423.50  $            59.00  $     78,470.00 

12
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 136 MM 187
920 CY  $            52.95  $     48,714.00  $            59.00  $     54,280.00 

13

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 34 MM 248

3 MI W OF AURORA

1200 CY  $            57.00  $     68,400.00  $            57.50  $     69,000.00 

14

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 4 MM 90

7 MI W OF DAVENPORT

365 CY  $            53.80  $     19,637.00  $            57.50  $     20,987.50 

15
D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

I-80 INTERCHANGE 305
1300 CY  $            60.55  $     78,715.00  $            56.75  $     73,775.00 

16
D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

CENTRAL CITY YARD
640 CY  $            59.86  $     38,310.40  $            58.25  $     37,280.00 

PARTIAL AWARD

L
in

e
 # Expanded Shale

PARTIAL AWARD

Buildex, Inc.
TRNLWB LLC 

DBA Trinity ESC - Boulder
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17
D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

GENEVA YARD
2200 CY  $            52.75  $   116,050.00  $            57.50  $   126,500.00 

18

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY L93B MM 2.7

3 MI S OF WACO

900 CY  $            55.43  $     49,887.00  $            57.50  $     51,750.00 

19
D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

STRANG YARD JCT 74 & 81
2700 CY  $            52.15  $   140,805.00  $            57.50  $   155,250.00 

20

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 92 MM 381

2 MI W OF CLARKS

2500 CY  $            58.39  $   145,975.00  $            58.25  $   145,625.00 

21

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 69 MM 68

5 MI N OF GRESHAM

2400 CY  $            57.00  $   136,800.00  $            57.50  $   138,000.00 

22
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 83 MM 151 SITE 607
650 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            57.50  $     37,375.00 

23
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 2 MM 144 SITE 617
1400 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            60.00  $     84,000.00 

24

D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 6 MM 118.7

2 MI W OF HOLBROOK

2000 CY  $            60.30  $   120,600.00  $            56.75  $   113,500.00 

25

D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 6 MM 10.4

13 MI W OF IMPERIAL

1500 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            50.75  $     76,125.00 

26

D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8

HWY 34 MM 30

1/2 MI W OF BENKELMAN

1500 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            50.75  $     76,125.00 

27
D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8

HWY 33 MM 3.3
230 CY  $            55.77  $     12,827.10  $            57.50  $     13,225.00 

28
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8

OGALLALA YARD
4000 CY  $            74.50  $   298,000.00  $            50.00  $   200,000.00 

29 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 1000 CY  $            59.60  $     59,600.00  $            59.00  $     59,000.00 

30 D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200 CY  $            59.50  $     11,900.00  $            59.00  $     11,800.00 

IN THE EVENT THAT ADDITIONAL EXPANDED SHALE MAY BE NEEDED DURING THE CONTRACT PERIOD, THE 

STATE IS SEEKING PRICING PER CUBIC YARD, FOB DESTINATION, BEYOND THE LOCATIONS NAMED IN THE 

INVITATION TO BID. EXPANDED SHALE FOR THE OPTIONAL LINES ARE SEPARATED BY DISTRICT.
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31 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200 CY  $            71.34  $     14,268.00  $            63.50  $     12,700.00 

32 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 1000 CY  $            66.94  $     66,940.00  $            57.50  $     57,500.00 

33 D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            62.00  $     12,400.00 

34 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 500 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            62.00  $     31,000.00 

35 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 500 CY  $            60.30  $     30,150.00  $            56.00  $     28,000.00 

36 D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            69.50  $     13,900.00 

37 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200 CY  $            59.60  $     11,920.00  $            59.00  $     11,800.00 

38 D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200 CY  $            59.50  $     11,900.00  $            59.00  $     11,800.00 

39 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200 CY  $            71.34  $     14,268.00  $            63.50  $     12,700.00 

40 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200 CY  $            66.94  $     13,388.00  $            58.25  $     11,650.00 

41 D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            62.00  $     12,400.00 

42 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200 CY  $            72.05  $     14,410.00  $            62.00  $     12,400.00 

43 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            56.00  $     11,200.00 

44 D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            69.50  $     13,900.00 

45 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200 CY  $            59.00  $     11,800.00  $            59.00  $     11,800.00 

46 D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200 CY  $            66.67  $     13,334.00  $            59.00  $     11,800.00 

47 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200 CY  $            72.50  $     14,500.00  $            63.50  $     12,700.00 

48 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200 CY  $            67.50  $     13,500.00  $            57.50  $     11,500.00 

49 D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            62.00  $     12,400.00 

50 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            62.00  $     12,400.00 

51 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            56.00  $     11,200.00 

52 D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200 CY  No Bid  $                  -    $            69.50  $     13,900.00 

Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms

60

0  0

*Please see item #8 Delivery 

under Specifications

90

Comments
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