
Buyer: Christie Kelly 4613 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/05/2014

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 CRS-2P DIST-1 3514 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $           498.80  $       1,752,783.20  No Bid  No Bid 
2 CRS-2P DIST-3 6521 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $           502.68  $       3,277,976.28  No Bid  No Bid 
3 CRS-2P DIST-4 5448 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $           495.17  $       2,697,686.16  No Bid  No Bid 
4 CRS-2P DIST-6 2993 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $           513.90  $       1,538,102.70  No Bid  No Bid 
5 CRS-2P DIST-7 175 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $           529.44  $            92,652.00  No Bid  No Bid 
6 CRS-2P DIST-8 1700 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $           506.21  $          860,557.00  No Bid  No Bid 

7 CRS-2P PLANT PICK 
UP 25 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

8 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
PLANT PICK UP 35 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

9 CRS-2VHL DIST-7 933 TN  $           545.00  $    508,485.00  NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

10 CRS-2VHL PLANT PICK 
UP 21 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

11 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-1 684 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
12 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-3 100 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
13 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-5 25 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  $           339.01  $        8,475.25 
14 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-6 580 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
15 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-7 400 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
16 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-8 250 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

17 CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT 
PICK UP 112 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  $           327.00  $      36,624.00 

18 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DIST-7 75 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

19 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
PLANT PICK UP 25 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

20 HFE-150 DIST-3 150 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
21 HFE-150 DIST-5 2075 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  $           547.73  $ 1,136,539.75 
22 HFE-150 DIST-7 25 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
23 HFE-150 DIST-8 20 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

24 HFE-150 PLANT PICK 
UP 35 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

25 HFE-300 DIST-4 1425 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
26 HFE-300 DIST-6 1925 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

Li
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Materials

PARTIAL AWARD

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Hills Materials CompanyFLINT HILLS RESOURCES, LP
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4613 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/05/2014

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. PriceLi
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Materials

PARTIAL AWARD

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Hills Materials CompanyFLINT HILLS RESOURCES, LP

27 HFE-300 DIST-7 800 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
28 HFE-300 DIST-8 400 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

29 HFE-300 PLANT PICK 
UP 25 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

30 HFE-1000 DIST-4 539 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
31 HFE-1000 DIST-5 75 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  $           743.00  $      55,725.00 
32 HFE-1000 DIST-6 100 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
33 HFE-1000 DIST-8 1175 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

34 HFE-1000 PLANT PICK 
UP 25 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

35 MC-250 DIST-4 100 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
36 MC-250 DIST-6 100 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 
37 MC-250 DIST-8 100 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

38 MC-250 PLANT PICK 
UP 25 TN  No Bid  $                  -    NO BID  NO BID  No Bid  No Bid 

39 DEMURRAGE AFTER 3 
HOURS 1 HR  $             60.00  $             60.00  $             60.00  $                   60.00  $             65.00  $             65.00 

0   N30

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

**

**Per Specifications

1
0   30

1

Line 39: /hour
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4613 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/05/2014

Description Qty UOM
1 CRS-2P DIST-1 3514 TN
2 CRS-2P DIST-3 6521 TN
3 CRS-2P DIST-4 5448 TN
4 CRS-2P DIST-6 2993 TN
5 CRS-2P DIST-7 175 TN
6 CRS-2P DIST-8 1700 TN

7 CRS-2P PLANT PICK 
UP 25 TN

8 CRS-2 STRAIGHT 
PLANT PICK UP 35 TN

9 CRS-2VHL DIST-7 933 TN

10 CRS-2VHL PLANT PICK 
UP 21 TN

11 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-1 684 TN
12 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-3 100 TN
13 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-5 25 TN
14 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-6 580 TN
15 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-7 400 TN
16 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST-8 250 TN

17 CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT 
PICK UP 112 TN

18 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
DIST-7 75 TN

19 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 
PLANT PICK UP 25 TN

20 HFE-150 DIST-3 150 TN
21 HFE-150 DIST-5 2075 TN
22 HFE-150 DIST-7 25 TN
23 HFE-150 DIST-8 20 TN

24 HFE-150 PLANT PICK 
UP 35 TN

25 HFE-300 DIST-4 1425 TN
26 HFE-300 DIST-6 1925 TN

Li
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Materials

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
 $           542.37  $        1,905,888.18  $           575.48  $ 2,022,236.72  $           615.00  $ 2,161,110.00 
 $           519.24  $        3,385,964.04  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           561.79  $        3,060,631.92  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           579.57  $        1,734,653.01  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           575.24  $           100,667.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           535.12  $           909,704.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           525.00  $             13,125.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           470.00  $             16,450.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           686.24  $           640,261.92  $           567.78  $    529,738.74  No Bid $                  -   

 $           630.00  $             13,230.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           277.97  $           190,131.48  $           224.60  $    153,626.40  $           561.00  $    383,724.00 
 $           272.60  $             27,260.00  $           256.15  $      25,615.00  No Bid $                  -   
 $           341.01  $               8,525.25  $           307.80  $        7,695.00  No Bid $                  -   
 $           327.52  $           189,961.60  $           282.12  $    163,629.60  No Bid $                  -   
 $           327.03  $           130,812.00  $           297.23  $    118,892.00  No Bid $                  -   
 $           287.92  $             71,980.00  $           263.18  $      65,795.00  No Bid $                  -   

 $           260.00  $             29,120.00  $           489.00  $      54,768.00  No Bid $                  -   

 $           526.24  $             39,468.00  $           474.00  $      35,550.00  No Bid $                  -   

 $           460.00  $             11,500.00  $           600.00  $      15,000.00  No Bid $                  -   

 $           481.29  $             72,193.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           547.55  $        1,136,166.25  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           531.74  $             13,293.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           496.69  $               9,933.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           475.00  $             16,625.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           520.68  $           741,969.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           540.95  $        1,041,328.75  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Jebro, Incorporated Vance Brothers, IncMartin Resource Management 
Corp. DBA Monarch Oil

Page 3 of 4



Buyer: Christie Kelly 4613 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/05/2014

Description Qty UOMLi
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Materials

27 HFE-300 DIST-7 800 TN
28 HFE-300 DIST-8 400 TN

29 HFE-300 PLANT PICK 
UP 25 TN

30 HFE-1000 DIST-4 539 TN
31 HFE-1000 DIST-5 75 TN
32 HFE-1000 DIST-6 100 TN
33 HFE-1000 DIST-8 1175 TN

34 HFE-1000 PLANT PICK 
UP 25 TN

35 MC-250 DIST-4 100 TN
36 MC-250 DIST-6 100 TN
37 MC-250 DIST-8 100 TN

38 MC-250 PLANT PICK 
UP 25 TN

39 DEMURRAGE AFTER 3 
HOURS 1 HR

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Jebro, Incorporated Vance Brothers, IncMartin Resource Management 
Corp. DBA Monarch Oil

 $           542.43  $           433,944.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           525.89  $           210,356.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           485.00  $             12,125.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           524.79  $           282,861.81  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           555.52  $             41,664.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           554.28  $             55,428.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           527.68  $           620,024.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           499.00  $             12,475.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           794.98  $             79,498.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           814.28  $             81,428.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   
 $           785.72  $             78,572.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           750.00  $             18,750.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $                  -   

 $           160.00  $                  160.00  $           187.50  $           187.50  $             70.00  $             70.00 

Line 10. CRS-2VHL plant pick up not awarded/Jebro, Inc was the 
only bid and due to distance, Dist-7 will not pick up at that location.

0   30
per spec1

AWARD EXPLANATION

Low Bidder does not meet 
specifications 3a, 7a and 7b.

0   30
One

Line 1: /Ton
Line 11: /Ton
Line 39: /Hour

net   30
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