
Buyer: Annette Walton 4591 OF
DHHS

Opening Date:  01/08/2014

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1

PERMANENT 
ADHESIVE 
LABELS VIRGIN 
250,000 ORDER

1000 M  $              3.75  $       3,750.00  $              9.10  $       9,100.00  No Bid  $                  -    $               8.20  $        8,200.00 

2

PERMANENT 
ADHESIVE 
LABELS VIRGIN
500,000 ORDER

1000 M  $              3.50  $       3,500.00  $              8.34  $       8,340.00  $               5.10  $       5,100.00  $               7.00  $        7,000.00 

3

PERMANENT 
ADHESIVE 
LABELS VIRGIN
750,000 ORDER

1000 M  $              3.40  $       3,400.00  $              7.77  $       7,770.00  $               3.80  $       3,800.00  $               6.45  $        6,450.00 

4

PERMANENT 
ADHESIVE 
LABELS 
RECYCLED
250,000 ORDER

1000 M  $            11.40  $     11,400.00  NA  $                  -    No Bid  $                  -   $                   -   

5

PERMANENT 
ADHESIVE 
LABELS 
RECYCLED
500,000 ORDER

1000 M  $              8.07  $       8,070.00  NA  $                  -    No Bid  $                  -   $                   -   

6

PERMANENT 
ADHESIVE 
LABELS 
RECYCLED
750,000 ORDER

1000 M  $              8.07  $       8,070.00  NA  $                  -    $               3.80  $       3,800.00 $                   -   

 $            38.19 $     38,190.00 $            25.21 $     25,210.00  $             12.70 $     12,700.00 $             21.65 $      21,650.00 

AWARD
PRECISION FORMS & 

GRAPHICS, INC.

30
NET  30

Line 4 - Not available in recycled
Line 5 - Not available in recycled
Line 6 - Not available in recycled

AMERICAN DIVERSITY 
BUSINESS SOLUTIONSAcclaim ID Products

0  30

Line 6 - Virgin

FAC

15

Li
ne

 # Permanent Adhesive Labels

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

20
Net  30

Comments

Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

No Bid
Shamrock Scientific Specialty 

Systems, Inc

Page 1 of 1


