
Buyer:  Teresa Fleming 4545 OF

Cornhusker State Industries

Opening Date:  11/26/13

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Chr, Integra, 

wo/arm Norix 

C110 or equivalent

900 ea  $            33.50  $     30,150.00  $            45.13  $     40,617.00  $            38.50  $     34,650.00 

Chr, Integra, 

wo/arm Norix 

C120 or equivalent

40 ea  $            50.50  $       2,020.00  $            58.43  $       2,337.20  $            47.50  $       1,900.00 

Chr, Integra, 

Lounge Norix 

C130 or equivalent

5 ea  $                  -    $          268.85  $       1,344.25 

Stack A Bunk, 

Standard Norix 

B530-601 or 

Equivalent 32"W x 

75"L

25 ea  $                  -   $0.00 $0.00  $          185.00  $       4,625.00 

Stack A Bunk, 

Large Norix B530-

603 or Equivalent 

32"W x 82"L

100 ea  $          185.50  $     18,550.00 $0.00 $0.00  $          200.00  $     20,000.00 

Storage Box, 

Tank, Pls, Sml 

Norix PB150 or 

Equivalent 20.25"L 

x 13.88"W x 11"H

10 ea  $            29.90  $          299.00 $0.00 $0.00  $            42.00  $          420.00 

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Norix
B530-603 as specified
32"W x 82"L (footprint)

 No longer available 

Norix
C130 - to be discontinued

Norix
B530-601 as specified
32"W x 75"L (footprint)

Norix Group, Inc.

Norix
C110 as specified

Norix
C120 as specified

Brand:

Brand:

4

Dimensions:

5

Brand:

2

Model:

3

Brand:
Model:

Correctional Technologies

Model:
Dimensions:

L
in

e
 # Intensive Use Institutional 

Furniture

6

Model:

Brand:
Model:

1

ModuForm, Inc.

 NO BID 

Cortech
86484

Moduform
5000-20

 Cortech 
7501

36"W x 81"L

N/A

N/A

ModuForm
5000-50

ModuForm
5000-20

ModuForm
5000-250

 NO BID 

Page 1 of 6



Buyer:  Teresa Fleming 4545 OF

Cornhusker State Industries

Opening Date:  11/26/13

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Storage Box, Lid, 

Pls, Sml Norix 

PBL401 or 

Equivalent 20.75"L 

x 14.5"W x 1"H

10 ea  $            19.50  $          195.00 $0.00 $0.00  $            25.00  $          250.00 

Storage Box, 

Tank, Pls, Med 

Norix PB200 or 

Equivalent 22.88"L 

x 17.38"W x 8.5"H

10 ea  $            29.90  $          299.00 $0.00 $0.00  $            43.00  $          430.00 

Storage Box, 

Tank, Pls, Lg Norix 

PB300 or 

Equivalent 22.88"L 

x 17.38"W x 

12.5"H

10 ea  $            19.50  $          195.00 $0.00 $0.00  $            47.50  $          475.00 

Storage Box, Lid, 

Med/Lg Norix 

PBL400 or 

Equivalent 23.12"L 

x 18"W x 1"H

20 ea  $            36.50  $          730.00 $0.00 $0.00  $            25.50  $          510.00 

Norix

PB300 as specified

22.88"L x 17.38"W x 12.5"H

Norix
PBL400 as specified
23.12"L x 18"W x 1"H

Norix
PBL401 as specified

20.75" x 14.5"W x 1"H

Norix
PB200 as specified

22.88"L x 17.38"W x 8.5"H

Norix
PB150 as specified

20.25"L x 13.88"W x 11"H

Brand:
Model: 3825p

23"L x 15.25"W x 8.5"H

 Cortech 

 7268p 

8

Dimensions:

10

Brand:

9

Brand:

Model:

Dimensions:

Dimensions:

Model:
Dimensions:

Brand:

Brand:

7

Model:
Dimensions:

Model:

6

3825p
23"L x 15.25"W x 8.5"H

 Cortech 

 Cortech 
9689p

23.5"L x 17.5"W x 1.5"H

Cortech

23"L x 15.25"W x 11.5"H

 Cortech 
 9689p 

23.5"L x 17.5"W x 1.5"H

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 
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Buyer:  Teresa Fleming 4545 OF

Cornhusker State Industries

Opening Date:  11/26/13

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Storage Box, 

Tank, Pls, XL 

Norix PB350 or 

Equivalent 33.88"L 

x 22.88"W x 11"H

50 ea  $                  -   $0.00 $0.00  $            93.00  $       4,650.00 

Storage Box Lid, 

Pls, XL Norix 

PBL402 or 

Equivalent 23"L x 

34.5"W x 1"H

50 ea  $                  -   $0.00 $0.00  $            43.50  $       2,175.00 

Table Slammer, 

Rnd, Pt, Norix 

XB3600PT or 

Equivalent 36" dia. 

x 29.25"H

10 ea  $          586.05  $       5,860.50 $0.00 $0.00  $          558.00  $       5,580.00 

Table Slammer, 

Pt, Norix 

XB3636PT or 

Equivalent 36"W x  

36"L x 29.25"H

10 ea  $          605.35  $       6,053.50  $          512.05  $       5,120.50  $          567.00  $       5,670.00 

Table Slammer, 

Rnd, Gt, Norix 

XB4200GT or 

Equivalent 42" dia. 

x 29.25"H

10 ea  $          633.56  $       6,335.60  $          620.35  $       6,203.50  $          708.00  $       7,080.00 

Norix X-Base Table

Norix X-Base Table

XB3600PT with Laminate Base - 

as specified

36" dia x 29.25"H

Norix X-Base Table

XB3636PT with Laminate Base - 

as specified

36"W  x 36"L x  29.25"H

Norix

PB350 as specified

33.88"L x 22.88"W x 11"H

Norix

PBL402 as specified

23"L x 34.5"W x 1"H

14

Model:

Dimensions:

15

Brand:

Brand:

13

Model:

Dimensions:

Dimensions:

11

Model:

Brand:

Brand:

Brand:

12

Model:

Dimensions:

N/A

N/A

 Moduform 

5000-542R-SLR

Same

 Moduform 

5000-542S-SLR

Same

 Moduform 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 ModuForm 

5000-536S-SLR

36" x 36"

 ModuForm 
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Buyer:  Teresa Fleming 4545 OF

Cornhusker State Industries

Opening Date:  11/26/13

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Table Slammer, 

Rnd, Pt, Norix 

XB4200PT or 

Equivalent 42" dia. 

x 29.25"H

10 ea  $          624.95  $       6,249.50  $          548.63  $       5,486.30  $          598.00  $       5,980.00 

Table, Dbl Wall 

Rnd, PT Norix 

JB4800PT or 

Equivalent 48" dia. 

X 29.25"H

10 ea  $          447.50  $       4,475.00 $0.00 $0.00  $          623.50  $       6,235.00 

Table, Leg Style, 

Rect, PT Norix 

LB3072PT or 

Equivalent 72"L x 

30"W x 29"H

10 ea  $          639.30  $       6,393.00  $          627.48  $       6,274.80  $          677.50  $       6,775.00 

Table, Leg Style, 

Rnd, PT Norix 

LB4200PT or 

Equivalent 42" Dia. 

x 29"H

10 ea  $          593.25  $       5,932.50  $          513.00  $       5,130.00  $          494.00  $       4,940.00 

Norix Leg Style Table 

LB4242PT - square top - round 

top 42" not available

42" x 42" x 29"H 

Norix Jupiter Table - Plain Top

JB4800PT as specified

49" dia x 29.25"H

Norix Leg Style Table 

LB3072PT as specified

72"L x 30"W x 29"H

XB4200GT with Laminate Base - 

as specified

42" dia x 29.25"H

Norix X-Base Table

XB4200PT with Laminate Base - 

as specified

42" dia x 29.25"H

Brand:

Model:

Dimensions:

19

Model No:

Dimensions:

Brand:

16

Model:

Dimensions:

17

Brand:

Model:

Dimensions:

Brand:

18

15

Model:

Dimensions:

5000-542R-GLR

Same

 Moduform 

5000-542R-SLR

Same

 Moduform 

5000-448R-SLR

Differences: X-Base Vinyl 

Bumper Edge

 Moduform 

5000-272E-SLM

Differences: Vinyl Bumper Edge

 Moduform 

5000-542R-SLR

5000-542R-GLR

42" dia

 ModuForm 

5000-542R-SLR

 ModuForm 

5000-272E

36"d x 72"w x 29.5h

 ModuForm 

5000-442R-SLR

42" dia

42" dia

 NO BID 
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Buyer:  Teresa Fleming 4545 OF

Cornhusker State Industries

Opening Date:  11/26/13

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Table, Maxmaster, 

4 Seat Rnd Norix 

MX4200-4 or 

Equivalent 42" Dia. 

Table

10 ea  $          727.25  $       7,272.50  $          901.08  $       9,010.80  $          696.50  $       6,965.00 

Ecomo-Max, Table 

w/Seats Norix 

EMX4205-4 or 

Equivalent 42" Dia. 

Table

20 ea  $                  -   $0.00 $0.00  $          887.50  $     17,750.00 

Shelf, Wall Mnt, 3 

Shf, Norix ATN300 

or Equivalent 

29"W x 55"L

10 ea  $          246.00  $       2,460.00 $0.00 $0.00  $          410.50  $       4,105.00 

Mirror, SS Norix 

R565-410 or 

Equivalent 

11.25"H x 9.5"W

20 ea  $            50.75  $       1,015.00 $0.00 $0.00  $            31.00  $          620.00 

 Norix 

R565-410 as specified

11.25"H x 9.9"W

50

Net 30

 Norix Econo-Max Stainless 

Steel Top Table 

 EMX4205-4 as specified 

42" dia Top

 Norix 

ATN300 as specified

29"W x 57"H x 11"D

 Norix Max-Master table with bolt-

down legs 

MX4200-4 as specified

42" dia Top

Brand:

7604

34"W x 24"H x 14.25"D - 2 Shf

Model No:

Brand:

23

24
% Discount Off List Price 70

VM1115

Non Core Items:

Model No:

Dimensions:

Model No:

Dimensions:

11" x 15"

Brand:

Brand:  Cortech 

21

Dimensions:

22

 N/A 

Model No:

Dimensions:

 Cortech 

20

30-45

2% 10 days

Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms -     -

 Moduform 

5000-342R1-SLM

 Vinyl Bumper Edge

 NO BID 

 ModuForm 

5000-342R1-SLR - 4 Seater

42" table top

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

52.5

30
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Buyer:  Teresa Fleming 4545 OF

Cornhusker State Industries

Opening Date:  11/26/13

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Line 14.  Alternate: same table 

with roto-mold base: $492.00@;

Line 15. Alternate: same table 

with roto-mold base: $624.50@;

Line 16. Alternate: same table 

with roto-mold base: $514.50@;

Comments

Line 19.  Alternate:  48" Round 

LB4800PT: $504.50@
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