
Buyer: Julie Hopp 4532 OF 

Statewide
Opening Date: 11/04/13
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Item Description Expanded Description

Est. 

Annual 

Usage

UOM
Brand/MFR 

Bid

 Item 

Number Bid
Unit Price

Brand/MFR 

Bid

 Item 

Number Bid
Unit Price

Brand/MFR 

Bid

 Item 

Number Bid
Unit Price

1 .40 Caliber Duty

180 Grain Brass Jacketed Hollow 

Point; Remington Golden Saber 

Index #GSB40SWB, Winchester 

RA40B, or EQUIVALENT

4 M Remington GSB40SWB 357.50$    No Bid Remington GSB40SWB 510.00$      

2 9mm Duty

147 Grain Brass Jacketed Hollow 

Point; Remington Golden Saber 

Index #GS9MMC or 

EQUIVALENT

3 M Remington GS9MMC 335.50$    " Remington GS9MMC 442.00$      

3 9mm Practice
Remington R9MM2, Speer 53651 

or equivalent, 124 Grain
49 M Remington L9MM2 250.80$    " Remington L9MM2 223.00$      

4 .45 Caliber Practice
230 Grain, Full Metal Jacket; 

Speer 53653 or EQUIVALENT
44 M Remington L45AP4 283.80$    " Remington L45AP4 335.00$      

5 .40 Caliber Practice
180 Grain, Speer lawman 53652 

or equivalent
4 M Remington L40SW3 258.50$    No Bid Remington L40SW3 285.00$      

6 .223 Caliber Duty

62 Grain, Hornady Tap Barrier 

83285 or equivalent Spire Point 

Rifle Round

50 M Remington PRC223R4 610.50$    Hornady 83285 613.59$ N/A - -

7 .223 Caliber Duty

55 Grain, Pointed Soft Point, New 

Casings; Winchester RA223R-

PSP, Federal T223A, or 

EQUIVALENT

7 M Remington R223R1 362.20$    No Bid Remington R223R1 720.00$      

8 00 Buck
9 Pellet Duty; Federal IE127-00 or 

EQUIVALENT
8 M Remington SPL1200 539.00$    " Remington SPL1200 675.00$      

9 00 Buck

9 Pellet, Practice, Reduced 

Recoil; 3DREQ, Federal LE13 200 

or EQUIVALENT

6 M Remington RR12BK00 508.20$    " N/A - -

10 Rifled Slug

1 oz Hollow Point; Winchester 

RA12R515, Federal F127RS or 

EQUIVALENT

1 M Remington SP12RS 459.80$    " Remington SP12RSB 635.00$      

11 Bird Shot

7.50-8 Pellet, Winchester 

TRGT127, Federal TGL128 or 

EQUIVALENT

5 M Remington GC12L7 271.70$    No Bid Remington GC12L7 200.00$      

Partial Award

Delivery Days ARO 180

% Discount Off Catalog 

and/or Price List

Catalog and/or Price List 

Name

Categories (Optional)

Payment Terms Net 30

OMB Guns

Bidders must provide percentage discount off catalog and/or price list(s).  List catalog and/or price list name.

ITB 4532 Ammunition Non Core List

Comments

See Attached Price list

Remington 2013 LE Price List

Effective July 1, 2013

ITB 4532 Ammunition Core List

42%

Hornady 2014 Law Enforcement 

Pricing

180 Minimum

Net 30

180+

0

Names - Hornady, Speer, Remmington, 

Winchester, Federal

Names - Hornady, Speer, 

Remmington, Winchester, Federal

Names - Hornady, Speer, Remmington, 

Winchester, Federal

Alamar Uniforms Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply Inc.
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1 .40 Caliber Duty

180 Grain Brass Jacketed Hollow 

Point; Remington Golden Saber 

Index #GSB40SWB, Winchester 

RA40B, or EQUIVALENT

4 M

2 9mm Duty

147 Grain Brass Jacketed Hollow 

Point; Remington Golden Saber 

Index #GS9MMC or 

EQUIVALENT

3 M

3 9mm Practice
Remington R9MM2, Speer 53651 

or equivalent, 124 Grain
49 M

4 .45 Caliber Practice
230 Grain, Full Metal Jacket; 

Speer 53653 or EQUIVALENT
44 M

5 .40 Caliber Practice
180 Grain, Speer lawman 53652 

or equivalent
4 M

6 .223 Caliber Duty

62 Grain, Hornady Tap Barrier 

83285 or equivalent Spire Point 

Rifle Round

50 M

7 .223 Caliber Duty

55 Grain, Pointed Soft Point, New 

Casings; Winchester RA223R-

PSP, Federal T223A, or 

EQUIVALENT

7 M

8 00 Buck
9 Pellet Duty; Federal IE127-00 or 

EQUIVALENT
8 M

9 00 Buck

9 Pellet, Practice, Reduced 

Recoil; 3DREQ, Federal LE13 200 

or EQUIVALENT

6 M

10 Rifled Slug

1 oz Hollow Point; Winchester 

RA12R515, Federal F127RS or 

EQUIVALENT

1 M

11 Bird Shot

7.50-8 Pellet, Winchester 

TRGT127, Federal TGL128 or 

EQUIVALENT

5 M

Delivery Days ARO

% Discount Off Catalog 

and/or Price List

Catalog and/or Price List 

Name

Categories (Optional)

Payment Terms

Comments

Brand/MFR 

Bid

 Item 

Number Bid
Unit Price

Brand/MFR 

Bid

 Item 

Number Bid
Unit Price

Brand/MFR 

Bid

 Item Number 

Bid
Unit Price

Winchester RA40B 357.00$      Speer 53962 299.00$            

Winchester RA9T 274.00$      Federal P9HST2 261.00$            

Winchester USA9MM 197.00$      Speer 53651 178.00$            

Winchester Q4170 289.00$      Speer 53653 239.00$            

Winchester Q4238 249.00$      Speer 53652 216.00$            

Winchester RA223R2 505.00$      Hornady 83285  $555/ 1000 rds Federal LE223T3 725.00$            

Winchester RA223R2 502.00$      Hornady 80255  $433/ 1000 rds Federal T223A 392.00$            

Winchester RA1200HD 418.00$      Federal F12700 348.00$            

Winchester RA1200HD 418.00$      Federal H13200 356.00$            

Winchester  RA12RS15 506.00$      Federal F127RS 404.00$            

Winchester TRGT127 274.00$      Federal TG128 248.00$            

Line 10: Is not being awarded.

Line 11: OMB Guns does not meet specifications due to delivery date.

Partial Award Partial Award

Award Explanation:

Line 7:  Ray O'Rerron Co., Inc. does not meet the specification of requiring a 62 grain round.

Line 10.  Low Recoil                       

Option 2 Line 10.  Winchester X12RS15 

(not a low recoil round) Bid Price 

$506.00

Names - Hornady, Speer, Remmington, 

Winchester, Federal

approx 30

Ultramax 2013 Price List

See below

Names - Hornady, Speer, Remmington, 

Winchester, Federal

n/a

n/a

0% 30 DAYS - Net 30

Bidders must provide percentage discount off catalog and/or price list(s).  List catalog and/or price list name.

ITB 4532 Ammunition Non Core List

180

40%

Hornady 2013 Retail Catalog

Names - Hornady, Speer, Remmington, 

Winchester, Federal

          ITB 4532 Ammunition Core List

Sunset Law Enforcement, Ltd Ultramax AmmunitionRay O'Herron Co., Inc.


