
Buyer:  Dianna Gilliland 4463 OF

Statewide
Opening Date:    09/06/13

Primary/E85 

Award

 Secondary 

Award 

Anderson Ford
Gene Steffy 

Chrysler Center

Husker Auto 

Group

Performance 

Dodge

 Sid Dillon Chev 

Buick 
 Sid Dillon Ford 

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

One Ton Diesel Regular Cab 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels 

Pickup
34,033.00$         38,247.00$         35,952.00$         38,853.00$          $         35,530.00  $         34,054.00 

Make: Ford RAM Chevrolet Dodge 2015 Chevrolet Ford

Model: F350 3500 RC 4x4 Silverado RAM Silverado 3500HD F-350 Reg Cab

GVWR: 14,000 14,000 13,400 10,300 13025 14000

Series, Code, Trim Level: 623A, F3D, XCT D28H6Z
3500-CK30903-

Base LT
3500 'SLT'

 CK35903, 1LT, 

LT 
 F3D, 623A, XLT 

Engine: 6.7L
6.7L Cummins 

Diesel

LML 6.6L 

Duramax

6.7L I6 Cummins 

Turbo Diesel
 6.6L Duramax 

 6.7L Power 

Stroke 

Transmission No. /Gear Ratio No.: 6R140/3.13.1 3.42 MW7/GT4 68RFE 3.42  MW7, 3.73  44W, 3.73 

EPA: N/A N/A NA @ This Time NA NA

Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days): 90-120 90-120 35/120 90-120 60-180 60-120

E85 One Ton Regular Cab 4x4 Dual Rear Wheels 

Pickup
27,399.00$         N/A  $         28,552.00 N/A  $         28,833.00  $         27,485.00 

Engine: 6.2L
L96 6.0L Vortec 

E85
6.0L 6.2L

Transmission No. /Gear Ratio No.: 6R140/3.13.1 MYD/GT5 MYD, 3.73 44P, 3.73

Make: Ford Chevrolet 2015 Chevrolet Ford

Model: F350 Silverado
 Silverado 

3500HD 
F-350 Reg Cab

GVWR: 14,000 13,400 13025 13800

Series, Code, Trim Level: 623A, F3D, XCT
3500-CK30903-

Base LT
 CK35903   F3D, 623A, XLT 

EPA: N/A NA @ This Time NA NA

Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days): 90-120 35/120 60-180 60-120

 $         (6,634.00)  $         29,136.00 
 $(5,997.00)

L96 
 $         (8,701.00) (6,500.00)$          (6,000.00)$          

6.2L 5.7L Hemi V8 6.0L Vortec 5.7L V-8 Hemi 6.0L 6.2L

 N/A  $         30,319.00  N/A N/A N/A

6.L V8 Mid Duty 

Hemi V8

 N/A  N/A N/A N/A

6  N/A  N/A  N/A  STD N/A N/A

7  N/A  $            (350.00)
 N/C

Std w/MW7 
 $            (425.00) N/A N/A

8

 $        1,125.00

includes fog 

lamps, power 

seat, reverse 

sensing 

 $              140.00  $              296.00  INC 190.00$              N/A

9  N/A  STD  N/A  STD N/A N/A

Air-Conditioning (deduct).

40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat (deduct).

From Automatic to Manual Four-Speed Transmission (deduct).

Fog Lights

Engine (other gas).

Specify Engine Size:

Engine (other diesel), including block heater, factory or dealer 

installed.

4

5 Model:

Warranty:

Specify Engine Size:

1 1 EA

2

2014 or Ciurrent Production Year One Ton Diesel Regular Cab 

4x4 Dual Rear Wheels Pickup Truck

1 EA

3
Engine (other gas).

Specify Engine Size:

L
in

e
 #

OPTIONS BID LIST
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Buyer:  Dianna Gilliland 4463 OF

Statewide
Opening Date:    09/06/13

Primary/E85 

Award

 Secondary 

Award 

10  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A N/A N/A

11  N/A  $           1,150.00  N/A  $              978.00 N/A N/A

12  N/A  STD  N/A  STD N/A N/A

13  $              165.00  STD  $              439.00  N/A 225.00$              265.00$              

 $                95.00  $              150.00  N/C  STD N/A 175.00$              

 200

Diesel only 
220 125 160 200

 N/A  STD  N/C  STD 98.00$                N/A

730  $              730.00 
 730 cca

Gas only 

16  $              195.00  STD  $              548.00  STD N/A 345.00$              

17  $            (600.00)  $            (910.00)  $            (750.00)  NO BID (550.00)$             (550.00)$             

18  STD  STD  $                97.00  $                57.00 STD STD

 N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A N/A N/A

 N/A 

 $            (450.00)  $         (1,000.00)  $            (577.00)  $         (1,020.00) (484.00)$             (419.00)$             

10,800 14,000
11,400

Diesel
NO BID 11,400 10960

 $           6,695.00  $         45,654.00  $           6,995.00  NO BID 6,990.00$           6,990.00$           

 Knapheide 696J 

or Omaha STD 

96V 

 Omaha Std 96V 

 Knapheide 696J 

or Omaha Std 

96V 

 Omaha Standard 

96V or Knapheide 

696J 

 Omaha Standard 

96V or Knapheide 

696J 

 $           7,825.00  $         46,854.00  $           7,995.00  NO BID 7,490.00$           7,490.00$           

 Knapheide 696J 

or Omaha STD 

96V 

 Omaha Std 

96V54D 

 Knapheide 

696D45J or 

Omaha Std 

96D54V 

 Omaha Standard 

96V or Knapheide 

696J 

 Omaha Standard 

96V or Knapheide 

696J 

23
 $      35, 852.00

includes spare 
 $         36,927.00  $            (550.00)  NO BID N/A 35,503.00$         

24
 $      35,044.00

includes spare 
 $         37,747.00  $            (550.00)  NO BID  $         35,930.00  $         34,595.00 

25  $         (1,316.00)  $         (2,000.00)  $         (1,299.00)  NO BID  $         (1,554.00)  $         (1,512.00)

14

15

No lid on Utility Body (deduct).

Heavy duty alternator, optional, minimum 105 amp alternator.

Bidder state amps:

Heavy duty battery optional.

Chassis Cab with no Utility Box (With dual wheels). 

GVWR:  (NOTE: Five wheels and tires will be required meeting 

same requirements as defined in the Specifications).

19

Sliding rear-vision window.

Chassis with eight foot Utility Body (see ATTACHMENT) Single 

wheel (Color of Utility Body to match manufacturer color charts).

State make and model:

Short pickup box length (deduct).

Bidder state box size: State dimensions box bid: _____" Length, 

_____" / width, _____" width between wheel wells.

Single rear wheels (deduct).

Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering (deduct).

Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim.

2 electric remote controlled outside mirrors, swing away type, 

6"x9" (deduct).

Right and left telescopic mirrors, minimum 6x8.

Second Power Outlet.

Bidder state wheelbase:

Bidder state CCA:

20

21

Chassis with eight foot Utility Body (see ATTACHMENT) Dual 

wheel (Color of Utility Body to match manufacturer color charts).

Chassis Cab with no Utility Box (With single wheels). 

22

State make and model:

Two wheel drive (deduct).
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Buyer:  Dianna Gilliland 4463 OF

Statewide
Opening Date:    09/06/13

Primary/E85 

Award

 Secondary 

Award 

 $              475.00  $              500.00  $              548.00  $              404.00  $              425.00  $              425.00 

 Ultimate Linings 

by Anderson Ford 
 Max Liner 

27  $                95.00  INC  $              109.00  STD 95.00$                95.00$                

28
 STD

See  attch. 
 N/C 

 NC 

See attached 
 SEE ATTACHED see attached see attached

29  $              705.00  N/A  $              199.00  SEE ATTACHED see attached see attached

30  $              395.00  N/C 
 $            547.00

See attached 
 SEE ATTACHED see attached see attached

31  $              795.00  $              700.00  $              879.00  $              596.00  $              470.00 

32  $              375.00  $              400.00  $              219.00  NO BID N/A 375.00$              

33  $              380.00  $              400.00  $              526.00  $              336.00 
 $           330.00

Diesel only 

 $           380.00

Diesel only 

34  N/A  INC 

 $          (247.00)

Requires Base 

WT Pkg 

 STD N/A N/A

35  N/A  INC 

 $          (247.00)

Requires Base 

WT Pkg 

 STD N/A N/A

36  STD  $           1,150.00  Std  STD 
 STD

Drivers side 

 STD

Drivers side 

37  N/A  $              350.00  $              309.00  N/A 325.00$              325.00$              

38  N/A  N/A  $              439.00  N/A 
 $            325.00

when available 
N/A

39  $              295.00  $              135.00 
 $            889.00

when available 
 N/A 

 $            425.00

when available 
370.00$              

40  N/A  See Attach  NA    N/A N/A N/A

41  N/A  See Attach  $              395.00  N/A N/A N/A

 N/A  $           2,945.00  NC    NO BID  (call for options)  (call for options) 

5/100,000

Premium Care

5/100,000

$100 Deductable

5/100,000

Pwr Train

43  $              295.00  $              500.00  $              500.00  $              400.00 
 $2.00 per mile or 

400 max 

 $2.00 per mile or 

400 max 

0 30 0 30 0 15 0 0 15 0 15

90-120 90-120 35-120 60-180 60-120

$5,260.00

8' Boss straight 

blade snow plow

$5,260.00

8' Boss straight 

blade snow plow

26

Comments

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

Seat lumbar support: Lumbar support in seats if not standard 

equipment.

Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer.

Equipment & engine service repair manual. 

State    YEARS _______     MILES ________

Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment outside the 

Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would be for vehicles 

bought by political entities and other Divisions of Government.

Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM.

Equipment & engine parts manual.

Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM

42

Standard Paint-Attach List and Identify as No Additional Cost 

Paints.

Cargo light.

Dealer or Factory installed rearview camera.

Dealer or Factory installed tailgate step.

Due to the build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles may consist of a Primary Award which is 

awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications and a Secondary Award which may be awarded to 

the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model meeting specifications.

Dealer or Factory installed dual alternators.

Keyless remote entry locking system (deduct)

Electronic compass/temp display (deduct).

For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of:  Dodge #PL1, 

Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code (9W3).

Extra Cost Paint-Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost Paints.

HD Rubberized spray in bed liner (Linex, Rhino or equivalent).

Bidder state manufacturer:

Protective vinyl side mouldings Dealer installed if not standard 

equipment. 
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