Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

PARTIAL PARTIAL PARTIAL

AWARD AWARD AWARD

Brads | "D | sande

% Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sér;gvaer:d & | g

5 INC. Company

Description Qty UOM |Unit Price|Unit Price[  Unit Price | Unit Price
1 |AUBURN YARD o [21000000) T
2 | ECUMSER YARD | 1000000 T
3 |pawNeECiTy yARD | 16000000 T
' |PALs oY vaRD o |1:800.0000] TN

DISTRICT 1 WINDROW
5 [GRAVEL JCT 105/136 1 MI S OF | 800.0000 | TN
JOHNSON

© |iwv s0@ PAWNEE CITy | 8000000 | TN
! Emigglgﬁé\/ﬁ,\fgﬁ/a 800.0000 | TN
5 JapionvaRD VE | 2000000 | T
9 |WeSTPONTYARD . [2000000 |
10 |C0LieRToN vaRD  [s000000 [T
11 8':;¢ERI’EIIDCING GRAVEL 2000000 TN
o [ | oooom |
DA S I
14 |CenTRALOITY YARD | 9000000 | T
15 |dounciry vARD | 1000000 | T
15 | EARNEY by 20 vaRD  [°000000 |TN
17| GRaND ISLAND vARD [7900000 | TN
18 |RAvENNAVARD 10000000 | TN
19 | CEhRNEY o0 vARD  |7°00000 |TN
20 gfgégﬁlfég%fgﬁ\ﬂ 500.0000 |TN
21 ajASsTT?N%ESICYIZSDGRAVEL 300.0000 |TN
22 Eﬂéf gI,EI,\(,|:|”\\:\?OGFRAAL\J/§(I5RA 1,200.0000 TN
23 E@iifv;w?z%vzgsgva 8,100.0000| TN

24 |\wv 281 2 MIN OF ST pauL_|1000000 | TN A
25 aﬁiimw?ﬁog,v: SLITI'_AL\I/EI??LTON 2,500.0000| TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Brads BROADFOOT | Central
- . SAND & Sand &
% Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sér;gvaer:d GRAVEL CO.. | Gravel
£ INC. Company
Description Qty UOM [Unit Price|Unit Price|  Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
26 HWY 39 1 MI N OF GENOA 2,500.0000( TN $ 853
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
27 |HWY 66 1 MI S OF CENTRAL 1,400.0000| TN
CITY
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
28 HWY 58 2 MI N OF ROCKVILLE 2,040.0000) TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
29 HWY 92 1 MI W OF LOUP CITY 2,040.0000) TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
30 HWY 14 1 MI S OF SUPERIOR 1,500.0000 [TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
31 H81 2 MI E OF AYR 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
32 HWY 14 14 MI S OF AURORA 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
33 HASTINGS YARD 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
34 [HWY 2812 MI N OF RED 715.0000 | TN
CLOUD
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
35 |HWY 78 3 MI N OF GUIDE 715.0000 | TN
ROCK
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
36 RAVENNA YARD 680.0000 | TN $ 8.10
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
37 HWY 2 @ CAIRO 510.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
38 HWY 4 7 MI E OF JCT4/14 1,200.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
39 CHADRON YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
40 |JCT 385/20 3 MI' W OF 1,000.0000| TN
CHADRON
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
41 CRAWFORD YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
42 GORDON YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
43 HARRISON YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
a4 HEMINGFORD YARD 1,000.0000f TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
45 ALLIANCE YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
46 BRIDGEPORT YARD 2,000.0000{ TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
47 GERING YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
48 CHAPPELL YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
49 HARRISBURG YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
50 KIMBALL YARD 2,000.0000{ TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
51 SYDNEY YARD 2,000.0000{ TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Brads BROADFOOT | Central
- . SAND & Sand &
% Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sér;gva;r:d GRAVEL CO.. | Gravel
£ INC. Company
Description Qty UOM [Unit Price|Unit Price|  Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
®2 |GOTHENBURG YARD 300.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
53 NORTH PLATTE HWY 30 YARD 3,000.0000) TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
54 SUTHERLAND YARD 3,000.0000) TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
55 NORTH PLATTE 1-80 YARD 3,000.0000) TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
56 OGALLALA YARD 4,000.0000( TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
57 CALLAWAY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
58 ARNOLD YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
59 BROKEN BOW YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
60 ANSLEY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
61 |HWY 251 MIS OF 1,000.0000| TN
SUTHERLAND
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
62 HWY 23 1 MI W OF DICKENS 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
63 [HWY 2320 MI S OF NORTH 2,000.0000| TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
64 HWY 183 3 MI S OF SARGENT 1,400.00001 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
65 HWY 2 @ ANSLEY 1,400.0000| TN
UIoT O WINDRUVY GRAVEL
66 [HWY 921 MI E OF ARNOLD 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 HWY 92 @ GANDY 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 HWY 2 6 Ml E OF DUNNING 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
69 HWY 2 1/2 MI N OF ANSELMO 700.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
70 HWY 70 @ BROKEN BOW 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
71 |HWY 215 MI S OF BROKEN 1,750.0000| TN
BOW
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
72 HWY 2 @ HYANNIS 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
3 HWY 2 10 MI W OF MULLEN 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
4 HWY 2 1 MI W OF MULLEN 2,000.0000{ TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
S HWY 30 9 MI E OF OGALLALA 4,000.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
76 HWY 61 1 MI N OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Brads BROADFOOT | Central
- . SAND & Sand &
% Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sér;gva;r:d GRAVEL CO.. | Gravel
£ INC. Company
Description Qty UOM [Unit Price|Unit Price|  Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
77 [HWY 40 15 MI W OF 700.0000 | TN
CALLAWAY
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
8 HWY 92 11 Ml E OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
79 [HWY 8312 MIN OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
80 |HWY 8315 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
81 [HWY 8318 MIN OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
82 HWY 92 3 MI E OF TRYON 1,300.00001 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
83 [HWY 97 9 MI N OF NORTH 660.0000 | TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
84 |HWY 92 2 MI W OF 350.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
85 BIG SPRINGS YARD 600.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
86 HWY 283 3 MI N OF ARAPAHOE 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
87 HWY 136 1 Ml E OF ORLEANS 1,950.0000| TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
88 |HWY 23 W EDGE OF 1,200.0000| TN
HOLDREGE
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
89 HWY 3 @ MINDEN 1,320.0000| TN $ 6.25
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
90 HWY 6 4 MI W OF MC COOK 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
a1 HWY 83 4 MI S OF MAYWOOD 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
92 |HWY 234 MI E OF 730.0000 | TN
MOORSFIELD
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
93 HWY 23 1/2 MI W OF ELWOOD 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
94 HWY 61 8 MI S OF ENDERS 575.0000 | TN $ 11.83
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
95 HWY 34 2 Ml E OF BENKELMAN 1,150.0000| TN HoOBEE
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
9% HWY 6 1 Ml E OF PALISADE 575.0000 | TN
UloT O DEICING OGRAVEL
97 [AINSWORTH YARD 1,000.0000 TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
98 ATKINSON YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
99 SPENCER YARD 1,000.0000| TN

Page 4 of 30



Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Brads BROADFOOT | Central
- . SAND & Sand &
% Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sér;gva;r:d GRAVEL CO.. | Gravel
£ INC. Company
Description Qty UOM [Unit Price|Unit Price|  Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
100 NAPER YARD 1,000.0000f TN | $ 9.45
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
101 VALENTINE YARD 2,000.0000{ TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
102 CODY YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
103 O'NEILL YARD 2,000.0000{ TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
104 SPRINGFIELD YARD 1,000.0000( TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
105 MERRIMAN YARD 2,000.0000{ TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
106 HWY 12 @ NORDEN 300.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
107 HWY 183 3 MI S OF BASSETT 900.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
108 HWY 20 2 AINSWORTH 900.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
109 HWY 20 2 MI E OF ATKINSON 2,450.0000
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
110 HWY 20 2 MI W OF EMMITT 700.0000
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
111 |HWY 137 22 MI N OF 1,500.0000| TN
NEWPORT
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
112 |HWY 183 3 MI E OF 1,500.0000| TN
SPRINGVIEW
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
113 HWY 10 3 MI E OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN -
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
114 HWY 281 2 Ml E OF SPENCER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
115 HWY 11 1 MI S OF BURWELL 2,100.0000) TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
116 HWY 183 14 MI N OF TAYLOR 1,400.00001 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
17 HWY 12 13 MI W OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
118 HWY 20 1 MI W OF NORDEN 600.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
119 HWY 20 5 MI E OF VALENTINE 1,200.0000( TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
120 HWY 20 1 MI W OF MERRIMAN 1,200.0000( TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
121 HWY 97 26 MI S OF VALENTINE 300.0000 | TN
Total
Payment Terms 100 30 net 30 NET 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 30 5 45
Comments

Line 79 was a tie G3 Enterprises Inc & Western Materials: Coin Flip: Western Materials win witness

Lines 69 & 70 was a no bid. The NDOR will purchase under agency authority.

Page 5 of 30



Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459

OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

PARTIAL | PARTIAL |PARTIAL| PARTIAL PARTIAL
AWARD | AWARD [ AWARD AWARD AWARD
Ed
D&L Elkhorn HOOKER
SAND & Broadfoot Sand & Emme G3 BROS
ﬁ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel GRAVEL gasnc:jnz Gravel zar;\fi/: Entelrnpcrlses, SAND &
£ LLC LLC : GRAVEL
Gravel
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price PL:irglé Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
1 AUBURN YARD 2,100.0000( TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
2 TECUMSEH YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
3 PAWNEE CITY YARD 1,500.0000f TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
4 FALLS CITY YARD 1,500.0000f TN
DISTRICT 1 WINDROW
5 |GRAVEL JCT 105/136 1 MI S OF | 800.0000 | TN
JOHNSON
DIST 1 WINDROW GRAVEL
6 HWY 50 @ PAWNEE CITY 800.0000 | TN
DIST 1 WINDROW GRAVEL
! HWY 136 @ TECUMSEH 800.0000 | TN
DIST 3 DEICING GRAVEL
8 ALBION YARD 200.0000 | TN
DIST 3 DEICING GRAVEL
9 WEST POINT YARD 200.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
10 FULLERTON YARD 500.0000 |TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
11 ORD YARD 300.0000 (TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
12 ST PAUL YARD 100.0000 | TN -
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
13 GREELEY YARD 300.0000 [ TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
14 CENTRAL CITY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
15 LOUP CITY YARD 100.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
16 KEARNEY HWY 30 YARD 500.0000 TN $ 6.30
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
7 GRAND ISLAND YARD 750.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
18 RAVENNA YARD 1,000.0000 |TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
19 KEARNEY 1-80 YARD 750.0000 (TN $ 6.30
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
20 |SHELTON 1-80 YARD 500.0000 |TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
21 HASTINGS YARD 800.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
22 HWY 34 3 MI W OF AURORA 1,200.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
23 HWY 115 MI S OF ORD 8,100.0000| TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
24 HWY 281 2 MI N OF ST PAUL 100.0000 TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
25 HWY 14 8 MI N OF FULLERTON 2,500.0000( TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads
Ed
D&L Elkhorn HOOKER
SAND & Broadfoot Sand & Emme G3 BROS
ﬁ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel GRAVEL gasnc:jnz Gravel zar;\fi/: Entelrnpcrlses, SAND &
£ LLC LLC : GRAVEL
Gravel
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price Pl:i?é Unit Price | Unit Price
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
26 14wy 391 MINOFGENOA  |2°00:0000) TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
27 |HWY 66 1 MI S OF CENTRAL 1,400.0000| TN
CITY
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
28 HWY 58 2 MI N OF ROCKVILLE 2,040.0000| TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
29 HWY 92 1 MI W OF LOUP CITY 2,040.0000| TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
30 HWY 14 1 MI S OF SUPERIOR 1,500.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
31 H81 2 MI E OF AYR 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
32 HWY 14 14 MI S OF AURORA 400.0000 | TN $ S
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
33 HASTINGS YARD 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
34 |HWY 281 2 MI N OF RED 715.0000 | TN
CLOUD
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
35 |HWY 78 3 MI N OF GUIDE 715.0000 | TN
ROCK
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
36 RAVENNA YARD 680.0000 [ TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
37 HWY 2 @ CAIRO 510.0000 | TN $ 8.16
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
38 HWY 4 7 MI E OF JCT4/14 1,200.0000| TN -
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
39 CHADRON YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
40 |JCT 385/20 3 MI W OF 1,000.0000| TN
CHADRON
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
41 CRAWEORD YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
42 GORDON YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
43 HARRISON YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
44 HEMINGFORD YARD 1,000.00001 TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
45 ALLIANCE YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
46 BRIDGEPORT YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
47 GERING YARD 3,000.0000( TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
48 CHAPPELL YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
49 HARRISBURG YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
50 KIMBALL YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
51 SYDNEY YARD 2,000.0000( TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads
Ed
D&L Elkhorn HOOKER
Broadfoot Emme G3
T+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel SAND & & Sons L & Sand & | Enterprises IO
o GRAVEL sand & Gravel Gravel Inc ’ SAND &
£ LLC = LLC : GRAVEL
ravel
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price Pl:ircl,lé Unit Price | Unit Price
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
52 GOTHENBURG YARD 300.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
53 NORTH PLATTE HWY 30 YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
54 SUTHERLAND YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
55 NORTH PLATTE 1-80 YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
56 OGALLALA YARD 4,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
57 CALLAWAY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
58 ARNOLD YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
59 BROKEN BOW YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
60 ANSLEY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
61 |HWY 251 MIS OF 1,000.0000| TN
SUTHERLAND
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
62 HWY 23 1 MI W OF DICKENS 2,000.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
63 [HWY 23 20 MI S OF NORTH 2,000.0000( TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
64 HWY 183 3 MI S OF SARGENT 1,400.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
65 HWY 2 @ ANSLEY 1,400.0000| TN
UIST O WINDRUVVYV OGRAVEL
66 |HWY 921 MI E OF ARNOLD 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 HWY 92 @ GANDY 1,000.0000| TN $ 12.34
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 HWY 2 6 Ml E OF DUNNING 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
69 HWY 2 1/2 MI N OF ANSELMO 700.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
70 HWY 70 @ BROKEN BOW 350.0000 1 TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
71 |HWY 215 MI S OF BROKEN 1,750.0000| TN
BOW
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
72 HWY 2 @ HYANNIS 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
3 HWY 2 10 MI W OF MULLEN 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
4 HWY 2 1 MI W OF MULLEN 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
s HWY 30 9 MI E OF OGALLALA 4,000.0000| TN
76 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 1,300.0000| TN

HWY 61 1 MI N OF ARTHUR
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads
Ed
D&L Elkhorn HOOKER
Broadfoot Emme G3
ETS Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel SAND & & Sons S Sand & | Enterprises EINOkS
® GRAVEL Sand & Gravel Gravel Inc ’ SAND &
£ LLC LLC : GRAVEL
Gravel
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price Pl:izlé Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
77 |HWY 40 15 MIW OF 700.0000 | TN
CALLAWAY
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
8 HWY 92 11 MI E OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
79 |HWY 83 12 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
80 |HWY 8315 MI N OF 660.0000 [ TN $ 11.25
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
81 |HWY 8318 MIN OF 660.0000 | TN $ 11.15
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
82 HWY 92 3 MI E OF TRYON 1,300.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
83 |HWY 97 9 MI N OF NORTH 660.0000 | TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
84 |HWY 92 2 MI W OF 350.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
85 BIG SPRINGS YARD 600.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
86 HWY 283 3 MI N OF ARAPAHOE 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
87 HWY 136 1 Ml E OF ORLEANS 1,950.0000) TN -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
88 |HWY 23 W EDGE OF 1,200.0000] TN
HOLDREGE
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
89 HWY 3 @ MINDEN 1,320.0000| TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
90 HWY 6 4 MI W OF MC COOK 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
91 HWY 83 4 MI S OF MAYWOOD 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
92 |HWY 234 MI E OF 730.0000 | TN
MOORSFIELD
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
93 HWY 23 1/2 MI W OF ELWOOD 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
94 HWY 61 8 MI S OF ENDERS 575.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
95 HWY 34 2 Ml E OF BENKELMAN 1,150.0000| TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
96 HWY 6 1 MI E OF PALISADE 575.0000 | TN
UlToT O DUEITCING ORAVLEL
97 |AINSWORTH YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
98 ATKINSON YARD 1,500.0000| TN $ 595
99 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 1,000.0000| TN $ 825

SPENCER YARD
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads
Ed
D&L Elkhorn HOOKER
SAND & Broadfoot Sand & Emme G3 BROS
ﬁ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel GRAVEL gasnc()jn; Gravel ?;235 Entelrnpcrlses, SAND &
£ LLC LLC : GRAVEL
Gravel
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price Pl:ircl,lé Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
100 NAPER YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
101 VALENTINE YARD 2,000.0000| TN $ 13.29
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
102 CODY YARD 1,000.0000| TN $ 18.14
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
103 O'NEILL YARD 2,000.0000| TN $ 6.75
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
104 SPRINGFIELD YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
105 MERRIMAN YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
106 HWY 12 @ NORDEN 300.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
107 HWY 183 3 MI S OF BASSETT 900.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
108 HWY 20 2 AINSWORTH 900.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
109 HWY 20 2 MI E OF ATKINSON 2,450.0000| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
110 HWY 20 2 MI W OF EMMITT 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
111 [HWY 137 22 MI N OF 1,500.0000| TN $ 882
NEWPORT
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
112 [HWY 183 3 MI E OF 1,500.0000| TN
SPRINGVIEW
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
113 HWY 10 3 MI E OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
114 HWY 281 2 MI E OF SPENCER 700.0000 | TN B B
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
115 HWY 11 1 MI S OF BURWELL 2,100.0000f TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
116 HWY 183 14 MI N OF TAYLOR 1,400.0000) TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
117 HWY 12 13 M| W OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN $ 12.90
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
118 HWY 20 1 MI W OF NORDEN 600.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
119 HWY 20 5 MI E OF VALENTINE 1,200.0000| TN $ S
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
120 HWY 20 1 MI W OF MERRIMAN 1,200.0000| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
121 HWY 97 26 MI S OF VALENTINE 300.0000 | TN $ S
Total
Payment Terms net 45 100 30 Net 30 0 60 100 60 100 30 30
Delivery Days ARO 10 45 30 15 20 10
Comments

Line 79 was a tie G3 Enterprises Inc & Western hed by Kay Benson

Lines 69 & 70 was a no bid. The NDOR
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

PARTIAL | PARTIAL
AWARD | AWARD
Jeffres
i . Sand & | Johnsen Kelly
T+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & .
o Gravel Construction
= Inc Gravel
-
Description Qty UOM | Unit Price|Unit Price| Unit Price
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
1 AUBURN YARD 2,100.0000( TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
2 TECUMSEH YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
3 PAWNEE CITY YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
4 FALLS CITY YARD 1,500.0000f TN
DISTRICT 1 WINDROW
5 |GRAVEL JCT 105/136 1 MI S OF | 800.0000 | TN
JOHNSON
DIST 1 WINDROW GRAVEL
6 HWY 50 @ PAWNEE CITY 800.0000 | TN
DIST 1 WINDROW GRAVEL
! HWY 136 @ TECUMSEH 800.0000 | TN
DIST 3 DEICING GRAVEL
8 ALBION YARD 200.0000 | TN $ 11.39
DIST 3 DEICING GRAVEL
o WEST POINT YARD 200.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
10 FULLERTON YARD 500.0000 |[TN $ 934
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
11 ORD YARD 300.0000 |[TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
12 ST PAUL YARD 100.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
13 GREELEY YARD 300.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
14 CENTRAL CITY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
5 LOUP CITY YARD 100.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
16 KEARNEY HWY 30 YARD 500.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
17 GRAND ISLAND YARD 750.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
18 RAVENNA YARD 1,000.0000 (TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
19 KEARNEY [-80 YARD 750.0000 |TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
20 SHELTON I-80 YARD 500.0000 |TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
21 HASTINGS YARD 300.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
22 HWY 34 3 MI W OF AURORA 1,200.0000 [TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
23 HWY 115 MI S OF ORD 8,100.0000) TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
24 HWY 281 2 MI N OF ST PAUL 100.0000 TN
25 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 2.500.0000| TN

HWY 14 8 MI N OF FULLERTON
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Jeffres
i . Sand & | Johnsen Kelly
T+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & .
o Gravel Construction
e Gravel
5 Inc
Description Qty UOM | Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
26 1wy 391 MINOF GENOA | 250000001 TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
27 |HWY 66 1 MI S OF CENTRAL 1,400.0000| TN
CITY
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
28 HWY 58 2 MI N OF ROCKVILLE 2,040.0000) TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
29 HWY 92 1 MI W OF LOUP CITY 2,040.0000) TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
30 HWY 14 1 MI S OF SUPERIOR 1,500.0000 [TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
31 H81 2 MI E OF AYR 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
32 HWY 14 14 MI S OF AURORA 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
33 HASTINGS YARD 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
34 |HWY 281 2 MIN OF RED 715.0000 | TN
CLOUD
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
35 [HWY 78 3 MI N OF GUIDE 715.0000 | TN
ROCK
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
36 RAVENNA YARD 680.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
37 HWY 2 @ CAIRO 510.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
38 HWY 4 7 MI E OF JCT4/14 1,200.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
39 CHADRON YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
40 |JCT 385/20 3 MI' W OF 1,000.0000| TN
CHADRON
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
41 CRAWFORD YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
42 GORDON YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
43 HARRISON YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
a4 HEMINGFORD YARD 1,000.0000f TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
45 ALLIANCE YARD 1,500.0000| TN | $ 13.40
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
46 BRIDGEPORT YARD 2,000.0000f TN [ $ 9.81
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
47 GERING YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
48 CHAPPELL YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
49 HARRISBURG YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
50 KIMBALL YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
51 SYDNEY YARD 2,000.0000( TN [ $ 13.30
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Jeffres
i . Sand & | Johnsen Kelly
T+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & .
o Gravel Construction
e Gravel
5 Inc
Description Qty UOM | Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
52 GOTHENBURG YARD 300.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
53 NORTH PLATTE HWY 30 YARD 3,000.0000( TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
54 SUTHERLAND YARD 3,000.0000( TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
55 NORTH PLATTE 1-80 YARD 3,000.0000( TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
56 OGALLALA YARD 4,000.0000( TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
57 CALLAWAY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
58 ARNOLD YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
59 BROKEN BOW YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
60 ANSLEY YARD 500.0000 [ TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
61 [HWY 251 MIS OF 1,000.0000| TN
SUTHERLAND
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
62 HWY 23 1 MI W OF DICKENS 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
63 [HWY 2320 MI S OF NORTH 2,000.0000( TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
64 HWY 183 3 MI S OF SARGENT 1,400.0000( TN [
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
65 HWY 2 @ ANSLEY 1,400.0000| TN
UIoST O WINDRUVY GRAVEL
66 [HWY 921 MI E OF ARNOLD 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 HWY 92 @ GANDY 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 HWY 2 6 Ml E OF DUNNING 1,000.0000( TN [
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
69 HWY 2 1/2 MI N OF ANSELMO 700.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
70 HWY 70 @ BROKEN BOW 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
71 [HWY 215 MI S OF BROKEN 1,750.0000| TN
BOW
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
72 HWY 2 @ HYANNIS 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
3 HWY 2 10 MI W OF MULLEN 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
74 HWY 2 1 MI W OF MULLEN 2,000.0000{ TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
S HWY 30 9 MI E OF OGALLALA 4,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
76 HWY 61 1 MI N OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

Department of Roads

4459 OF

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Jeffres
Sand & OISO Kell
H* Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & v
o Gravel Construction
e Gravel
= Inc
-
Description Qty UOM | Unit Price|Unit Price| Unit Price
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
77 [HWY 40 15 MI W OF 700.0000 | TN
CALLAWAY
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
8 HWY 92 11 MI E OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
79 [HWY 83 12 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
80 [HWY 8315 MIN OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
81 [HWY 8318 MIN OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
82 HWY 92 3 MI E OF TRYON 1,300.0000{ TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
83 |HWY 97 9 MI N OF NORTH 660.0000 | TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
84 [HWY 922 MIW OF 350.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
85 BIG SPRINGS YARD 600.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
86 HWY 283 3 MI N OF ARAPAHOE 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
87 HWY 136 1 Ml E OF ORLEANS 1,950.0000) TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
88 [HWY 23 W EDGE OF 1,200.0000| TN
HOLDREGE
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
89 HWY 3 @ MINDEN 1,320.0000| TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
90 HWY 6 4 MI W OF MC COOK 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
9 HWY 83 4 MI S OF MAYWOOD 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
92 [HWY 234 MIE OF 730.0000 | TN
MOORSFIELD
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
93 HWY 23 1/2 MI W OF ELWOOD 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
94 HWY 61 8 MI S OF ENDERS 575.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
95 HWY 34 2 MI E OF BENKELMAN 1,150.0000) TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
96 HWY 6 1 MI E OF PALISADE 575.0000 | TN
UlTo T O DEITCING OGRAVEL
97 [AINSWORTH YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
98 ATKINSON YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
99 SPENCER YARD 1,000.0000| TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Jeffres
Sand & sallsol Kell
T+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & v
o Gravel Construction
e Gravel
5 Inc
-
Description Qty UOM | Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
100 NAPER YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
101 VALENTINE YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
102 CODY YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
103 O'NEILL YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
104 SPRINGFIELD YARD 1,000.0000| TN | $ 12.00
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
105 MERRIMAN YARD 2,000.0000( TN [ $ 22.65
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
106 HWY 12 @ NORDEN 300.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
107 HWY 183 3 MI S OF BASSETT 900.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
108 HWY 20 2 AINSWORTH 900.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
109 HWY 20 2 MI E OF ATKINSON 2,450.0000) TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
110 HWY 20 2 MI W OF EMMITT 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
111 |HWY 137 22 MI N OF 1,500.0000| TN
NEWPORT
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
112 |HWY 183 3 MI E OF 1,500.0000| TN
SPRINGVIEW
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
113 HWY 10 3 MI E OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
114 HWY 281 2 Ml E OF SPENCER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
115 HWY 11 1 MI S OF BURWELL 2,100.0000| TN |SSEREBHS
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
116 HWY 183 14 MI N OF TAYLOR 1,400.0000| TN (RERRLEIER
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
17 HWY 12 13 MI W OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
118 HWY 20 1 MI W OF NORDEN 600.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
119 HWY 20 5 MI E OF VALENTINE 1,200.0000| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
120 HWY 20 1 MI W OF MERRIMAN 1,200.0000| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
121 HWY 97 26 MI S OF VALENTINE 300.0000 | TN
Total
Payment Terms Net 10 30 100 60
Delivery Days ARO As $ 30.00| $ 30.00
Comments

Line 79 was a tie G3 Enterprises Inc & Western \

Lines 69 & 70 was a no bid. The NDOR
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

PARTIAL| PARTIAL |PARTIAL PARTIAL | PARTIAL
AWARD [ AWARD [ AWARD AWARD | AWARD
LAKESIDE Mid-
Kembel Marxsen Ogallala
T+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & SANDAND | L &L Sand & NEECE O Ready
o GRAVEL Gravel Aggregate .
e Gravel Gravel Mix Co.
5 LLC Inc.
Description Qty UOM | Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price| Unit Price | Unit Price
1 DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL 2.100.0000| TN

AUBURN YARD

DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
2 TECUMSEH YARD 1,500.00001 TN

DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
3 |PAWNEE CITY YARD 1,500.0000| TN

DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
4 |raLLs CITY YARD 1,500.0000| TN

DISTRICT 1 WINDROW
5 |GRAVEL JCT 105/136 1 MI S OF | 800.0000 | TN
JOHNSON

DIST 1 WINDROW GRAVEL
® |HwY 50 @ PAWNEE CITY 800.0000 | TN

DIST 1 WINDROW GRAVEL
! HWY 136 @ TECUMSEH 800.0000 | TN

DIST 3 DEICING GRAVEL
8 ALBION YARD 200.0000 | TN

DIST 3 DEICING GRAVEL
o WEST POINT YARD 200.0000 |TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
10 |FULLERTON YARD 500.0000 (TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL

1 ORD YARD 300.0000 |TN

B e e i
s PAREIETNE | oo
14 'é'ESJT‘Lﬁf'S.'?f Y(ZF;/EVEL 500.0000 | TN
15 DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 100.0000 | T™N

LOUP CITY YARD

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
16" |KEARNEY HWY 30 YARD =00.0000 TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
17 |GRAND ISLAND YARD 750.0000 |TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
18 RAVENNA YARD 1,000.0000 (TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
19 |KEARNEY 1-80 YARD 750.0000 (TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
20 |SHELTON 1-80 YARD 500.0000 |TN $ 860

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
21 HASTINGS YARD 300.0000 TN

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
22 HWY 34 3 Ml W OF AURORA 1,200.0000 TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
23 |,y 115 MI S OF ORD 8,100.0000| TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
24 HWY 281 2 MI N OF ST PAUL 100.0000 /TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
25 HWY 14 8 MI N OF FULLERTON 2,500.0000) TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

Kembel i Marxsen Ll Ogallala
ETS Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & SAND AND [ Sand & NEgESE Ready
® GRAVEL Gravel Aggregate .
e Gravel Gravel Mix Co.
5 LLC Inc.
Description Qty UOM|Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price|Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
26 |wy 39 1 MI N OF GENOA 2,500.0000( TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
27 |HWY 66 1 MI S OF CENTRAL 1,400.0000] TN
CITY
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
28 HWY 58 2 MI N OF ROCKVILLE 2,040.0000) TN $ 11.99
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
29 HWY 92 1 MI W OF LOUP CITY 2,040.0000| TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
30 HWY 14 1 MI S OF SUPERIOR 1,500.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
31 H81 2 MI E OF AYR 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
32 HWY 14 14 MI S OF AURORA 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
33 HASTINGS YARD 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
34 |HWY 281 2 MI N OF RED 715.0000 | TN
CLOUD
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
35 |HWY 78 3 MI N OF GUIDE 715.0000 | TN $ 10.83
ROCK
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
36 RAVENNA YARD 680.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
37 HWY 2 @ CAIRO 510.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
38 HWY 4 7 MI E OF JCT4/14 1,200.0000) TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
39 CHADRON YARD 1,000.0000( TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
40 [JCT 385/20 3 MI W OF 1,000.0000] TN
CHADRON
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
41 CRAWEORD YARD 1,000.0000] TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
42 GORDON YARD 2,000.0000] TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
43 HARRISON YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
44 HEMINGFORD YARD 1,000.0000] TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
45 ALLIANCE YARD 1,500.0000( TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
46 BRIDGEPORT YARD 2,000.0000f TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
47 GERING YARD 3,000.0000] TN | $ 6.67
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
48 CHAPPELL YARD 1,000.0000] TN $ 11.40
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
49 HARRISBURG YARD 1,000.0000] TN | $ 7.66
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
50 KIMBALL YARD 2,000.0000| TN [ $ 12.36
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
51 SYDNEY YARD 2,000.0000| TN $ 18.33
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

Kembel i Marxsen Ll Ogallala
ETS Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & SAND AND [ Sand & NEgESE Ready
o GRAVEL Gravel Aggregate .
e Gravel Gravel Mix Co.
5 LLC Inc.
Description Qty UOM|Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price|Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
52 GOTHENBURG YARD 300.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
53 NORTH PLATTE HWY 30 YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
>4 |SUTHERLAND YARD 3,000.0000{ TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
55 NORTH PLATTE I-80 YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
56 OGALLALA YARD 4,000.0000( TN $ 11.00
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
57 CALLAWAY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
58 ARNOLD YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
59 BROKEN BOW YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
60 ANSLEY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
61 |HWY 251 MIS OF 1,000.0000] TN
SUTHERLAND
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
62 HWY 23 1 MI W OF DICKENS 2,000.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
63 |HWY 23 20 MI S OF NORTH 2,000.0000] TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
64 HWY 183 3 MI S OF SARGENT 1,400.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
65 HWY 2 @ ANSLEY 1,400.0000] TN
UIST O WINDRUVV OGRAVEL
66 |[HWY 92 1 Ml E OF ARNOLD 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 HWY 92 @ GANDY 1,000.0000( TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 HWY 2 6 MI E OF DUNNING 1,000.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
69 HWY 2 1/2 MI N OF ANSELMO 700.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
70 HWY 70 @ BROKEN BOW 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
71 |HWY 215 MI S OF BROKEN 1,750.0000] TN
BOW
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
72 HWY 2 @ HYANNIS 1,300.0000( TN $ 15.25
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
73 HWY 2 10 Ml W OF MULLEN 1,300.0000] TN $ 16.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
74 HWY 2 1 MI W OF MULLEN 2,000.0000| TN $ 15.20
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
5 HWY 30 9 Ml E OF OGALLALA 4,000.0000| TN # B2l
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
76 HWY 61 1 MI N OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN $ 11.14
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

Kembel i Marxsen Ll Ogallala
ETS Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & SAND AND Sand & heDEELE Ready
® GRAVEL Gravel Aggregate .
e Gravel Gravel Mix Co.
5 LLC Inc.
Description Qty UOM | Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price|Unit Price| Unit Price | Unit Price
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
77 |HWY 40 15 MI W OF 700.0000 | TN
CALLAWAY
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
78 HWY 92 11 MI E OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN $ 1471
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
79 |HWY 83 12 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
80 [HWY 83 15 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
81 |HWY 83 18 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
82 HWY 92 3 MI E OF TRYON 1,300.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
83 |HWY 97 9 MI N OF NORTH 660.0000 [ TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
84 [HWY 92 2 MI W OF 350.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
85 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 600.0000 | TN $ 955

BIG SPRINGS YARD

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
86 HWY 283 3 MI N OF ARAPAHOE 730.0000 | TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
87 HWY 136 1 MI E OF ORLEANS 1,950.00001 TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

88 |HWY 23 W EDGE OF 1,200.0000( TN
HOLDREGE
89 DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL 1,320.0000| TN

HWY 3 @ MINDEN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
9 hwy 64 MI W OF MC cook | 730:0000 | TN $ 805

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
91 lhwy 83 4 mi's OF MAYWoOD | 730-0000 | TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

92 |HWY 23 4 MI E OF 730.0000 [ TN
MOORSFIELD
93 DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL 730.0000 | TN

HWY 23 1/2 MI W OF ELWOOD

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
94 |HWY 61 8 MI S OF ENDERS 575.0000 TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
9 HWY 34 2 Ml E OF BENKELMAN 1,150.0000| TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
9 1HWY 6 1 MI E OF PALISADE 575.0000 | TN $ 825

Ulo T O UCICING ORAVLEL

97 |AINSWORTH YARD 1,000.0000| TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
98 ATKINSON YARD 1,500.0000| TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
99 SPENCER YARD 1,000.0000( TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

Kembel A N Marxsen alies Ogallala
T+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Sand & SANDAND | L &L Sand & NEECE O Ready
o GRAVEL Gravel Aggregate .
e Gravel Gravel Mix Co.
5 LLC Inc.
Description Qty UOM|Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price|Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
100 NAPER YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
101 VALENTINE YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
102 CODY YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
103 O'NEILL YARD 2,000.0000( TN
104 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 1,000.0000| TN

SPRINGFIELD YARD

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
105 |\ERRIMAN YARD 2,000.0000| TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
106 HWY 12 @ NORDEN 300.0000 [ TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
107 HWY 183 3 MI S OF BASSETT 900.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
108 HWY 20 2 AINSWORTH 900.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
109 11wy 20 2 MI E OF ATKINSON | 24°0-0000| TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
110 1wy 20 2 MI w OF EMMITT 700.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL

111 [HWY 137 22 MI N OF 1,500.0000( TN
NEWPORT
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL

112 [HWY 183 3 MI E OF 1,500.0000( TN
SPRINGVIEW

113 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 700.0000 | TN

HWY 10 3 Ml E OF NAPER

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
114 1hwy 281 2 Mi E OF SPENCER | 7900000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
115 1wy 111 MI S OF BURWELL | 210000001 TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
116 1wy 183 14 MI N OF TAYLOR | 1400-0000| TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
117 THwy 12 13 MI W OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
118 HWY 20 1 MI W OF NORDEN 600.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
119 HWY 20 5 MI E OF VALENTINE 1,200.0000f TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
120 14wy 20 1 MI W OF MERRIMAN | 1:200-0000] TN $ 24.00

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
121 HWY 97 26 MI S OF VALENTINE 300.0000 | TN

Total

Payment Terms 100 30 N/A N/A 100 30 100 60 100 30
Delivery Days ARO As 10 10 per ITB 45
Comments

Line 79 was a tie G3 Enterprises Inc & Western \
Lines 69 & 70 was a no bid. The NDOR
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459

OF Opening Date: 08/23/13

Department of Roads

PARTIAL PARTIAL
AWARD AWARD

4::) Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel GRAVEL, Sand &

- ING. Inc.

Description Qty UOM | Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price

! ZIJS;ulRﬁE\I(i:'Q\IS GRAVEL 2,100.0000( TN

> |TECUMSER YARD | 15000000] TN

3 |AwNEECiTYvARD | 16000000 TN

* |Pais oy varD - |18000000) TN

DISTRICT 1 WINDROW
5 |GRAVEL JCT 105/136 1 MI S OF | 800.0000 | TN
JOHNSON

© |owv s0@ PAWNEE CITy | 8900000 | T

! zﬁii;ﬁ'gDTRE%vL\J/l\ngAl-\ll = 800.0000 | TN

5 |aBlonvaARD Ve | 2000000 | TN

O |WestroiT vany - [2000000 [

10 Eb?_{égTE(;ilNyiSDRAVEL 500.0000 |TN

11 glsgifgécme GRAVEL 23000000 TN

12 |oTPAuYARD e | 1000000 | T

13 |CReeLoy vARD oo | 3000000 | T

14 Ok e[ sooooo0 | v [STGHE

15 |Coun ity vARD | 1000000 | TN

15 |k EARNEY Hwy 30 vaRD  [°000000 TN

17| GRAND ISUAND vARD 7900000 |TN

18 |RAVENNAVARD - [1000.0000 | TN

19 E:;SATR?VEEI%'S%AGF?{;VEL 750.0000 |TN

) P e

21 3IASSTT?NDGESIC§(IEI§DGRAVEL 300.0000 |TN

22 3@12? gl,z ﬁ,"\\:\?OGFR:L\J/EERA 1,200.0000 TN

23 3@1‘;:\/5”,\\‘4?200\/,\:/823\”1 8,100.0000( TN

24 | R oAV, [100.0000  |TN

25 | RO SRV |2:500.0000( TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel

Line #

Description Qty UOM | Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
26 |HwY 39 1 MI N OF GENOA 2,500.0000| TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
27 |HWY 66 1 MI S OF CENTRAL 1,400.0000( TN
CITY

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
28 lawy 58 2 MI N OF ROCKVILLE | 20400000 TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
29 HWY 92 1 MIW OF LOUP CITY 2,040.0000) TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
30 HWY 14 1 MI S OF SUPERIOR 1,500.0000 TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
31 lh812MIE OF AYR 400.0000 | TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
32 |HwY 1414 MI S OF AURORA | 4000000 | TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
33 HASTINGS YARD 400.0000 | TN

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

34 |HWY 281 2 MI N OF RED 715.0000 [ TN
CLOUD
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
35 |HWY 78 3 MI N OF GUIDE 715.0000 [ TN
ROCK
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
36 RAVENNA YARD 680.0000 [ TN
37 DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL 510.0000 | TN

HWY 2 @ CAIRO

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
38 HWY 4 7 MI E OF JCT4/14 1,200.0000f TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
39 |CHADRON YARD 1,000.0000| TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

40 |JCT 385/20 3 MI W OF 1,000.0000( TN
CHADRON
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
41 CRAWEORD YARD 1,000.0000( TN
42 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 2.000.0000| TN

GORDON YARD

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
43 HARRISON YARD 2,000.0000f TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
44 | LEMINGFORD YARD 1,000.0000| TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
45 ALLIANCE YARD 1,500.0000f TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
46 BRIDGEPORT YARD 2,000.0000f TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

a7 GERING YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

48 CHAPPELL YARD 1,000.0000( TN

49 DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL 1,000.0000| TN

HARRISBURG YARD

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
50 |KIMBALL YARD 2,000.0000| TN

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
51 |SYDNEY YARD 2,000.0000| TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel

Line #

Description Qty UOM | Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
52 GOTHENBURG YARD 300.0000 | TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
53 NORTH PLATTE HWY 30 YARD 3,000.0000] TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
54 SUTHERLAND YARD 3,000.0000) TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
55 NORTH PLATTE 1-80 YARD 3,000.0000) TN

DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

56 OGALLALA YARD 4,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

57 CALLAWAY YARD 500.0000 | TN -
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

58 ARNOLD YARD 500.0000 [ TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

59 BROKEN BOW YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL

60 ANSLEY YARD 500.0000 [ TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

61 |HWY 251 MIS OF 1,000.0000( TN
SUTHERLAND

62 DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL 2.000.0000| TN

HWY 23 1 MI W OF DICKENS

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
63 |HWY 23 20 MI S OF NORTH 2,000.0000| TN
PLATTE

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
64 HWY 183 3 MI S OF SARGENT 1,400.0000| TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
65 HWY 2 @ ANSLEY 1,400.0000( TN -

UlIoT O WINDRUVW OGRAVEL

66 [HWY 92 1 MI E OF ARNOLD 350.0000 [ TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 lawy 92 @ GANDY 1,000.0000( TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 HWY 2 6 MI E OF DUNNING 1,000.00001 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
®9 lhwy 2 172 MI N OF ANSELMO | 7000000 | TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
70 HWY 70 @ BROKEN BOW 350.0000 | TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
71 |HWY 21 5 MI S OF BROKEN 1,750.0000( TN
BOW

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
72 HWY 2 @ HYANNIS 1,300.0000( TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
3 HWY 2 10 MI W OF MULLEN 1,300.0000f TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
4 HWY 2 1 MI W OF MULLEN 2,000.0000f TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
> |hwy 30 9 MI E OF ocALLALA |#00000001 TN

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
76 HWY 61 1 MI N OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000) TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

1+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel

g

-

Description Qty UOM | Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price| Unit Price |Unit Price

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

77 |HWY 40 15 MIW OF 700.0000 | TN
CALLAWAY
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

8 HWY 92 11 MI E OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

79 |HWY 83 12 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

80 |HWY 8315 MI N OF 660.0000 [ TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

81 |HWY 83 18 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

82 HWY 92 3 MI E OF TRYON 1,300.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

83 |HWY 97 9 MI N OF NORTH 660.0000 [ TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

84 |HWY 92 2 MI W OF 350.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

85 BIG SPRINGS YARD 600.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

86 HWY 283 3 MI N OF ARAPAHOE 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

87 HWY 136 1 Ml E OF ORLEANS 1,950.0000) TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

88 |HWY 23 W EDGE OF 1,200.0000( TN $ 835
HOLDREGE
89 DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL 1,320.0000| TN

HWY 3 @ MINDEN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
90 HWY 6 4 MI W OF MC COOK 730.0000 | TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
91 lhwy 83 4 MI's OF MAYWOOD | 730-0000 | TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
92 |HWY 23 4 MI E OF 730.0000 [ TN
MOORSFIELD

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
93 HWY 23 1/2 MI W OF ELWOOD 730.0000 | TN -

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
9 lHwy 61 8 MI S OF ENDERS 575.0000 | TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
9 HWY 34 2 Ml E OF BENKELMAN 1,150.0000f TN

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL
% lwy 61 MiEOF PALISADE | 2720000 | TN

UloT O DEICING OGRAVLEL
97 |AINSWORTH YARD 1,000.0000| TN -

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
98 ATKINSON YARD 1,500.0000| TN

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
99 SPENCER YARD 1,000.0000( TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4459 OF Opening Date: 08/23/13
Department of Roads

1+ Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel

2

-

Description Qty UOM | Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price| Unit Price [Unit Price

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

100 NAPER YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

101 VALENTINE YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

102 CODY YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

103 O'NEILL YARD 2,000.0000( TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

104 SPRINGFIELD YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

105 MERRIMAN YARD 2,000.0000( TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
106 HWY 12 @ NORDEN 300.0000 [ TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
107 HWY 183 3 MI S OF BASSETT 900.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
108 HWY 20 2 AINSWORTH 900.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
109 11wy 20 2 MI E OF ATKINSON | #4°0-0000| TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
1101wy 20 2 MI w OF EMMITT 700.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL

111 [HWY 137 22 MI N OF 1,500.0000( TN
NEWPORT
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL

112 (HWY 183 3 MI E OF 1,500.0000( TN
SPRINGVIEW

113 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 700.0000 | TN

HWY 10 3 Ml E OF NAPER

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
114 1hwy 281 2 Mi E OF SPENCER | 7000000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
115 HWY 11 1 MI S OF BURWELL 2,100.0000| TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
116 1wy 183 14 MI N OF TAYLOR | 1:400-0000| TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL

117 HWY 12 13 MI W OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
118 HWY 20 1 MI W OF NORDEN 600.0000 | TN -
119 DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL 1,200.0000| TN

HWY 20 5 MI E OF VALENTINE

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
120 HWY 20 1 MI W OF MERRIMAN 1,200.0000f TN

DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
121 HWY 97 26 MI S OF VALENTINE 300.0000 | TN

Total

Payment Terms 100 30 100 90 0
Delivery Days ARO 30 upon 30 30 45
Comments

Line 79 was a tie G3 Enterprises Inc & Western \
Lines 69 & 70 was a no bid. The NDOR
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

PARTIAL | PARTIAL
AWARD AWARD
Ulrich Western
* Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Materials
) Gravel Inc.
< Inc.
-
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
1 AUBURN YARD 2,100.0000| TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
2 TECUMSEH YARD 1,500.0000) TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
3 PAWNEE CITY YARD 1,500.0000) TN
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL
4 FALLS CITY YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DISTRICT 1 WINDROW
5 |GRAVEL JCT 105/136 1 MI S OF | 800.0000 | TN
JOHNSON
DIST 1 WINDROW GRAVEL
6 HWY 50 @ PAWNEE CITY 800.0000 | TN
DIST 1 WINDROW GRAVEL
! HWY 136 @ TECUMSEH 800.0000 | TN
DIST 3 DEICING GRAVEL
8 ALBION YARD 200.0000 | TN
DIST 3 DEICING GRAVEL
9 WEST POINT YARD 200.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
10 FULLERTON YARD 500.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
11 ORD YARD 300.0000 |TN $ 8.00
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
12 ST PAUL YARD 100.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
13 | GREELEY YARD 300.0000 | TN GRS
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
14 CENTRAL CITY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
15 | ouP cITY YARD 100.0000 | TN RERNLS
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
16 KEARNEY HWY 30 YARD 500.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
1 GRAND ISLAND YARD 750.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
18 RAVENNA YARD 1,000.0000 | TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
19 KEARNEY 1-80 YARD 750.0000 TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
20 SHELTON 1-80 YARD 500.0000 |TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
21 HASTINGS YARD 300.0000 |TN
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
22 HWY 34 3 MI W OF AURORA 1,200.0000 TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
23 HWY 11 5 MI S OF ORD 8,100.0000| TN 8.14
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
24 HWY 281 2 MI N OF ST PAUL 100.0000 (TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
25 HWY 14 8 MI N OF FULLERTON 2,500.0000{ TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Ulrich Western

* Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Materials

) Gravel Inc.

< Inc

-

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

26 |y 39 1 MI N OF GENOA 2,500.0000( TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

27 [HWY 66 1 MI S OF CENTRAL 1,400.0000| TN
CITY
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

28 HWY 58 2 MI N OF ROCKVILLE 2,040.0000
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

29 HWY 92 1 MI W OF LOUP CITY 2,040.0000
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

30 HWY 14 1 MI S OF SUPERIOR 1,500.0000|TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

31 H81 2 MI E OF AYR 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

82 HWY 14 14 MI S OF AURORA 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

33 HASTINGS YARD 400.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

34 [HWY 281 2 MI N OF RED 715.0000 | TN
CLOUD
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

35 [HWY 78 3 MI N OF GUIDE 715.0000 | TN
ROCK
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

36 RAVENNA YARD 680.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

37 HWY 2 @ CAIRO 510.0000 | TN
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL

38 HWY 4 7 MI E OF JCT4/14 1,200.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

39 CHADRON YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

40 |JCT 385/20 3 MI' W OF 1,000.0000| TN
CHADRON
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

41 CRAWEORD YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

42 GORDON YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

43 HARRISON YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

44 HEMINGFORD YARD 1,000.0000] TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

45 ALLIANCE YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

46 BRIDGEPORT YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

47 GERING YARD 3,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

48 CHAPPELL YARD 1,000.0000( TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

49 HARRISBURG YARD 1,000.0000) TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

50 KIMBALL YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

51 SYDNEY YARD 2,000.0000| TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

Department of Roads

4459 OF

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Ulrich Western
* Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Materials
) Gravel Inc.
< Inc
-
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
52 GOTHENBURG YARD 300.0000 | TN $ 10.57
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
53 NORTH PLATTE HWY 30 YARD 3,000.0000{ TN $ [
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
54 SUTHERLAND YARD 3,000.0000| TN $ 7.60
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
55 NORTH PLATTE 1-80 YARD 3,000.0000{ TN $ [
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
56 OGALLALA YARD 4,000.0000 TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
57 CALLAWAY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
58 ARNOLD YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
59 BROKEN BOW YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL
60 ANSLEY YARD 500.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
61 [HWY 251 MIS OF 1,000.0000| TN
SUTHERLAND
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
62 HWY 23 1 MI W OF DICKENS 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
63 [HWY 2320 MI S OF NORTH 2,000.0000| TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
64 HWY 183 3 MI S OF SARGENT 1,400.0000{ TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
65 HWY 2 @ ANSLEY 1,400.0000( TN
DIST O WINDRUVY OGRAVEL
66 [HWY 92 1 MI E OF ARNOLD 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
67 HWY 92 @ GANDY 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 HWY 2 6 MI E OF DUNNING 1,000.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
69 HWY 2 1/2 MI N OF ANSELMO 700.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
70 HWY 70 @ BROKEN BOW 350.0000 | TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
71 [HWY 215 MI S OF BROKEN 1,750.0000| TN
BOW
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
72 HWY 2 @ HYANNIS 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
3 HWY 2 10 MI W OF MULLEN 1,300.0000) TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
& HWY 2 1 MI W OF MULLEN 2,000.0000f TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
75 HWY 30 9 MI E OF OGALLALA 4,000.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
76 HWY 61 1 MI N OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

Department of Roads

4459 OF

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Ulrich Western

* Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Materials

) Gravel Inc.

< Inc

-

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

77 [HWY 40 15 MIW OF 700.0000 | TN
CALLAWAY
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

8 HWY 92 11 MI E OF ARTHUR 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

79 [HWY 83 12 MI N OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

80 [HWY 8315 MIN OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

81 [HWY 8318 MIN OF 660.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

82 HWY 92 3 MI E OF TRYON 1,300.0000| TN
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

83 [HWY 97 9 MI N OF NORTH 660.0000 | TN
PLATTE
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

84 [HWY 922 MIW OF 350.0000 | TN
STAPLETON
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL

85 BIG SPRINGS YARD 600.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

86 HWY 283 3 MI N OF ARAPAHOE 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

87 HWY 136 1 Ml E OF ORLEANS 1,950.0000) TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

88 [HWY 23 W EDGE OF 1,200.0000| TN
HOLDREGE
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

89 HWY 3 @ MINDEN 1,320.0000| TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

90 HWY 6 4 MI W OF MC COOK 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

9 HWY 83 4 MI S OF MAYWOOD 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

92 [HWY 234 MIE OF 730.0000 | TN
MOORSFIELD
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

93 HWY 23 1/2 MI W OF ELWOOD 730.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

94 HWY 61 8 MI S OF ENDERS 575.0000 | TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

95 HWY 34 2 MI E OF BENKELMAN 1,150.0000) TN
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

96 HWY 6 1 MI E OF PALISADE 575.0000 | TN
Ulo T O DEITCING OGRAVLEL

97 [AINSWORTH YARD 1,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

98 ATKINSON YARD 1,500.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

99 SPENCER YARD 1,000.0000| TN
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Buyer: Christie Kelly

4459 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 08/23/13

Page 30 of 30

Ulrich Western
* Deicing Gravel and Windrow Gravel Materials
@ Gravel Inc.
k= Inc
-
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
100 NAPER YARD 1,000.0000( TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
101 VALENTINE YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
102 CODY YARD 1,000.0000( TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
103 O'NEILL YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
104 SPRINGFIELD YARD 1,000.00001 TN
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
105 MERRIMAN YARD 2,000.0000| TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
106 HWY 12 @ NORDEN 300.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
107 HWY 183 3 MI S OF BASSETT 900.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
108 HWY 20 2 AINSWORTH 900.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
109 HWY 20 2 MI E OF ATKINSON 2,450.00001 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
110 HWY 20 2 MI W OF EMMITT 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
111 [HWY 137 22 MI N OF 1,500.0000( TN
NEWPORT
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
112 [HWY 183 3 MI E OF 1,500.0000( TN
SPRINGVIEW
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
13 HWY 10 3 MI E OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
114 HWY 281 2 MI E OF SPENCER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
115 HWY 11 1 MI S OF BURWELL 2,100.00001 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
116 HWY 183 14 MI N OF TAYLOR 1,400.0000{ TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
17 HWY 12 13 MI W OF NAPER 700.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
118 HWY 20 1 MI W OF NORDEN 600.0000 | TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
119 HWY 20 5 MI E OF VALENTINE 1,200.00001 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
120 HWY 20 1 MI W OF MERRIMAN 1,200.00001 TN
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL
121 HWY 97 26 MI S OF VALENTINE 300.0000 | TN
Total
Payment Terms 030 30 100
Delivery Days ARO as needed 30 As Ordered
Comments
Line 79 was a tie G3 Enterprises Inc & Western \
Lines 69 & 70 was a no bid. The NDOR No Bids
K4



