
Buyer:  Peter Kroll 4360 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  05/21/13

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 20, MP 418.25
N SIDE WILLIS

3000 TN  $          33.23  $   99,690.00  $                -    No Bid  No Bid 

2

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 51, MP 23.65
N SIDE 4 MI NORTH AND 1 
WEST OF LYONS

1000 TN  $                -    $                -    $                -    No Bid  No Bid 

3

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 75, MP 129 
E SIDE 2 MI SOUTH OF 
TEKAMAH

2000 TN  $                -    $                -    $                -    No Bid  No Bid 

4

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 75, MP 148.6
W SIDE DECATUR

2200 TN  $                -    $                -    $                -    No Bid  No Bid 

5

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 94, MP 17
S SIDE 4 EAST OF 
WALTHILL

975 TN  $          29.80  $   29,055.00  $                -    No Bid  No Bid 

6
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
AINSWORTH YARD

300 TN  $          38.95  $   11,685.00  $                -    $          47.20  $   14,160.00 

7
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
O'NEILL YARD

500 TN  $          33.95  $   16,975.00  $                -    No Bid  No Bid 

8
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
NORTH SPENCER, 2 MI

500 TN  $          37.20  $   18,600.00  $                -    No Bid  No Bid 

9
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
SOUTH BURWELL, 1 MI

500 TN  $          33.23  $   16,615.00  $                -    No Bid  No Bid 

10
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
SOUTH VALENTINE, 5 MI

2500 TN  $          44.56  $  111,400.00  $          32.44  $   81,100.00  $          42.00  $  105,000.00 

$  304,020.00  $   81,100.00 $  119,160.00 

**
0% N30 DAYS

** Per Specifications

0% 30 DAYS
90 days

Black Strap Inc

Li
ne

 # Chip Seal Ledge Rock

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

Comments
30 days

Net% 15 DAYS

Line 10 - Ton

AWARD

Danielski Farms, Inc. HILLS MATERIALS 
COMPANY
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Buyer:  Peter Kroll 4360 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  05/21/13

Description Qty UOM

1

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 20, MP 418.25
N SIDE WILLIS

3000 TN

2

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 51, MP 23.65
N SIDE 4 MI NORTH AND 1 
WEST OF LYONS

1000 TN

3

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 75, MP 129 
E SIDE 2 MI SOUTH OF 
TEKAMAH

2000 TN

4

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 75, MP 148.6
W SIDE DECATUR

2200 TN

5

D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
HWY 94, MP 17
S SIDE 4 EAST OF 
WALTHILL

975 TN

6
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
AINSWORTH YARD

300 TN

7
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
O'NEILL YARD

500 TN

8
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
NORTH SPENCER, 2 MI

500 TN

9
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
SOUTH BURWELL, 1 MI

500 TN

10
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE 
ROCK
SOUTH VALENTINE, 5 MI

2500 TN

Li
ne

 # Chip Seal Ledge Rock

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

Comments

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

 $          22.10  $   66,300.00  $          26.72  $   80,160.00    

 $          26.07  $   26,070.00  $          31.90  $   31,900.00    

 $          29.30  $   58,600.00  $          31.50  $   63,000.00  $           28.85  $    57,700.00 

 $          26.33  $   57,926.00  $          31.50  $   69,300.00    

 $          24.28  $   23,673.00  $          32.00  $   31,200.00    

 no bid     $          33.70  $   10,110.00    

 no bid     $          27.50  $   13,750.00    

 no bid     $          24.50  $   12,250.00    

 no bid     $          30.95  $   15,475.00    

 no bid     $          39.47  $   98,675.00    

$  232,569.00  $  150,260.00 $    57,700.00 

Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.

100% 30 DAYS
As ordered30 days 30 days

AWARD AWARD AWARD

L.G. Everist, Inc Spencer Quarries Inc
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