Buyer: Christie Kelly 4301 OF Opening Date: 04/08/13
Department of Roads

Partial Award Partial Award Partial Award
Knife River Oldcastle
I : : McCORMICK MINNEAPOLIS Materials
ﬁ Bltummlc\)/lﬁe?ic:ld Patch L Pﬁ, \(/:lng Co., Eglrfz g{\%? EXCAVATION & | Asphalt Systems | Midwest Co. Pavers Inc.
£ ' : PAVING INC d/b/a Omni
Midwest . :
Engineering
Description Qty [UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

PATCHING D-1

1| SUPERIOR ST (310 TN No Bid NO BID $ 107.00( $ 144.96( $ 108.00

LINC

PATCHING D-1

2 AUBURN 320 TN | $ 112.40 NO BID $ 112,50 $ 150.33( $ 116.00
PATCHING D-1 .

3 BEATRICE 310 TN No Bid NO BID $ 114.75( $ 161.45( $ 114.00
PATCHING D-1 "

4 DAVID CITY 310 TN NO BID $ 11050 $ 150.33( $ 114.00
PATCHING D-1 .

5 DORCHESTER 315 TN No Bid NO BID $ 115.00( $ 158.00( $ 113.00
PATCHING D-1 "

6 FAIRBURY 315( TN NO BID $ 118.00( $ 172.18( $ 118.50
PATCHING D-1

7 FALLS CITY 310 TN | $ 118.00 NO BID $ 113.00( $ 162.98( $ 122.50
PATCHING D-1

8 GREENWOOD 3100 TN | $ 108.67 NO BID $ 110.00( $ 137.68| $ 108.00
PATCHING D-1

9 NEBRASKA CITY 320 TN | $ 109.73 NO BID $ 11450 $ 139.60( $ 113.00
PATCHING D-1 .

10 PALMYRA 330 TN No Bid NO BID $ 113.20( $ 145.35( $ 110.00
PATCHING D-1 "

11 PAWNEE CITY 310 TN NO BID $ 114.15( $ 158.00( $ 117.50
PATCHING D-1

12| SALT VALLEY [315| TN " NO BID $ 112.00( $ 146.88( $ 109.00

LINC

PATCHING D-1 "

13 SEWARD 310 TN NO BID $ 116.30 $ 152.63( $ 110.50
PATCHING D-1 "

14 TECUMSEH 315( TN NO BID $ 11485 $ 151.10( $ 114.00
PATCHING D-1

15 WAHOO 310l TN | $ 108.67 NO BID $ 113.00 $ 138.83( $ 110.50

16 PAT&EE D-2 310l TN | $ 108.00 NO BID $ 114.70( $ 136.15( $ 116.00
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PATCHING D-2
17 ELKHORN 315| TN | $ 106.50 NO BID $ 113.00( $ 136.15 113.00
PATCHING D-2
18 FREMONT 340 TN | $ 108.00 NO BID $ 115.00( $ 139.21 113.00
PATCHING D-2
19 OMAHA 310l TN | $ 106.50 NO BID $ 107.15( $ 127.71 112.00
PATCHING D-2
20 GRETNA 310l TN | $ 106.50 NO BID $ 109.25( $ 131.55 110.50
PATCHING D-2
21 PLATTSMOUTH 315| TN | $ 108.00 NO BID $ 110.00( $ 131.55 113.00
22 PATAC\:L%I:\(I)?Q D-3 245 TN | $ 121.73 152.36 NO BID $ 115.40( $ 174.86 126.00
PATCHING D-3 .
23 BLOOMFIELD 320| TN No Bid 139.60 NO BID $ 118.00( $ 189.81 134.00
PATCHING D-3
24 COLUMBUS 315| TN | $ 115.33 NO BID $ 119.30( $ 158.76 118.50
PATCHING D-3 .
25 HARTINGTON 335| TN No Bid 135.42 NO BID $ 117.80( $ 182.53 131.00
PATCHING D-3
26 HUMPHREY 270 TN | $ 118.13 NO BID $ 118.80( $ 164.51 122.50
27 PATCHING D-3 305| TN No Bid 133.25 NO BID $ 117.30( $ 176.40 128.00
LAUREL
28 PATE;;':I(; D-3 300 TN | $ 113.33 135.42 NO BID $ 117.00( $ 153.40 119.00
29 PAT,\?:CES_' D-3 300 TN | $ 123.60 145.98 NO BID $ 124.60( $ 181.76 132.00
PATCHING D-3
30 NIOBRARA 320 TN | $ 129.33 143.78 NO BID $ 128.00( $ 197.10 138.00
PATCHING D-3
31 NORFOLK 100 TN | $ 118.67 140.04 NO BID $ 120.00( $ 168.73 125.50
PATCHING D-3 S .
32 SIOUX CITY 330| TN No Bid 127.50 NO BID $ 115.00( $ 162.60 126.00
33 PATVSQLNNGE D-3 335| TN | $ 118.27 135.75 NO BID $ 116.20 $ 166.05 125.00
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PATCHING D-3

34 WEST POINT 290 TN |' $ 113.33| $ 139.00 NO BID $ 118.00( $ 152.25 118.50
PATCHING D-4 .

35 AURORA 315 TN | $ 121.33 NO BID $ 123.00 No Bid 118.50
PATCHING D-4 .

36 GENEVA 315 TN | $ 122.00 NO BID $ 117.00 No Bid 118.50
PATCHING D-4 .

37 GRAND ISLAND 230 TN | $ 124.00 NO BID $ 125.00 No Bid 120.00
PATCHING D-4 .

38 HASTINGS 200] TN | $ 125.47 NO BID $ 120.00 No Bid 122.50
PATCHING D-4 : .

39 HEBRON 365| TN No Bid NO BID $ 128.75 No Bid 122.50
PATCHING D-4 .

40 KEARNEY 30| TN | $ 128.80 NO BID $ 131.20 No Bid 126.00

41 PATC(;I?'\IIDG D-4 30| TN | $ 127.33 NO BID $ 127.00 No Bid 131.50
PATCHING D-4 .

42 OSCEOLA 200] TN | $ 114.67 NO BID $ 118.50 No Bid 118.00
PATCHING D-4 .

43 RAVENNA 120 TN | $ 128.27 NO BID $ 128.20 No Bid 126.00
PATCHING D-4 : .

44 RED CLOUD 270 TN No Bid NO BID $ 120.00 No Bid 131.00
PATCHING D-4 .

45 ST PAUL 30| TN | $ 123.00 NO BID $ 122.00 No Bid 125.00
PATCHING D-4 : .

46 SUPERIOR 300| TN No Bid NO BID $ 117.00 No Bid 128.00

47 PAT?SISS D-4 250 TN | $ 118.40 NO BID $ 119.00 No Bid 114.00
PATCHING D-5 . .

48 CHADRON 30 TN No Bid $ 192501 $ 140.00 No Bid 182.00
PATCHING D-5 " .

49 GERING 30 TN $ 178.90| $ 133.00 No Bid 177.00
PATCHING D-5 " .

50 SIDNEY 30 TN $ 166.50| $ 137.00 No Bid 164.00

Page 3 of 5




Buyer: Christie Kelly 4301 OF Opening Date: 04/08/13
Department of Roads

Knife River Oldcastle
A : : McCORMICK MINNEAPOLIS Materials
s B't”m'”fﬂ‘;efgld Patch  (Flinn Pﬁ‘}‘g”g Co., Eg;‘i g{\% ";‘ EXCAVATION & | Asphalt Systems | Midwest Co. | Pavers Inc.
-5 : . PAVING INC d/b/a Omni
Midwest . .
Engineering
Description Qty [UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
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51 AINSWORTH 30| TN No Bid NO BID $ 123.00 No Bid $ 151.00
52 PATC’:HlNG D-8 30| TN | $ 128.93 NO BID $ 126.00 No Bid $ 140.00
O'NEILL
PATCHING D-6 . .
53 NORTH PLATTE 30| TN No Bid $ 180.00| $ 110.00 No Bid $ 144.00
PATCHING D-6 . .
54 LEXINGTON 30| TN No Bid NO BID $ 115.00 No Bid $ 134.00
PATCHING D-6 . .
55 OGALLALA 30| TN No Bid $ 167.50| $ 138.00 No Bid $ 151.00
PATCHING D-6 . .
56 BROKEN BOW 30| TN No Bid NO BID $ 125.00 No Bid $ 137.00
PATCHING D-6 . .
57 MULLEN 30| TN No Bid $ 188.50| $ 140.00 No Bid $ 157.00
. UPM HIGH
Sirggi?] N?Lr::]isfl'vgf rial UPM PERFORMANCE |  OMEGA-mix UPM UPM
9 ' COLD PATCH
LINCOLN PER .
58 TON FOB PLANT 300 TN NO BID $ 102.50 No Bid $ 103.92
6701
Address of Location: CORNHUSKER
Hwy
B_ran_d Name of Material OMEGA-mix UPM
Bidding:
OMAHA PER TON .
59 FOB PLANT 120 TN | $ 107.00 NO BID $ 102.50| $ 106.25 No Bid
Address of Location: 6506 Grover St. SRIE & O 2991 G Street
Omaha ST
B_ran_d Name of Material OMEGA-mix UPM
Bidding:
S SIOUX CITY
60 |PER TON FOB 90 | TN $ 127.50 NO BID $ 103.00 No Bid No Bid
PLANT
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2220 Hawkeye
Address of Location: Dn_ve Sioux 123 STEUBN ST
City, lowa
51105

B_ran_d Name of Material UPM OMEGA-mix

Bidding:

NORTH PLATTE
61 (PER TON FOB 30 (TN NO BID $ 103.00 No Bid No Bid

PLANT

Address of Location: 3201 Hwy 30 NO

B.ran.d Name of Material OMEGA-mix

Bidding:

0

Payment Terms Net% 30 DAYS NET% 30 DAYS OA)D%E(; 30 0% 30 DAYS
Delivery Days ARO required 5 days 30 days 30 days 5 days
Comments
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Bid Withdrawn

Aggregate Industries
Dobson Brothers Construction




