Buyer: Michelle Musick

AWARD
see explanation

4296 OF
Department of Roads

AWARD
see explanation

AWARD
see explanation

Opening Date: 04/01/2013

Ergon Asphalt

Martin Resource

Simon

" Liquid Ashpaltic Materials & Emulsions Flint Hills Hills Materials Jebro Management . Contraqtors DBA Vance
o Inc " |Respurces, LP| Company Incorporated | DBA Monarch Oil | Mountain States | Brothers, Inc
5 ) Materials

Description Qty [(UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 |[CRS-2P DIST 1 3,225 | TN No Bid $ 598.50 No Bid $ 529.06 | $ 583.64 No Bid $ 607.00
2 [CRS-2P DIST 3 4,700 | TN No Bid $ 613.00 No Bid $ 523.29( $ 598.89 No Bid No Bid
3 [CRS-2P DIST 4 4975 TN [ $ 57355| $ 527.50 No Bid $ 524.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 |CRS-2P DIST 6 2,750 | TN No Bid $ 554.50 No Bid $ 547.99 No Bid $ 589.00 No Bid
5 [CRS-2P DIST 7 175 TN No Bid $ 564.00 No Bid $ 584.74 | $ 698.02( $ 604.00 No Bid
6 [CRS-2P DIST 8 2,900 | TN No Bid $ 557.00 No Bid $ 536.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 [CRS-2P PLANT PICK UP 6 TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 530.00 No Bid $ 675.00 No Bid
8 [CRS-2VHL DIST 7 1350 TN | $ 571.08 NO BID No Bid $ 664.89 | $ 57490 % 578.00 No Bid
9 [CRS2-VHL PLANT PICK UP 21| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 600.00 No Bid $ 660.00 No Bid
10|CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 1 1,000 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 261.20| $ 230.30 No Bid $ 507.00
11 |CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 3 325 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 261.85| $ 244.63 No Bid No Bid
12 |CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 5 25| TN No Bid NO BID $338/76/Ton | $ 331.01( $ 578.33( $ 280.00 No Bid
13 |CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 7 575 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 326.69 | $ 282.66 | $ 301.00 No Bid
14 |CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 8 325 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 27646 | $ 280.08( $ 393.00 No Bid
15|CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT PICK UP 51| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 250.00 | $ 550.00 [ $ 280.00 No Bid
16 |CSS-1H STRAIGHT DIST 7 150 [ TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 520.74 | $ 489.20| $ 524.00 No Bid
17 |CRS-2 STRAIGHT PLANT PICK UP 42 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 460.00 No Bid $ 485.00 No Bid
18 |HFE-150 DIST 3 75| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 471.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 |HFE-150 DIST 5 1,975 | TN No Bid NO BID $579.00/Ton | $ 541.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 |HFE-150 DIST 7 25| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 521.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 |HFE-150 DIST 8 25| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 486.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 |HFE-150 PLANT PICK UP 55| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 455.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 |HFE-300 DIST 4 1,475 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 467.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 |HFE-300 DIST 6 2,075 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 480.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 |HFE-300 DIST 7 950 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 477.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 |HFE-300 DIST 8 450 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 478.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 |HFE-1000 DIST 4 800 [ TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 495.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 |HFE-1000 DIST 5 75| TN No Bid NO BID $694.86/Ton | $ 542.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 |HFE-1000 DIST 6 50| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 537.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 |HFE-1000 DIST 7 50| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 560.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 |HFE-1000 DIST 8 1,175 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 505.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 |MC-250 DIST 4 50| TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 803.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 |MC-250 DIST 6 100 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 811.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 |MC-250 DIST 8 100 | TN No Bid NO BID No Bid $ 785.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Payment Terms 0% 30 days | 0% N30 days | Net 30 days 0% 30 days 0% 30 days 0% 30 days
Delivery Days ARO 1 day 1 day Speci:‘)i(ce;tions One day per spec per spec

Award Explanation: Line 5, CRS-2P DIST 7: Low bidder took exception to Breach of Contract Statement, awarded to 2nd low bidder.
Line 12, CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 5: due to cost effective issues, awarded to 2nd low bidder
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