Buyer: Ruth Gray

4295 OF
Ed. Lands Funds

Opening Date: 03/29/2013

AWARD

AWARD

** . . Crop Production Services, .
.GC_) Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description [Qty[uOM]| UnitPrice |  Ext. Price Unit Price |  Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
Kearney Area

44 2, 4-D LV In 2.5 Gal Containers $ 23.96| $ 4,792.00| $ 20.20( $ 4,040.00 $ -
1 200|] GL - _

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Albaugh 2x2.5 iEeeons LV;:: N - 2.2

6# 2, 4-D LV in 30 Gal Barrel $ 2881 $ 10,803.75[ $ 23.46| $  8,797.50 | $ -
2 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 375| GL Albaugh 30 Weedonegla_a\lf E(Sir-]tNuform &Y

CH:;EtZPng\r'g Substitute) in 2.5 Gal $ 3073 $  3,073.00| $ 2200| $  2,200.00 $ -
3 ' 100| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding PBI 2x2.5 Hi Dep 2.5 gal. cont.

Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, $ 56.48| $  2,824.00| $ 4686| $  2,343.00 $ -

Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers
4 50| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 4x1 Tordon 22K - 1 gal. cont.

%Ldnf nhzzirf N ;GGe;eC”g n(gi‘;tsross’t’ $ 56.48| $  5,648.00 $ 46.86| $  4,686.00 $ i
5 ph) in 2. 100| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Tordon 22K - 2.5 gal. cont.

Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, etc) $ 2782|$  22.256.00| $ 2756| $  22,048.00 $ -

in 2.5 Gal Containers
6 800| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Grazon P & D - 2.5 gal. cont.

ﬁrgéogaﬁ)ﬁgn‘z;ﬁ:ge”c (Hired Hand, etc.) $ 2734|$  8202.00| $ 27.46| $  8,238.00 $ -
7 300| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 30 Grazon P & D - 30 gal. drum

C|mar_ron, MFG by Dupont in Available $ 420 s 420.00 $ i

Containers
8 100| Oz

. . . I Escort XP - 2 0z to 64 oz cont.
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding .
Precision Pack
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4295 OF
Ed. Lands Funds

Opening Date: 03/29/2013

Crop Production Services,

I+ . - .
_“c_’ Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description Qty| UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Metsulfuron Methyl in Available Containers $ 495| % 495.00| $ 293 $ 293.00 $ -
9 100| Oz

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Plotter, Rotam 8 x 8 0z Metcel VMF - 160z Bottles

E'(‘;";f;f}:rgee”er'c (Panoramic) in 1 Gal $ 17360 $  1,736.00| $ 114.00| $  1,140.00 $ -
10 ' 10| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Panoramic, Alligare 4x1 Plateau Herbicide - 1 gal. cont.

E'(‘;";f:f};rsee”er'c (Panoramic) in 1 QT $ 7247($  1,15952| $ 59.50 | $ 952.00 $ -
11 ! 16 | QT

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Panoramic, Alligare 6x1 Panoramic 25L - 1 gt. Cont.

Methylated Seed Qil in 2.5 Gal Containers $ 1524 $ 7,620.00| $ 11.10| $  5,550.00 $ -
12 500| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding United Suppliers, Succeed 2x WSO o5 Lozvglggfi PITOEIES -

Overdrive or Generic in 7.5 LB Containers $ 45.10( $ 6,765.00| $ 2950 $  4,425.00 $ -
13 150( LB : —

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding BASF 4x7.5 ORI I—ée()rﬁ;ude =Dl

g"(')'ﬁts;’n”;’s'\"m by Dow in 2.5 Gal $  32070| $ 824250 $ 20973 $  7,493.25 $ -
14 ' 25| 6L

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Milestone

g"(')'ﬁts;’n”;’s'\"m by Dowin 1 QT $ 83.84| $  2,012.16| $ 76.22| $  1,829.28 $ -
15 ' 24 | QT

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 12x1 Milestone

Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers $ 58.96] $ 14,7000 $ 60.80[ $ 15,200.00 [ $ -
16 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 250 GL Forefront HL, DOW 2x2.5 elCCiieln Hlé;erblmde e
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Buyer: Ruth Gray 4295 OF Opening Date: 03/29/2013
Ed. Lands Funds

H . - Crop Production Services, .
.GC_, Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description Qty| UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

ggf}‘f;:éfsl MFG by Dowin S LB $ 86.80| $  2,170.00| $ 78.90| $  1,972.50 $ -
17 ' 25| LB

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 4x5 Chaparral 5 Ib Cont.

chaparral, MFG by Dowin 1.25 L8 $  8680|$ 217000/ $ 7890 $  1,972.50 $ i
18 ' 25| LB

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 6x1.25 Chaparral 1.25 |b. Cont.

Prono_ne Power Pills in Available $ s 5120 $  10,240.00 $ i

Containers
19 200( LB Pronone Power Pellets - 5.5 Ib

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Cont o

KEARNEY TOTAL $ 104,708.93 $ 103,840.03 $ -

Wayne/Creston/Norfolk Area

4# 2, 4-D LV In 2.5 Gal Containers $ 23.96] $ 4,792.00] $ 2020] $  4,040.00] $ 18.47[ $  3,694.00
20 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 2001 GL Albaugh 2x2.5 Weedone LV SZI- Nuform - 2.5 CornBelt 4# LV 2.5 g

6# 2, 4-D LV N 30 Gal Containers $ 28.81] $ 10,803.75| $ 2346 $ 8,797.50| $ 2397 $ 8,988.75
21 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 375| GL Albaugh 30 WeedonegLE:I/ E(iju-mNuform -30 CornBelt 6# LV 2.5 g

g;:tzpn(e'\r'g Substitute) 2.5 Gal $ 30.73| $  3,073.00| $ 2200| $  2,200.00| $ 2239| $  2,239.00
22 ' 100| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding PBI 2x2.5 Hi-Dep 2.5 gal. Cont. Hi Dep 2.5 g

Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, $ 56.48| $  2,824.00( $ 46.86| $  2,343.00| $ 48.44| $  2,422.00
23 Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers 50| oL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 4x1 Tordon 22K 1 gal. Cont. Tordon 22K 1g

io.rdonhzz.K ;’rSGGenleC”C (to.“tp‘)s‘t’ $ 56.48| $  5648.00( $ 46.86| $  4,686.00 | $ 48.44| $  4,844.00
o4 | THUMP ) in 2.5 Gal Containers 100| cL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Tordon 22K 2.5 gal. Cont. Tordon 22k 2.5 g
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

Ed.

4295 OF
Lands Funds

Opening Date: 03/29/2013

Crop Production Services,

I+ . - .
_“c_’ Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description Qty| UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, etc) $ 2782 $  22,256.00| $ 2756 $ 22,048.00| $ 28.79| $ 23,032.00
in 2.5 Gal Containers
25 800| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Grazon P & D 2.5 gal. Cont. GrazonP &D 25¢g
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, etc.) $ 2734 $  8,202.00| $ 27.46| $  8,238.00| $ 2829 $  8,487.00
in 30 Gal Containers
26 300| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 30 Grazon P & D 30 gal. Drum GrazonP &D 30 ¢
C|mar_ron, MFG by Dupont in Available $ s 420 $ 420.00 | $ 439 s 439.00
27 Containers 100| oz
. . . - Escort XP - 2 0z to 64 0z Cont. | substitute Escort by Dupont
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding - .
Precision Packing 80z
Metsulfuron Methyl in Available Containers $ 495| % 495.00| $ 293 $ 293.00( $ 439] $ 439.00
28 100| Oz
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Plotter, Rotam 8 x 8 Metcel VMF 160z Bottles Escort
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 Gal $  17360| $  1,736.00| $ 114.00| $ 1,14000|$  12497|$ 1,249.70
Containers
29 10| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Panoramic 2SL, Alligare 4x1 Plateau 1 gal. Cont. Panoramic 1g
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 QT $ 72.47| $  1,159.52] $ 59.50 | $ 952.00 | $ 3519 $  563.04
Containers
30 16| QT
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Panoramic 2SL, Alligare 6x1 Panaromic 25L qt. Cont. Panoramic 1 QT
Methylated Seed Qil in 2.5 Gal Containers $ 15.24| $ 7,620.00| $ 11.10( $ 5,550.00| $ 9.16| $ 4,580.00
31 500| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Succeed, United 2x2.5 MSO by Loveland Products - Sunwet 2.5 g
2.5 gal. Cont.
Overdrive or Generic in 7.5 LB Containers $ 45.10] $ 6,765.00| $ 2950 $ 4,425.00| $ 32971 $ 4,945.50
32 150| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding BASF 4x7.5 Overdrive 7.5 Ib. Cont. OverDRive 7.5#
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

Ed.

4295 OF
Lands Funds

Opening Date: 03/29/2013

Crop Production Services,

I+ . - .
.GC_, Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description Qty| UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 2.5 Gal $  32070|$  824250|$  20073|$ 7.49325($  299.73| $ 7.493.25
Containers
33 25| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Milestone 2.5 gal. Cont. Milestone 2.5¢g
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 1 QT $  8384|s  201216]$ 76.22| 3 182028|8%  76.22|$ 1,829.28
Containers
34 24| QT
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 12x1 Milestone 1 gt. Cont. Milestone QT
Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers $ 5896 $  14,740.00( $ 60.80| $ 15,200.00 [ $ 62.97| $ 15,742.50
35 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 2501 GL Forefront HL, DOW 2x2.5 Forefront HL - 2.5 gal. Cont. ForeFront HL 2.5g
Chaparrral, MFG by Dowin 5 LB $  8680|$%  2170.00| $ 7890| $ 197250|$  7954| $ 1,988.50
Containers
36 25| LB
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 4x5 Chaparral Herbicide 5 Ib. Cont. Chaparral 5#
Chaparral, MFG by Dow in 1.25 LB $  8680|$%  2170.00| $ 7890| $ 197250|$  7954| $ 1,988.50
37 Containers | LB _
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 6x1.25 Chaparral I-(|:eorrt1)t|0|de 1.251b. Chaparral 1.25#
Pronone Power Pills in Available $ s 5120 $ 10,24000|$  265.76| $ 9,833.12
38 Containers 200l LB
. . . - Pronone Power Pellets - 5.5 Ib. | Pronone Power Pellets 5.5#
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding . .
Cont. pail 37 pails
WAYNE/CRESTON/NORFOLK AREA $ 104,708.93 $ 103,840.03 $ 104,798.14
TOTAL
Broken Bow Area
o2 o et s s swm]s o s
39 ph) in 2. 100| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Tordon 22K 2.5 gal. Cont.
Tqrdon 22K or Generic (_Outpost, $ s 46.86| $ 2.343.00 $ i
40 Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers 50| oL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding

Tordon 22K 1 gal. Cont.
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4295 OF
Ed. Lands Funds

Opening Date: 03/29/2013

Crop Production Services,

I+ . - .
_“c_’ Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description Qty| UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

irgzsogzl&&r?:aiirrl:nc (Hired Hand, etc) $ $ 2756| $  20,670.00 $ i
41 1< : 750| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Grazon P & D 2.5 gal. Cont.

gggtealpnél\rls Substitute) in 2.5 Gal $ $ 2200| $ 5.500.00 $ i
42 ' 250| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Hi-Dep 2.5 gal. Cont.

ggﬁts;?nn;'sMFG by Dowin 2.5 Gal $ $ 29973 $ 14,986.50 $ i
43 50| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Milestone 2.5 gal. Cont.

g(')lﬁtsfnneer’sMFG by Bowin 1 QT $ $ 7622 $  2134.16 $ i
44 ' 28| QT

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Milestone 1 gt. Cont.

E?;fsl;;rsGenerlc (Panoramic) in 1 Gal $ $ 114.00| $ 1,710.00 $ i
45 ' 15| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Plateau 1 gal. Cont.

(F;Elr:ttasté;rsGenerlc (Panoramic) in 1 QT $ $ 5950 | s 714.00 3 i
46 : 12| QT

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Panoramic 25L qt. Cont.

Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers B $ 60.80| $  4,560.00 | $ -
a7 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding [ Forefront HL Herbicide - 2.5

gal. Cont.

Methylated Seed Qil in 2.5 Gal Containers $ $ 11.10| $ 555.00 $ -
48 50 | GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding MSO by LOZVEIZZ? Products -
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Buyer: Ruth Gray 4295 OF Opening Date: 03/29/2013
Ed. Lands Funds

Crop Production Services,

E Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
- Description Qty| UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Overdrive or Generic in 7.5 LB Containers $ -1 8 2950 $  4,425.00 $ -
49 150| LB

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Overdrive 7.5 Ib. Cont.

Crossbow in 1 Gal Containers [ $ -13 36.45] $ 364.50 | 3 -
50 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 10 6L Crossbow L 1 gal. Cont.

Dicamba in 2.5 Gal Containers [ $ -13 56.00] $  2,800.00 | $ -
51 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 50| GL Rifle 2.5 gal. Cont.

BROKEN BOW AREA TOTAL $ - $ 65,448.16 $ -

Bridgeport Area

oty o o oo s [s swm[s uns s
5o (1UMph) in 2. ! 25| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Tordon 22K 2.5 gal.

oty s oo™ c |5 wwl[s wunw s
53 ph) 25 | 6L

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Tordon 22K 1 gal.

Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers B -1 60.80[ $  1,824.00 | $ -
54 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 301 GL Forefront HL 2.5 gal.

Eljrt:;l;eorrsGenenc (Panoramic) in 1 Gal $ s 114.00| $ 1,140.00 $ i
55 10| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Plateau 1 gal. Cont.

Miestone, MFG by owin 2.5 G2l $ -|'s 20973 $  7,493.25 $ -
56 25| GL

Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Milestone 2.5 gal. Cont.
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4295 OF

Ed. Lands Funds

Opening Date: 03/29/2013

Crop Production Services,

I+ . - .
.GC_, Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description Qty| UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 1 QT
; $ $ 76.22| $ 2,134.16 $ -
57 Containers 28| ot
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Milestone 1 gt. Cont.
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, etc)
. ) $ $ 2756 | $ 2,756.00 $ -
5g |in 2.5 Gal Containers 100| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Grazon P & D 2.5 gal. Cont.
Dicamba in 2.5 Gal Containers [ $ $ 56.00] $  2,800.00 $ -
59 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 501 GL Rifle 2.5 gal. Cont.
Hi-Dep (No Substitute) in 2.5 Gal
i $ $ 2200 $ 440.00 $ -
60 Containers 20| aL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Hi Dep 2.5 gal. Cont.
Methylated Seed Oil in 2.5 Gal Containers $ $ 11.10( $ 222.00 $ -
61 20| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding MSO 2.5 gal. Cont.
2,4-D LV In 2.5 Gal Containers B $ 20.20| $  1,010.00 $ -
62 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding S0 GL Weedone LV 4# 2.5 gal. Cont.
Roundup or Generic in 2.5 Gal Containers $ $ 16.00| $ 1,600.00 $ -
63 100| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Makaze 2.5 gal. Cont.
Roundup or Generic in 1 Gal Containers $ $ 2425| $ 485.00 $ -
64 20| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Razor PRO 1 gal. Cont.
BRIDGEPORT AREA TOTAL $ $ 24,247.41 $ -
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

Ed.

4295 OF
Lands Funds

Opening Date: 03/29/2013

Crop Production Services,

I+ . - .
.GC_, Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description [Oty[uOM]| UnitPrice |  Ext. Price Unit Price |  Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
McCook Area
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, $ 56.48| $  4,236.00 | $ 46.86| $ 351450| $  48.44|$  3,633.00
65 Triumph) in 2.5 Gal Containers | oL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Tordon 22K 2.5 gal. Cont. Tordon 22K 2.5g
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, $ 56.48| $  1,604.40 | $ 46.86| $ 140580 $  4844|$  1,453.20
66 Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers 30| oL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 4x1 Tordon 22K 1 gal. Cont. Tordon 22K 1g
Hi-Dep (No Substitute) in 2.5 Gal $ 3073 s 921.90 | $ 2200|$  660.00| $ 2239|$ 67170
Containers
67 30| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding PBI 2x2.5 Hi Dep 2.5 gal. Cont. HiDep25¢g
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, etc) $ 2782| $  13,910.00( $ 27.56| $ 13,780.00| $ 28.79| $ 14,395.00
in 2.5 Gal Containers
68 500|] GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Grazon P & D 2.5 gal. Cont. Grazon P&D 2.5¢g
2,4-D LV In 2.5 Gal Containers $ 23.96] $ 1,198.00 | $ 2020/ $  1,010.00( $ 18.47] $ 923.50
69 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 50| GL LV4 Albaugh 2x2.5 Weedone LV 4# 2.5 gal. Cont. CornBelt 4# LV ester 2.5 g
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 2.5 Gal $ 32070|$  6594.00|$ 299.73( $ 599460| $  299.73| $  5,994.60
Containers
70 20| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 2x2.5 Milestone 2.5 gal. Cont. Milestone 2.5g
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4295 OF
Ed. Lands Funds

Opening Date: 03/29/2013

ETs . - Crop Production Services, .
_“c_’ Chemicals Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Timberland Division Van Diest Supply Company
~ Description Qty| UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 1 QT $ 83.84| $  1,676.80| $ 7622 $  1,524.40| $ 76.22| $  1,524.40
Containers
71 20| QT
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding DOW 12x1 Milestone 1 gt. Cont. Milestone Qts
Roundup or Generic in 2.5 Gal Containers $ 1579 $ 394.75( $ 16.00( $ 400.00| $ 15.97| $ 399.25
72 25| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding Albaugh, Glystar Plus 2x2.5 Makaze 2.5 gal. Cont. Glyphosate Pro 4 2.5¢
Methylated Seed Qil in 2.5 Gal Containers $ 1524 $ 1,524.00| $ 11.10( $ 1,110.00| $ 9.16| $ 916.00
73 100| GL
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding United, Succeed 2x2.5 MSO 2.5 gal. Cont. Sunwet 2.5¢g
Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers $ 58.96] $ 1,474.00] $ 60.80| $  1,520.00( $ 62.97| $ 1,574.25
4 Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding 25| 6L DOW, Forefront HL 2x2.5 Forefront HL 2.5 gal. Cont. FOREFRONT HL 2.5g
Pronone Power Pills in Available $ s 5120 $ 256000 $  265.76| $ 2,657.60
75 Containers 50| LB
. . . - Pronone Power Pellets 5.5 Ib. Pronone Power Pellets 5.5#
Specify Brand and Container Size Bidding .
Cont. 10 pails
MCCOOK AREA TOTAL $ 33,623.85 $ 33,479.30 $ 34,142.50
GRAND TOTALS [ $ 243,041.71 | $ 330,854.93 | $ 138,940.64
Payment Terms 0% - 0 Days 0% - 0 Days Net - 45 Days
Delivery Days ARO 5 Days 10 Days 10 Days

Comments

Broken Bow Area - No Bid
Bridgeport Area - No Bid

REdITIEY Aread - NU BID
Broken Bow Area - NO BID
Bridgeport - NO BID

*No bid is being awarded to the Broken Bow Area because the
valid responding vendors did not meet the Warehouse Location
Requirements.
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