Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Atkinson Sand & Gravel (ASG) | Broadfoot Sand & Gravel, Inc. | Deweese Sand & Gravel, Inc. Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC
- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

L [om sron SORTAE | o] s : |
2 [DeTormon R SAEL | o] s : |
s [DSTomoR SO SRAE | o] s : |
Do oS | o s : |
o DT oron Con e | oo s : |
7 |DTSrOR COTOTAE. | o] s : |
o [DSyosmon ORTORAE | awo] s : |
o Do o S | zzoo s : |
1o DTS Ao oM SrAVE | o] s : |
1 [T SAOR CONTCAAVEL | o] 7 s : |
o o e o | 700 s : |
1y DTSR CONTORAE | o] s : |
Lo [DISTREOR CORTORAVEL | o] 1 s : |
I o o e e | 00 s : |
1o DT eom o e, | oo s : |
17 DT SAROR CORTORAVEL | 0] 7 s : |
iy DT SPROR ONTORATE | o] s : |
1o [T AOR CON SPAE | o] s : |
20 [DSTAENOR CONTRATE | 0] 1 s : |
21 D57 SR CORTORRE. | o] s : |

Page 1 of 42



Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Atkinson Sand & Gravel (ASG) | Broadfoot Sand & Gravel, Inc. | Deweese Sand & Gravel, Inc. Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC
- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

22 |y 13 2w1S oF cretoaron | 199 ™ s : : 5 - s -
23 |y 104 MmN oF pleree | 1099 ™ 5 . : s : s :
24 |owvstamnorscTamer | 2% ™ s : : 5 - s :
25 | )7 121150 2 M S OF WAUSA. 750 TN s : : 5 - s :
2 |y s amnororn | 2000 ™ 5 . : s : s :
27 v sremsoromn | a0 ™ 5 . : s : s :
28 |y 201 2 Win OF GREpLEY | 0% ™ s : : 5 - s :
29 |y 02 5MiN OF centraL Gy | 59| ™ s - s sas|s  7asso0 s :
30 |owy 10 10m S OF Lowp oy | 009 ™ s s 1s4s]s 1340000 s - s :
31 mﬂié gM&F;ESSTGRAVEL 500| TN $ -|$ 11.95 5,975.00 $ ; $ ;
32 |y 145 MIN OF FULLERTON 00| TN s : : 5 - s :
33 |owy 2618mIS OF Retey | 1899 ™ s : : 5 - s :
34 |y 261 0miN oF GREELEY | 290 ™ s : : 5 - s :
35 3{/\8/1(;53'?2'\/' I\%RNCOOFAL&?:\\(/EL 500| TN $ - -|'$ 1404|8 7,020.00 $ -
36 3L§$g¢?\ﬂ'\fszoiO£;§§AVEL 1500| TN $ - -|$ 1254 s 18,810.00 $ )
37 3{/\8/1(22?4'\:'2%?3?3??52?'_ 1000 TN $ - -|$ 1429|8 14,290.00 $ -
38 3{,\S,$;£R2M ,\%RECOCI):A/IYGRRAVEL 1000 TN $ - -|$ 1434|$ 14,340.00 $ 3
39 3{/\8/1(22\? “&?\EECF)QTASENAXEET 1500 TN $ - -|$ 1698|8% 25,470.00 $ -
40 JDcI:STle//ige'sw 5o Sl?uogggglfgﬁl’zlgl? 2500 TN $ - -|$ 1849|8 46,225.00 $ -
a1 3{/?/1(‘;? ?m?g C():I?QIJH%EAR\’/OEI(EK 1000 TN $ - -|$ 1599|8% 15,990.00 $ -
42 3{/\3;{;{;41%\4 l\(/:I)IRNCOOFA;EGDRél/gIL_JD 1000 TN $ - -|$ 1674|8 16,740.00 $ -
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Atkinson Sand & Gravel (ASG) [ Broadfoot Sand & Gravel, Inc. | Deweese Sand & Gravel, Inc. Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC
- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

i Do Sron CONCATEL | o] s : |
i D Ao O e | o] s : |
s DT pon Rt oA, | o] s : |
17 DTS AOR CON CRAVEL | o] s : |
i DT rOR CORT SRATE | o] s : |
io [DSTSPNOR ORTCRATEL | o] s : |
0 [DTSAOR CORTCPATEL | o] s : |
o1 [DoT o R OAE | o] s : |
s2 [DTSamon ORTSrATE | o] s : |
55 DT SAon O CRAVEL | o] s : |
o o O ety | oo s : |
o5 DT rmon CORT CrmveL | o] s : |
oo Do Con e | o] s : |
o7 Do o e | o] s : |
oo D Soon CORT caaveL | soo] s : |
oo D S COmT caaveL | oo s : |
oo [DeTS oo R SAvE. | o] s : |
61 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 2000l TN $ ) $ i

HWY 385 11 MI N OF BRIDGEPORT

52 |, wy 3056 MIN OF BRIDGEPORT | 20%0] T s : s :
3 |aLviance varD | 3000] ™ s : s :
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Atkinson Sand & Gravel (ASG) | Broadfoot Sand & Gravel, Inc. | Deweese Sand & Gravel, Inc. Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC
- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

65 [Pl oEon CORTORATEL | 0] 1 s : |
oo DI S2EOR CORTORRTE | 0] 7 s : |
oo DT SAEUOR CORTORRYE | 0] s : |
o9 DT SARIOR CONTORREL | 0] 1 s : |
70 E:;EE\SR\'(\Q%RDCOAT GRAVEL 3000 TN $ ) $ )
71 [BETEARIOR CORTORRE | o] s : |
72 g?g[\?T%RYM,SRRDCOAT GRAVEL 500| TN $ ) $ )
7o [T oon oo | oo s : |
7o [T smon R e | oo s : |
75 [DTEAOR CORT SAVE | o] s : |
7o [DeTaIoR O RAE | o] s : |
7 [T poR comcrmves | ool s : |
78 QLSSTL‘|55¢$'XSS COAT GRAVEL 500| TN $ ) $ )
7 T e o e | o] s : |
0 [DSTOOR R SRR | oo s : |
o D o CON AT e | oo s : |
o2 D o o S| oo s : |

Page 4 of 42



Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13

Statewide
ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel Atkinson Sand & Gravel (ASG) [ Broadfoot Sand & Gravel, Inc. | Deweese Sand & Gravel, Inc. Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC
c
£
Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
83 DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1800 TN $ i $ ) $ ) $ )

HWY 23 4 MI E OF GRANT

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
84 luwy 23 5 MI W OF GRANT 500| TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
85 |wy 6 1 MI E OF PALISADE 2400 TN $ j $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
86 HWY 6 1 MI W OF WAUNETA 18001 TN $ . $ N $ - $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
87 HWY 23 1 MI W OF ELWOOD 1000} TN $ . $ N $ - $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
88 HWY 6 W EDGE OF HOLDREGE 1000} TN $ . $ N $ - $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
89 HWY 4 @ RAGAN 1000{ TN $ - $ -|$ 1499 $ 14,990.00 $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
90 HWY 6 E EDGE OF MINDEN 3000| TN $ -|$ 1090( $ 32,700.00 $ - $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
91 HWY 10 12 Ml S OF MINDEN 1000{ TN $ -|$ 1280 $ 12,800.00 | $ 12.09( $ 12,090.00 $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
92 SPRINGVIEW YARD 2600 TN [$ 1455( $ 37,830.00 $ - $ - |s 1415( s 36,790.00

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
93 HWY 183 7 MI N OF SPRINGVIEW 1200 TN | $ 1585 $ 19,020.00 $ - $ -[$ 15.09( $ 18,108.00

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
94 JCT 12/137 22 MI N OF NEWPORT 1500 TN [ $ 13.10( $ 19,650.00 $ - $ - $ 12328 18,480.00

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
95 HWY 11 1.5 MI N OF BUTTE 800 TN [$ 1095( $ 8,760.00 $ - $ -l $ 1232( 8 9,856.00

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
96 HWY 2811 MI N OF SPENCER 1500 TN [ $ 10.55( $ 15,825.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
97 |3CT 11/91 BURWELL YARD 2500 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
98 lawy 91 2 MI W OF TAYLOR 1000 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
99 |37 281/95 5 MI E OF CHAMBERS 500] TN | $ 12.95| $ 6,475.00 $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
100 HWY 12 12 Ml W OF NAPER 1000 TN [ $ 1295 $ 12,950.00 $ - $ -|$ 1280 $ 12,800.00

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL

101 NAPER YARD 2500( TN | $ 11.45( $ 28,625.00 $ - $ -|1$ 1165( $ 29,125.00
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
102 HWY 83 52 MI S OF VALENTINE 1000( TN $ - $ - $ -|$ 2536 9% 25,360.00
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
103 HWY 61 50 MI S OF MERRIMANN 1500 TN $ - $ - $ -1 $ 3395(% 50,925.00
Total $ 149,135.00 $ 64,965.00 $ 193,460.00 $ 201,444.00
Payment Terms 100 30 NET 30 NET 45 045
Delivery Days ARO 90 5 10 30
Comments
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Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide

Armor Coat Gravel

Line #

Atkinson Sand & Gravel (ASG) | Broadfoot Sand & Gravel, Inc. | Deweese Sand & Gravel, Inc.

Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC

Description | oty [uom|[unit Price | Ext. Price

Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price |

Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF

Opening Date: 02/08/13

Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Emme Sand & Gravel G-3 Enterprises Hinrichsen Sand & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel
- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1|y 153w N OF CLaRKSON | 1609 TN - s _ s -
2wt 15 oM NOF ScHviEr | 2090] ™ - s - s -
3wy srimitorteiGh | 1600] ™ - s - s -
+ |iwy 525 miw or wesTpomr | 750 ™ - s _ s -
5wy o1 15 Min of nomroLk | 1200] ™ - s _ s -
5 lawy 20 @wiis 3000| TN : $ : $ .
7 Premon SFTOTE | o] . S N PR
o Prarsimon O | amo] . S N PR
> liwy 75 @ocT 751 pucatur | 2290] ™ - s _ s -
10 |wy oram e oF warre | 1090] ™ - s - s -
N A i e . S N PR
12 | wy 116 /2 Wi w OF Concoro | 1700] ™ - s _ s -
N e i I . S N PR
N T . S N PR
15 1wy 2051 5 OF waRTINSBURG | 2090] T - s _ s -
19 | wviis 12w OF Concorn | 1700] ™ - s _ s -
17 3E;T?NA(§T%?\IRY323T GRAVEL 3100 TN [ $ 16.80 52,080.00 $ _ $ )
18 LWy 155 MI N OF LAUREL 70| ™ - s - s -
19 3@$i;‘?m?§(§§©é§§£_\/EL 1000 TN | $ 12.94 12,940.00 $ _ $ )
20 E:SE;AAIEAM \(()A'?R(I:DOAT GRAVEL 1000 TN | $ 13.75 13,750.00 $ _ $ )
21 ?éiTli/QE%OVREEOngR%RAVEL 2500 TN [$ 12.80 32,000.00 $ 1331 $ 33,275.00 $ -
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF

Opening Date: 02/08/13

Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Emme Sand & Gravel G-3 Enterprises Hinrichsen Sand & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel
- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

22 | O ek 1000| TN |$ 12748 12,740.00 $ 1219 $  12190.00 $ ]
% |y 10 amINOF PiERCE | 1090] T 5 - s - s -
2 |y o1 iminoF acTomer | 2290] ™ s : s _ s -
25 | O e 750| TN | $ 1480 8 11,100.00 $ ] $ ]
2 |y 11 1M oE ORD - | 2000] T 5 - s - s -
27 |y irem s oroRp - | 2000] 5 - s - s -
2 |ywy 261 2 1N OF GReELEY | 3500] T s - s _ s -
29 | Y 55 5 MIN OF CENTRAL GITY 500| TN $ - $ - |s 14948 747000
% |owy 1010 S o Loupeiry | 1090] ™ s - s _ s -
3w 10@ HAzaRD 500| TN $ : $ : $ .
% |y 14 sminoF FuLLerTon | 590 ™ s - s _ s -
3 |ywy 201 5 1S OF Greetey | 1990] ™ s - s _ s -
% |uwy 261 20 NOF GReerey | 2090] ™ s - s _ s -
3 3{/?/$;Q-R2’\AI\%RNCC?FA|]§§£¥EL 500| TN $ - $ -|$ 1290 $ 6,450.00
35 | oWy 2 7MW OF CARG 1500| TN $ : $ : $ .
¥ |owy 6w £ OF pasTinGs | 1090] ™ 5 - s - s -
38 |y 261 oML E OF AYR 1000| TN $ : $ : $ .
39 |y 4 1 miw OF paveNpoRT | 1590] T s - s _ s -
40 3cT 14136 5 1 N OF SUPERIOR | 25%0] ™ s - s _ s -
1 |iwy 761 M S OF GUDE ROCK | 1000] ™ s - s _ s -
%2 |y 281 2. N OF RED CLop | 1000] ™ s - s _ s -
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF

Opening Date: 02/08/13

Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Emme Sand & Gravel G-3 Enterprises Hinrichsen Sand & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel
- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

R R i e R I SEE T | oo
% | > @ HALSEY 1500/ TN $ : $ $ : $ .
% iy 2 3miE OF ErLsworTs | 1000] ™ s - s s _ s -
% iy 2015 M £ OF Cradron | 1000] ™ s - s s _ s -
47 iy 201 MIE OF RUSHVILLE | 20%0] T s - s s _ s -
% |y 2720 M' S OF CorpON | 2000] ™ s - s s _ s -
% iy 27 5 M S OF Gomoon | 1000] ™ s - s s _ s -
%0 |ywy 27 1m1 5 OF GompoN | 1090] ™ s - s s _ s -
5 |y 27 12 M1 s OF Ostikosn | 1590] ™ s - s s _ s -
2 |y 209w 5 OF tarmison | 2590] ™ s - s s _ s -
53 |y 305 miw OF Siokey | 3090] ™ 5 - s s - s -
% |uwy 7114 M1 N OF CrAWEORD | ©0%0] ™ s - s s _ s -
% |uwy 71915 OF CrawFoRD | 1090] ™ s - s s _ s -
% |uwy 7126 M1 S OF Crawrorp | 30%0] ™ s - s s _ s -
5 |uwy o7 17 i N OF RUSHVILE | 3390] ™ s - s s _ s -
% |y 305 16 1 S OF Crapron | 3090] ™ s - s s _ s -
%9 |y 305 2611 S OF Crapron | 1090] ™ s - s s _ s -
0 |ywy 305 6 i N OF ALLANCE | 1090] T s - s s _ s -
61 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 2000 TN ¢ ] s . ] . _

HWY 385 11 MI N OF BRIDGEPORT

©2 |,y 305 6 i N OF BriDGEPORT | 2090] T s - s s _ s -
63 L LIANCE YARD e 3000| TN $ . $ $ : $ .
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF

Opening Date: 02/08/13

Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Emme Sand & Gravel G-3 Enterprises Hinrichsen Sand & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel
- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

o5 [DTSdiOR CORTORRVEL | o] 1w : - $ - s I
oo [P LENOR CORTERREL | ] : - $ - I I
67 25;’325!\:25 COAT GRAVEL 5000| TN $ ) $ ; $ - 3$ -
e I R : - $ - I I
o9 [PTSANOR CORTOAVEL | ] 1w : - $ - s I
70 ElllagzﬁR\:\/IA%RD COAT GRAVEL 3000 ™ $ ) $ ; $ - 3$ -
11 [B1 ARVOR CORTOAVEL | ] 7w : - $ - s I
72 8ESSTA(\)R\I\(/IAORRDCOAT GRAVEL 500| TN $ ) $ ; $ - 3$ -
o [y SR COT e | oo : - : - s s -
o oo aoRcon e | s : - : - I s -
1o [DeToAIOR CORTERNEL ™ | ] 1w : - : - s »
1o [DToARIORCON SN | o] : - : - I »
7 [DereioR Com St | s : - : - s s -
78 Q:QSS‘I'LBE\A;\R\’(I\A/ISDR COAT GRAVEL 500| TN $ ) $ ; $ - 3$ -
1o [DT SARORCORTSRRVE | o] 1 : - : - s »
N I : [ molswosmeol s »
A s I : - : - s s -
o2 [DeroRioR CoRTeRnvEL | o] : 3 O =) I DR s -
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF

Opening Date: 02/08/13

Statewide
E Armor Coat Gravel Emme Sand & Gravel G-3 Enterprises Hinrichsen Sand & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel
- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
o [ PR SO SRR ] ; 1T = s s
oo [DETIARMORCONT SRR | s ; 1= s s
o DT LARUOR CORTSHATEE | a1 ; 1= s s
oo [T LARMOR SO SR | o] ; 1= s s
o7 [BETIAMOR O ST | o] ; 1= s s
S R R ; 1= s s
g |DISTTARMOR COAT GRAVEL | 50q] s : s - s - s -
B e e K ; 1= s s
A R ; 1= s s
o2 [DSTARMOR COATOAVEL | g 1 ; 1= s s
S R R ; 1= s s
B e e ; 1 = s s
o5 |DIST & ARMOR COAT GRAVEL oo T 3 108]s  Ba6a00 s - s - s -
96 3{/?; 2&?%?? (c:)ltngpgﬁé\ég- 1500 TN | $ 10.24( $ 15,360.00 $ - $ - $ -
o [DETEAROR CONT SRV | s ; 1 = s s
S ; 1= s s
99 ?éiTZnggASOSICEOS\:gE:&/EERS 500f TN [ $ 9.60($ 4,800.00 $ -[$ 912 $ 4,560.00 $ -
10 [Qer e AEOR CORTETAEL | o] 7 ; 1= s s
101 EEJE??A;R;\'\QODR COAT GRAVEL 2500 TN $ - $ - $ - $ -
102 3{/?; 23A EITZM [\%Rs%?:A\I A(IB_EQ\'I{:?\ILE 1000 TN $ -|$ 21.00($ 21,000.00 $ - $ -
103 3{/?; 21A EITOMI\(/?IRSCO?:A&SRRQ\I\CIEAII\JN 1500 TN $ -|$ 2650 % 39,750.00 $ - $ -
Total $ 163,234.00 $ 90,600.00 $ 50,025.00 $ 33,810.00
Payment Terms 100 60 100 30 100 30
Delivery Days ARO 15 20 60 15
Comments
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide
ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel Emme Sand & Gravel G-3 Enterprises Hinrichsen Sand & Gravel Hooker Bros Sand & Gravel
.5
Description | oty [uom| unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Island Landhandlers Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. Johnson Sand & Gravel L.G. Everist, Inc.

- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 |y 153 N OF CLarkson | 16%0] ™ : s 2075|s 4280000
2_|iwT 15 6 M N OF SCHviEr | 20%0] ™ - s 2035|s  5670000
3 |iwyerimitortEiGh | 1600 ™ - s 2855 4615000
+ Jiwy 32 5miw or wesTpomT | 750 ™ : s 2605 1770000
5 |wy o115 min of nomroLk | 1200] ™ : s 280|s 2056000
6 3{/\8;3??@MV$EL?SOAT GRAVEL 3000| TN - $ 1835( $ 55,050.00
" lwvsiimworacrsr | 1000] ™ - s 20155 2015000
® lwy 752 S OF rekawan | 20%0] ™ : s 225|s 4650000
® |iwy 75 @ocT 751 pucaTuR | 2200] ™ : s 2075|s 4565000
10 |\ wy osami £ oF waLrL | 1090] ™ : 5 1060)s  1960000
1wy 122 M S OF PoNCA | 1890] ™ - s 10205 345000
12 |,y 116 /2 Wi w OF Concoro | 170] ™ - s 20755 3200
13 |uwy o 1M N OF EwerSON | 1390] ™ - s 10705 2561000
14 E:ESV'\I;S:SI?FMLSI:\;:QSATGRAVEL 600 TN - $ 2035( $ 12,210.00
15 |, wy 2051 5 OF waRTINSBURG | 20%0] T - s 10805 48080.00
16 |, wviie 12w OF Concorn | 17%0] ™ - s 20755 2700
17 | aRTINGTON YARD. 3100 TN . $ 2335($ 72,385.00
19 |, WY 155 I\ OF LAUREL rso| ™ - s 20555 1501250
19 | wy 121 it OF verDEL | 1090] ™ - s w105 3410000
20 z:g‘;::g/&\ﬂsz%OATGRAVEL 1000 TN - $ 3275( $ 32,750.00
2 ?é?’Tli/gihéo\leggng%RAVEL 2500| TN - $ 3275( % 81,875.00
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Island Landhandlers Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. Johnson Sand & Gravel L.G. Everist, Inc.

- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
22 |,y 132 mi S OF Creioiron | 10%0] ™ s - - s s 2255 2905000
2 ﬂfﬁé\m?ﬁ SSQTE(;E@VEL 1000} TN $ - - $ -|s 2710| s 27,100.00
24 mﬁf\ 1R ﬁlo{f ((D:I? JAgTGQ%\E{fL 2200 TN $ - - $ -|'s 2200| 8 48,400.00
2 JD(I:STTl?élAlsReluvI 2o S|(:soc?;\f//§ﬁ\s//§|_ 7S0[ TN $ - - $ -|s 2575| 8 19,312.50
% |owy 11 1 MINOFORD | 2000] T s s oss 1060000 s | wosu

27 |ywy 11 6MISOF ORD | 3000] T s s mas[s  sazmoo0 s | wosu

2 |uwy 201 2 MIN OF GReELEy | 3500 ™ s [s nawls w0000 s | nosi

29 iy o S MINOF CeNTRALGTY | 50| TN |$ 1523|8  761500 : s | nosi

% owy 1010m S Ot tovpoiry | 1000] ™ s - - s | nosi

2 oy 10 HAZARD 00| TN s - - s [ oo

% |y 14 sminor FuLLERTon | 50| ™ s - s 1s00s  7s0000] noeia

33 3{/\S/$;£_Réw,\%RSCOCI):Ag§ERETé§L 1800| TN [ $ 16.90| $ 30,420.00 | $ 15.00 27,000.00 $ - No Bid
 |ywy 261 10 M N OF GREELEY | 2000] ™ s [s unls  2s0000 s | nosi

35 3{/\S/$;£_R2M’\%RNC§FAL§§£¥EL 500/ TN [$ 12.10| $ 6,050.00 - $ - No Bid

36 3{/\S/$;¢?\A|\:|SVRO?:O§;§§AVEL 15001 TN [ $ 1340| $ 20,100.00 - $ - No Bid

37 3{/\8/$22IT\4|\:|2%E%§;§§2\£EL 1000| TN [$ 1445| $ 14,450.00 - $ - No Bid

38 3{,\S,$;£R2M B%RECOCI):A/IYGRRAVEL 1000( TN | $ 14.45| $ 14,450.00 - 3$ - | NoBid

39 [ e A EARORT 1500 TN |'$ 17.40( 8 26,100.00 : $ | nosid

%0 |37 1473 S N OF SUpERIOR | 2500 TN |$ 18785 4695000 : s | nosi

a1 [ O O o ek 1000 TN |'$ 19.00$ 19,000.00 : $ | nosid

42 ﬂlfllgéA:I.RZ'\Al\(/:I)IRNCOOFA;ISDRét/gIL_JD 1000/ TN [ $ 19.00| $ 19,000.00 - $ - No Bid
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Island Landhandlers Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. Johnson Sand & Gravel L.G. Everist, Inc.
- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
43 3{,?;;??"\\2?@%%;{&2@1& 1700 TN [ $ 12.10( $ 20,570.00 - $ - No Bid
44 ,3L\S,$;%Rm§LRSE$ATGRAVEL 1500 TN $ -|1$ 1220 18,300.00 $ - | NoBid
% |owy 2311 £ OF ELLsworTn | 1900] ™ s - : s | nosi
% |y 20 15 M £ OF Crapron | 1900] ™ s - : s | nosi
47 |y 201 i€ OF RUSHWLLE | 20%0] ™ s - : s | nosi
% |y 2729 M S OF Gorpon | 2000] ™ s - : s | nosi
% |y 27 5Mi S OF GompON | 1900] ™ s - - s | wosu
% |ywy 271 IS OF GORDON | 1000] ™ s - - s | wosu
51 |y o7 12 1S OF Ostikosr | 1900] ™ s - : s | nosi
5 |y 295 M1 S OF arRiSoN | 25%0] ™ s - : s | nosi
% |y 305 MW or Sioney | 3900] ™ s - - s | wosw
54 |uwy 7110 M N OF CRAWFORD | 00| ™ s - : s | nosio
% |uwy 719 M1 OF Crawrorp | 1900] ™ s - : s | nosi
% |uwy 7126 M S OF CrAwrORD | 00| ™ s - : s | Nosio
57 |uwy 87 17 M N OF RUSIVILLE | 0] T s - : s | nosi
5 |ywy 365 16 M1 S OF Criapron | 2%0] ™ s - : s | nosi
%9 |y v 365 26 M1 S OF Crapron | 1000] ™ s - : s | nosi
% |yry 365 6 M N OF ALLIANCE | 1900] T s - : s | nosi
61 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 2000l TN 3 ] ] s ] o B
HWY 385 11 MI N OF BRIDGEPORT

©2 |,y 355 6 M N OF BRIDGEPORT | 2000] ™ s - : s | Nosio
53 AL LIANCE YARD | 3000 TN s - - s [ nosu
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Island Landhandlers Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. Johnson Sand & Gravel L.G. Everist, Inc.
- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
© |CrAwroRD vaRD | 1000] ™ - s - No B
© |\ ARRISON YARD | 1000] ™ - s - No B
% | nRRISBURG vARD | 3000] T - s - No B
57 |QERING YARD e 5000 TN - $ - No Bid
% |6RIDOLRORT YARD | 2000) T - s - No B
©9 | ChappELL vARD | 3000] ™ - s - No B
70 E:;EiﬁRx%RDCOATGRAVEL 3000 TN . s ] o Bid
™ |OGALALAYARD | s000] T - s - No B
72 glg(')l"\?TAORYMAORRDCOATGRAVEL 500 TN . s ] o Bid
73 |1 AWY 403 MI W OF CALLAWAY 0| ™ - s : o g
74 |uwy a0 14w OF CaLLaway | 59| ™ - s : o id
5 lowy o2 1 mit OFARNOLD | 1900] T - s - No B
7 |1y 163 2 MI S OF SARGENT 0| T [s emsls  asmoo o g
7 |iwy 707 mit oF wesTerwie | 5% ™ |5 wess|s 74000 o id
78 2:\1831‘;?'\:85 COAT GRAVEL 500 TN -|$ 1458( s 7,290.00 No Bid
™9 lowy 1639 M SO Anstey | 1090] ™ [s waa]s 1680000 o g
%0 |4y 2 111 W OF MULLEN 00| TN s was]s  sas0 No g
2 |ywy o7 7 Min OF NORTH PLATTE | 50| ™ : s - o i
% |y 83 15 M N OF STAPLETON | 1900] ™ s ws2|s  1ss200 o id
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Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13

Statewide
ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel Island Landhandlers Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. Johnson Sand & Gravel L.G. Everist, Inc.
c
£
Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
83 DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1800 TN $ ) $ ) $ ) No Bid

HWY 23 4 MI E OF GRANT

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
84 liwy 23 5 MI W OF GRANT 500 TN $ - $ - $ - | NoBid

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
85 |iwy 6 1 MI E OF PALISADE 2400| TN $ - $ - $ - | NoBid

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
86 |wy 6 1 MI W OF WAUNETA 1800 TN $ - $ - $ - | NoBid

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
87 liwy 23 1 MI W OF ELWOOD 1000) TN $ - $ - $ - | NoBid

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
88 |wY 6 W EDGE OF HOLDREGE 1000 TN $ - $ - $ - | NoBid

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
89 luwy 4 @ RAGAN 1000 TN $ - $ - $ - | NoBid

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
9 |wY 6 E EDGE OF MINDEN 3000] TN $ - $ - $ - | NosBid

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
9% liwy 10 12 MI S OF MINDEN 1000) TN $ - $ - $ - | NoBid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
92 SPRINGVIEW YARD 2600| TN $ -|$ 1836( $ 47,736.00 $ - No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
93 HWY 183 7 MI N OF SPRINGVIEW 1200( TN $ -[$ 19348 23,208.00 $ - No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
94 JCT 12/137 22 MI N OF NEWPORT 1500( TN $ -|[$ 1100 $ 16,500.00 $ - No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
95 HWY 11 1.5 MI N OF BUTTE 800 TN $ -|$ 1974 8 15,792.00 $ - No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
96 HWY 2811 MI N OF SPENCER 1500( TN $ -[$ 2072( % 31,080.00 $ - No Bid

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL

97 JCT 11/91 BURWELL YARD 2500 TN $ -1$ 99| $ 24,750.00 $ - No Bid
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
98 HWY 91 2 Ml W OF TAYLOR 1000( TN $ -1$ 12.00( $ 12,000.00 $ - No Bid
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
99 JCT 281/95 5 MI E OF CHAMBERS 500( TN $ -|1$ 1376 $ 6,880.00 $ - No Bid
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
100 HWY 12 12 Ml W OF NAPER 1000( TN $ -1$ 11.10( $ 11,100.00 $ - No Bid
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
101 NAPER YARD 2500 TN $ -1$ 1090( $ 27,250.00 $ - No Bid
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
102 HWY 83 52 MI S OF VALENTINE 1000( TN $ -1$ 15.02( $ 15,020.00 $ - No Bid
DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
103 HWY 61 50 MI S OF MERRIMANN 1500( TN $ -1$ 26.06( $ 39,090.00 $ - No Bid
Total $ 224,705.00 $ 497,641.00 $ 7,500.00 $ 931,265.00
Payment Terms 30 NET 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 as required 30 30

Comments
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Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide

Armor Coat Gravel

Line #

Island Landhandlers Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. Johnson Sand & Gravel

L.G. Everist, Inc.

Description | oty [uom| unit Price | Ext. Price

Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price |

Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
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Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation DBA Marxsen Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel
= Central Sand & Gravel Company
-
Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 DIST'3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1600 TN | $ 1530( $ 24,480.00 [ $ 13.00( $ 20,800.00 | $ 15.80| $ 25,280.00

HWY 15 3 MI N OF CLARKSON

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2 HWT 15 6 MI N OF SCHUYLER 2000 TN [$ 13.07| $ 26,140.00 [ $ 1250 $ 25,000.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
3 HWY 57 1 MI E OF LEIGH 1600 TN | $ 1391( $ 22,256.00 [ $ 13.50( $ 21,600.00 | $ 15.20| $ 24,320.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
4 |HWY 32 5 MI W OF WEST POINT 750 TN $ - $ . $ .

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
5 HWY 81 15 Ml N OF NORFOLK 1200 TN | $ 1296( $ 15,552.00 $ -|$ 1250 $ 15,000.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
6 HWY 20 @ WILLIS 3000| TN $ - $ -|$ 19.70( $ 59,100.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
7 |Hwy 51 1 MI W OF JCT 77 1000 TN $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
8 HWY 75 2 MI S OF TEKAMAH 2000 TN $ - $ - $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
9 lawy 75 @ JCT 75/51 DUCATUR 2200] TN $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
10 HWY 94 4 MI E OF WALTHILL 1000} TN $ - $ - $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
11 HWY 12 2 MI S OF PONCA 1800 TN $ -|$ 2000(8$ 36,000.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
12 HWY 116 1/2 Ml W OF CONCORD 1700( TN $ - $ -|$ 16.20( $ 27,540.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
13 HWY 9 1 MI N OF EMERSON 1300 TN $ - $ - $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
14 NEWCASTLE YARD 600( TN $ -|$ 2100($ 12,600.00 | $ 20.60( $ 12,360.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
15 HWY 20 3 MI S OF MARTINSBURG 2600| TN $ - $ -|$ 18.10( $ 47,060.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
16 HWY116 1/2 Ml W OF CONCORD 1700( TN $ - $ -|$ 16.20( $ 27,540.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
17 HARTINGTON YARD 3100| TN $ - $ -|$ 18.00( $ 55,800.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
18 HWY 15 3 MI N OF LAUREL 750 TN $ - $ -|$ 1650 $ 12,375.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
19 HWY 12 1 MI E OF VERDEL 1000 TN $ - $ -|$ 2150 % 21,500.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
20 NIOBRARA YARD 1000| TN $ - $ -|$ 2050(% 20,500.00

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
21 JCT 14/84 @ VERDIGRE 2500| TN $ - $ -|$ 1930 $ 48,250.00
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel (I:_yman Richey Corporation DBA Ve s e Matteo Sand & Gravel
k= entral Sand & Gravel Company

- Description Qty |UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

22 |,y 155 w1 S OF CreforTon | 1000] ™ s : s s 3]s 1730000
23 3{,?,1( icf Emﬂs g,? QlTEgEéVEL 1000 TN | $ 1320 $ 13,200.00 $ $ 13.90| $ 13,900.00
2 |owy 11 mNoF acTomst | 2200] T s . s : _
25 [PSTSAORCORT SN | ] 1w : . : e P
2o [EeT 4ATIOR CORTGRAVEL | ] 7 : . : : _
27 [EST4AMOR SO GTREL | ] 7 : . : : _
28 3:/?; ;QR;A’\%RNCC?FAESSQ_VEEL 3600 TN [$ 18.25| $ 65,700.00 $ $ )
2 3{/?; ng ‘? m?ﬁ gg ééﬁfrf\féw 500/ TN | $ 14.55|$ 7,275.00 $ $ .
30 3{/?; 4]1-0A i:\/l A%RS%?:A:O?JTDA(\:/IEI\-( 1000 TN | $ 17.47( $ 17,470.00 $ $ )
31 3{/?; ‘:Il.OAgMI-(I)AEACISST GRAVEL 500 TN | $ 16.79( $ 8,395.00 $ $ )
32 3{/?; if ‘? m?ﬁ gg /FAES_E%E&\J 500 TN | $ 13.93|$ 6,965.00 $ $ ]
33 3{/?; ;QRE;\A l\(/?IRS%?:A(-BrSERI)EAI\_\I/EEYL 1800 TN | $ 16.85( $ 30,330.00 $ $ )
34 | Wy 281 10 M1 N OF GREELEY 20000 TN | $ 18.49|$ 36,980.00 $ $ ]
35 3{/?; ;QR;A’\%RNCC?FALSORQ;/EL 500 TN | $ 13.10( $ 6,550.00 $ $ )
36 3{/?; ; ?TAI\IA%RO('::OCA;SORAVEL 1500 TN | $ 1358( $ 20,370.00 $ $ )
37 3@%2?%2%?%&;1%2& 1000 TN [ $ 1455($ 14,550.00 $ $ )
38 |y 261 oML E OF AYR 1000| TN $ : $ $ ]
39 |,wy 4 11 1w OF DavENPORT | 1500] T s - s : _
4 |3c7 14156 SMIN OF SUperior | 25%0] ™ s - s : _
41 |y 70 11 S OF GUIDE ROGK___ | 1000] ™ s - s : _
% |,y 2012 Min oF RED Gloup | 1000] ™ s - s : _
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel (I:_yman Richey Corporation DBA Marxsen Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel

k= entral Sand & Gravel Company

- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

43 3{/?; ;4A§ m?\?/ (CZ)(;AA'L(;SQXEL 1700) TN | $ 13.10| $ 22,270.00 $ $ -
s st o e [ | [ SE $ -
e e M E SE $ -
A e KB SE $ -
e e I SE $ -
D A e M E SE $ -
i s R L SE $ -
N s R L SE $ -
R s R L SE $ -
S R s R L SE $ -
e s R L SE : -
s SRR e e[| [ SE $ -
e s R L SE : -
e s R L SE : -
S s R L SE : -
9 |uwy 365 2611 S OF CriabRON | 2000] ™ s : 5 s :
S s R L SE $ -
61 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 2000| TN s ] ¢ s ]

HWY 385 11 MI N OF BRIDGEPORT

52 |wy 365 6 MIN OF BRIDGEPORT | 2000] ™ s : 5 s :
5 A tianice vamo | 2000] ™ s : s s :
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel (I:_yman Richey Corporation DBA Marxsen Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel

k= entral Sand & Gravel Company

- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
 |CRawroRD varD | 1000 ™ : ' : ° '
o5 [STERUOR CORTGRAEL | 0] 7w : - : $ -
 |iARRISBURG YARD | 000| ™ : ' : ° '
 |oRIDGERORT YARD | 2000| ™ : ' : ° '
R i e R I E JEE : -
70 EllagzﬁR\:\/IA%%COATGRAVEL 3000| TN $ _ $ $ -
R I R B E JEE : -
72 cD)Iggl\?TA(\)R\'\(A/SQRDCOAT GRAVEL 500 TN $ _ $ $ -
3 lowy a0sMiw OF cALLAwaY | 50| ™ : - i : ‘
7 lwv a0 1M wor caliaway | 50| ™ : - i : ‘
7 lwy o iMIE OF ARNOLD | 1500] ™ : - i ° ‘
76 lwy 165215 oF sarcen | 50| ™ : - i : ‘
7 lowy 107 MIE oF wesTeRve | 50| ™ : - i : ‘
78 2:\185165\?5%35 COAT GRAVEL 500 TN $ _ $ $ -
™ lowv 1630 soF Ansiey | 2000] ™ : - i ° ‘
 lowy 2 tmwormen | 50| ™ : - i ° ‘
L |wy 577 MIN OF NorTH PLATTE | 50| ™ : - i : '
2 |uw 53 15 Wi N oF STAPLETON | 1000] ™ : - i : ‘
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel (I:_yman Richey Corporation DBA Marxsen Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel

k= entral Sand & Gravel Company

- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

N A E I T .
o [STRORCON SRV | ol | | s S S .
oo [LST IS ONSAE |l | s S S .
oo [ISTUARMOR O SNV | [ | | s S S .
o [T O S [ | s S S .
D e E I E T - [ .
8 | 4 @ RAGAN 1000| TN $ . $ : $ :
N e R S S .
o [T O S o | | s S S .
92 |CorINGVIEW YARD 2600| TN $ . $ : $ :
o e ey || s T - I .
T e e Y B E T - I .
N e e R S S .
o [roren SO o[ | | s T 1 s .
o [T ONERET | ol | s S S .
oo [hT AR CONCEAET | ol | |5 S S .
99 |31 261195 5w € OF campers | 0] ™ s - s - s -
B R L S S .
101 EEJE??A;R;\I\QODR COAT GRAVEL 2500 TN s ] 3 ] s ]
e [ | | T - I .
B e s B E T - I .
Total $ 338,483.00 $ 116,000.00 $ 439,675.00
Payment Terms 100 30

Delivery Days ARO 45 per ITB

Comments
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide
ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel Lyman Richey Corporation DBA Marxsen Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel
= Central Sand & Gravel Company
-
Description | oty [uom| unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Mid Nebraska Aggregate Inc. Overland Sand & Gravel Overton Sand & Gravel Inc. Paulsen Inc.

- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

L [om sron SORTAE | o] | : |
2 [oTormion R SAEL | o] | : |
s [DSTormon SO SRAEL | o] | : |
Do o | o | : |
o DT oron Con e | oo | : |
o [DITSpmIoR CORTORAVEL | 0] 1 | : |
7 |DTSrOR CORTOTAE. | o] | : |
o [DSyosmon ORTORAEL | o] | : |
o Do o S | zzoo | : |
o DTS AOR oM SRAVE | o] | : |
1 [T SAOR CONTCAAVEL | 0] 7 | : |
o o e o | 700 | : |
1y [DETS Ao CONTORAE | o] | : |
Lo [DISTREOR CORTORAVEL | o] 1 | : |
e | : |
1o DT eom ConT e, | oo | : |
17 DT SAROR CORTORAVEL | 0] 7 | : |
iy DT SPROR CONTORATE. | o] | : |
1o [T AOR ON SAE | o] | : |
20 [DTAENOR CONTRATE | 0] 7 | : |
2 [T SR CORTORE. | o] | : |
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Mid Nebraska Aggregate Inc. Overland Sand & Gravel Overton Sand & Gravel Inc. Paulsen Inc.

- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
22 |,y 132 mi S OF Creioiron | 10%0] ™ s - s _ : _
2 |owy 10amiN oF PiERcE | 1000] ™ s : s _ s _
2 |owy o1 1M OF scT s | 2200 ™ s : s _ s _
25 |07 121159 2 i 5 OF WAUSA rso| ™ s : s _ s _
2 oWy 111 MINOFORD | 2090] T s : s _ s _
27 | oWy 11 6MISOFORD | 3090] T s : s _ s _
2 |uwy 261 2 MIN OF GReELEy | 3900 T s : s _ s _
29 |,wy 02 5 min oF CenTRALGiy | 5% ™ s [[s asofs 720000 s -
% |owy 1o10m S ot tovpoiry | 1000] ™ s : s _ s _
31 alf,on %M,&EESSTGRAVEL 500( TN | $ 13.69| $ 6,845.00 $ - $ .
% |y 1esminor FuLteRTon | 50| ™ s [[s ses0]s  sas000 s -
33 |ywy 261 8w S OF GrepLEy | 1900] ™ s : s . s _
3 |ywy 261 10 M N OF GREELEY | 2000] ™ s : s _ » _
35 |V wy 261 2 M1 N OF LIBORY 00| TN s : s : : _
36 a{/\S/'\E;?TAYSVRO?:Oé;SgAVEL 1500 TN [ $ 13.99( $ 20,985.00 $ . $ )
37 aﬁigﬁml\fg%g%i;.ﬁsé\éa 1000 TN [$ 1495( $ 14,950.00 $ . $ )
38 a{/\S/'\E;EﬁRZM'\%RECOCI):A;YGRRAVEL 1000 TN [$ 1495 $ 14,950.00 $ . $ )
39 iy 4 11 MW OF DAVENPORT | 1500 TN |§ 17835 2674500 s : s -
%0 |37 1413 S N OF SUpERIOR | 25%0| TN |$ 23008 5750000 s : s -
“ iy 761 M S OF GUIDEROCK | 1000 TN |$ 1685|5  1685000 s : s -
42 a{/\S/'\l;;E;AlRZM'\%RNCgFA;SDRéngD 1000 TN [ $ 17.66( $ 17,660.00 $ . $ )
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Mid Nebraska Aggregate Inc. Overland Sand & Gravel Overton Sand & Gravel Inc. Paulsen Inc.

- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
43 3L\S/$gf§m?vsggAALigngL 1700 TN [ $ 15.00( $ 25,500.00 | $ 16.10 27,370.00 $ -
44 3L\S/$;%RMSLQE$ATGRAVEL 1500( TN $ - - $ 1635( $ 24,525.00
% |iwy 23w £ OF ELLsworTn | 1900] ™ s : : s 25155 2515000
% |y 20 15 M £ OF Crapron | 1900] ™ s - : s -
AR e R E - . T
% |ywy 2729 M S OF Gorpon | 2000] ™ s - - s -
o [T ROR SR SRET | ol || » . . T
o [ISTERMORCONGRNE | ol || » . . T
51 |y 27 12 S OF Ostikosr | 1900] ™ s : : s 16035 2608500
% |y 295 M1 S OF arRiSon | 25%0] ™ s - - s -
A e R I E . . T
e e o | [ - . T
s oo mmonconcae, oo m| |0 - . T
% |uwy 7126 M S OF CrAwroRD | 20%0] ™ s - : s -
S |uwy 7 17 MiN OF RUSHVILE | 3%0] ™ s - : s -
% |uwy 305 16 S OF Crapon | 20%0] ™ s - : s -
o [rremenconcae, Jwofm| [ - . T
0 |y 3056 MIN OF ALLANCE | 10%0] T s - : s -
61 DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 2000 TN s ] ] s 2523 s 045000

HWY 385 11 MI N OF BRIDGEPORT ’

52 |,wy 3056 MiN OF BriDGEPORT | 20%0] T ; - : s 2755 4950000
63 |aiianceE vaRD e 3000| TN $ . . $ .
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Mid Nebraska Aggregate Inc. Overland Sand & Gravel Overton Sand & Gravel Inc. Paulsen Inc.

- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
64 g:?S;V\?FAC')?RNI;O\?ACRODAT GRAVEL 1000 TN - - $ -
65 |aRRIsON YARD 1000| TN . : $ .
66 | ARRISBURS YARD 3000| TN - . $ -
57 |QERING YARD e 5000 TN . : $ .
88 |oriDaLPORT YARD 2000 TN - |s 2347|s 46,940.00
69 g:_isgpiéfysz%OATGRAVEL 3000( TN - -|$ 1581| $ 47,430.00
70 E:;EiﬁRx%RDCOATGRAVEL 3000 TN . ) s -
n BISZL?.QEXA?ER%OAT CRAVEL 5000 TN - -|1$ 9.49( ¢ 47,450.00
72 BESST%R\'\(ASRRDCOATGRAVEL 500| TN - $ 10.98 5490.00 [ $ 11.49( $ 5,745.00
73 |1 WY 403 MI W OF CALLAWAY 00| TN - s 12ss]s  casso
74 IB{/\S/-\:iéA?M\%?NCgﬁESLRLi\C\EkY 500| TN - $ 13.46 6,730.00 | $ 1297| $ 6,485.00
75 aﬁig;]ﬁm?gggﬁgﬁgfglﬂ 1500( TN - $ 14.62 21,930.00 | $ 14.99( $ 22,485.00
7 |1y 163 2 MI S OF SARGENT 0| ™ - s wsr|s s
v 5%35\ 7R mlo.? é):l?\/;/TESTREAF\e/\iLLLE 500 TN - -ls 1423] 3 7,115.00
78 2:\1851‘;¢$ng COAT GRAVEL 500{ TN - $ 12.26 6,130.00 | $ 1250| $ 6,250.00
79 a{/\sl;l; iéRgM'\%RSCOC::A;N%IT_é\éEL 1000 TN - $ 11.01 11,010.00 | $ 14.24| $ 14,240.00
80 IB{/\S/\T(%W\C/)VRO?:OI\?JL?_EQVEL 500 TN - -|s 20793 10,395.00
9 |ywy o7 7 Min OF NORTH PLATTE | 50| ™ - s wsils  eaesoo
% |y 83 15 M N OF STAPLETON | 1000] ™ - s weos  1rs0000
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4207 OF
Statewide

Buyer: Ruth Gray Opening Date: 02/08/13

E Armor Coat Gravel Mid Nebraska Aggregate Inc. Overland Sand & Gravel Overton Sand & Gravel Inc. Paulsen Inc.

- Description Qty [UOM [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
% |ywy 23 amiE OF Grant | 1900] ™ s - s : s s wa0ls  2e12000
% |1y 235 MW OF CRANT 00| TN s - s : s s wamls om0
% |y 6 111 £ OF pALISADE | 2400] ™ s - s : s s wss]s  srsssoo
% |y 6 111 W OF wANETA | 1900] T s - s : s s wsils  saso
87 3L\S/$;;?m?vsg%;{\?vgg\éEL 1000 TN $ - $ -|1$ 898(% 8,980.00 | $ 10.34| $ 10,340.00
88 IE{I\S/-\I;éCVREMS)(?ECgFAIIC?L%AR\E%E 1000 TN $ - $ -|s 1048 s  10480.00 $ -
89 3L\S/$ZA@R§§§A%OATGRAVEL 1000[ TN [$ 1255($ 12,550.00 $ - $ ; $ )
9 3{,3%@2%%@%2%55@"5" 3000| TN [$ 11.00( $ 33,000.00 $ - $ ; $ )
91 IE{I\S/-\:?léAlRZl\AA%RSCO?:A&IEEQ\I\/IEL 1000( TN [$ 1150 $ 11,500.00 $ - $ ; $ )
o2 [DSTS AR SO ORAYEL | g $ - s s $ -
%3 |ywy 1657 N OF SpRGviEW | 1200] T s - s - s _ s -
% |3c7 120157 22 i N OF NEwporT | 1500] T s - s : s _ s -
% iy 1115 MIN OF BUTTE 00| TN s - s - s _ s -
% liwy 291w NoF spenceR | 1900 TN s - s - s _ s -
9 |3c 1201 BURWELL vaRD | 20| ™ s - s - s - s -
% |owy o1 oMW OF TaviOR | 1000] ™ s - s : s s wszls 1302000
99 |3c7 201195 5 Wi £ OF Chawpers | 50| ™ s - s : s _ s -
100 | v 15 12 miw OF NapER | 1900 TN s - s - s _ s -
101 BIASJE?:{AYI?AI\QCSR COAT GRAVEL 2500 TN $ . s ] 3 ) s -
192 |y 63 52 1 S OF vaeTing | 1900] T s - s - s _ s -
103 iy 61 50 1 S OF merRIMAN | 1500] ™ s - s - s _ s -
Total $ 259,035.00 $ 42,870.00 $ 70,750.00 $ 550,589.00
Payment Terms 100 30

Delivery Days ARO 30 upon request 1 requested
Comments
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

Line #

Armor Coat Gravel

Description

| Qty [uom

Mid Nebraska Aggregate Inc.

Overland Sand & Gravel

Overton Sand & Gravel Inc.

Paulsen Inc.

Ext. Price Unit Price |

Unit Price|  Ext. Price
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Unit Price | Ext. Price



Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel Simom contraciors Inc. Dl Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. T & F Sand & Gravel, Inc.
= Ogallala Ready Mix Co.
—
Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 DIST'3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1600 TN $ - $ -|1$ 1350 $ 21,600.00 $ -

HWY 15 3 MI N OF CLARKSON

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2 |HWT 15 6 MI N OF SCHUYLER 2000] TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
3 HWY 57 1 MI E OF LEIGH 1600( TN $ - $ -|$ 1450 $ 23,200.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
4 HWY 32 5 MI W OF WEST POINT 750 TN $ - $ - $ 11.99( $ 8,992.50 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
5 HWY 81 15 MI N OF NORFOLK 1200 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
6 HWY 20 @ WILLIS 3000 TN $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
7 HWY 51 1 MI W OF JCT 77 1000 TN $ - $ -|$ 14.00( $ 14,000.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
8 HWY 75 2 MI S OF TEKAMAH 2000| TN $ - $ -|$ 1475( $ 29,500.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
9 HWY 75 @ JCT 75/51 DUCATUR 2200| TN $ - $ -|$ 1475( $ 32,450.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
10 HWY 94 4 MI E OF WALTHILL 1000 TN $ - $ -|$ 1460 $ 14,600.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
11 HWY 12 2 MI S OF PONCA 1800 TN $ - $ -|$ 2070($ 37,260.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
12 HWY 116 1/2 Ml W OF CONCORD 1700( TN $ - $ -|$ 17.20( $ 29,240.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
13 HWY 9 1 MI N OF EMERSON 1300( TN $ - $ -|$ 1475( $ 19,175.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
14 |NEWCASTLE YARD 600 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
15 HWY 20 3 MI S OF MARTINSBURG 2600| TN $ - $ -|$ 1875( $ 48,750.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
16 HWY116 1/2 Ml W OF CONCORD 1700( TN $ - $ -|$ 17.20( $ 29,240.00 $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
17 |HARTINGTON YARD 3100] TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
18 1wy 15 3 MI N OF LAUREL 7501 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
19 1wy 12 1 MI E OF VERDEL 1000 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
20 |NIOBRARA YARD 1000| TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2L e 14/84 @ VERDIGRE 2500] TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )
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Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel S CIEERS Inc. DBA Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. T & F Sand & Gravel, Inc.
= Ogallala Ready Mix Co.
—

Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
22 DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1000 ™ $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

HWY 13 2 MI S OF CREIGHTON

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
23 |HWY 10 4 MI N OF PIERCE 1000) TN $ - $ - $ - $ ]

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
24 HWY 51 1 MI N OF JCT 9/7/51 2200 TN $ B $ - $ - $ -

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2 JCT 121/59 2 MI S OF WAUSA 750 TN $ B $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
26 14wy 11 1 MI N OF ORD 2000] TN $ - $ - $ - $ )

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
27 |4wy 11 6 MI S OF ORD 3000] TN $ - $ - $ - $ )

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
28 HWY 281 2 MI N OF GREELEY 3600 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2 HWY 92 5 MI N OF CENTRAL CITY 500] TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
30 HWY 10 10 MI S OF LOUP CITY 1000} TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
31 HWY 10 @ HAZARD 500| TN $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
32 |4wY 14 5 MI N OF FULLERTON 500/ TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
33 HWY 281 8 MI S OF GREELEY 18001 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
34 HWY 281 10 MI N OF GREELEY 2000 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
35 |4wy 281 2 MI N OF LIBORY 500 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
36 |iwy 2 7 MI W OF CAIRO 1500| TN $ - $ - $ - $ )

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
37 |HWY 6 4 MI E OF HASTINGS 1000 TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
38 |wy 281 2 MI E OF AYR 1000| TN $ - $ - $ - $ )

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
39 HWY 4 11 MI W OF DAVENPORT 15001 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
40 13CT 14/136 5 MI N OF SUPERIOR 2500] TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
4 HWY 78 1 MI S OF GUIDE ROCK 1000} TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
42 HWY 281 2 MI N OF RED CLOUD 1000} TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

Page 32 of 42



Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel S CIEERS Inc. DBA Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. T & F Sand & Gravel, Inc.
= Ogallala Ready Mix Co.
—

Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
43 DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1700 ™ $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

HWY 34 3 MI W OF AURORA

DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
44 HWY 2 @ HALSEY 1500| TN $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
45 HWY 2 3 MI E OF ELLSWORTH 1000 TN $ -|$ 2506(8$ 25,060.00 $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
46 HWY 20 15 MI E OF CHADRON 1000} TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
a7 HWY 20 1 MI E OF RUSHVILLE 2000 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
48 HWY 27 29 MI S OF GORDON 2000 TN $ B $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
49 lHwyY 27 9 MI S OF GORDON 1000 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
50 |4wy 27 1 MI S OF GORDON 1000 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
51 HWY 27 1/2 MI S OF OSHKOSH 1500 TN | $ 16.63| $ 24,945.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2 |HWY 29 9 MI S OF HARRISON 2500 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ]

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
53 HWY 30 3 MI W OF SIDNEY 3000 TN [$ 23.05( $ 69,150.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
54 HWY 71 14 MI N OF CRAWFORD 6000 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
55 HWY 71 9 MI S OF CRAWFORD 1000} TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
56 HWY 71 26 MI S OF CRAWFORD 3000 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
57 HWY 87 17 MI N OF RUSHVILLE 3300 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
58 HWY 385 18 MI S OF CHADRON 3000 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
59 HWY 385 26 MI S OF CHADRON 1000} TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
60 HWY 385 8 Ml N OF ALLIANCE 1000 TN $ -|$ 2070($ 20,700.00 $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
HWY 385 11 MI N OF BRIDGEPORT

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
62 | \wy 385 8 MI N OF BRIDGEPORT 2000] TN $ gc e SARLaY $ ) $ )

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
63 ALLIANCE YARD 3000| TN $ -|$ 1001($ 57,030.00 $ - $ -

61 2000| TN $ -|$ 15.10( $ 30,200.00 $ - $ -
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 02/08/13

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel Sigon Contractors Inc. Dl Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. T & F Sand & Gravel, Inc.
I= gallala Ready Mix Co.

- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
55 | ARRISON YARD o 1000| TN $ . $ - $ $ :
66 aE;RSISA;U'\g%RYiORADT GRAVEL 3000 TN $ -|$ 1400| $ 42,000.00 $ $ -
67 25’;2@5’225 COAT GRAVEL 5000 TN $ -|$ 1270| $ 63,500.00 $ $ -
68 gﬁggéﬁg@RYiggT GRAVEL 2000 TN $ -|$ 16.05| $ 32,100.00 $ $ -
69 g:fgpiéliy S ;R%OAT GRAVEL 3000 TN [$ 1529( $ 45,870.00 $ - $ $ _
70 E:,?AEES_R\:\AA%RD COAT GRAVEL 3000 TN $ -|$ 1910| $ 57,300.00 $ $ -
71 CD)EZL?_/A;\E&A\?ER%OAT GRAVEL 5000 TN [$ 1267 $ 63,350.00 $ - $ $ _
72 8ES|\?TA(\3R\'\(A£QRDCOAT GRAVEL 500| TN $ ) $ : $ 3$ -
73 |1 Wv 403 MI W OF CALLAWAY 00| ™ s - s : s s -
™ |uwy o 14w OF Cattaway | 59| ™ s - s : s s -
o feremmonconeaE Tw | | s 1T JEE T
7 |1y 1692 1S OF SARGENT 0| ™ s - s : s s -
77 |y 707 i€ OF wesTeRviLe | 590 ™ s - s : s s -
78 2:\jSSTL6E¢§'\AAgDR COAT GRAVEL 500( TN $ - $ - $ $ 1378 $ 6,890.00
™ |owv 1s3om S oransiey | 1090] ™ s : s : s s 12055 1205000
N e e : - : - : s -
© |ywv o7 7 min OF NoRTH pLATTE | 59| ™ s : s : s s -
2 |,y 3 15 i N OF STAPLETON | 1090] T s - s : s s -
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Buyer: Ruth Gray 4207 OF Opening Date: 02/08/13
Statewide

ﬁ Armor Coat Gravel Simom contraciors Inc. Dl Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. T & F Sand & Gravel, Inc.
= Ogallala Ready Mix Co.
—

Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
83 DIST'7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1800/ TN [$ 1583| $ 28,494.00 $ - $ - $ -

HWY 23 4 MI E OF GRANT

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
84 HWY 23 5 Ml W OF GRANT 500 TN | $ 15.83| $ 7,915.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
85 14wy 6 1 MI E OF PALISADE 2400 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
86 HWY 6 1 Ml W OF WAUNETA 18001 TN $ B $ - $ - $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
87 HWY 23 1 MI W OF ELWOOD 1000} TN $ B $ - $ - $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
88 HWY 6 W EDGE OF HOLDREGE 1000| TN $ - $ - $ -[$ 1119( $ 11,190.00

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
89 HWY 4 @ RAGAN 1000 TN $ - $ - $ -|[$ 1205( $ 12,050.00

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
9 WY 6 E EDGE OF MINDEN 3000f TN $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
0 HWY 10 12 MI S OF MINDEN 1000} TN $ B $ - $ - $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
92 |SPRINGVIEW YARD 2600 TN $ - $ - $ - $ )

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
93 HWY 183 7 MI N OF SPRINGVIEW 1200 TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
94 |3CT 12/137 22 MI N OF NEWPORT 1500 TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
9 14wy 11 1.5 MI N OF BUTTE 800 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
% HWY 2811 MI N OF SPENCER 1500 TN $ B $ - $ - $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
97 13T 11/91 BURWELL YARD 25001 TN $ - $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
98 14wy 91 2 MI W OF TAYLOR 1000 TN $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
99 |3CT 281/95 5 MI E OF CHAMBERS 500/ TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
100 1wy 12 12 MI W OF NAPER 1000 TN $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
101 NAPER YARD 2500 TN $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
102 HWY 83 52 MI S OF VALENTINE 1000} TN $ . $ - $ - $ -

DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL

103 1y 61 50 MI S OF MERRIMANN 1500 TN $ ) $ ) $ ) $ )
Total $ 239,724.00 $ 358,970.00 $ 308,007.50 $ 42,180.00
Payment Terms 100 90 0
Delivery Days ARO 30 30 45
Comments
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Buyer:

Line #

Ruth Gray

Armor Coat Gravel

4207 OF
Statewide

Simon Contractors Inc. DBA

Opening Date: 02/08/13

Description

| Qty [uom

Ogallala Ready Mix Co.

Unit Price | Ext. Price

Unit Price |

Simon Contractors

Ext. Price

Stalp Gravel, Inc.

T & F Sand & Gravel, Inc.

Unit Price | Ext. Price
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Unit Price | Ext. Price



Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Ulrich Gravel Inc. Western Materials, Inc.
_ Description Qty [UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1|y 155 MiN OF Ciarkson | 1900 T ;
2 T 156 MinoF Scruvier | 2000 T ;
® v s MEoF Lt | 1600 T :
4 Jiwy 325w wor west poir | 750] ™ ;
5 | a1 1IN OF NoRFoLK | 1200] T ;
6 3533??@“”&?55” GRAVEL ool -
" lwvstsmworsctr | 1000 ™ ;
® |y 762 S OF rekawan | 2000 T ;
At $
10 v o4 a e oF waLtrLL | 1900 T ;
1L v 152 M5 OF pONCA | 1890 T ;
12 |y 116 112 W w OF concorp | 1700 ™ ;
13 v o1 Min OF Emerson | 1990 ™ ;
14 NEWCASTLE YARD o so0] T Z
15 v 203 1S O marTissURs | 2000 T ;
19 wvite 1o Miw OF Concoro | 1790 ™ ;
17 | OARTINGTON YARD | 3100] T ;
19 Y 163 ML N OF LAUREL rs0| ;
19 v 15 1 MLE OF vERDEL | 1000 T ;
20 | IOBRARAYARD | 1000] T .
21 |367 14184 @ VERDIORE 2500 TN S
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Ulrich Gravel Inc. Western Materials, Inc.
- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
2 [Ty vron ot emE | o] ; IE
2 [DETS RO COAT SRR | o] ; IE
2o TS RRMOR CORT SRV | a1 ; IE
2 [PETamMOR TR | s ; IE
26 3{/?; if\]ﬁ’l\\ﬂ/l?l\'? SSQLSRAVEL 2000 TN [$ 955($ 19,100.00 $
27 3{/?; ifGRm?ggESLSRAVEL 3000 TN [$ 11.00( $ 33,000.00 $
28 3{/?; ;&BA:\LRZI\AI\(/?IRNCC?FAESSQ_VEE(L 3600 TN [$ 11.25( $ 40,500.00 $
o [T peon o e | s ; IE
30 3{/?; iOA 1ROM§ IRSCOOFAIZI-O?JTDA(\:/IEI\-( 1000 TN | $ 11.75( $ 11,750.00 $
1 [DETAROR COAT SR | ; IE
2 [oeTReon oo | s ; IE
33 3{/?; ;QR;\A I\(/?IRS%OFA(-BFSERI)E?_\I/EEL 1800 TN | $ 1150( $ 20,700.00 $
34 3{/?; ;&BA:\LR]%?\/I'T ﬁ %";‘:TG%R;AE\(E} 2000 TN [$ 1155( $ 23,100.00 $
S R I ; IE
50 [DETSARMOR CORTSANVEL | e 1 ; IE
o7 [T mROR SO e | o] ; IE
0 [DET ARG CORTSRAVEL | au] 1 ; IE
A R ; IE
R R ; IE
o [T spmon oo o] ; IE
A K ; IE
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Ulrich Gravel Inc. Western Materials, Inc.

- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

s [P SroR OATSERE | ] ; : |
i [T PRMOR CONT SRV g 1 ; $ |
45 3@$ 2 g‘?%g%g%ﬁzscwggfﬁ 1000 TN $ $ 2571 $ 25,710.00
46 3{?& 20A 1R5M [8 IRECOOFA(-:I-If A%'A&V;L' 1000 TN $ $ 26.70( $ 26,700.00
47 |DISTS ARNOR COAT GRAVEL | 00| s s 2556|5  5112000
48 a{fﬁ 2;‘2R$A§|RS%?:A;§§§(\D/'\E]L 2000 TN $ $ 2812 $ 56,240.00
49 a{fﬁ 2;‘9Rm?§ggégS§é\N/EL 1000 TN $ $ 2941 $ 29,410.00
50 3{/?; 2;‘?'&2?55522&53\’\1'1 1000 TN $ $ 2877($ 28,770.00
51 3{?; 2;‘5’;‘3?;8?;?3@;5; 1500 TN $ $ 2478 $ 37,170.00
52 3{?; 2;‘5'&?555&‘15;2&% 2500 TN $ $ 1711 $ 42,775.00
53 3{?; 20A E 'l\\A/I?V'T/ gggTD%i'?{VEL 3000 TN $ $ 2509( $ 75,270.00
54 3{?; 3??4M§|RNCC())FA(-:F§AR\)/’VAI\:/OEII;D 6000 TN $ $ 2371 $ 142,260.00
a5 |DISTEARMOR CORT GRAVEL | 00l 7y s s 2063|s 2063000
56 3{?; 3:LA2R(;\AI\(/?IRSCC)OFA(I§AT/{/A¥CI§;D 3000 TN $ $ 18.01( $ 54,030.00
57 3{?; gf\lR;\Ah(/?IRNCC?FA;SSRHA\XII_EII:E 3300 TN $ $ 2884 $ 95,172.00
58 a{f; g;:‘_)R]{\gOMRl’ (S:%";\:TC?—&QIC{ECI)-N 3000 TN $ $ 2257($ 67,710.00
59 a{f; 2§)R2'\20M'T (S:%";\:TC?—&QIC{ECI)_N 1000 TN $ $ 2143 $ 21,430.00
60 a{f; 2;:5;\/' S IRNCC())FA ZL?_:?A?\JVCEEL 1000 TN $ $ 2307 $ 23,070.00
61 DIST'S ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 2000 TN $ $ 16.78( $ 33,560.00

HWY 385 11 MI N OF BRIDGEPORT ’

62 a{f; 28ALL>RE;\AI\(/?IRNCC())|:AI-3FRCTI§2\IE/IE(ISRT 2000 TN $ $ 19.02( $ 38,040.00
63 ,Iill_?_-er?\léEMYa';g OAT GRAVEL 3000 TN $ $ 2062 $ 61,860.00
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Ulrich Gravel Inc. Western Materials, Inc.

- Description Qty |UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

64 EEXVSFA(\DRRNEI)OYR A(égAT GRAVEL 1000 TN $ -1$ 2171 $ 21,710.00
65 3E;R5|SA§,3A$ARRCDOAT GRAVEL 1000 TN $ - 1% 1872 $ 18,720.00
66 3E;R5|SA§U'\1?OGRY(;ORADT GRAVEL 3000 TN $ -1%$ 1568( $ 47,040.00
67 ggglzé‘l?xgg COAT GRAVEL 5000 TN $ -|1$ 1381( $ 69,050.00
68 g:'j; 235 C’;AISFRYiggT GRAVEL 2000 TN $ -1 $ 1774 $ 35,480.00
69 EEXPSPQEI’EA S ;R(I:DOAT GRAVEL 3000 TN $ - 1% 2990( % 89,700.00
70 E:;EES_R&%% COAT GRAVEL 3000 TN $ - 1% 2030(¢%$ 60,900.00
71 BT EAROR SORTORAEL | ] 1 ; IE |
72 CD)Ig(‘:I)' ST%R\';ASRRDCOAT GRAVEL 500 TN $ ) $ )
o oo Ao comT o | s ; IE |
e TR con o, | s ; IE |
7o [DETEARMOR CORTOREL | e ; IE |
76 3{/?; ?&RZ'\A [8 IRS%?:A; A%TB@{\JE'I'L 500 TN [ $ 14.00( $ 7,000.00 $ -
 erenson comerer | s s mwls v | -
78 2:\JSSTL6E¢ R;'\AASDR COAT GRAVEL 500 TN [ $ 1550( $ 7,750.00 $ -
7o [oeTamor corT oA | o] ; IE |
0 [DETEARMORCON SRV | s ; IE |
o DT Ao o e e | ; s wuls omn
82 a{f; 23A 1R5M l\(/?IRNCC())FA -SrT(,;AIR;ﬁ\E/E(ISN 1000 TN $ - 1% 2097($ 20,970.00
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Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

E Armor Coat Gravel Ulrich Gravel Inc. Western Materials, Inc.
- Description Qty [UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
53 Do poon SOATSTREL | o] ; | : |
oo DT 208 CONTSRATEL | o] ; | : |
o5 DT A0 CONT RATEL | o] ; | : |
oo DT AR CON SrvE. | o] ; | : |
o7 DT AOR CONT RAVEL | o] ; | : |
o0 DT R O e | o] ; | : |
g |DISTTARMOR COAT GRAVEL | 500 s - s -
I ; | : |
o1 DT 1O COR AVE | o] ; | : |
52 [DTAOR CORTORAYEL | 0] 7 ; | : |
3 |y 183 7 i N OF SpRieviEW | 1200] T s : s :
% |1c7 12157 22 M N OF NEWRORT | 1590] T s : s :
o5 DT S/ RO CORTORAYE | o] ; | : |
o0 [DTOAOR CONGRATE. | o] ; | : |
97 ?éiTli/g?’\éISRRV(V:SLAI\_TYiEgVEL 25001 TN | $ 1025| $ 25,625.00 $ -
98 3{2\3 glAZR’l\\A/I(I)V'T/ gg"il\_-;‘sfggEL 1000| TN [ $ 1250| $ 12,500.00 $ -
9 | c7 201195 5 Wi OF Cramaers | 59| ™ s : s :
1o [y pon OATSRAYEE | on] ; | : |
101 REJE%AYTQ%R COAT GRAVEL 2500 TN $ - $ -
R ; | : |
13 |,y 6150 M S O wemRIAN | 15%0] T s : s :
Total $ 208,525.00 $ 1,301,017.00
Payment Terms 00
Delivery Days ARO as needed 20
Comments
No Bid
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Brads Sand & Gravel

Opening Date: 02/08/13



Buyer: Ruth Gray

4207 OF
Statewide

Line #

Armor Coat Gravel

Description

Ulrich Gravel Inc.

Western Materials, Inc.

| oty [uom| unit Price |

Ext. Price

Unit Price | Ext. Price
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K4 Trucking LLC

Opening Date: 02/08/13



