
Buyer: Ruth Gray 4199 OF

Nebraska State Patrol
Opening Date:  01/28/2013

PARTIAL 

AWARD

PARTIAL 

AWARD
PARTIAL AWARD

Ed M. Feld Equip. 

Co. Inc.

Jack's Uniforms & 

Equipment 

Primary Bid

Jack's Uniforms & 

Equipment 

Alternate Bid

Jones 

Automotive / 

Federal Signal

SoundOff 

Signal

Response 1

SoundOff Signal

Response 2

TOMAR 

Electronics

Whelen 

Engineering

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

46" - 49" LED light bar with directional lights 150 EA $2,578.00 $918.00 $835.00 $766.49 $752.49 $1,059.00 $775.00 

Brand and Model Number Bidding Whelen Liberty 2ITRPL4TA4IF* 2ITRPLA2

SoundOff 

Signal Magnum 

48EMG2-12-

6T1 48" - (12 

Led Corners 

and 6LED 

Inboard 

Modules)

SoundOff Signal 

Magnum 48EMG2-

6-6-T1 48" - (6Led 

Corners and 

6LED Inboard 

Modules)

TOMAR 970L-

4908-0801

WHELEN 

JUSTICE 

LIGHTBAR 

JNESP1

46" - 49" LED reflectorized light bar with directional 150 EA  No Bid $1,140.00 $1,140.00 $838.00 $761.46 $749.49  No Bid $799.00 

Brand and Model Number Bidding 2747A5 2747A5

Federal Signal 

LGD45Z-NSP 

and 331105 

(SMC5)

SoundOff 

Signal Magnum 

48EMG2-12-3-

T1 48" - (12Led 

Corners and 

3LED Inboard 

Models)

SoundOff Signal 

Magnum 48EMG2-

6-3-T1 48" - (6Led 

Corners and 

3LED Inboard 

Modules

WHELEN 

JUSTICE 

LIGHTBAR 

JNESP2

52" LED light bar with directional lights 100 EA  No Bid $943.00 $880.00 $870.49 $824.49 $1,093.00 $855.00 

Brand and Model Number Bidding  2ITRPL52AIF*  2ITRPL52A3 

 SoundOff 

Signal Magnum 

54EMG2-12-6-

T1 54" - (12Led 

Corners and 

6LED Inboard 

Modules) 

 SoundOff Signal 

Magnum 54EMG2-

6-6-T1 54" - (6Led 

Corners and 

6LED Inboard 

Modules) 

 TOMAR 970L-

5309-1010 

WHELEN 

JUSTICE 

LIGHTBAR 

JNESP3

52" LED reflectorized light bar with directional lights 100 EA  No Bid $1,189.00 $1,189.00 $968.00 $866.49 $804.40  No Bid $875.00 

Brand and Model Number Bidding  2752A5 2752A5

Federal Signal 

LGD53Z-NSP 

and 331105 

(SMC5)

 SoundOff 

Signal Magnum 

54EMG2-12-3-

T1 54" - 12Led 

Corners and 

3LED Inbloard 

Modules) 

 SoundOff Signal 

Magnum 54EMG2-

6-3-T1 54" - (6Led 

Corners and 

3LED Inboard 

Modules) 

WHELEN 

JUSTICE 

LIGHTBAR 

JNESP4

Net 30 Net 30 1%/10 days 0%/0 days 0%/0 days 2%/10 days 0/Net 30 days

30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 20 days 30 days 30-45 days

*Includes arrowstick 

control head

No Bid:

Light and Siren

L
in

e
 # Light Bars

3

4

Line 1: First and second apparent low bidder SoundOff Signal did not meet Specification 3.H. during testing. Third 

apparent low bidder Whelen Engineering did not meet Specification 3.H. during testing.

Line 3: First  and third apparent low bidder SoundOff Signal bid 54" light bar and the requested item was a 52" 

light bar. Second apparent low bidder Whelen Engineering did not meet Specification 3.H. during testing. 

Comments

Payment Terms

1

Delivery Days ARO

2

Line 4: First and second apparent low bidder SoundOff Signal bid 54" light bar and the requested item was a 52" 

light bar. Third apparent low bidder Whelen Justice did not meet Specification 3.H. during testing.

Award Explanation
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