
Buyer:  Michelle Musick 4111 OF

Statewide
Opening Date:    09/21/12

SECONDARY AWARD

 PRIMARY AWARD & 

E85 

 Anderson Auto Group  Courtesy Ford - Lincoln 
 Gene Steffy Chrysler 

Center 
 Husker Auto Group  Performance Dodge  Sid Dillon Chev Buick  Sid Dillon Ford Lincoln 

Description Qty UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

3/4 Ton Diesel Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup  $                  35,439.00  $                   38,009.00  $                   39,638.00  $                    35,157.00  $                    39,196.00  $                  35,573.00  $                    35,480.00 

Make:  Ford  Ford  RAM  Chevrolet  DODGE CC  Chevrolet  Ford 

Model:  F250  F-250 2500  Silverado  RAM  Silverado  F-250, Crew Cab 

GVWR: 10,000 10,000 lbs 8,800 10,000 8800 10,000 10,000

Series, Code, Trim Level:
 603A, W2B, XLT  XLT, 603A  SLT-DJ7H91 

 2500-CK20743-Base 

LT 
 2500 'SLT' 'DJ7H92'  2500HD, CK 20743, LT  F-250, W2B, XLT 

Engine:
 6.7L Diesel  6.7L V8  6.7L Cummins  LML 6.6L Duramax 

 6.7L I6 CUMMINS 

TURBO DIESEL 
 6.6L Duramax  6.7L Power Stroke 

EPA:  N/A  N/A  N/A  NA @ This Time  N/A  N/A 

Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days):  90-120  90-120  90-120  35-120  90-120  40-120  40-120 

E85 3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup  $                  29,010.00  $                   31,640.00  N/A  $                    28,026.00  N/A  $                  28,544.00  $                    29,160.00 

Engine:  6.2L V8  6.2L V8  L96 6.0L Vortec E85  6.0L  6.2L 

Make:  Ford  Ford  Chevrolet  Chevrolet  Ford 

Model:  F250  F-250  Silverado  Silverado  F-250, Crew Cab 

GVWR: 10,000 10,000 lbs 9500 9,500 10,000

Series, Code, Trim Level:
 603A, W2B, XLT  XLT, 603A 

 2500-CK20743-Base 

LT 
 2500HD, CK 20743, LT  F-250, W2B, XLT 

EPA:  N/A  N/A  NA @ This Time  N/A  N/A 

Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days):  90-120  90-120  35-120  40-120  40-120 

 $                  (6,429.00)  $                   (6,369.00)  $                 (10,000.00)  $                    (5,997.00)  $                  (10,519.00)  $                   (6,000.00)  $                    (5,500.00)

 6.2L V8  6.2L V8  5.7L Hemi V8  L96 6.0L Vortec  6.0L V8  6.2L V8 

 N/A  N/A  NA  N/A  N/A  N/A 

 -  -  - 

 N/A  N/A  NA  NA  N/A  N/A 

 -  -  -  - 

 -  -  -  - 

 -  -  -  - 

 -  -  -  - 

6  N/A  N/A  $                       (400.00)  NC  NO BID  N/A  N/A 

7 185.00$                       148.00$                        STD 288.00$                           N/A STD 256.00$                          

8  $                    1,095.00 945.00$                         N/A  $                         269.00  N/A  $                        145.00  $                      1,125.00 

9  N/A  N/A  N/A  NA  N/A  N/A  N/A 

10  $                    1,080.00 904.00$                         N/A  $                      1,295.00  $                         786.00  $                        995.00  $                         995.00 

11  N/A  N/A  N/A  NA  N/A  N/A  N/A 

12  N/A  STD  STD  $                        (699.00)  STD.  N/A  N/A 

13  N/A  N/A  $                       (180.00)  $                          (59.00)  $                        (153.00)  N/A  N/A 

14  $                       165.00  STD MANUAL  N/A  $                         399.00  N/A  $                        295.00  $                         195.00 

15  STD.  STD  STD  $                           88.00  STD.  STD  STD 

16  $                         95.00  STD  STD  $                           99.00  STD.  $                          95.00  $                           95.00 

17  N/A  STD  STD  $                        (247.00)  STD.  N/A  N/A 

18  SEE ATTACHED  SEE ATTACHED  N/C  NC-See attached  SEE LIST  SEE ATTACHED  SEE ATTACHED 

19  N/C  $                        544.00  $                        450.00  $                         199.00  "  NC  NC 

20  N/A  SEE ATTACHED  $                        450.00  $                         455.00  "  SEE ATTACHED  SEE ATTACHED 

21  $                  (1,895.00)  $                   (2,880.00)  $                    (2,600.00)  $                    (1,299.00)  $                    (2,509.00)  $                   (1,759.00)  $                    (1,616.00)

 $                       450.00  $                        450.00  $                        475.00  $                         498.00  $                         404.00  $                        495.00  $                         495.00 

 Ultimate Linings done 

by Anderson Ford 
 Ultimate Lining  Mopar  Max Liner  FACTORY  Line-X  Line-X 

 $                       295.00  $                        174.00  $                   39,928.00  $                         497.00  $                        (171.00)  $                        475.00  $                         474.00 

 172"  172" 169  167.7" 149"  167.7"  172" 
8'  8 Ft Box 96  8' 6'  8' 8'

 $                    4,995.00  $                     4,262.00  $                     4,250.00  $                      4,995.00  NO BID  $                     4,990.00  $                      4,890.00 

 Western 8' Steel Pro 

Plus 

 Boss, Built to 

Specifications 
 Hiniker 

 Boss/Boss 

TB15020/4635 

w/joystick, crate, 

undercarriage kit, head 

lite kit & sno deflector kit 

 8' Boss Steel Super 

duty, joystick control, 

under carriage, plow 

prep pack, installed 

 8' Boss Steel Super 

duty, joystick control, 

under carriage, snow 

plow prep package, 

installed 

 $                       185.00  $                          72.00  $                     1,225.00  $                         497.00  NO BID  $                        495.00  $                         285.00 

3

5

24

Two electric remote controlled outside mirrors, swing 

Rear seat (deduct).

Bucket type seats-Cloth w/vinyl trim.

L
in

e
 #

1

2013 or Current Production Year 3/4 Ton Diesel

 Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup Truck

2

4

OPTIONS BID LIST

25

22

23

1 EA

1 EA

Standard Paint-Attach List and Identify as No Additional 

Cost Paints.

Keyless remote entry locking system (deduct).

Cargo light.

Second Power Outlet.

Right and left telescopic mirrors, minimum 6"x 8".

Camper type, extended arm, min. 7"x10" (deduct).

40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench Seat W/lumbar support 

w/vinyl (deduct).

Fog Lights.

Electronic Shift 4 Wheel Drive System.

Automatic to Manual Four-Speed Transmission 

Specify Engine Size:

Warranty:

Model:

If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer:

Engine (other diesel), including block heater, factory or 

Specify Engine Size:

Engine (other gas).

Specify Engine Size:

Engine (other gas).

Snow plow package minus snow plow blade.

Specify snow plow package manufacturer and details: 

Snow plow attachment of pickup manufacturer's 

Bidder state box size: 

Bidder state wheelbase:

Increased pickup box length of approximately 8 feet with 

Bidder state manufacturer:

HD Rubberized spray in bed liner (Linex, Rhino or 

Two wheel drive model (to include all season tires) 

Extra Cost Paint-Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost 

Paints.

For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of: Dodge 

#PY5269, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A 
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Buyer:  Michelle Musick 4111 OF

Statewide
Opening Date:    09/21/12

 Anderson Auto Group  Courtesy Ford - Lincoln 
 Gene Steffy Chrysler 

Center 
 Husker Auto Group  Performance Dodge  Sid Dillon Chev Buick  Sid Dillon Ford Lincoln 

Description Qty UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

L
in

e
 # 2013 or Current Production Year 3/4 Ton Diesel

 Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup Truck

 Snow Plow Prep 

Package - Ford Motor 

Co. 

 Computer Selected 

Springs For Snowplow 

Application Extra Heavy-

Duty Alternator 

 Mounting Brackets, 

Controller, Underhood 

Wiring 

 includes 10 Amp Pwr for 

backup & roof 

emergency light, forward 

lamp wiring harness, 

provisions for roof 

mounted lamp/beacon, 

instrument panel jumper 

wiring harness for brake 

controller & skid plate. 

 10 amp power for 

backup and roof light, 

forward lamp wiring 

harness, provision for 

roof beacon, increased 

front axle weight rating, 

160 amp Alt. on gas 

engine or Dual 125 amp 

on Diesel 

 Computer selected 

springs extra heavy duty 

alternator 

26  $                       405.00  $                        324.00  STD  $                         377.00  STD.  $                        295.00  $                         405.00 

 $                    6,395.00  $                     6,525.00  $                   45,762.00  $                      6,995.00  NO BID  $                        668.00  $                      6,680.00 

 Omaha STD. 96V or 

Knapheide 696J 
 Omaha Standard 96V  Knapheide 

 Knapheide 696J or 

Omaha Std 96V 

 Omaha Standard 96V 

or Knapheide 696J 

 Omaha Standard 96V 

or Knapheide 696J 
 yellow $293.00  $295.00 yellow 

 other color $560.00  $560.00 other color 

29  $                     (600.00)  $                      (460.00)  $                    (1,200.00)  $                        (750.00)  N/A  $                      (600.00)  $                        (600.00)

30  N/A  N/A  N/A  NA  NO BID  N/A  N/A 

31  N/A  N/A  STD  $                        (277.00)  STD.  N/A  N/A 

 $1276.00 Factory 

 $400.00 Dealer 

33  $                       375.00  $                        315.00  $                        325.00  $                         199.00  NO BID  N/A  $                         375.00 

34  $                       380.00  $                        319.00  N/A  $                         478.00  NO BID  $                        270.00  $                         380.00 

35  N/A  N/A  See Attached  $                         399.00  N/A  $                        295.00  N/A 

36  $                       395.00  N/A  See Attached  $                         799.00  N/A  N/A  $                         370.00 

37  N/A  N/A  See Attached  NA  N/A  $                        695.00  N/A 

38  N/A  N/A  See Attached  $                         359.00  N/A  N/A  N/A 

 $                    2,995.00  CALL FOR OPTIONS  $                     2,840.00  NC  NO BID  CALL FOR OPTIONS  CALL FOR OPTIONS 

 Years - 5

Miles - 100,000

Premium Care 

 5 years

100,000 Miles

$100 deductible 

 Years - 5

Miles - 100,000

Pwr Train 

40  $2.00 per mile  $                        250.00  $                        500.00  $                         500.00  $                         400.00  $                        400.00  $                         400.00 

41  $                         95.00  N/APP  $                          75.00  $                         299.00  NO BID  $                        190.00  $                         190.00 

42  $                         95.00  N/C  $                          75.00  $                         199.00  NO BID  $                          70.00  $                           70.00 

43  $                       195.00  N/A  $                        130.00  $                         275.00  NO BID  $                        175.00  $                         175.00 

 $                       920.00  N/A  $                        795.00  $                         899.00  NO BID  $                        820.00  $                         820.00 

750  - 750 CCA 730 750 750 

 $                         95.00  $                          63.00  $                        180.00  $                         198.00  NO BID  $                        495.00  $                         275.00 

 200-Diesel only  200 AMP 180
 160-Requires 6.0L 

Vortec 

 160 amp - gas engine/ 

Dual 125 amp on Diesel 
200

46  $                       295.00  $                        105.00  $                        300.00  $                         490.00  NO BID  $                        371.00  $                         371.00 

47  $                       199.00  N/A 
 Not Availbel/ working 

on a solution 
 $                         297.00  NO BID  $                        199.00  $                         199.00 

48  $                       289.00  N/A  $                        230.00  $                         389.00  NO BID  $                        299.00  $                         299.00 

49  $                       299.00  N/A  $                        255.00  $                         389.00  NO BID  $                        299.00  $                         299.00 

50  $                       360.00  N/A  $                        285.00  $                         425.00  NO BID  $                        329.00  $                         329.00 

51  N/A  N/A  N/A  NA for GM Truck  NO BID  N/A  N/A 

52  $                       660.00  N/A  $                        615.00  $                         699.00  NO BID  $                        659.00  $                         659.00 

53  $                       139.00  N/A  $                        126.00  $                         299.00  NO BID  $                        164.00  $                         164.00 

54  $                       249.00  N/A  $                        235.00  $                         299.00  NO BID  $                        280.00  $                         280.00 

 0% 30 DAYS  0%  15 DAYS  0%  30 DAYS  0%  15 DAYS 0  0% 30 DAYS  0% 30 DAYS 

 90-120  90-120  90-120  35-120  40-120  40-120 

Line 8: Inc. fog 

lights/Power 

seat/Reverse sensing     

Line 10: Requires 

Carpet           

Line 26: Power

 Line 8:  Included in XLT 

Value Package      Line 

10:  Requires Carpet          

Line 26: Power         

Line 6: STD w/MW7

Line 12: Requires Base 

WT Pkg - lose Pwr 

Windows

Lines 13, 17 and 31:  

Requires Base WT Pkg        

Line 20:  See Attached     

Lines 32, 33, 41 and 46:  

Dealer is circled

Line 36:  When available

Line 5: Block Heater in 

Diesel Bid

w/Gas Bid $77.00

Line 13: OPTION

Line 23: 8' BID 169" W/B

Line 34: Diesel only     

Lines 35 and 37: when 

available

Addition

Line 55:  C.N.G. - Bifuel 

21.2gge tank 11,150.00

Line 8: Requires: XLT 

Value Package

Line 10:  Requires 

carpet           

Line 34:  Diesel only     

Line 36 when available

Additions   

Line 55: C.N.G. - Bifuel  

21.2 gge tank 

11m359.00

Line 56: Shift on the fly 

4x4 256.00

 $                        695.00 

Electronic compass/temperature display system 

Deduction for minimum 7,200 pound GVWR for basic 

No lid on Utility Body (deduct).

27

 N/A  N/C  $                        165.00  $                     1,250.00 

44

45

 $                         799.00  $                      1,343.00  $                         495.00 

25

 $                       895.00 

LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY

28  $                         599.00 

39

 $                        690.00 32

Color of Utility Body to match manufacturer color charts.

Dealer or Factory installed rearview camera.

Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM.

Equipment & engine parts manual.

Sliding rear-vision window.

Specify plow package minus snow plow blade 

manufacturer and details: 

State make and model:

Chassis with eight foot Utility Body for single wheel. See 

Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM.

Equipment & engine service repair manual.

Dealer or Factory installed dual alternators.

Dealer or Factory installed tailgate step.

Indicate CCA:

Auxiliary Battery (Largest available battery) with Dual 

Dome Light or Courtesy Lamp:  To be centered not 

Disconnect of factory dome light or courtesy lamps.

Factory or dealer disconnect of daylight running lights if 

Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment 

State    YEARS _______     MILES ________

Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer.

Roof mounted blue tree antenna. Centered on roof ten 

Roof mounted antenna. Located ten (10) inches forward 

Setina PB 400 Push Bumper with installation on front of 

Pro-Gard X Push bumper with installation on front of 

vehicle.

100 WATT siren speaker installed behind front grill with 

Two (2) Clear/White LED Modules.  Mounted on either 

Two (2) Clear/White LED Modules.  Vertical mounted at 

Alternating headlight flasher wig-wag module with 

flasher override for optional override at night installed 

Reverse sensing alarm system.  Dealer installation is 

Indicate Amps:

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

Comments

Alternator with Highest Output available.

Comments

Totals
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