
Buyer:  Michelle Musick 4071 OF

Upholstery Fabric
Opening Date:  07/26/12

CF Stinson, Inc Douglass Industries, Inc Mayer Fabrics Momentum Textiles, LLC

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

 $                                  11.72  $                                                 10.59  $                                              11.95 

2
GRASSCLOTH 
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  13.35  $                                                 13.10  $                                              11.95 

3
GEMENI 
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  10.84  $                                                       -    $                                                8.45 

4
COPA 
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                 11.50  $                                              11.95 

5
SPARKLE 
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  11.50  $                                                       -    $                                                9.95 

6
MULTICREPE   
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  11.85  $                                                       -    $                                              11.95 

7
AXIS TOO 
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  13.50  $                                                       -    $                                                9.95 

8
REFLECTANCE                         
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  13.61  $                                                       -    $                                              14.95 

9
ASTERISK           
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  15.79  $                                                 12.23  $                                              12.95 

10
GENESIS             
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  11.72  $                                                 10.59  $                                              11.95 

11
MIRA                     
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  13.25  $                                                       -    $                                              17.45 

12
DELMAR              
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  14.75  $                                                       -    $                                                9.95 

13
TRAFFIC              
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  13.95  $                                                       -    $                                              14.95 

14
TERRAIN             
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  13.95  $                                                       -    $                                              18.45 

15
MEANDER           
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  11.50  $                                                       -    $                                              17.45  $                                        9.80 

16
UNIVERSE           
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  11.85  $                                                       -    $                                              12.95  $                                        9.80 

17
TRACERY            
PANEL FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  13.35  $                                                       -    $                                              13.95  $                                        9.80 

18
WAVE LENGTH   
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              11.95 

19
CARAT                 
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              12.95 

20
STRUCTURE      
SEATING FABRIC

100.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              14.95 

21
CHARLSTON      
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              12.95 

22
ASTRO                 
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              14.95 

23
FORTE                 
SEATING FABRIC

100.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                 12.71  $                                                7.95 

24
CROSS CHECK  
SEATING FABRIC

100.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                                8.95 

25
MOONSCAPE      
SEATING FABRIC

200.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              16.45 

26
FOUNDATION     
SEATING FABRIC

200.0000 YD  $                                  16.16  $                                                       -    $                                              10.95 

27
CONFETTI           
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  16.16  $                                                       -    $                                              10.95 

EQUAL
PANEL FABRIC

L
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e
 # Upholstery Fabric

1 50.0000 YD
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28
ENDURO              
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                   8.10  $                                                9.45 

29
IMPACT                
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  16.16  $                                                       -    $                                              10.95 

30
SPIN                     
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  17.96  $                                                       -    $                                              32.45 

31
ZIP                         
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              11.95 

32
BRYANT PARK   
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  $                                  13.09  $                                                       -    $                                                9.95 

33
BASIS 
SEATING FABRIC

25.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                        8.95 

34
ERA                       
SEATING FABRIC

25.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              10.95  No Bid 

35
EXPO                    
SEATING FABRIC

200.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              13.95  $                                        8.95 

36
ORIGIN                 
SEATING FABRIC

300.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                                7.95  $                                        8.25 

37
PERK                    
SEATING FABRIC

1,000.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                                8.95  $                                        8.50 

38
INTERVAL            
SEATING FABRIC

1,000.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -    $                                              11.95  $                                        9.85 

39

CRYPTON SUPER 

PORFOLIO ONE 
SEATING FABRIC

50.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                 25.07  $                                              24.95 

40
SHERPA               
SEATING FABRIC               

25.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                   8.10  $                                                9.45 

41
SHIRE                   
SEATING FABRIC

25.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                   8.10  $                                                9.45 

42
CHANNEL            
SEATING FABRIC

25.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                       -   

43
SMART CHOICE 
SEATING FABRIC

25.0000 YD  No Bid  $                                                 13.39  $                                              13.95 

44

ALL SEASON, 100% 

VINYL 
SEATING FABRIC

1,000.0000 YD  No Bid 13.75  $                                              12.95 

0% 30 0% 30 0% 30

4-10 3-5Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms
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Line 1: Bidding alt Genesis

Line 2: Bidding alt Tussah

Line 3: Bidding alt Prime

Line 5: Bidding alt Imprint

Line 6: Bidding alt Spree

Line 8: Phasing out bidding 

alt Array

Line 13: Phasing out bidding 

alt Dapple

Line 14: Phasing out bidding 

alt Nikko

Line 15: Bidding alt Imprint

Line 16: Bidding alt Spree

Line 17: Bidding alt Tussah

Line 26 Bidding Alt New 

Hempstead

Line 27 Phasing Out Bidding 

Transcend

Line 29 Phasing Out Bidding 

Alt New Hempstead

Line 30: Phasing Out Bidding 

Alt Thicket

Line 1: Douglass pattern name: 

Berwick II exact fabric

Line 2: Alternate Pattern Name: 

Gillette

Line 4 Alternate pattern name: Kenyon

Line 9: Alternate pattern name: Foliage

Line 10: Douglass pattern name: 

Berwick II exact fabric

Line 23: Alternate pattern name: 

Icon/Delmar

Line 28: Douglass pattern names: 

Sherpa/Shire exact fabric

Line 39: Exact Fabric to include 

patterns: Flounce, Fuse, Gamut, Ritzy, 

Straightaway & Trinket

Line 42: Fabric is no longer available

Line 43: Exact Fabric to include 

pattersn: Circuit, Flip, flutter, Ring, 

Slide, Switch, Twist, and Zing.

Line 44: Douglass Pattern Name: 

colorguard Exact Product

Line 3: Disc. Alternative basic       

Line 5: Disc Alternative Strata 

Line 7: Alternative Fresco                     

Line 8: Alternative Paragon                   

Line 9: Zest                              

Line 10: Alternative Equal                      

Line 11: Anasazi                      

Line 12: Fresco                          

Line 13: Space Odyssey                   

Line 15: Anasazi                       

Line 16: Interlude/universe          

Line 17: Whirlwind                     

Line 19: Disc. Amulet                    

Line 21: Disc. Mosaic                     

Line 26: Foundation 10                    

Line 27: Essential                           

Line 28: Duraweave 10                    

Line 29: Dapper                              

Line 30: Synapse                            

Line 31: Cavalier                             

Line 32: Quattro                             

 Line 34: Sequel                              

Line 35: Genesis                            

Line 36: Forte                                 

Line 37: Crosscheck                       

Line 38: Artistry                              

Line 39: Proximity I & II coordinates  

Line 40: Duraweave 10                 

Line 41: Duraweave 10                      

Line 43: Ensemble coordinates

Line 15,16 and 17 :Additional 

panel fabric options have been 

submitted on Attachment A 

forms. Panel fabric cards 

included with samples.                 

Line 34: This fabric will be 

Discontinued on 1/1/13. 

Alternate fabrics have been 

submitted on Attachment A 

forms. New sample card and 

memo samples have been 

included.                              

Line 36 and 37: Origin and Perk 

are still available, but are not 

sampled on the new upholstery 

card that we are proposing.

Line 9: Lowest Bidder - Douglass Industries, Inc's alternate bid was to 

descript.  

Second Lowest Bidder - Mayer Fabric's alternate bid pattern was the 

wrong direction.

AWARD EXPLANATION:

The following lines were not awarded: 1 - 8, 11 - 14, 19, 21, 24, 26 - 

34, 39, 42 and 43.

Comments
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