Buyer: Michelle Musick

o Average Manufacturer & . "
E Item Description mn Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU

Category

Roll Tissue

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics

4049 OF Bid Tab

Cash-Wa Distibuting

Sheets /

Dimension: Feet per roll

Failure to provide complete responses below may be grounds to reject the bid!

CENTRAL POLY CORP.

Bid Price per Manufacturer & .
- Product Line / Brand Mfg stem iders SKU n

Failure to provide complete responses below may be grounds to reject the bid!

Dimensions

Sheets / Feet| Net Case
per roll Weight

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

Roll Tissue, white, 1-ply, aprox. 4 1/2" x 4 1/2",

=Y

equivalent

Facial Tissue
Facial tissue, boxed, white, 8.33" x 8.0", 2 ply,
30/100 cs. GP 47410 or equivalent.

1225

case

SCA

TF6710A

New

1 |1210 sheets/roll, 80 rolls/case, GP 14580 or 110 6 case No Bid ATLAS A125 A125 A125 9 4.5x3.8 1000 44 43.66
Roll Tissue, white, 1-ply, aprox. 4 1/2" x 4 1/2",

2 1500 sheets/roll, 48 rolls/case, GP14448 or 1610 36 case No Bid $
Roll Tissue, white, 2-ply, aprox. 4.5 x 4.05, 500

3 [sheets/roll, 80 rolls/case, GP19880/01 or 19250 42 case SCA T™M1616S New 9% 500/4X3.75 $ 3353 ATLAS A250 A250 A250 9 45X3.8 500 36 39.6
Roll tissue, white, 2-ply, 3 3/4" x 4", 865 ’

4 36 rolls/case, GP-19375 or equivalent 130 4 case No id $

5 Roll tissue, white, 2-ply, 80/605, KC-04460-60 or 760 4“4 case No Bid s

Facial tissue, boxed, white, premium, 36/100,
Kleenex 21400 or equivalent
Napkins
Disp Napkin tallfold tallfold, size, 7 1/4" x 13 1/2",

160

case

05812 or equivalent

8 |1 ply, standard weight, white or natural 40/250, 1A 220 5 case $
32680G or equi
Disp napkins, Irg size, White, 12" x 17", 1-ply,
i 121500 cs. GP-37402 or equivalent 15 3 case SCA D802A 80575 6000 12x17 $
Paper napkin, luncheon size, 12" x 13", 1 ply, 1/4
10 |fold, white or natural, 12/500case, GP 37707 or 4200 19 case SCA L3141 80587 6000 | 13x11.5 $
equivalent
Paper Towels, Wipers & Dusting Cloths
Paper towel, singlefold, Natural, 1-ply, 9.5" x 10
11]7/8", 250 towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case, GP 23504 or | 8460 51 case SCA SK1850A 82815 4000 | 0.25x9.125
i PUTNEY P800 9.25X10.25 19.37 $ 2099
Paper towel, multifold, Natural, 1-ply, 9 1/4" x 9
12 1/2", 200 towels/pkg, 20 pkgs/case, GP 23304 or | 12100 40 case SCA MK520A 82827 4000 | 9.5x9.12
i PUTNEY P200N 9.25X9.5 19.15 $ 2098
Paper towel, multifold, White, 1-ply, 9 1/4" x 9
1] /2’,’,1 161250 GP 24500 or equiya‘\/ent 4050 | 40 | case SCA MBS38 | 82857 | 4000 | 951 PUTNEY P200B 925¢95 015 |5 2007
Paper towel, roll, 2-ply, 11" x 8.6", 84 - 85
14 | sheetsirol, 30 rols/case, GP 27385 or equivalent | 20 | 11| ©%se SCA HB19S0A | 82866 | S0roll | 119 Bheets/ol - |§ 074 0s ases AS85 AS85 30 11X8 19 |s 3099
Paper Towel, Center pull Roll Towel, 7.8"W x
15 |15°L, White, 560/t0l, 4 rolsfcase, GP 28143 B’ | e NoBid s
16 enMotion white Towel, 800", 6/cs GP-89460 or 790 6 case No Bid
i VONDREHLE 8168 8168 VD816B 6 10X800' 800" 45 $ 4870
Wipers, delicate task, 3-ply, soft, non-abrasive,
17 [15"W x 16.7"L, 20BX(70)CS, GP 29778 or 50 4 case No Bid
i $
Wipers, Light Duty, white, 1-ply, 15"W x 16.5"L,
8 20/140 cs Georgia Pacific 29756 or equivalent 20 b case No 8id $
Wipers, All Purpose Medium Duty, white, 1/4 fold
19 [bulk, 12.5" x 14.4", 12/90 cs, Kimberly Clark 810 34 case No Bid s
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

Category

Cups, Food Containers

Portion cup pleated paper 3/4 oz., White, 5000/cs

- Average Manufacturer &
E Item Description mn Product Line / Brand Ifg's Item #

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics
4049 OF Bid Tab

Cash-Wa Distibuting

Sheets / | Net Case| Bi per Manufacturer &
Biders SKU Weight Product Line / Brand fastemt

20 A 390 5 case SOLO 075-2050 84700 5000
|~ [Solo 75 or equivalent
21 |Portion cup, 1 0z, paper, 5000/cs, SW-100 or 695 11 case SOLO 1002050 | 84740 | 5000
|~ [equivalent
2 252‘;302 oz paper souffle cup, white, 2500cs, 2 3 | case SoLo 2002050 | 84790 | 5000
2 F‘ortior] cup clear plastic 2 oz., 2500cs, PV-YS200 160 3 case SOLO B200-0100 87071 2500
or equivalent.
24 |1 202. portion cup, 2500 cs, PV-YLS2FR or 70 2 case SOLO PL2-0090 | 87906 | 2500
|~ |equivalent.
25 Cold c.up 50z plstc translucent, 2500cs, SW-CDE5 20 2 case SOLO Y55 87909 2000
or equivalent.
2% Lid 50z. co‘ld cup, 2500cs, NO STRAW SLOT, SW- 20 9 case
L53 or equivalent.
Paper cup, White, Non-waxed, Drinking, 30z.,
27 2400cs, Solo RDAL or equivalent. 400 9 case SOLO RD3L-0205( 89977 2400
2g | Waxed oold cup, 50z, 3000/cs, Solo R53 or 90 6 case SOLO R53-08000 | 84142 | 3000
| [equivalent
29 Wa)_(ed cold cup, 60z., 2000/cs, Solo R6NN or 20 2 case
| [equivalent
20 Wa)_(ed cold cup, 90z, 2,000/cs, Solo RN or 190 14 case
|~ [equivalent
3 Hot/Co_Id cup, white, 60z., 1000/cs, WinCup 6C6 4 7 case DART 606 85010 1000
or equivalent
2 Hot/Co_Id cup, white, 80z., 1000/cs, WinCup 8C8 2410 18 case DART 808 85020 1000
or equivalent.
3 Hot/Cold cup,‘whne, 120z., 1000/cs, WinCup 1340 7 case DART 12016 85001 1000
12C16 or equivalent
34 | Cup, 4 oz, 1000/cs, WC-4C4 or equivalent 30 7 case DART 4J4 85905 1000
35 |Lid for 4 oz cup, 1000/cs, WC-4L or equivalent 30 3 case DART 4JL 86196 1000
| 36 | Vented Lid for 8¢8, Wincup 65 3 case DART 8JL 86210 1000
Vented Lid, Wincup WC-FL 35 2 case

Plates, Bowls, Food Containers
Paper plate 6" coated, fluted rigid rim, 1,000cs,

Wincup 16FC or equivalent.
Plates, Bowls, Food Containers
3 compartment hngd tray white foam, 9" x 9" x

%8 | Solo MWP6 or 2 1| case
Paper plate 9" coated, fluted rigid rim, 1,000cs,

% | 0lo MWP9 or W9 | e
Foam plate 6", non-laminated, 1 section, white,

40 1000/cs, PV-YTH10006 or 335 4 case GENPAK 80600 80094 1,000
Foam plate 9", non-laminated, 1 section, white,

4 500/cs, PV-YTH10009 o 1200 10 case GENPAK 80900 80093 1000
Foam plate, 9", 1 section, white, dbl laminated,

42 500/cs, PV-YTK10009 o equivalent. 30 2 case GENPAK LAMO09 80057 1000
Foam plate 9", 3 section, white, double laminated,

43 500/cs, PV-YTK10011 of equivalent. 85 8 case GENPAK LAM39 80056 1000
Foam bowl 50z., white, 1,000cs, non-laminated,

4 |Pv-YTH10004 or equivalent, L R s

45 Foam bowl 6-80z., white, double laminated, 310 6 case
500/cs, Wincup 8B or equivalent.
Foam bowl 120z., white, double laminated,

46 500/cs, Wincup 12FC o equivalent. 1450 16 case GENPAK LAM21 80051 1000
Foam bowl 160z., laminated inside, 500/cs,

47 50 4 case

CENTRAL POLY CORP.

Bidders SKU Dimensions heets / Feet| Net Case
per roll Weight

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

#8 35", 200/, Pactiv TD19903 or equivalent, 0 | 8 | e CENPAK SN203 | 80165 | 200
49 |16 oz Paper Food Container, 500/cs Solo VS516 10 1 case SOLO V8516 84151 500
50 3 compartment microwavable tray, Clear View, 2 4 case
250/cs,Pactiv CN8-4638 or equivalent
51 Lid for 3 compartment microwavable tray, 250/cs 2 1 case
|~ |Pactiv ClearView CN8-4684
| 52 |5 Compartment Lunch Tray, PV-YTH10500 56 ? case GENPAK 10500 80154 500
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

Category

Plastic Utensils
Spoon medium plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs,

Cash-Wa Distibuting

o Average Manufacturer & . Sheets /
Emn Product Line  Brand Migs lm # Bidders SKU m Feet per roll

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics
4049 OF Bid Tab

Bid Price pe Manufacturer & .
Product Line / Brand ifg's tem

CENTRAL POLY CORP.

Sheets / Feet| Net Case id Price per]

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

Foil 18" x 500 standard Weight, Aluminum Foil,

Foil & Plastic Film Wrap & Bags

53 1A-406014 or equivalent 2125 14 case primesource 75002494 87090 1000 $

54 Spoon heavy glasllc white, bulk pack, 1,000cs, 1A-| 1025 31 case SOLO GD7TTW 87110 1000
| ™ 1406034 or equivalent. $

55 |Fork medium plastio white, Bulk pack 1,0000s, 1A-) 155 | 5 case primesource | 75002491 | 87140 | 1000
406010 equivalent $

56 Fork Heavy plgstlc white, Bulk pack 1,000cs, 1A- 310 " case SOLO GDSFW 87130 1000
406028 or equivalent $

57 |Knife medium plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs, 1A 1g, 5 case primesource | 75002490 | 87155 | 1000
406017 or equivalent $

58 :L\Jf;:lleanslhc heavy white, 10/100cs, 1A-406037 or 5 9 case SOLO GDBKW 87150 1000

Paper Sacks
44# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500,

75,12 x 7 x 17, or equivalent

™3 |Duro bag DB-4K, 5x 314 x -3/ or equivalent | 2% | O | bakS DURO ANKGR | BT60 | 8500

74 |8 Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-6K, 6X) 41 | 5 | pgies DURO 80010 | 81180 | 41500
3-5/8 x 110r equivalent
8# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-8K,

75 6-1/8 x 4 x 12-3/8 or equivalent 90 6 bales DURO 80957 81200 4/500
124# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-12K, 7;

76 118 x 4-1/4 x 13-3/4 or equivalent 580 9 bales DURO 80959 81220 2/500
20# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-20K 8-|

m 114 x 5-5/16 x 16-1/8 or equivalent, 185 5 bales DURO 80962 81280 2/500

8 57# Brown Kraft, Bale_ 500, Duro Bag DB-1/6 BBL 20 8 bales DURO 80076 81300 500
57,12 x 7 x 17 or equivalent

79 #75 Brown Kraft, Bale 400, Duro Bag, DB-1/6 BBL 25 5 bales
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59 cutter box 1 roll cs, Reynolds 614 or equivalent, 2 1 roll HANDI FOIL 51803 82517 18 500FT 2231 s

o |Foll 18"x 1000 standard weigh, Aluminum Foil 10 2 roll HANDI FOIL 11803 | 82518 18" 1000FT 39.75
cutter box 1 roll cs, Reynolds 615 or equivalent. $

g1 ol 18"x 500 heavy weighi, Aluminum o, 15 5 roll HANDI FOIL 51807 | 82516 18" 500FT 3177
cutter box 1 roll cs, Reynolds 624 or equivalent. $
Foil 18" x 1000 heavy weight, Aluminum Foil, "

62 cutter box 1 roll cs, PV-625 or equivalent, 500 10 roll HANDI FOIL 11807 82522 18 1000FT 59.93 $
Foil Sheets, Aluminum Foil Sheets 12" x 10 3/4",

63 6/500cs, PV-721 o equi 50 4 roll HANDI FOIL 51215 82526 7451 $

64 | Film 12"x2000' Foodservice AN-NW122 50 2 roll AEP 87900 82601 14.22 AEP 122 122 122 1RL 12X2000' 2000 S 19.99

65 Film wrap 18 x 1000 w/cutter, 1 roll ¢s, Anchor 80 7 ol
PW181 or equi AEP 181 181 181 1RL 18X1000" 1000" $  15.99
Film wrap 18 x 2000 w/cutter, 1 roll case, Anchor

66 PW182 or equi 2410 17 roll AEP 87902 82602 18 2000 20.90 AEP 182 182 182 1RL 18X2000' 2000° $  18.99
Pan liner Quillon Treated, 16 3/8x24 3/8, 1,000cs, .

67 Bleyco PAN24 or 230 3 case primesource 19915 82120 1000 $

68 i:p'“."'"‘ bag, 67X 8", 1000/cs, ELKAY HOTRC | 1, 5 | case | FOODHANDLER | 20FH40 | 88521 | 500 s
Ziploc quart bag, Pint Size, 6" x 8", 1000cs,

69 ELKAY F20608 or 125 3 case FOODHANDLER 20FH50 88541 500 $

70 |l ock bag, B 1/2" X7 1/2", 2000cs, EK-HDOT or | 5, 4 | case | FOODHANDLER | 20012M | 81570 | 2000 s
Ziploc Gallon Bag, 10 9/16" x 11", 1.75ml, 250/cs,

il ELKAY F210126 or 210 5 case FOODHANDLER 20FH60 88561 250 $
Sandwich bag dry wax, 6.75"x6.75", 1000/bx, Bag

72 Craft 300401 or equivalent. 15 3 case BAGCRAFT 320050 81587 2000 $




Buyer: Michelle Musick

Category

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics
4049 OF Bid Tab

Cash-Wa Distibuting

CENTRAL POLY CORP.

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

Miscellaneous
| 92 |Carefree Finish, 5 Gal. SJ-5104731 or equivalent 20 1 case

o
S

BETCO

65405

Bag Rack Covers, HB-Z20480XNRO or equivalent 73 ? rolls

Payment Terms

FOODHANDLER

228B52D

88640

CENTRAL POLY

CP5280

CP5280

CP5280

o Average Manufacturer & . Sheets / Bid Price pe Manufacturer & Sheets / Feet| Net Case id Price per]
Hygiene
Aprons light weight plastic, white, 46"L x 28"W, case
80 | Will be ordered (shipped) in cases of 1,000 175 5 10M FOODHANDLER | 250FH20 88590 500
(10/100) ME-75007247 or equi $
81 Apr.on, poly, 2 mil, Box of 100, ME-L419 or 60 3 Box
| [equivalent $
Glove, poly FDA approved, Embossed, wrist
8 length, sizes small, medium and large, Must be 2440 % case
ordered/shipped in cases of 10,000 (10/1000), VK- 10M
78050 smimedirg-pg or equivalent AMMEX #PGLOVE | PGLOVE | PGLOVE 10 57.99
Hairnet heavy duty nylon, X-large, fire retardant,
83 144/pk, Magid, IM-7386821 or equivalent. 235 14 case ROYAL PH144LTL | 699998 144 s
Cap operating room 21", Fire retardant, Non
84 |Woven, cloth like material, 10/100cs,VK-21500LG | 900 1 case FOODHANDLER 300-575 88750 500
or equivalent. $
g5 | CaP paper adjustable, white, LA-RPPRCC2W or s ] case -- ;
86 | Toilet Seat Cover, HS-DS5000 or equivalent 10 1 case GOLDMAX 2100-4 83112 P S
Personal Seat Covers, 3000/cs, KC-07410 or
87 X 200 9 case $
83 | Tampax, 500/cs, Hospeco T500 or equivalent 74 4 case I S
Maxi pad folded thin, Sanitary Napkin 250/cs, --
8 Hospeco MT-4 or equi 1400 % case $
Maxi super/overnight with wings, Sanitary Napkin
90 |individually wrapped, 200cs, Hospeco MT-200 or 255 4 case
i $
Primory Foam soap, 2/cs, GJ-P5665-02 or
O |equivalent 850 | 12 | e |geTco cLARIO 71229
--

Delivery Days

15

Comments
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

o Average Manufacturer & ,
E Item Description mn Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU

Category

Roll Tissue

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics
4049 OF Bid Tab

EGAN SUPPLY

Failure to provide complete responses below may be grounds to reject the bid!

Dimensions Sheets / Feet| Net Case Bid Price Manufacturer & Wig's Item #
per roll Weight per UoM | Product Line / Brand

Interboro Packaging ( Bid "A")

Sheets / Feet|
per roll Weight

Failure to provide complete responses below may be grounds to reject the bid!

idders SKU Dimension:

Net Case

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

=Y

Facial Tissue
Facial tissue, boxed, white, 8.33" x 8.0", 2 ply,
30/100 cs. GP 47410 or equivalent.

1225

case

Boardwalk

BWK

6500

cs

8X7.4

Roll Tissue, white, 1-ply, aprox. 4 1/2" x 4 1/2",
111210 sheets/roll, 80 rolls/case, GP 14580 or 110 6 case Boardwalk BWK 6170 (&) 4.5x4 1000SH 389 $ 3914
Roll Tissue, white, 1-ply, aprox. 4 1/2" x 4 1/2",
2 11500 sheets/roll, 48 rolls/case, GP14448 or 1610 36 case NO BID $
Roll Tissue, white, 2-ply, aprox. 4.5 x 4.05, 500
3 |sheets/roll, 80 rolls/case, GP19880/01 or 19250 42 case Boardwalk BWK 6150 (&) 4.5X3.75 500SH 35 $ 3199
Roll tissue, white, 2-ply, 3 3/4" x 4", 865
4 36 rollslcase, GP-19375 or 130 4 case GP GP19 375 (&) 3.75X4 865 215 $ 6033
5 :l'j'ls':fe‘:: white, 2-ply, B0/605, KC-04460-600r | 765 | 44 | case Boardwalk BWK 6150 cs | 45x375 | 5008H 35 [s 3199

~

Facial tissue, boxed, white, premium, 36/100,
Kleenex 21400 or equivalent
Napkins
Disp Napkin tallfold tallfold, size, 7 1/4" x 13 1/2",

160

case

KC

KC-2

1400

cs

8 |1 ply, standard weight, white or natural 40/250, 1A- 220 5 case Boardwalk BWK 8302 Ccs 7X13.5
32680 or equi
Disp napkins, Irg size, White, 12" x 17", 1-ply, -
9 12/500 cs. GP-37402 or equivalent 15 3 case Boardwalk BWK 8314 cs 12x17
Paper napkin, luncheon size, 12" x 13", 1 ply, 1/4
10 |fold, white or natural, 12/500case, GP 37707 or 4200 19 case Boardwalk BWK 8310 CS 11x13
equivalent
Paper Towels, Wipers & Dusting Cloths
Paper towel, singlefold, Natural, 1-ply, 9.5" x 10
11 (7/8", 250 towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case, GP 23504 or | 8460 51 case Boardwalk BWK 6210 cs 9x9
Paper towel, multifold, Natural, 1-ply, 9 1/4" x 9
12 1/2", 200 towels/pkg, 20 pkgs/case, GP 23304 or | 12100 40 case Boardwalk BWK 6202 CS 99
Paper towel, multifold, White, 1-ply, 9 1/4"x 9 -
13 112", 16/250 GP 24590 or equivalent 4050 40 case Boardwalk BWK 6200 (&) 9x9
Paper towel, roll, 2-ply, 11" x 8.6", 84 - 85
14 30 rolisfcase, GP 27385 or equivalent 1130 1 case Boardwalk BWK 6272 (&) 11x9 85SH 17.8 $ 1587
Paper Towel, Center pull Roll Towel, 7.8"W x
15 15°L. White, 560/rol, 4 rols/case, GP 28143 975 15 case GP GP28 1-43 (&) 7.8x15 560 13.6 $ 4963
16 enMollon white Towel, 800", 6/cs GP-89460 or 790 6 case NOBID s
Wipers, delicate task, 3-ply, soft, non-abrasive,
17 |156"W x 16.7"L, 20BX(70)CS, GP 29778 or 50 4 case GP GP29 7-78/03 CS 15x16 216 $ 6253
Wipers, Light Duty, white, 1-ply, 15"W x 16.5"L,
18 20/140 o5 Georgia Pacific 20756 o 250 6 case GP GP297 56/03 (&) 15x16 216 $ 5646
Wipers, All Purpose Medium Duty, white, 1/4 fold
19 |bulk, 12.5" x 14.4", 12/90 cs, Kimberly Clark 810 34 case KC KCC-0 5812 (&) 12x13 15 $ 3764
05812 or equivalent
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

The State of Nebraska

Disposable Paper Plastics

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

4049 OF Bid Tab
ateqo PP boro Bid
= o Average Manufacturer & , " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case Bid Price Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per]|
2 Item Description Est Qty order UoM Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight per UoM | Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM
p ood Conta
20 |Portion cup pleated paper 3/4 oz., White, 5000/cs | 50y | 5 | aqe Solo ScCors cs 95 |s s1m $
|~ [Solo 75 or equivalent
21 |Portion cup, 1 0z, paper, 5000/cs, SW-100 or 695 11 case Solo SCC 100 cs "o |s 5775 $
|~ [equivalent
29 |Pleated 2 oz paper souffle cup, white, 2500cs, 2 3 | case Solo SCC 200 cs 15 |s 8350 $
| = |Solo 200,
23 |Portion cup dlear plastio 2.0z, 2500cs, PV-YS200 | 46 | 5 | a0 Dart DCC 200PC cs 125 |s 4033 $
or equivalent.
24 |1 202. portion cup, 2500 cs, PV-YLS2FR or 70 2 case Dart Dcc-200PCL cs 86 |§ 4417 $
|~ |equivalent.
25 Cold cyp 50z plstc translucent, 2500cs, SW-CDE5 20 2 case Solo SCC-CDE5 cs 2 s 7976 s
or equivalent.
2% Lid 50z. co‘ld cup, 2500cs, NO STRAW SLOT, SW- 20 9 case NOBID s s
L53 or equivalent.
Paper cup, White, Non-waxed, Drinking, 30z., NOBID
%7 |2400cs, Solo RD3L or equivalent. W0 | e s s
2% Wa)_(ed cold cup, 50z., 3000/cs, Solo R53 or %0 6 case NOBID s s
| — |equivalent
29 | Waxed cold cup, 6oz, 2000/cs, Solo RENN or 20 2 case Solo SCC-RENNJ cs 255 |$ 106.96 $
| " |equivalent
30 | Waxed cold cup, Soz., 2,000/cs, Solo R9N or 190 | 14 | case Solo SCC-RONJ cs 2 [$ 13019 $
| — |equivalent
3 Hot/Co_Id cup, white, 60z., 1000/cs, WinCup 6C6 4 7 case NOBID s s
or equivalent
2 Hot/Co_Id cup, white, 80z., 1000/cs, WinCup 8C8 2410 18 case NOBID s s
or equivalent.
Hot/Cold cup, white, 120z., 1000/cs, WinCup NOBID
3 12C16 or equivalent 1840 ! case 0 $ $
34 |Cup, 4 oz, 1000/cs, WC-4C4 or equivalent 30 7 case NOBID S
35 |Lid for 4 oz cup, 1000/cs, WC-4L or equivalent 30 3 case NO BID $
| 36 |Vented Lid for 8¢8, Wincup 65 3 case NO BID $
37 |Vented Lid, Wincup WC-FL 35 2 case NO BID $ $
Pla Bo ood Conta 8
Paper plate 6" coated, fluted rigid rim, 1,000cs, y
38 Solo MWP6 or 2 1 case AM AJM-cp06 AWH (&) 12 $ 5568 $
Paper plate 9" coated, fluted rigid rim, 1,000cs, y
39 Solo MWPS or 295 9 case AM AIM-CP9GO[  AWH 25 $ 6176 $
Foam plate 6", non-laminated, 1 section, white,
40 1000/cs, PV-YTH10006 or 335 4 case Dart DCC-6 pwC (&) 6 $ 1765 $
Foam plate 9", non-laminated, 1 section, white,
4 500/cs, PV-YTH10009 o 1200 10 case Dart DCC-9 pwC (&) 82 $ 2327 $
Foam plate, 9", 1 section, white, dbl laminated,
42 500/cs, PV-YTK10009 or equivalent. 30 2 case Solo SCC-R5F9 CS 9 $ 4011 $
Foam plate 9", 3 section, white, double laminated,
43 500/cs, PV-YTK10011 or equivalent. 85 8 case Solo SCC-R59 cyw CS 12 $ 4385 $
Foam bowl 50z., white, 1,000cs, non-laminated,
44 PV-YTH10004 or equivalent, 155 5 case Boardwalk BWK 5LW | LAMBBWL 4.68 § 4197 $
Foam bowl 6-80z., white, double laminated, !
4 500/cs, Wincup 8B or equivalent. 310 6 case No Bid $ $
Foam bowl 120z, white, double laminated,
46 500/cs, Wincup 12FC or equivalent. 1450 16 case Dart | DCC-1213 | wwQ | 10.5 $ 4646 $
Foam bowl 160z., laminated inside, 500/cs,
’ . " No Bid
4 Wincup 16FC or equivalent. 50 ¢ case °F 3 3
Pla Bo ood Conta &
3 compartment hngd tray white foam, 9" x 9" x y 9.38X9.38X
#8 35" 200/cs, Pactiv TD19903 or equivalent, 0 | 8 | e Dart pecso | MW cs 3 93 |8 28 §
49 |16 oz Paper Food Container, 500/cs Solo VS516 10 1 case NO BID $ $
3 compartment microwavable tray, Clear View,
50 250/cs,Pactiv CN8-4638 or equivalent 2 ! case NOBID $ $
Lid for 3 compartment microwavable tray, 250/cs
[ 5" |Pactiv Clearview CNg4684 2 L NoBD § §
| 52 |5 Compartment Lunch Tray, PV-YTH10500 56 ? case NO BID $ $
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

4049 OF Bid Tab
atego P bo aging Bid
= o Average Manufacturer & , " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case Bid Price Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per]|
2 Item Description Est Qty order UoM Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight per UoM | Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # [ Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM
Spoon medium plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs,
53 1A-406014 or equivalent 2125 14 case Boardwalk BWKYF wsw cs 6.3 14.53 $
54 |Spoon heavy plastic white, bulk pack, 1,000cs, 1A 1055 | 3 case Dixie DIX SH217 cs 5.75' 14 33.52 $
406034 or equivalent.
55 |Fork medium plastio white, Bulk pack 1,0000s, 1A 155 | 5 case Boardwalk BWKYFW | Fw cs 6 1453 $
406010 equivalent
56 |Fork Heavy plastio white, Bulk pack 1,000cs, 1A- |~ 54, 11 case Dixie DIX-TH207 cs 10 3158 $
406028 or equivalent
57 Knife medium P\asnc white, Bulk pack 1,000cs, 1A{ 180 5 case Boardwalk BWKFWKW cs 63 1453 s
406017 or equivalent
58 Kmf_e plastic heavy white, 10/100cs, 1A-406037 or 5 9 case NOBID s
equivalent.
oil & Pla ap & Bag
59 |l 18"x 500 standard Weight, Aluminum Foil 2 1 roll Boardwalk BWK7124 RL 184500 500 85 2253 $
cutter box 1 roll ¢s, Reynolds 614 or equivalent.
o |l 18" 1000 standard weight, Aluminum Foil, 10 2 roll Boardwalk BWK7106 RL 18X1000 | 1000 11 44.03 $
cutter box 1 roll cs, Reynolds 615 or equivalent.
g1 |l 18" x 500 heavy weight, Aluminum Foll 155 | 5 ol Boardwak | BWK7124 RL 18500 | 500 85 25 $
cutter box 1 roll cs, Reynolds 624 or equivalent.
2 |1l 18"x 1000 heavy weight, Aluminum Foil 50 | 10 | ol Boardwalk | BWK7116 RL | 1extooo | 1000 135 6187 $
cutter box 1 roll cs, PV-625 or equivalent.
Foil Sheets, Aluminum Foil Sheets 12" x 10 3/4",
63 6/500cs, PV-721 or equi 50 4 roll Boardwalk BWK7164 (&) 12x10.75 I:I 215 89.48 |:| $
64 |Film 12"x2000' Foodservice AN-NW122 50 2 roll 0 BID S
65 Em;”{ao"r 18 1000 wicutter, 1 oll s, Anchor 80 7 ol Reynolds Reyo04 RL | 1extooo | 1000 419 268 $
66 Em;”z’ao"r 18x 2000 wicutter, 1 rollcase, Anchor | 0 | q7 | g Reynolds Reyo14 RL | 18000 | 2000 1045 3172 $
Pan liner Quillon Treated, 16 3/8x24 3/8, 1,000cs, . . BGC
67 Bleyco PAN24 or 230 3 case | Packing Dynamics 030001 BX 16.37x24 - $
o i:ploc pintbag, 6'x6", 1000/cs, ELKAY HOTRC | 5 case NO BID - s
Ziploc quart bag, Pint Size, 6" x 8", 1000cs,
69 ELKAY F20608 o 125 3 case NO BID $
70 |Flip lock bag, 6 1/2"x7 12", 2000cs, EK-HDOT or | - 4 case NO BID Stering-675675 | Asper | Stering- | o000 | 6 75675 - 3441b. [8.34
sample #70| 675675
Ziploc Gallon Bag, 10 9/16" x 11", 1.75ml, 250/cs,
il ELKAY F210126 or 210 5 case NO BID $
Sandwich bag dry wax, 6.75"x6.75", 1000/bx, Bag NO BID
72 | Cratt 300401 or equivalent. 15 5| o ° §
Paper Sacks
44# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500,
73 | buro bag DB4K, 5 x 3-1/4 x 9-34 or equivalent | 20 | ° | baes BagGK | 4500 B §
7 6# Brown Kraft, §\eeve 500, Duro Bag DB-6K, 6 x| 10 5 bales Bag GK 6500 BL s
3-5/8 x 11or equivalent
8# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-8K,
] \ y |
B 6-1/8 x 4 x 12-3/8 or equivalent 90 6 bales NOBID $
124 Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-12K, 7;
76 | 1/g x.4-114 x 13-3/4 or equivalent 580 9 | bales | Bag GK | 12:500 | $
20# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-20K 8-|
] , |
77 | 114 x 55116 x 16-1/8 or equivalent. 18 | 5 | bales NOBID §
8 57# Brown Kraft, Bale_ 500, Duro Bag DB-1/6 BBL 220 8 bales Bag SK 1657 BL s
57,12 x 7 x 17 or equivalent
79 #75 Brown Kraft, Balef‘»OO, Duro Bag, DB-1/6 BBL 25 5 bales NOBID s
75,12 x 7 x 17, or equivalent
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

4049 OF Bid Tab
ateqo PP boro P g Bid
= o Average Manufacturer & , " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case Bid Price Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per]|
2 Item Description Est Qty order UoM Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight per UoM | Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM
giene
Aprons light weight plastic, white, 46"L x 28"W, case As per INT-2846-
80 | Will be ordered (shipped) in cases of 1,000 175 5 10M NO BID $ INT-2846-DA sample DA 100/10* 28"x46" 27481b. | $  45.00
(10/100) ME-75007247 or equi #80A
g1 |/Apron. poly, 2 mil, Box of 100, ME-L419 or 60 3 Box NO BID $ INT-2442-DA Asper | INT-244- 247x42" 19491 |$ 4200
|~ [equivalent sample #81 DA
Glove, poly FDA approved, Embossed, wrist
length, sizes small, medium and large, Must be case NOBID g As per g
82 | rderedlshipped in cases of 10,000 (10/1000), vk-| 20 | 2 | oM $ INT-PG sample g2 | INTPG | 100110110 32490bs 1§ 4100
78050 sm/med/Irg-pg or equivalent
Hairnet heavy duty nylon, X-large, fire retardant, NO BID
83 | 1441pk, Magid, IM-7386B21 or equivalent. L6 | 14| case $ $
Cap operating room 21", Fire retardant, Non
84 |Woven, cloth like material, 10/100cs,VK-21500LG 900 1 case NO BID $ $
or equivalent.
85 Cap_ paper adjustable, white, LA-RPPRCC2W or 5 1 case NOBID s s
86 | Toilet Seat Cover, HS-DS5000 or equivalent 10 1 case NO BID $ S
a7 |Personal Seat Covers, 3000/cs, KC-07410 or 20 9 case ke KC07410 I os 10 s 443 s
88 | Tampax, 500/cs, Hospeco T500 or equivalent 74 4 case ROCHESTER _ [RC-25176488 cs 10 $ 6463 $
go | Ma pad folded tin, Sanitary Napkin 250/cs, 1 140 | 35 | case | ROCHESTER ~[RC25130073 cs $ 3866 s
Hospeco MT-4 or
Maxi super/overnight with wings, Sanitary Napkin
90 |individually wrapped, 200cs, Hospeco MT-200 or | 255 4 case $ $
Primory Foam soap, 2/cs, GJ-P5665-02 or
° equivalent 80 | 12 | case NO BID
aneo
| 92 |Carefree Finish, 5 Gal. $J-5104731 or equivalent 20 1 case NOBID $ $
93 |Bag Rack Covers, HB-Z20480XNRO or equivalent 73 ? rolls NOBID $ INT-5280-H sa:;:; e;;g;; INT-5280-H 50+ 6.711b. (9.94
Payment Terms 0 30
Delivery Days 10-14
Line 38 & 39 1200 CS
Line 44 1250 CS
Line 46 1000 CS
Comments Line 59 20 mic * We can only ship this item 6000/Case. Price per 2000
Line 60 14 mic
Line 61 20 mic
Line 62 16 mic
Line 63 2400 SH

Page 8 of 16



Buyer: Michelle Musick The State of Nebraska Opening Date: 07/06/2012
Disposable Paper Plastics

4049 OF Bid Tab
AWARD
Category
o Average Manufacturer & , " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per| Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case | Bid Price per
EM“ Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # [ Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM
Roll Tissue
Roll Tissue, white, 1-ply, aprox. 4 1/2" x 4 1/2",

111210 sheets/roll, 80 rolls/case, GP 14580 or 110 6 case $ Georgia Pacific 14580/01 | GP-145800 80 4.0x4.0 1210 shts 4247 $ 38.25
equivalent
Roll Tissue, white, 1-ply, aprox. 4 1/2" x 4 1/2",

2 |1500 sheets/roll, 48 rolls/case, GP14448 or 1610 36 case $ Georgia Pacific 14448/01 | GP-14448/0 48 4.0x4.0 1500shts 29.8 $ 30.49
equivalent
Roll Tissue, white, 2-ply, aprox. 4.5 x 4.05, 500

3 |sheets/roll, 80 rolls/case, GP19880/01 or 19250 42 case $ Georgia Pacific 19880/01 | GP-19880/0 80 4.0x4.0 | 550SHTS 30.2 $ 30.16
equivalent
Roll tissue, white, 2-ply, 3 3/4" x 4", 865 . . =

4 36 rolslcase, GP-19375 or equivalent 130 4 case $ Georgia Pacific 19375 | GP-19375 36 3.85"X4.05 | 1000Shts 2389 [$ 38.82

5 :ﬂ:‘:;‘: white, 2:ply, 80/605, KC-0ME0.800r | 760 | 44 | case s Kimberly Clark | 04460 |KC.04460-6| 80 | 4.0°X4A" | 550 Shts u (s 3680

Facial Tissue
Facial tissue, boxed, white, 8.33" x 8.0", 2 ply, . ’ . .

6 301100 cs, GP 47410 or equivalent. 1225 9 case $ Georgia Pacific 47410 | GP-47410 30 8'x8.33 12 $ 14.61
Facial tissue, boxed, white, premium, 36/100, 160 5 case $ Georgia Pacific 21400 | KC-21400 3% 8.4"8.2" 168 |$ 3101
Kleenex 21400 or equivalent
Disp Napkin tallfold tallfold, size, 7 1/4" x 13 1/2",

8 |1 ply, standard weight, white or natural 40/250, 1A- 220 5 case $ Netchoice $32680 | 1A-32680G 10M 6x13.5 248 $ 27.48
32680G or equi
Disp napkins, Irg size, White, 12" x 17", 1-ply, ) " Y e

9 | 12500 o5, GP-37402 or eauivalent 15 3 case $ Georgia Pacific 37402 | GP-37402 6M 12'x17 392 $ 38.87
Paper napkin, luncheon size, 12" x 13", 1 ply, 1/4

10 |fold, white or natural, 12/500case, GP 37707 or 4200 19 case $ Netchoice 35624 1A-35624G 6M 13x11.5 213 $ 26.05
Paper towel, singlefold, Natural, 1-ply, 9.5" x 10 10.250°%9.1

11 |7/8", 250 towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case, GP 23504 or 8460 51 case $ SCA SK1850A | SC-SK185 16/25 ) 25 : 20.6 $ 14.20
equivalent
Paper towel, multifold, Natural, 1-ply, 9 1/4" x 9

12 |1/2", 200 towels/pkg, 20 pkgs/case, GP 23304 or | 12100 40 case $ SCA MK520A | SC-MK520 16/25 9.5"x9.125" 19.1 $ 13.87
equivalent
Paper towel, multifold, White, 1-ply, 9 1/4" x 9 . " v "

1 112", 161250 GP 24590 or equivalent 4050 40 case $ Georgia Pacific 24590 GP-24590 4M 9.25x9.5' 19 $ 15.99
Paper towel, roll, 2-ply, 11" x 8.6", 84 - 85 . B —an

1 sheetsiall, 30 rollsicase, GP 27385 or equivalent 1130 1" case $ Netchoice 24310 1A-243100 30Ro 11."x9 84 Sheets 18.2 $ 18.04
Paper Towel, Center pull Roll Towel, 7.8"W x . ) Y oA En

15 15°L. White, 560/r0l, 4 rollsicase, GP 28143 975 15 case $ Georgia Pacific 28143 GP-28143 4 7.8'x15 560 Shts 136 $ 2849

1 :Smgf hite Towel, 800", 6/cs GP-89460 or 790 6 case $ Georgia Pacific 89460 | GP-89460 6 10'%800' 800 204 |$ 4461
Wipers, delicate task, 3-ply, soft, non-abrasive,

17 [15"W x 16.7"L, 20BX(70)CS, GP 29778 or 50 4 case $ Georgia Pacific 29778/03 | GP-29778/0( 1400 15'x16.7" 292 |$ 46.52
equivalent
Wipers, Light Duty, white, 1-ply, 15"W x 16.5'L, ) " Y "

18 201140 o Georgia Pacific 20756 or equivalent 250 6 case $ Georgia Pacific 29756/03 | GP-29756/0 2800 15x16.7 276 $ 48.38
Wipers, All Purpose Medium Duty, white, 1/4 fold

19 [bulk, 12.5" x 14.4", 12/90 cs, Kimberly Clark 810 34 case $ Kimberly Clark 5812 KC-05812 1080 12.5"x14.4" 16.75 $ 33.08
05812 or equivalent
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics

Opening Date: 07/06/2012

4049 OF Bid Tab
Category
o Average Manufacturer & , " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per| Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case | Bid Price per
Ewm Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # [ Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM
Cups, Food Containers
99 |Porton cup pleated paper 34 oz, White, S000/cs | - 3gy | 5 | g0 $ Solo 0752050 | SW-075 | 5000 105 |$ 3148
Solo 75 or equivalent
91 |Portion cup, 1 0z, paper, 5000/cs, SW-100 or 695 | 11 | case s Solo 1002050 | SW-100 | 5000 13§ 3463
|~ [equivalent
2 z'jg‘;goz oz paper souffle cup, uhite, 2500cs, 2 3 | case s Solo 2002050 | SW-200 | 2500 15 [$ 4019
23 |Potton cup dlear plastio 2 oz, 2500cs, PY-YS200 | 4, 3 | case s Pactiv YS200 | PV-Ys200 [ 2400 129 [s 4713
or equivalent.
94 |-id 2oz portion cup, 200 cs, PY-YLSZFR or 70 2 | case s Pactiv YLS2FR | PVPLS2 | 2400 8 |$ 2267
|~ |equivalent.
25 | Cold cup oz piste ranslucent, 2500cs, SW-CDES | - 5y | 5 | g0 $ Solo CDE5-0009| SW-CDE5 | 2500 2 s 3R
or equivalent.
26 |14 Soz. cold cup, 2500cs, NO STRAW SLOT, SW/ 5, 7 | case s Solo 1530100 | SW-L53 | 3000 75 |8 5215
L53 or equivalent.
Paper cup, White, Non-waxed, Drinking, 30z.,
27 2400cs, Solo RDAL or equivalent. 400 9 case $ Solo D3LBB-020 [ SW-RD3L 2400 125 $ 61.36
25 | Waxed cold cup, Soz., 3000/cs, Solo RS or 0 | 6 | case s Salo R53.00035 | SW-RS3 | 3000 % s 8022
equivalent
» Zﬁﬁ:ﬁm oup. Goz. 2000/cs, Solo RGN or 0 | 2 | ase s Salo RGNN-0005| SW-RGNN | 2000 %5 |s 5301
% Zﬁﬁ:ﬁm cup. 9oz, 2,000/cs, Solo RON or 190 | 14 | case s Salo RON-00055 | SW-RON | 2000 2 |s 7630
34 |HotCold oup, white, 60z, 1000/cs, WinCup 6C6 | ;5 7| case $ Wincup 6C6 | wcecs | 1000 55 |§ 1234
or equivalent
3 |HoVCold oup, white, 8oz, 1000/cs, WinCup 8CB | o4y | 15 | cae $ Wincup 8cs | wcsecs | 1000 62 |§ 1455
or equivalent.
33 | HoUCold oup, white, 120z., 1000/cs, WinCup 10 | 7 | case $ Wincup 12016 | we-2cts| 1000 97 |$ 2115
12C16 or equivalent
34 | Cup, 4 oz, 1000/cs, WC-4C4 or equivalent 30 7 case Wincup 4C4 WC-4C4 1000 5.22 13.54
35 |Lid for 4 oz cup, 1000/cs, WC-4L or equivalent 30 3 case Wincup 4L WC-4L 1000 34 8.60
| 36 |Vented Lid for 8¢8, Wincup 65 3 case Wincup 8L WC-8L 1000 4.47 8.64
37 |Vented Lid, Wincup WC-FL 35 2 case $ Wincup FL WC-FL 500 3.5 $ 8.00
Pla Bo ood Conta 8
Paper plate 6" coated, fluted rigid rim, 1,000cs, ¥
38 Solo MWPS or equivalent. 2 1 case $ SOLO 6B(MP6-J8 | SW-MP6B 1000 125 $ 31.76
Paper plate 9" coated, fluted rigid rim, 1,000cs, " ¥
39 Solo MWP9 or equivalent 295 9 case $ Solo P9(MP9B-2 | SW-MP9B 500 16.7 $ 25.32
Foam plate 6", non-laminated, 1 section, white, .
40 1000/cs, PV-YTH10006 or equivalent. 335 4 case $ Pactiv YTH10006 | V-YTH1000 1000 6.23 $ 14.05
Foam plate 9", non-laminated, 1 section, white, .
41 500/cs, PV-YTH10009 or equivalent. 1200 10 case $ Pactiv TH10009 | PV-TH1000 1000 6.96 $ 12.96
Foam plate, 9", 1 section, white, dbl laminated, "
42 500/cs, PV-YTK10009 or equivalent. 30 2 case $ Pactiv TK10009 |PV-TK1-000 500 7.78 $ 2242
Foam plate 9", 3 section, white, double laminated, "
43 500/cs, PV-YTK10011 or equivalent. 85 8 case $ Pactiv TK10011 |PV-TK1-001 500 778 $ 2242
Foam bowl 50z., white, 1,000cs, non-laminated, "
44 PV-YTH10004 or equivalent, 155 5 case $ Pactiv YTH10004 | V-YTH1000 250 44 $ 17.57
Foam bowl 6-80z., white, double laminated, "
45 500/cs, Wincup 88 or equivalent. 310 6 case $ Wincup 8B WC-8B 500 4.84 $ 13.32
Foam bowl 120z., white, double laminated, "
46 500/cs, Wincup 12FC or equivalent. 1450 16 case $ Wincup 12FC WC-12FC 500 5.81 $ 16.34
Foam bowl 160z., laminated inside, 500/cs, .
47 Wincup 16FC or equivalent. 50 4 case $ Wincup 16FC WC-16FC 500 6.58 $ 18.26
Plates, Bowls, Food Containers & Trays
3 compartment hngd tray white foam, 9" x 9" x " i
48 35", 200/cs. Pactiv TD19903 or equivalent, 780 8 case $ Pactiv YTD19903 | V-YTD1990 150 9x9x3.5 6.7 $ 9.91
49 |16 oz Paper Food Container, 500/cs Solo VS516 10 1 case $ Solo VS516J | SW-VS516J 500 1602 325 $ 54.33
3 compartment microwavable tray, Clear View, i
50 250/cs,Pactiv CN8.4638 or equivalent 2 1 case $ Pactiv CN8-4638 | PV-CN8463 250 9-3/8X8X1.5 16.5 $ 67.64
Lid for 3 compartment microwavable tray, 250/cs "
i Pactiy ClearView CN8-4684 2 1 case $ Pactiv CNB8468H [ PV-CN8468 252 9-3/8X8X1.5 1.04 [$ 67.64
| 52 |5 Compartment Lunch Tray, PV-YTH10500 56 ? case $ Pactiv YTH10500 | V-YTH1050 500 8.25X10.25 179 [$§ 18.02
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Buyer: Michelle Musick The State of Nebraska Opening Date: 07/06/2012
Disposable Paper Plastics
4049 OF Bid Tab

Category

o Average Manufacturer & , " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per| Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case | Bid Price per
E Item Description Mn Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # [ Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM

Plastic Utensils
Spoon medium plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs,

58 | k06014 o sacnlont 25 | 14 | case $ Netchoice 406014 | NP406014 | 1000 6.25 62 [s 743

54 |Spoon heavy plastic white, bulk pack, 1,000cs, 1A 1055 | 3¢ case $ Netchoice 406034 | np-406034 | 1000 I 98 |$ 1885
406034 or equivalent.

55 |Fork medium plastic white, Bulk pack 1.000cs, 1A-| 4430 | 5 | gase $ Netchoice 406010 | NP406010| 1000 6.25" 63 |5 143
406010 equivalent

56 zgég;;:;:y plastic white, Bulk pack 1,0006s, 1A- | 349 | 41 | g0 $ Netchoice 406028 | NP-406028 | 1000 7 13 |$ 1885

57 fggg;;‘i‘:‘””‘ plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs, 14| g, 5 case $ Netchoice 406017 | NP406017| 1000 6.25" 72 |$ 18

5g |Knife plastic heavy white, 10/100cs, 1A-406037 or | - 2 | case $ Netchoice 406037 | NP406037| 1000 7 107 |s 1898

equivalent.
Foil & Plastic Film Wrap & Bags

Foil 18" x 500 standard Weight, Aluminum Foil,

59| ter box 1ol o8 Roynada 614 o st 2 1 roll $ Pactiv 614 PV-614 Rol 18 500 704 |s 2238

go | POl 18"x 1000 standard weight, Aluminum Foil, | 2 rall $ Pactiv 615 | PV615 | Rol 18" 1000 139 [§ 3589
cutter box 1 roll ¢s, Reynolds 615 or equivalent.

g1 |l 18" x 500 heavy weight, Aluminum Foll 155 5 roll $ Pactiv 624 PV-624 Roll 18" 500 1041 |$ 2555
cutter box 1 roll ¢s, Reynolds 624 or equivalent.
Foil 18" x 1000 heavy weight, Aluminum Foil, " 0 1

62 | torbox 1 10l o8 PU-628 o cautveont, 500 | 10 roll $ Pactiv 625 PV-625 Rol 18 1000 1889 |§ 4312
Foil Sheets, Aluminum Foil Sheets 12" x 10 3/4", " 0 3

63 |c500cs, PY-721 or ecuivelont 50 4 roll $ Pactiv 721 PV-721 3000 | 12'X10.75 % |$  69.03

64 |Film 12'x2000' Foodservice AN-NW122 50 2 roll S Netchoice 1A-01109 | 01109 Roll__| 12'x1000 611 |5 883

g5 | Fim wrap 18 x 1000 wieutter, 1 rol s, Anchor 80 7 roll $ Netchoice PW181 | AN-PW181|  Roll 18x1000° | 1000 7 |8 7%
PW181 or equivalent.

ge | Fim wrap 18 x 2000 wieuter, 1roll case, Anchor | oy |47 roll $ Netchoice A1 | 0111 Roll | 18x2000' [ 2000 88 |$ 1244
PW182 or equivalent

g7 |Pan liner Quillon Treated, 16 3/8x24 38, 1.000cs, | 5y | 3 | (g0 $ PrimeSource | PAN24 | MEPAN24| 1000 [6-3/3x4-38 %5 [s 300
Bleyco PAN24 or equivalent

gg |ZPloc pintbag, 67 x &', 1000/cs, ELKAY HOTRC | -, 5 case $ Elkay HO7RC | EK-HO7RC | 1000 6'%6" 48 |$ 1638
or equivalent
Ziploc quart bag, Pint Size, 6" x 8", 1000cs, | 8"

69 | clicny Fa0605 o oquivalont 125 3 case $ Elkay F20608 | Ek-F20608 | 1000 648 85 |$ 1386

70 Zg‘jl'v":l';ntiag 612" x7 112", 2000cs, EKHDOT or | 4 case $ Elkay HDO7 | EK-HDO7 | 2000 | 6.75x6.25 34 |$ 8.25
Ziploc Gallon Bag, 10 9/16" x 11", 1.75ml, 250/cs,

71 [Eliay F210126 or equivalnt 210 5 case $ Elkay F21012G [EK-F210120( 250 10x12 18 [$ 1229

72 |Sandwich bag dry wax, 6.75%6.75", 1000/bx, Bag | 4 3 case $ Bag Craft 300401 | ME-300401| 1000 | 67565 52 |s 128

Craft 300401 or equivales
Paper Sacks

44# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500,

73 | Do boa DBAK. 5 x 314 534 orequivalont | 20 9 | bales $ Duro Bag 81007 | DB4K 4000 5% |$ 6085

74 |8 Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-6K, 6X) 41 | 5 | pgies $ Duro Bag 80983 | DBGK | 2000 2 |5 310
3-5/8 x 11or equivalent
8# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-8K,

75 |6 x4 x 1238 o squivalent 90 6 | bales $ Duro Bag 80984 | DBBK 2000 5 |$ 4662
124 Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-12K, 7;

76 | i 4t x 1354 or ceivalont 580 9 | bales $ Duro Bag 80982 | DB-1K | 1000 % |$ 2074
20# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-20K 8-|

77 |11 x 55116 x 15-16 o scialont 185 5 | bales 5 Duro Bag 80979 | DB-20K 500 2% [$  19.08

7 |O7# Brown Kraft Bale 500, DuroBag DB-U6 BBL | 5 | g | pgies $ Duro Bag 80076 | B-16BBL5| 500 512 [§ 3490
57,12 x 7 x 17 or equivalent

7 |#75 Brown Kraft, Bale 400, Duro Bag, DB-A/6 BBL| )5 5 bales $ Duro Bag 80080.17 |B-1/6BBL7 | 400 5 |$ 4095

75 12 x 7 x 17, or equivalent
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Buyer: Michelle Musick The State of Nebraska Opening Date: 07/06/2012
Disposable Paper Plastics

4049 OF Bid Tab
Category
o Average Manufacturer & , " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per| Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case | Bid Price per
Ewm Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # | Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item # [ Bidders SKU Pack Dimensions per roll Weight UoM
Hygiene
Aprons light weight plastic, white, 46"L x 28"W, case As per INT-2846-
80 [Will be ordered (shipped) in cases of 1,000 175 5 oM INT-2846-DPA sample DPA 100/10** | 28"x46" 16.00 Ibs. 30.00 VOLK 28460 | VK-28460 1000 28X46" 21 $ 36.54
(10/100) ME-75007247 or equivalent #80B
g1 |/Apron. poly. 2mi. Box of 100, ME-L419 or 60 3 Box INT-2442-DA Asper | INT-2442- 24x42" 19.491b 4200 | PRIME SOURCE | 7.40E+08 | 1A419 100 | 286" 72 [§ 1136
|~ [equivalent sample #81 DA
Glove, poly FDA approved, Embossed, wrist
length, sizes small, medium and large, Must be case As per
82 orderedlshipped in cases of 10,000 (1011000), VK- 2440 25 1M INT-PG sample #62 INT-PG | 100/10/10 3249 Ibs 41.00 VOLK 78050 | VK-78050 10M 30 $ 45.03
78050 sm/med/Irg-pg or equivalent
Hairnet heavy duty nylon, X-large, fire retardant, T
83 144/pk, Magid, IM-7386B21 or equivalent. 235 14 case $ IMPACT 7386B21 | M-7386B21 100 LARGE 0.8 $ 11.55
Cap operating room 21", Fire retardant, Non VK.
84 |Woven, cloth like material, 10/100cs,VK-21500LG | 900 1 case $ VOLK 21500LG 21500(-]LG 1000 21" 7 $ 21.95
or equivalent.
8 ecsf.fl?ﬁ{ adjustable, white, LARPPRCC2Wor | 1| case $ Royal Paper | PP-RCC2V | RPPRCC2 | 1000 %4 |5 8660
86 [Toilet Seat Cover, HS-DS5000 or equivalent 10 1 case $ Hospeco DS-5000 [HS-DS5000( 5000 28 $ 26.94
87 ::Lf;’:;'mseat Covers, 3000/cs, KC-07410 or 200 | 9 | case $ Kimberly Clark | 7410 | Kc.07410 | 3000 19 |5 4563
88 | Tampax, 500/cs, Hospeco T500 or equivalent 74 4 case $ Hospeco T500 HS-T500 500 75 $ 54.47
g | Maxi pad folded thin, Sanitary Napkin 250/cs, 1400 | 32 | case $ Hospeco MT4 | HSMT4 | 250 12 |s 2643
Hospeco MT-4 or equivalent
Maxi super/overnight with wings, Sanitary Napkin
90 [individually wrapped, 200cs, Hospeco MT-200 or 255 4 case $ Hospeco MT200 | HS-MT200 200 9 $ 28.57
equivalent
Primory Foam soap, 2/cs, GJ-P5665-02 or
91 | equivalent 850 | 12 | case Primory P5665-02  |GJ-P5665- 2 6ls 3532
cellaneous
| 92 | Carefree Finish, 5 Gal. SJ-5104731 or equivalent 20 1 case S Diversey 5104731 [SJ-5104731 1 45 $ 92.80
As per a HB-
- ? -5280- -5280- -
93 |Bag Rack Covers, HB-Z20480XNRO or equivalent 73 ? rolls INT-5280-H sample #93 INT-5280-H 50 6.711b. |$§ 9.94 Heritage Z0480XNRO Z0480XNRO 50 8.1 $ 13.97
Payment Terms 30 NET 2
Delivery Days 10-14 15
Comments * We can only ship this item 400/ case. Price is per 1000.
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics

4049 OF Bid Tab
Category
. Average Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per]
Emm Product Line  Brand g lem ¥ Biacers SKU Peck pimeneions per roll Weight UM
Roll Tissue
Roll Tissue, white, 1-ply, aprox. 4 1/2" x 4 1/2",
1 {1210 sheets/roll, 80 rolls/case, GP 14580 or 110 6 case $
equivalent
Roll Tissue, white, 1-ply, aprox. 4 1/2" x 4 1/2",
2 1500 sheets/roll, 48 rolls/case, GP14448 or 1610 36 case $
equivalent
Roll Tissue, white, 2-ply, aprox. 4.5 x 4.05, 500
3 |sheets/roll, 80 rolls/case, GP19880/01 or 19250 42 case $
equivalent
Roll tissue, white, 2-ply, 3 3/4" x 4", 865
4 sheetsroll, 36 rolls/case, GP-19375 or equivalent 130 4 case $
5 RoHvt\ssue, white, 2-ply, 80/605, KC-04460-60 or 760 4“4 case s
equivalent
Facial Tissue
Facial tissue, boxed, white, 8.33" x 8.0", 2 ply,
8 |30/100 cs. GP 47410 or equivalent. 125 8 | e §
Facial tissue, boxed, white, premium, 36/100,
Kleenex 21400 or equivalent 160 5 case $
Disp Napkin tallfold tallfold, size, 7 1/4" x 13 1/2",
8 |1 ply, standard weight, white or natural 40/250, 1A{ 220 5 case $
32680G or equivalent
Disp napkins, Irg size, White, 12" x 17", 1-ply,
® |121500 cs, GP-37402 or equivalent s 8 | case s
Paper napkin, luncheon size, 12" x 13", 1 ply, 1/4
10 (fold, white or natural, 12/500case, GP 37707 or 4200 19 case $
Paper towel, singlefold, Natural, 1-ply, 9.5" x 10
11 |7/8", 250 towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case, GP 23504 or 8460 51 case $
equivalent
Paper towel, multifold, Natural, 1-ply, 9 1/4" x 9
12 |1/2", 200 towels/pkg, 20 pkgs/case, GP 23304 or | 12100 40 case $
Paper towel, multifold, White, 1-ply, 9 1/4" x 9
13 |12, 16/250 GP 24590 or equivalent 4050 ) 40| case $
Paper towel, roll, 2-ply, 11" x 8.6", 84 - 85
! sheets/roll, 30 rolls/case, GP 27385 or equivalent 1130 " case $
Paper Towel, Center pull Roll Towel, 7.8"W x
15 |15°L. white, 56010, 4 roll/case, GP 28143 I | | e s
16 enMol\Ion white Towel, 800", 6/cs GP-89460 or 790 6 case 3
Wipers, delicate task, 3-ply, soft, non-abrasive,
17 |15"W x 16.7"L, 20BX(70)CS, GP 29778 or 50 4 case $
Wipers, Light Duty, white, 1-ply, 15"W x 16.5"L,
"8 |20/140 os Georgia Paifc 29756 or equivalent | 2 | & | s s
Wipers, All Purpose Medium Duty, white, 1/4 fold
19 |bulk, 12.5" x 14.4", 12/90 cs, Kimberly Clark 810 34 case $

05812 or equivalent
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics
4049 OF Bid Tab

Pacific Care Products

idders SKU Dimension: Sheets  Feet) - Net Case
per roll Weight

Category

. Average Manufacturer & .
E Item Description mn Product Line / Brand Mfg's Item #

Cups, Food Containers
Portion cup pleated paper 3/4 oz., White, 5000/cs

2 Solo 75 or equivalent 39 5 case $
21 Port.lon cup, 1 0z, paper, 5000/cs, SW-100 or 695 1" case s
|~ [equivalent
Pleated 2 oz paper souffle cup, white, 2500cs,
22 Solo 200, 20 3 case $
2 Pomor] cup clear plastic 2 oz., 2500cs, PV-YS200 160 3 case s
or equivalent.
2% Lid ?oz. portion cup, 2500 cs, PV-YLS2FR or 70 2 case s
| |equivalent.
25 Cold c.up 50z plstc translucent, 2500cs, SW-CDE5 20 2 case s
or equivalent.
% Lid 50z. co‘ld cup, 2500cs, NO STRAW SLOT, SW/ 20 ” case s
L53 or equivalent.
Paper cup, White, Non-waxed, Drinking, 30z.,
%7 |2400cs, Solo RD3L or equivalent. W0 | e s
2% Wa)_(ed cold cup, 50z., 3000/cs, Solo R53 or %0 6 case s
| [equivalent
29 Wa)_(ed cold cup, 60z., 2000/cs, Solo R6NN or 20 2 case s
| [equivalent
20 Wa)_(ed cold cup, 90z., 2,000/cs, Solo R9N or 190 14 case s
| [equivalent
31 Hot/CgId cup, white, 60z., 1000/cs, WinCup 6C6 45 7 case s
or equivalent
2 Hot/CgId cup, white, 80z., 1000/cs, WinCup 8C8 2410 18 case s
or equivalent.
3 Hot/Cold cup,‘whne, 120z., 1000/cs, WinCup 1340 7 case
12C16 or equivalent
34 | Cup, 4 oz, 1000/cs, WC-4C4 or equivalent 30 7 case
35 |Lid for 4 oz cup, 1000/cs, WC-4L or equivalent 30 3 case
| 36 |Vented Lid for 8¢8, Wincup 65 3 case
Vented Lid, Wincup WC-FL 35 2 case

Plates, Bowls, Food Containers
Paper plate 6" coated, fluted rigid rim, 1,000cs,

%8 | Solo MWP6 or 2 L s
Paper plate 9" coated, fluted rigid rim, 1,000cs,

39 Solo MWP9 or 295 9 case $
Foam plate 6", non-laminated, 1 section, white,

“011000/cs, PV-YTH10006 or 8|4 | e s
Foam plate 9", non-laminated, 1 section, white,

#1 | 500/cs, PV-YTH10009 or 200 ] 10| e s
Foam plate, 9", 1 section, white, dbl laminated,

#2 | 500/cs, PV-YTK10009 o equivalent. % 2 case $
Foam plate 9", 3 section, white, double laminated,

#3 | 500/cs, PV-YTK10011 o equivalent. 8 8 case $
Foam bowl 50z., white, 1,000cs, non-laminated,

“ | Pv-YTH10004 or equivalent, L A B s
Foam bowl 6-80z., white, double laminated,

45 500/cs, Wincup 8B or equivalent. 310 6 case $
Foam bowl 120z., white, double laminated,

46 500/cs, Wincup 12FC or equivalent. 1450 16 case $

4 Foam bowl 160z., laminated inside, 500/cs, 50 4 case $

Wincup 16FC or equivalent.
Plates, Bowls, Food Containers

3 compartment hngd tray white foam, 9" x 9" x
#8 |3.5°. 200/cs, Pactiv TD19903 or equivalent, L R §
49 |16 oz Paper Food Container, 500/cs Solo VS516 10 1 case $
3 compartment microwavable tray, Clear View,
50 | 501cs Pactiv CNB4638 or equivalent 2 ! case §
51 Lid for 3 compartment microwavable tray, 250/cs 2 4 case s
|~ |Pactiv ClearView CN8-4684
| 52 |5 Compartment Lunch Tray, PV-YTH10500 56 ? case $
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics

4049 OF Bid Tab
Category
. Average Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per]
Emm Product Line / Brand M'g s o ¥ Bidders SKU Peck pimensions per roll WEIgh‘ UoM
Plastic Utensils
Spoon medium plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs,
53 | 1A-406014 or equivalent HB | | e s
Spoon heavy plastic white, bulk pack, 1,000cs, 1A-
o 406034 or equivalent. 1025 o cese §
Fork medium plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs, 1A-
%5 | 406010 equivalent W) | wse s
Fork Heavy plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs, 1A-
% 406028 or equivalent 310 " case $
Knife medium plastic white, Bulk pack 1,000cs, 1A
5 406017 or equivalent 180 5 case $
58 Kmf_e plastic heavy white, 10/100cs, 1A-406037 or 5 9 case s
equivalent
Foil & Plastic Film Wrap & Bags
59 Foil 18" x 500 standard Weight, Aluminum Foil, 2 1 ol s
cutter box 1 roll ¢s, Reynolds 614 or equivalent.
6 Foil 18" x 1000 standard weight, Aluminum Foil, 10 2 ol s
cutter box 1 roll ¢s, Reynolds 615 or equivalent.
Foil, 18" x 500 heavy weight, Aluminum Foil,
6 cutter box 1 roll cs, Reynolds 624 or equivalent. 195 5 ro §
Foil 18" x 1000 heavy weight, Aluminum Foil,
6 cutter box 1 roll ¢cs, PV-625 or equivalent. 500 10 roll $
Foil Sheets, Aluminum Foil Sheets 12" x 10 3/4",
83 |g/500cs, PV-721 or eaui % ¢ o s
64 | Film 12"x2000' Foodservice AN-NW122 50 2 roll $
Film wrap 18 x 1000 w/cutter, 1 roll ¢s, Anchor
65 PW181 or 80 7 roll $
Film wrap 18 x 2000 w/cutter, 1 roll case, Anchor
66 PW182 or 2410 17 roll $
Pan liner Quillon Treated, 16 3/8x24 3/8, 1,000cs,
57 | Bleyco PAN24 or equi 0 8 case $
68 sl'p\oc.pmt bag, 6"x 6", 1000/cs, ELKAY HO7RC 1o 5 case 3
Ziploc quart bag, Pint Size, 6" x 8", 1000cs,
89 | ELKAY F20608 or [l I s
0 Fllp.\urfk bag, 6 1/2" x 7 1/2", 2000cs, EK-HDO7 or 20 4 case s
Ziploc Gallon Bag, 10 9/16" x 11", 1.75ml, 250/cs,
™ [ELKAY F21012G or equi M0 5 | e s
Sandwich bag dry wax, 6.75"x6.75", 1000/bx, Bag
72 Craft 300401 or equivalent. 15 $ cose §
Paper Sacks
44# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500,
™3 |Duro bag DB-4K, 5x 3-14 x -3/ or equivalent | 2% | 8 | baeS s
74 6# Brown Kraft, §\eeve 500, Duro Bag DB-6K, 6 x 110 5 bales s
3-5/8 x 11or equivalent
8# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-8K,
» 6-1/8 x 4 x 12-3/8 or equivalent 90 6 bales $
124# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-12K, 7;
76 | 118 x 4-1/4 x 13-3/4 or equivatent S0 | 9 | bals s
20# Brown Kraft, Sleeve 500, Duro Bag DB-20K 8-|
77 | 114 x 5:5/16 x 16-118 or equivalent. 1 ] 5 | baes s
574# Brown Kraft, Bale 500, Duro Bag DB-1/6 BBL
K 57,12 x 7 x 17 or equivalent 20 8 bales $
79 #75 Brown Kraft, Bale 400, Duro Bag, DB-1/6 BBL 25 5 bales s

75,12 x 7 x 17, or equivalent
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Buyer: Michelle Musick

The State of Nebraska
Disposable Paper Plastics

4049 OF Bid Tab
Category
. Average Manufacturer & . " " . Sheets / Feet| Net Case |Bid Price per]
Emm Product Line / Brand M'g s o ¥ Bidders SKU Peck pimensions per roll WEIght UoM
Hygiene
Aprons light weight plastic, white, 46"L x 28"W, case
80 [Will be ordered (shipped) in cases of 1,000 175 5 oM Amercare PA1 PA1 10/100 22lb $  45.00
(10/100) ME-75007247 or equivalent
81 Aprvon‘ poly, 2 mil, Box of 100, ME-L419 or 60 3 Box
| |equivalent
Glove, poly FDA approved, Embossed, wrist
length, sizes small, medium and large, Must be case
82 | rderedishipped in cases of 10,000 (10/1000), VK-| 20 | % | 1om Amercare PG PGt 101100 %% %00
78050 sm/med/Irg-pg or equivalent
Hairnet heavy duty nylon, X-large, fire retardant,
83 |144ipk, Magia, 7386821 or equivlent, el I e
Cap operating room 21", Fire retardant, Non
84 |Woven, cloth like material, 10/100cs,VK-21500LG 900 11 case Amercare BC1 BC1 10/100 10 $ 24.00
or equivalent.
85 Cag paper adjustable, white, LA-RPPRCC2W or 5 4 case s
86 | Toilet Seat Cover, HS-DS5000 or equivalent 10 1 case $
87 Per;onal Seat Covers, 3000/cs, KC-07410 or 200 9 case s
88 | Tampax, 500/cs, Hospeco T500 or equivalent 74 4 case Body Form T500 T500 500 7 $  55.00
g | Maxi pad folded thin, Sanitary Napiin 250/cs, 1400 | 32 | case Amercare AF250 | AF250 250 8 $ 1450
Hospeco MT-4 or equivalent
Maxi super/overnight with wings, Sanitary Napkin
90 |individually wrapped, 200cs, Hospeco MT-200 or 255 4 case Amercare AF290 AF290 250 85 $  25.00
equivalent
91 Pnn.mry Foam soap, 2/cs, GJ-P5665-02 or 850 12 case
equivalent
Miscellaneous
| 92 |Carefree Finish, 5 Gal. SJ-5104731 or equivalent 20 1 case $
93 |Bag Rack Covers, HB-Z20480XNRO or equivalent 73 ? rolls $
Payment Terms 30
Delivery Days 7
Comments

Award Explanation:

Contract awarded to overall low bidder.

Page 16 of 16

Opening Date: 07/06/2012



