Buyer: Michelle Musick

4002 OF

Nebraska Department of Roads

Opening Date: 05/29/12
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PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD
Chip Seal Ledge Rock Blackstrap Inc Gana TrL.'Ckmg & Hills Materials Company L. G. Everist, Inc. Spencer Quarries Inc. Westover Rock & Sand,
Excavating Inc. Inc.
.% Description QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK
1 HWY 121, MP 12 1,300.00 N 26.92 No Bid 30.45 20.10 | $ 30.10
(WEST SIDE)
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK
2 HWY 59, MP 25 1,400.00 N 30.14 37.19 No Bid 25.05 2325( % 28.60
(SOUTH SIDE)
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK
3 HWY 14, MP 188 1,600.00 N 32.45 40.86 No Bid 32.97 2350 ( $ 29.85
(WEST SIDE)
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK .
4 HWY 12, MP 236.2 (EAST SIDE) 1,100.00 N 27.37 33.08 No Bid 22.16 2645 | $ 22.35
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK
5 HWY 16, MP 28.2, 1/4 MI S OF | 1,700.00 N 26.17 32.86 No Bid 25.10 29.87 | $ 23.80
JCT 35 & 16 (EAST SIDE)
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK
6 HWY 81, MP 202, 3.43 MI S OF | 1,306.00 TN 30.69 38.95 No Bid 26.13 20.72 | $ 28.50
JCT 81 & 12 (WEST SIDE)
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . . .
7 ALLIANCE MAINTENANCE YARD 2,000.00 TN No Bid $ 31.60 No Bid No Bid
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . . .
8 HWY 385, MP 141 2,000.00 TN No Bid $ 29.10 No Bid No Bid
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK E . . .
9 SIDNEY, W OF JCT 30 & 385 2,000.00 TN No Bid 5475 | $ 41.90 No Bid No Bid
Payment Terms: 0 15 00 0 N/30 100 30 100 30
Delivery Days ARO: 30 As Needed 30 14-21 As ordered
Comments:
Invalid Bid
K4 Trucking



