
Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 5 GALLON $10.6400 $13.25
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 10998 11343
MILK, WHITE, 2%, GALLON $2.3100 $2.79
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11004 5997
MILK, WHITE, FAT FREE, GALLON $2.0800 $2.55
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11006 5998
MILK, WHITE, WHOLE, GALLON $2.5100 $2.98
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 10961 5996
MILK, WHITE, 1% GALLON $2.1700 $2.60
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11008 5999
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 1/2 GALLON $1.3300 $1.50
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 10976 6869
MILK, WHITE, 2%, 1/2 GALLON $1.3500 $1.53
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 10975 6867
MILK, WHITE, WHOLE, 1/2 GALLON $1.4100 $1.69
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 10974 6865
MILK, WHITE, SKIM, 1 QUART $0.6900 $0.77
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11040 21185
MILK, WHITE, 2%, 1/2 PINT $0.1690 $0.2066
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11044 5768
MILK, WHITE, FAT FREE, 1/2 PINT $0.1570 $0.1890
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11043 6846
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

MILK, WHITE, WHOLE, 1/2 PINT $0.1850 $0.2310
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 10990 6844
MILK, WHITE, 1% 1/2 PINT $0.1590 $0.1890
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11035 11353
LOWFAT BUTTERMILK, QUART $0.7400 $0.85
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11232 9180
LOWFAT BUTTERMILK, 1/2 GALLON $1.3800 $1.61
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 29349 8007
HALF AND HALF, PINT $0.5500 $0.67
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11247 6856
HALF AND HALF, QUART $1.1900 $1.33
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 18619 21189
WHIPPED CREAM, AEROSOL CAN $18.3600 $1.89
Brand Bidding: Dairy Fresh Classic Cream

Size and Case Size Bidding: 15 oz 12 per case (1.53 per 
unit) 15 oz/12 per cs

Item # 49393 9790
SOUR CREAM, 5 LB CONTAINER $4.9500 $5.61
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11573 6825
SOUR CREAM, INDIVIDUAL $9.8500 $11.55
Brand Bidding: Dairy Fresh Roberts

Size and Case Size Bidding: 1 oz 100 per case (.0985 per 
unit) 1 oz/100 per case

Item # 41345 8946
SOUR CREAM, LIGHT, 5 LB $4.7500 $5.61
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 10886 12060
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

SOUR CREAM, 16 OZ $0.9900 $1.29
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Size and Case Size Bidding: 16 oz - All Natural 16 oz/18 per cs
Item # 49751 6826
SOUR CREAM, FAT FREE, 16 OZ $5.5800 $1.29
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts

Size and Case Size Bidding: 16 oz 6 per case (.93 per unit) 16 oz/18 per cs

Item # 38914 8240
COTTAGE CHEESE, 5 LB $6.1500 $6.55
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11654 1673
YOGURT, 6 OZ, BLUEBERRY $5.5200 $0.4425
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 12825 (.46 per unit) 20257
YOGURT, 6 OZ, BLACK CHERRY $5.5200 $0.4425
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts

Item # 12824 (.46 per unit) *20262 White Chocolate 
Raspberry

YOGURT, 6 OZ, PEACH $5.5200 $0.4425
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 12828 (.46 per unit) 20259
YOGURT, 6 OZ, STRAWBERRY/BANANA $5.5200 $0.4425
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 12831 (.46 per unit) 20256
YOGURT, 6 OZ, RASPBERRY $5.5200 $0.4425
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 12829 (.46 per unit) 20261
YOGURT, 6 OZ, STRAWBERRY $5.5200 $0.4425
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 12830 (.46 per unit) 20255
YOGURT, 6 OZ, MIXED FLAVORS $0.4600 $0.4425
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts

Item # 12826 - Cherry Vanilla     
12827 - Vanilla *Multiple Codes
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

YOGURT, LITE 6 OZ, MIX FLAVOR $5.5200 $0.4425
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts

Item #

11106 - Banana Cream Pie
11107 - Black Cherry

11108 - Blueberry
11109 - Lemon Chiffon

11110 - Peach
11111 - Raspberry
11112 - Strawberry
11113 - Straw/Ban.

*Multiple Codes

YOGURT, 1/2 GALLON NO BID $4.09
Brand Bidding: N/A Prairie Farms FF Van
Item # N/A 19483
ORANGE JUICE, 1 GALLON $3.1500 $3.98
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11181 6831
ORANGE JUICE, 1/2 PINT $0.2620 $0.3045
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts
Item # 11188 8247
IC MIX, 1/2 GAL, CHOCOLATE $20.7000 $2.52
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts

Size and Case Size Bidding: 1/2 gal 9 per case (2.3000 per 
unit) Half Gallon/9 per cs

Item # 37969 8242
IC MIX, VANILLA, HALF GAL $18.2700 $2.52
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Roberts

Size and Case Size Bidding: 1/2 gal 9 per case (2.03 per 
unit) Half Gallon/9 per cs

Item # 37968 8243
MARGARINE, SOLID, 1 LB $21.9000 $26.10
Brand Bidding: Shedds Sheds
Size and Case Size Bidding: 1# 30 per case (.73 per unit) 1 lb./30-lbs per cs
Item # 23125 4749
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

MARGARINE/OLEO, INDIVIDUAL $16.6864 n/a
Brand Bidding: Gold-N-Sweet

Size and Case Size Bidding: 90 ct 12 lbs per case (.0155 
per unit)

Item # 14840
MARGARINE, IND CUPS $25.5330 $12.90
Brand Bidding: Churn Spread Country Crock

Size and Case Size Bidding: 5 gram 900 per case (.0284 
per unit) 900/BX

Item # 17388 2207
BUTTER, IND FOIL WRAPPED $47.7500 $49.95
Brand Bidding: Meadow Gold Roberts

Size and Case Size Bidding: 59 ct. 17 lbs per case (.0476 
per unit) 17 lb. 47 CT. CONT CHIP

Item # 40173 2165
ICE CREAM, CUP, VANILLA, 4 OZ $2.1000 $2.90
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star
Pack Size Bidding: 24 pk (4.20 ÷ 2 = 2.10 doz) 24/4oz
Item # 43807 4020
ICE CREAM, CUP, CHOCOLATE, 4 OZ $2.1000 $2.90
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star
Pack Size Bidding: 24 pk (4.20 ÷ 2 = 2.10 doz) 24/4oz
Item # 43823 4018
ICE CREAM, CUP, STRAWBERRY, 4 OZ $2.1000 $2.90
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star

Item #
43809                     

Pack size:  24pk (4.20÷2 = 
2.10 doz)

4019

ICE CREAM, 3 GALLON, ASSORTED $12.9000 $13.50

Brand Bidding: Old Fashioned Land O Lakes Hiland Roberts

Item # See Attachment "A" 9318

Flavors: See Attachment "A" Van,Choc,Choc Chip, Cookies 
& Cream

45 185 EA

43 370 DZ

44 230 DZ

41 35 CS

42 1,115 DZ

39 580 BX

40 165 CS
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

ICE CREAM, 4 QUART, ASSORTED $4.7900 $5.55
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Hiland Roberts
Item # See Attachment "B" 21477,21478,21485
Flavors: See Attachment "B" Van,Country Van,Cherry Nut
ICE CREAM, 1/2 GALLON $2.4500 $2.66
Brand Bidding: Deans (48 oz IC) Hiland Roberts
Item # See Attachment "C" 9427

Flavors: See Attachment "C"

Van,Choc,Choc Chip, CC 
Ckie Dgh, Straw, Blk Walnut, 

Cherry Nut, Cook &Crm, 
Butter Pecan

SHERBERT CUP, ORG 4 OZ $2.0250 $2.59
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star

Pack Size Bidding: 24 pk (4.05 ÷ 2 = 2.0250 
doz)

24 Pk

Item # 43804 4023
SHERBERT CUP, RSP 4 OZ $2.0250 $2.59
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star

Pack Size Bidding: 24 pk (4.05 ÷ 2 = 2.0250 
doz)

24 Pk

Item # 43803 4024
NOVELTIES, FUDGE BAR $23.7000 $5.06
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 6-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 44649 (.1646 per unit-bar) 3616
NOVELTIES, IC BAR $19.4000 $6.44
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh Nort Star Old Recipe
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 4-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 45512 (.2021 per unit-bar) 3621
NOVELTIES, EDYS FRUIT BAR OR EQUIVALENT $16.1500 $6.24
Brand Bidding: Edy's North Star Straw.
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 1-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 45680 (.6729 per unit-bar) 15518

51 195 CS

52 20 CS

49 85 DZ

50 15 CS

47 165 EA

48 285 DZ

46 217 EA
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

TRIPLE BLAST,  OR EQUIVALENT $15.7000 $11.16
Brand Bidding: Nestle North Star Ofsh Triple Choc.
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 12 pk 2-12 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 24880 (.6542 per unit) 13895
POPSICLES, ASSORTED $15.8000 $3.98
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 4-24 pk per case 24 PK O/C/B
Item # 45705 (.1646 per unit) 3623
IC BAR, KLNDK CHOC TACO, 4 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $22.4800 $22.40
Brand Bidding: Klondike Klndk
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 1-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 2479 (.9367 per unit) 3648
IC BAR, NEST BUTTERFINGER, 4 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $22.5000 $7.76
Brand Bidding: Nestle North Star Toffee Bar
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 1-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 25692 (.9375 per unit-bar) 3633
IC BAR, NEST DRUMSTICK, 4.6 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $22.5000 $10.04
Brand Bidding: Nestle North Star OfashVan Cone
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 1-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 11516 (.9375 per unit-bar) 3631
IC BAR, SNICKERS, 3.33 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $45.0000 $22.50
Brand Bidding: Snickers Snicker
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 2-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 26609 (.9375 per unit-bar) 16200
IC SAND, NEST VAN, 6 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $48.4500 $9.10

Brand Bidding: Nestle North Star Van Sand King 
Size

Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 3-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 34435 (.6729 per unit) 7243
IC SAND, LT VAN, 3.5 OZ $26.7000 $5.90
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star RF Sand 3.5 oz
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 6-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 43764 (.1854 per unit) 15517

59 5 CS

60 160 CS

57 20 CS

58 7 CS

55 5 CS

56 5 CS

53 21 CS

54 5 CS
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

EDY IC DIBS VAN CRNCH CT, 4 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $17.9500 n/a
Brand Bidding: Edy's
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 12 pk 1-12 pk per case
Item # 24879 (1.4958 per unit)
IC BAR, NEST CRNCH VAN, 3 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $17.9500 n/a
Brand Bidding: Nestle
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 1-24 pk per case
Item # 45103 (.7479 per unit-bar)
IC BAR, NEST TLHE CHC CHP, 7 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $17.9500 $11.44
Brand Bidding: Nestle North Star CNC Sand.
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 1-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 13240 (.7479 per unit-bar) 18891
NEST ORG PUSHUP, 2.75 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $10.5000 $7.76
Brand Bidding: Nestle North Star Totally Tubular
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 1-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 25355 (.4375 per unit) 3629
NEST STWBRY SHTCK, 4 OZ OR EQUIVALENT $22.5000 $5.56

Brand Bidding: Nestle North Star Strawbrry 
Shortcake

Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 1-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 11366 (.9375 per unit) 7108
IC BAR, FUDGE, 2.5 OZ $19.4000 $2.53
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 4-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 43763 (.2021 per unit-bar) 3616
MALT CUP, CHOCOLATE, 12 FL OZ $5.5000 $5.85
Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star 10oz Malt Cup
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 12 pk 1-12 pk per case 12 pk/1
Item # 43811 (.4583 per unit) 4013
LOL D EASE SKIM, 1/2 GAL OR EQUIVALENT $3.0300 $3.49
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Lactaid 100% NF
Item # 34315 5648
LOL D EASE 2% E 1/2 GAL OR EQUIVALENT $3.0300 $3.49
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Lactaid 2%
Item # 34316 11169

67 210 CS

68 25

69 635

EA

EA

65 5 CS

66 150 DZ

63 5 CS

64 10 CS

61 5 CS

62 5 CS
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

LOL D EASE WHL, 1/2 GAL OR EQUIVALENT $3.0300 $3.49
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Lactaid Whole
Item # 34317 10349
POPSICLES, 1.75 OZ RED WHITE & BLUE $17.7000 $4.42

Brand Bidding: Deans Country Fresh North Star Super Pop R/W/B 
4.5oz

Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 24 pk 6-24 pk per case 24 PK/1
Item # 43912 (.1229 per unit) 7407
MILK, CHOCOLATE, LOL TMOO, 1%, GAL OR EQUIVALENT $2.5800 $3.09
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Tru Moo Roberts FF Choc
Item # 47420 8006
MILK, CHOCOLATE, TMOO, 1% SQ 1/2 PINT OR EQUIVALENT $0.1850 $0.2188
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Tru Moo Roberts FF Choc
Item # 48148 5772

MILK, STRAWBERRY, TMOO, SKIM, S, 1/2 PINT OR EQUIVALENT $0.1750 $0.2140

Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Tru Moo Roberts FF Straw
Item # 46073 11376
MILK, CHOCOLATE, LOL, 1% PINT, OR EQUIVALENT $0.4900 $0.65
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Tru Moo *Roberts FF Choc
Item # 47450 12829
MILK, CHOCOLATE, SKIM, TRUMOO, 1/2 PINT OR EQUIVALENT $0.1750 $0.2140
Brand Bidding: Land O Lakes Tru Moo Roberts
Item # 48110 5772
NOVELTIES EDY'S FRUIT BAR OR EQUIVALENT $27.5000 n/a
Brand Bidding: Edy's
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 12 pk 5-12 pk per case
Item # 45829 (.4583 per unit)
FROZEN YOGURT, 1/2 GAL VANILLA $14.7000 $2.45
Brand Bidding: Dean Hiland Roberts
Pack Size and Case Qty Bidding: 48 oz - 6 per case HGallon/3
Item # 43784 (2.4500 per unit) 22053

78 30 CS

74 5,184 EA

8,000

77 10 CS

76

70 25 EA

CS

73 77,000 EA

71

72 1,670 GL

25

75 EA

8,000 EA
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

LOWFAT BUTTERMILK, QUART NO BID $1.11
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Roberts

Item # 21187
COTTAGE CHEESE, 5 LB NO BID $9.5930
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Roberts

Item # 1673
ICE CREAM, 3 GALLON, ASSORTED NO BID $18.90
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Hiland Roberts

Item # 9318 Van,Choc,Strawe, Choc 
Chip,Cookies&Cream

MARGARINE, SOLID, 1 LB NO BID 1.4536/unit
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Sheds

Item # 4749
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, 1/2 PINT NO BID $0.3010
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Roberts FF Choc

Item # 5772
MILK, WHITE, 2%, GALLON NO BID $3.77
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Roberts

Item # 5997

2,500 EA

82 1,001 CS

81 400 EA

83

80 500 EA

11,800 EA

84

79 1,000 QT
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3993 OF Opening Date:  05/25/12

Dean Holding Co.  DBA Dean 
Foods North Central, LLC Roberts Dairy Foods

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Milk Products

MILK, WHITE 2%, 1/2 PINT NO BID $0.2910
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Roberts

Item # 5768
MILK, WHITE, SKIM, 1/2 PINT NO BID $0.2890
Brand Bidding: Roberts
Item # 6846
MILK, WHITE, WHOLE, 1/2 PINT NO BID $0.2990
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Roberts

Item # 6844
SOUR CREAM, 5 LB CONTAINER NO BID $9.4640
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: Roberts

Item # 6825
ICE CREAM CUPS, VANILLA NO BID $4.50
Brand Bidding: North Star 24PK/1
Item # 4020
ICE CREAM CUPS, CHOCOLATE NO BID $4.50
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: North Star

Pack Size Bidding: 24 PK/1
Item # 4018
ICE CREAM CUPS, STRAWBERRY NO BID $4.50
West NE Vets Home, Scottsbluff                                              Brand 
bidding: North Star

Pack Size Bidding: 24 PK/1
Item # 4019

Award Explanation: Lines 58 and 78 were awarded to Roberts Dairy Foods as a result of a coin toss.

90 50 DZ

DZ

91 50 DZ

5089

86 14,411 EA

88 80 EA

87 8,000 EA

85 28,000 EA
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