
Buyer:  Michelle Musick 3954 OF
Nebraska Department of Roads

Opening Date: 04/30/12

AWARD AWARD

Blackstrap Inc Central Salt Nebraska Salt & 
Grain Co

Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Salt Region 1 Peak 15000 TN  $                    58.40  $                    51.72  $                    51.60 
2 Salt Region 1 Off-Peak 30000 TN  $                    49.40  $                    42.74  $                    45.00 
3 Salt Region 2 Peak 10000 TN  $                    57.50  No Bid  $                    52.11 
4 Salt Region 2 Off-Peak 20000 TN  $                    49.50  No Bid  $                    49.07 
5 Salt Region 3 Peak 3700 TN  $                    67.35  No Bid  $                    60.03 
6 Salt Region 3 Off-Peak 7400 TN  $                    57.25  No Bid  $                    50.11 
7 Salt Region 4 Peak 2300 TN  $                    72.90  No Bid  $                    63.36 
8 Salt Region 4 Off-Peak 4700 TN  $                    63.80  No Bid  $                    58.17 

 0% 15 Days N/A Net 30

30 Days 1 - 7 Days 
As required AS REQUIRED

 Crushed Rock Salt  Crushed Rock Salt  Crushed Rock Salt 

 Independent Salt 

Invalid Bid
Paul Bartels Trucking Co - Vendor did not 

attend the Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting.

No Bid

Description

Highway Deicing Salt

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

Comments
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