Buyer: Michelle Musick

3944 OF

Opening Date: 04/10/12

Statewide
AWARD
Brown & Bigelow, Dynamic International JLM Unlimited Orient Arts, Inc dba The Unisource
1+ Long and Short Sleeved Polo Shirts Alamar Uniforms ' Advertising . . ’
° Inc. Soluti Promotional Ideas | Enterprises, LLC Company
o olutions
= Changes to Changes to
Description Quantity [ UOM Unit Price 9es Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price 9es
Description Description
Short Slv Polo w/ Logo-
1 Blue (SML to 3XL) 3,000 EA 15.85 SML to XL $ 7.86 687 | % 1350 | $ 12.00 9.01
Short Slv Polo w/ Logo- Specials - Talls &
2 |Blue (Specials-talls & 3,000 EA 20.85 P $ 8.55 911 | $ 14.00 | $ 13.25 10.87 | No Talls in Jerzee
Above 2XL
above 3XL)
Long Slv Polo w/ Logo-
3 Blue (SML to 3XL) 3,000 EA 20.50 SML to XL $ 9.86 10.60 | $ 1350 | $ 14.64 12.33
Long Slv Polo w/ Logo- . .
4 |Blue (Specials-talls & 3,000 | EA 2540 | Specials-Talls & | o 11.72 1254 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.94 15.75 | No Talls in Jerzee
Above 2XL Only to 4XL
above 3XL)
Short Slv Polo w/ Logo-
5 Ash (SML to 3XL) 2,000 EA 15.85 SML to XL $ 7.86 687 ($ 1350 | $ 12.00 8.32
Short Siv Polo w/ Logo- Specials - Talls & '\f]c:a:;::assm
6 |Ash (Specials-talls & 2,000 EA 20.85 P $ 8.55 9.11($ 14.00 | $ 15.94 No Bid
Above 2XL See Attached
above 3XL)
Letter
No L/S in Ash for
Long Slv Polo w/ Logo- : Jerzees
7 2,000 EA 20.50 SML to XL 9.86 10.60 13.50 14.64 No Bid
Ash (SML to 3XL) $ $ $ See Attached
Letter
Long Slv Polo w/ Logo- Specials - Talls & NJZ;?EILSsm
8 |Ash (Specials-talls & 2,000 EA 25.40 Above 2XL $ 11.72 1254 | $ 15.00 | $ 13.25 No Bid See Attached
above 3XL)
Letter
Brand Style Bidding Jerzee Jerzee ML 437 Anvil 4640 Jerzsitieniport Jerzees 437/437 ML
Payment Terms Net 30 0 Net 30 2% 30 Days 1% 30 Days 2% 10 Days 0.25% 10 Days
Delivery Days ARO 14 7-10 30 30 15
Comments

lof2




Buyer: Michelle Musick 3944 OF Opening Date: 04/10/12

Statewide
1+ Long and Short Sleeved Polo Shirts Orient Arts, Inc dba The Unisource | Paradise Sunshine Sayre Enterprises Inc. Stroud Safety Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
° Company - Alternate Development Inc Apparel
c
£
Description Quantity [ UOM Unit Price Changes_ to Unit Price Unit Price Changes_ to Unit Price Unit Price Changes_ to
Description Description Description
$10.95 S- XL
Short Slv Polo w/ Logo- $5.93 S, M, L, XL $10.25 S-XL
1 |Blue (SML to 3XL) 3000 | EA $12.10 2X $ 9.42 $8.94 2XL, 3XL $ 7.95 $12.49 2X - 3%
$14.50 3X
$15.50 4X
$17.50 5X $12.49 axL
Short Siv Polo w/ Logo- $18.50 6X XL XL $22.10 5XL - 6XL
2 |Blue (Specials-talls & 3,000 | EA $24.00 7 $ 1179 | $ 8.94 No Talls $ 8.25 $19.50 L - XL Talls
above 3XL) $15.95 L &XL Tall $22.10 2XL - 3XL Talls
$16.95 2X Tall $24.05 4XL - 6XL Talls
$18.95 3X Tall
$20 25 4AX Tall
$14.95 S-XL $13.98 S-XL
L Slv Polo w/ Logo- 9.43 S, M, L, XL
3 B?l:f (S,\\'AL?:;)V(L) %91 3000 | EA $16.05 2x $ 13.05 :11 18 XL $ 10.50 $15.93 2XL
$18.45 3X ) $22.43 3XL
Long Slv Polo w/ Logo- $19.50 ax gzzgfs L‘-D;(L ('ar);ll_ls
4 |Blue (Specials-talls & 3,000 EA $21.95 $ 15.79 No Bid $ 11.75 :
above 3xXL) $22.95 5X $25.03 2XL - 3XL Talls
i 6X $27.63 4XL - 6XL Talls
$10.95 S-XL
Short Slv Polo w/ Logo- $8.58 S, M, L, XL
5 2,000 EA $12.10 2X $ 9.42 ol o $ 7.95| $ 11.91 S-3XL
Ash (SML to 3XL, ! 8.59 2XL, 3XL
( ) $14.50 3X $
$15.50 4X
$17.50 5X $11.91 4XL - 5XL
Short Siv Polo w/ Logo- $18.50 6X XL BXL $22.75 6XL
6 |Ash (Specials-talls & 2,000 | EA $24.00 7 $ 1179 | $ 8.59 No Talls $ 8.25 $18.85 L - XL Talls
above 3XL) $15.95 L & XL Tall $21.45 2XL - 3XL Talls
$16.95 2X Tall $24.05 4XL - 6XL Talls
$18.95 3X Tall
420 25 AX Tall
Long Slv Polo w/ Logo- $14.95 S- XL $19.83 S- XL
7 Ashg(SML to 3XL) 9 2,000 EA $16.05 2X $ 13.05 No Bid $ 11.00 $21.13 2XL
$18.45 3X $22.43 3XL
$25.03 4XL - 5XL
Long Slv Polo w/ Logo- $19.50 4X $26.33 6XL
8 |Ash (Specials-talls & 2,000 EA $21.95 5X $ 15.79 No Bid $ 11.75 $22.43 L- XL Talls
above 3XL) $22.95 6X $25.03 2XL - 3XL Talls
$28.98 4XL - 6X1 Talls
- ’ Jerzees and Stroud 55PNKC & Jerzees 437/ 437L and
Brand Style Bidding Port Authority K500, K500 LS Stedman Jerzees 437M and Jerzees 437ML 55PNKCLS Tri-Mountain 105 / 106
Payment Terms 0.25% 10 Days 0% N/A 2% 20 Days 0% 30 Days
Delivery Days ARO 15 7 30 15 30
Comments
NO TALLS in Port Authority K500LS
Invalid Bid
M.D. Brown Co.

20f2



