Buyer: Ruth Gray 3938 OF Opening Date: 04/05/12

Statewide
PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD
; Expanded Shale Buldex, Inc. TXI
- Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 |D-1EXPANDED SHALE 3/4"X 3/8"JCT15&64, | 4 o5 | cy | $ 565.85| $ 69,81250| $ 60.60| $  75750.00

5 MIN OF DAVID CITY

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" WAHOO
2 MAINTENANCE YARD 1,100 | CY | $ 53.10( $ 58,410.00| $ 62.00( $ 68,200.00

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 SEWARD
3 MAINTENANCE YARD 875 CY [$ 5310 $ 46,46250($ 59.60| $ 52,150.00

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 HWY 8, MP 62
(STEELE CITY)

D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 HWY 136 MP
> 162 (HARBINE CO-OP) 1,140 | €Y

6 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 CENTRAL 620 cy
CITY MAINTENANCE YARD

D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 W JCT 81 & 92
! N SIDE, HWY 81 MP 83 1,095 | CY

D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 ALLIANCE :
8 MAINTENANCE YARD 2,000 | CY No Bid $ 47.00( $ 94,000.00

9 EI_SSCE(;(PANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 3 MI W OF 2,000 | CY No Bid $ 46.30( $ 92,600.00

D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 E SIDE OF :
10 SIDNEY, W OF JCT 30 & 385 2,000 | CY No Bid $ 4280 $ 85,600.00

D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 1-80 MP 237
11 (LEXINGTON) 700 CY [$ 5825|% 40,775.00($ 4980| $ 34,860.00

D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 1-80 MP 190

1,940 | CY 50.70( $ 98,358.00| $ 59.60( $ 115,624.00

51.30( $ 58,482.00| $ 59.60( $ 67,944.00

54.10( $ 33,542.00| $ 56.80( $ 35,216.00

*a | B | B | B

53.10( $ 58,14450| $ 59.20( $ 64,824.00

12 (MAXWELL) 700 CY [$ 6180|$% 43,260.00($ 48.05|$ 33,635.00
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 1-80 MP 126

13 (OGALLALA) 2590 | CY | $ 66.80( $ 173,012.00| $ 42.80( $ 110,852.00

14 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 HWY 30 MP 1,190 | CY | $ 66.30( $ 78,897.00| $ 43.50( $ 51,765.00

136 (ROSCOE)
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 JCT HWY 21 &
15 |40 (OCONTO) 700 | CY | $ 60.00( $ 42,00000|$ 51.20|$ 35,840.00

D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 SE HWY 2

16 | BUNNING) 2,000 | CY | $ 64.60| $ 129,200.00| $ 52.60| $ 105,200.00

17 |P:6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X #8 HWY 2MP 1551 700 | oy | g 71.00| $ 49,700.00| $ 49.80| $  34,860.00
(WHITMAN)

1g |7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X 3/8"HOLDREGE | 5 | oy | g s540|$  2,770.00|$ 5325|$  2,662.50

MAINTENANCE YARD

Page 1 of 2



Buyer: Ruth Gray

3938 OF Opening Date: 04/05/12
Statewide

ﬁ Expanded Shale Buldex, Inc. TXI

£

- Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" HWY 6 MP

19 89, 2 MI W OF MCCOOK 50 CY |$ 57.90( $ 2,895.00| $ 48.00( $ 2,400.00
Total $ 985,720.50 $1,163,982.50
Payment Terms 0
Delivery Days ARO 30 60

Comments

Line ltem #1 thu #5
This material will be
available for shipment in
November and December

2012

Line Item #6 thu #7
This material will be
available for shipment in
June and July 2012

Line Item #8 thu #10
No Bid

Line ltem #11 thu #17
This material will be
available for shipment in
December 2012 and
January 2013

Line Item #18 thu #19
This material will be
available for shipment in
June and July 2012

No Bid
Blackstrap Inc.

Lines 18 and 19
Not Awarded
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