
Buyer: Mary Lanning 3937 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 04/03/12

Vendor Total Bid Vendor Total Bid

 Crescent Electric 195,780.26$                       Crescent Electric 19,886.20$                      

Graybar 246,630.57$                      Graybar 25,156.49$                      

Scott Electric No Bid Scott Electric No Bid

AWARD Voss Lighting 116,902.51$                      AWARD Voss Lighting 12,498.66$                      

WESCO Distribution 119,570.15$                      WESCO Distribution 14,999.96$                      

Vendor Total Bid Vendor Total Bid

Crescent Electric $                     369.60* Crescent Electric $                 1,422.90**

Graybar $                     381.34* Graybar $                 1,478.64**

Scott Electric $                    138.00* Scott Electric No Bid

AWARD Voss Lighting $                    140.64* *** AWARD Voss Lighting $                 1, 378.80**

WESCO Distribution $                    162.24* WESCO Distribution $                  1,714.58**

Vendor Group 1/Brand Bid Group 3/Brand Bid Group 4/Brand Bid

Crescent Electric GE GE GE

Graybar GE GE GE

Scott Electric No Bid Wiko No Bid

Voss Lighting Philips Eiko Eiko

WESCO Distribution Philips Eiko Eiko

No Bid

Philips Advance

Philips Advance

Group 1 Group 2

Group 3 Group 4

*** Awarded as an overall low.

* Items 2 & 3 not included in cost evaluation due to not 
all bidders provided a price for these items

**Item 5 not included in cost evaluation due to not all 
bidders provided a price for this item

Group 2/Brand Bid 

GE

GE
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3937 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 04/03/12

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 F28T8/XLSPX50ECO| T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 32400 20.15$     75% 5.04$      163,296.00$  GE
2 F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32W Bipin Base 3852 9.40$      75% 2.35$      9,052.20$      GE
3 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34W Med Bipin Base 2550 6.67$      75% 1.67$      4,258.50$      GE
4 F40C50/ECO| T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 1090 10.43$     75% 2.61$      2,844.90$      GE
5 F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 972 9.40$      75% 2.35$      2,284.20$      GE
6 F28T8/XLSPX41ECO| T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 648 20.15$     75% 5.04$      3,265.92$      GE
7 45R20/RVL-PK1/6| R20 45W Medium Base CC-6 534 14.64$     75% 3.66$      1,954.44$      GE
8 F5BX/827/ECO| Twin Tube 5W (G23) 400 7.66$      75% 1.92$      768.00$         GE
9 F17T8/SPX35/ECO| T8 17W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 384 17.24$     75% 4.31$      1,655.04$      GE

10 F13DBX/835/ECO4P| Quad Tube 13W G24q-1 370 18.33$     75% 4.58$      1,694.60$      GE
11 F26DBX/841/ECO4P| Quad Tube 26W G24q-3 350 24.39$     75% 6.10$      2,135.00$      GE
12 65R/FL/RVL PQ1/6 120| 65W Reveal Reflector Lamp 277 14.55$     75% 3.64$      1,008.28$      GE
13 57A/IF-PROLINE| Incandescent A-line 264 1.78$      75% 0.45$      118.80$         GE
14 F32T8/SPX35/ECO|T8 ECOWX SPX35 T8 32W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 252 13.74$     75% 3.44$      866.88$         GE
15 F40N/ECO|FLOURESCENT T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 210 11.01$     75% 2.75$      577.50$         GE

TOTALS 195,780.26$  

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 GE232MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 468 60.88$     75.50% 14.92$    6,982.56$      GE
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 320 67.30$     75.50% 16.49$    5,276.80$      GE
3 GE232MAX-L/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 210 60.88$     75.50% 14.92$    3,133.20$      GE
4 GE432MAX-N/ULTRA-MINI CAN| Electronic Ballast 148 71.94$     75.50% 17.63$    2,609.24$      GE
5 GE-232-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 140 54.93$     75.50% 13.46$    1,884.40$      GE

TOTALS 19,886.20$    

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 FDV Projector Light 24 24.52$     37.20% 15.40$    369.60$         GE
2 Q100CL/MC/2V  A/V-SSTV Lamp 10 41.42$     75.00% 10.36$    103.60$         GE
3 ELZ  A/V-SSTV Lamp 4 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

TOTALS 473.20$         

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 7414Y Mini Lamp 72 12.54$     41.80% 7.30$      525.60$         GE
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4  Wedge Lamp 2530 0.60$      41.80% 0.35$      885.50$         GE
3 TEL/24PSB-UNIT Eiko Miniature lamp 10 1.57$      41.80% 0.91$      9.10$             GE
4 44 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.46$      41.80% 0.27$      2.70$             GE
5 7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

TOTALS 1,422.90$      

Price List #  9200D

Group 2 - Ballast

Group 4 - Lamps, Miniature

Date:  12/01/11

Date:  11/07/11

Date:  08/01/11

Date:  08/01/11

Vendor:  Crescent

Price List #  M5200D

Price List #  BAL7200D

Group 3 - Lamps, Special

Price List #  PH3200D

Group 1 - Lamps
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3937 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 04/03/12

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 F28T8/XLSPX50ECO| T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 32400 20.15 68.50% 6.35$       205,650.90$  GE
2 F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32W Bipin Base 3852 9.4 68.50% 2.96$       11,405.77$    GE
3 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34W Med Bipin Base 2550 6.67 68.50% 2.10$       5,357.68$      GE
4 F40C50/ECO| T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 1090 10.43 68.50% 3.29$       3,581.14$      GE
5 F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 972 9.4 68.50% 2.96$       2,878.09$      GE
6 F28T8/XLSPX41ECO| T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 648 20.15 68.50% 6.35$       4,113.02$      GE
7 45R20/RVL-PK1/6| R20 45W Medium Base CC-6 534 14.64 68.50% 4.61$       2,462.59$      GE
8 F5BX/827/ECO| Twin Tube 5W (G23) 400 7.66 68.50% 2.41$       965.16$         GE
9 F17T8/SPX35/ECO| T8 17W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 384 20.42 68.50% 6.43$       2,470.00$      GE

10 F13DBX/835/ECO4P| Quad Tube 13W G24q-1 370 17.74 68.50% 5.59$       2,067.60$      GE
11 F26DBX/841/ECO4P| Quad Tube 26W G24q-3 350 22.15 68.50% 6.98$       2,442.04$      GE
12 65R/FL/RVL PQ1/6 120| 65W Reveal Reflector Lamp 277 14.55 68.50% 4.58$       1,269.56$      GE
13 57A/IF-PROLINE| Incandescent A-line 264 1.78 68.50% 0.56$       148.02$         GE
14 F32T8/SPX35/ECO|T8 ECOWX SPX35 T8 32W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 252 13.74 68.50% 4.33$       1,090.68$      GE
15 F40N/ECO|FLOURESCENT T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 210 11.01 68.50% 3.47$       728.31$         GE

TOTALS 246,630.57$ 

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 GE232MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 468 60.88 69% 18.87$     8,832.47$      GE
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 320 67.3 69% 20.86$     6,676.16$      GE
3 GE232MAX-L/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 210 60.88 69% 18.87$     3,963.29$      GE
4 GE432MAX-N/ULTRA-MINI CAN| Electronic Ballast 148 71.94 69% 22.30$     3,300.61$      GE
5 GE-232-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 140 54.93 69% 17.03$     2,383.96$      GE

TOTALS 25,156.49$   

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 FDV Projector Light 24 24.52 35.20% 15.89$     381.34$         GE
2 ESN  A/V-SSTV Lamp 10 35.20% -$        -$               GE
3 ELZ  A/V-SSTV Lamp 4 20.19 35.20% 13.08$     52.33$           GE

TOTALS 433.67$        

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 7414Y Mini Lamp 72 12.54 39.30% 7.61$       548.05$         GE
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4  Wedge Lamp 2530 0.6 39.30% 0.36$       921.43$         GE
3 24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 1.05 39.30% 0.64$       6.37$             GE
4 44 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.46 39.30% 0.28$       2.79$             GE
5 7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 1.06 39.30% 0.64$       321.71$         GE

TOTALS 1,800.35$     

Vendor: Graybar

Group 3 - Lamps, Special

Price List #  M3400

Group 1 - Lamps

Price List #  M1000

Group 2 - Ballast

Group 4 - Lamps, Miniature

Date:  12/01/11

Date:  08/01/11

Date:  08/01/11

Date:  11/07/11

Price List #  M2000

Price List #  M6100
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3937 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 04/03/12

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 F28T8/XLSPX50ECO| T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 32400
2 F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32W Bipin Base 3852
3 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34W Med Bipin Base 2550
4 F40C50/ECO| T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 1090
5 F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 972
6 F28T8/XLSPX41ECO| T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 648
7 45R20/RVL-PK1/6| R20 45W Medium Base CC-6 534
8 F5BX/827/ECO| Twin Tube 5W (G23) 400
9 F17T8/SPX35/ECO| T8 17W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 384

10 F13DBX/835/ECO4P| Quad Tube 13W G24q-1 370
11 F26DBX/841/ECO4P| Quad Tube 26W G24q-3 350
12 65R/FL/RVL PQ1/6 120| 65W Reveal Reflector Lamp 277
13 57A/IF-PROLINE| Incandescent A-line 264
14 F32T8/SPX35/ECO|T8 ECOWX SPX35 T8 32W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 252
15 F40N/ECO|FLOURESCENT T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 210

TOTALS 0.00

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 GE232MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 468
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 320
3 GE232MAX-L/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 210
4 GE432MAX-N/ULTRA-MINI CAN| Electronic Ballast 148
5 GE-232-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 140

TOTALS 0.00

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 FDV Projector Light 24 6.05 5% 5.75 138 Wiko
2 ESN  A/V-SSTV Lamp 10 10.05 5% 9.55 95.5 Wiko
3 ELZ  A/V-SSTV Lamp 4 7.08 5% 6.73 26.92 Wiko

TOTALS 260.42

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 7414Y Mini Lamp 72
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4  Wedge Lamp 2530
3 24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10
4 44 Eiko Miniature lamp 10
5 7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500

TOTALS 0.00

Vendor: Scott Electric

Group 3 - Lamps, Special

Price List #  SW-1

Group 1 - Lamps

Price List #  

Group 2 - Ballast

Group 4 - Lamps, Miniature

Date:  

1/1/2012

Date:  

Date:  

Price List #  

Price List #  
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Buyer : Mary Lanning 3937 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 04/03/12

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 F28T8/XLSPX50ECO|///F28T8/XLSPX50ECO T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 32400 34.86$     92% 2.79$      90,396.00$   PHILIPS
2 F32T8/SP41/ECO  ///  F32T8TL741ALTO T8 32W Bipin Base 3852 12.06$     87.6% 1.50$      5,778.00$     PHILIPS
3 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP  /// F34CWRSWEAL T12 34W Med Bipin Base 2550 0.98$      2,499.00$     PHILIPS
4 F40C50/ECO /// F40C50 T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 1090 17.51$     86.50% 2.36$      2,572.40$     PHILIPS
5 F32T8/SP35/ECO ///  F32T8TL735ALTO T8 Bipin Base 972 12.06$     87.6% 1.50$      1,458.00$     PHILIPS
6 F28T8/XLSPX41ECO ///  PHLF32T8ADV841EWALTO  2 T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 648 34.86$     92% 2.79$      1,807.92$     PHILIPS
7 45R20/RVL-PK1 /// 50R20/FL/NTL R20 45W Medium Base CC-6 534 19.41$     71% 5.63$      3,006.42$     PHILIPS
8 F5BX/827/ECO ///   PLS5W827ALTO Twin Tube 5W (G23) 400 14.72$     89% 1.62$      648.00$        PHILIPS
9 F17T8/SPX35/ECO ///   F17T8TL835ALTO T8 17W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 384 26.33$     87% 3.42$      1,313.28$     PHILIPS

10 F13DBX/835/ECO4P ///   PLC13W8354PALTO Quad Tube 13W G24q-1 370 9.74$      3,603.80$     PHILIPS
11 F26DBX/835/ECO/4P ///  PLC26W8354PALTO Quad Tube 26W G24q-3 350 3.61$      1,263.50$     PHILIPS
12 65R/FL/RVL PQ1/6 120 ///  65BR30FL55  12/1 65W Reveal Reflector Lamp 277 19.28$     71% 5.59$      1,548.43$     PHILIPS
13 57A/IF-PROLINE ///  PHL5 57 A Incandescent A-line 264 1.94$      86.50% 0.26$      68.64$          PHILIPS
14 F32T8/SPX35/ECO|T8 ECOWX SPX35 /// PHLF32T8TL8 T8 32W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 252 17.01$     87% 2.21$      556.92$        PHILIPS
15 F40N/ECO|FLOURESCENT  /// F40T12/835 ALTO T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 210 13.51$     86.50% 1.82$      382.20$        PHILIPS

TOTALS 116,902.51$ 

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 GE232MAX-N/ULTRA ///  ADVIOPA2P32N35I Electronic Ballast 468 8.89$      4,160.52$     PHILIPS/ADVANCE
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINET8 /// ADVICN4P32N35I Electronic Ballast 320 11.36$    3,635.20$     PHILIPS/ADVANCE
3 GE232MAX-L/ULTRA /// IOPA2P32LWN35I Electronic Ballast 210 8.89$      1,866.90$     PHILIPS/ADVANCE
4 GE432MAX-N/ULTRA-MINI CAN /// ADVIOPA4P32SC35 Electronic Ballast 148 10.98$    1,625.04$     PHILIPS/ADVANCE
5 GE-232-120-N|PROLINET8 /// ADVICN2P32N35I Electronic Ballast 140 8.65$      1,211.00$     PHILIPS/ADVANCE

TOTALS 12,498.66$   

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 FDV Projector Light 24 16.75$     65% 5.86$      140.64$        EIKO
2 ESN  A/V-SSTV Lamp 10 16.20$     65% 5.67$      56.70$          EIKO
3 ELZ  A/V-SSTV Lamp 4 51.58$     65% 18.05$    72.20$          EIKO

TOTALS 269.54$        

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 7414Y  NOT LISTED IN EIKO PRICE SHEET Mini Lamp 72 NETTED 10.95$    788.40$        GE
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4  Wedge Lamp 2530 0.52$      55% 0.23$      581.90$        EIKO
3 24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 1.41$      55% 0.64$      6.40$           EIKO
4 44 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.46$      55% 0.21$      2.10$           EIKO
5 7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 1.00$      55% 0.45$      225.00$        EIKO

TOTALS 1,603.80$     

AWARD
Vendor: Voss

Price List #  ELP2011

Price List #  ELP2005 MIN-SB

Price List #  PS100U//PS100UEXCEL

Price List #  164CC

Group 1 - Lamps

Date:  05/01/05

Date:  11/01/11

Date:  05/16/11

Date:  11/15/11

Group 4 - Lamps, Miniature

Group 2 - Ballast

Group 3 - Lamps, Special
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3937 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 04/03/12

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 F28T8/XLSPX50ECO|///F32T8/ADV850/EW/ALTO 2 T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 32400 2.90        93,960.00$     Philips
2 F32T8/SP41/ECO|///F32T8/TL741/ALTO T8 32W Bipin Base 3852 2.65        10,207.80$     Philips
3 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP///F34CW/RS/EW T12 34W Med Bipin Base 2550 0.70        1,785.00$       Philips
4 F40C50/ECO|///F40C50 T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 1090 3.00        3,270.00$       Philips
5 F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP///F32T8/TL735ALTO T8 Bipin Base 972 1.50        1,458.00$       Philips
6 F28T8/XLSPX41ECO|///F32T8/ADV841/EW/ALTO T8 28W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 648 2.90        1,879.20$       Philips
7 45R20/RVL-PK1/6|///45R20LLL 120 V R20 45W Medium Base CC-6 534 1.40        747.60$          Philips
8 F5BX/827/ECO|///PL-S5W827/2P/ALTO Twin Tube 5W (G23) 400 1.45        580.00$          Philips
9 F17T8/SPX35/ECO|///F17T8/TL835/ALTO T8 17W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 384 2.70        1,036.80$       Philips

10 F13DBX/835/ECO4P|///PL-C13W/35/4P/ALTO Quad Tube 13W G24q-1 370 3.60        1,332.00$       Philips
11 F26DBX/841/ECO4P|///PL-C 26W/35/4P/ALTO Quad Tube 26W G24q-3 350 3.85        1,347.50$       Philips
12 65R/FL/RVL PQ1/6 120|///65BR30/FL55 CDA 130V 65W Reveal Reflector Lamp 277 1.85        512.45$          Philips
13 57A/IF-PROLINE|///57A 130V 48/1 Incandescent A-line 264 0.40        105.60$          Philips
14 F32T8/SPX35/ECO|T8 ECOWX SPX35///F32T8/TL8 T8 32W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 252 2.35        592.20$          Philips
15 F40N/ECO|FLOURESCENT///F40T12/ADV835/ALTO T12 40W Medium Bi-Pin (G13) 210 3.60        756.00$          Philips

TOTALS 119,570.15$   

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 GE232MAX-N/ULTRA|///IOP2P32SC Electronic Ballast 468 11.22$    5,250.96$       Advance
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINET8///ICN4932NN351 Electronic Ballast 320 12.80$    4,096.00$       Advance
3 GE232MAX-L/ULTRA|///IOP2P32LWSC Electronic Ballast 210 11.22$    2,356.20$       Advance
4 GE432MAX-N/ULTRA-MINI CAN///IOP4P32SC| Electronic Ballast 148 13.10$    1,938.80$       Advance
5 GE-232-120-N|PROLINET8///ICN2P32N351 Electronic Ballast 140 9.70$      1,358.00$       Advance

TOTALS 14,999.96$     

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 FDV Projector Light 24 16.89$     60% 6.76$      162.24$          EIKO
2 ESN  A/V-SSTV Lamp 10 16.32$     60% 6.53$      65.30$            EIKO
3 ELZ  A/V-SSTV Lamp 4 17.73$     60% 7.09$      28.36$            EIKO

TOTALS 255.90$          

Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price Ext Price Brand
1 7414Y Mini Lamp 72 24.35$     60% 9.74$      701.28$          EIKO
2 85 28V .04A T1-3/4  Wedge Lamp 2530 0.99$      60% 0.40$      999.35$          EIKO
3 24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 2.70$      60% 1.08$      10.80$            EIKO
4 44 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.79$      60% 0.32$      3.15$              EIKO
5 7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 1.90$      60% 0.76$      380.50$          EIKO

TOTALS 2,095.08$       

Vendor: Wesco

Group 3 - Lamps, Special

Price List #  EIKO PRICE SHEET

Group 1 - Lamps

Price List #  PS-100-D

Group 2 - Ballast

Group 4 - Lamps, Miniature

Date:  04/02/12

Date:  04/02/12

Date:  05/16/11

Date:  11/15/11

Price List #  EIKO PRICE SHEET

Price List #  163C
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