
 

 
 

Rejection of Bids 
 

 
Date:  May 3, 2012  
 
To:  All Bidders  
 
From:  Michelle Musick, Buyer 

State Purchasing Bureau  
 
RE:  Invitation to Bid (ITB) 3928 OF  

 

 
 
The State of Nebraska is rejecting all bids received on the above referenced Invitation to Bid for 
Carbonless Paper. 
 
Your firm will be given the opportunity to participate when new proposals are solicited. 
Thank you for your interest in doing business with the State of Nebraska. 
 



Buyer: Michelle Musick 3928 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/26/12

Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporattion Xpedx

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1 DIGITAL - 2PT Strt/Rev 8.5x11 180 M $11.57 $20.33 $13.85 $23.49 
2 DIGITAL - 2PT Strt/Rev 8.5x14 5 M $14.70 $25.65 $17.546 $29.58 
3 DIGITAL - 2PT Strt/Rev 11x17 5 M $22.90 $42.63 $27.70 $46.77 
4 DIGITAL - 3PT Straight 8.5x11 560 M $13.00 $21.09 $14.4511 $24.08 
5 DIGITAL - 3PT Straight 8.5x14 5 M $16.52 $27.02 $17.8144 $30.77 
6 DIGITAL - 3PT Straight 11x17 110 M $25.81 $44.29 $30.8303 $48.38 
7 DIGITAL - 3PT Straight 9x11perfd 5 M $13.20 $21.09  No Bid $37.76 
8 DIGITAL - 4PT Straight 8.5x11 10 M $13.90 $22.59 $15.844 $25.74 
9 DIGITAL - 4PT Reverse 8.5x11 5 M $13.90 $22.59 $15.844 $25.74 

10 DIGITAL - 4PT Straight 8.5x14 5 M $17.67 $28.89  No Bid $32.29 
11 DIGITAL CB WHITE 8.5x11 5 M $12.92 $20.74 $13.052 $24.18 
12 DIGITAL CFB WHITE 8.5x11 5 M $15.70 $25.24 $16.632 $12.54 
13 DIGITAL CFB CANARY 8.5x11 5 M $15.87 $25.60 $16.79 $27.81 
14 DIGITAL CF CANARY 8.5x11 5 M $9.45 $15.40 $10.332 $21.80 
15 DIGITAL CF PINK 8.5x11 5 M $9.45 $15.40 $10.332 $21.80 

20# coated back: white, 8.5x11
carbonless paper, uncollated
20# coated back: color, 8.5x11
carbonless paper, uncollated
20# coated back: white, 8.5x14
carbonless paper, uncollated
20# coated back: color, 8.5x14
carbonless paper, uncollated
20# coated back: white, 11x17
carbonless paper, uncollated
20# CB: white, 17.5x22.5
coated back carbonless paper
20# CB: white, 22.5x34.5
coated back carbonless paper
20# CB: color, 22.5x34.5
coated back carbonless paper
20# CB: white, 28.5x34.5
coated back carbonless paper

$13.90 

$14.08 

$17.80 

$18.01 

$27.81 

$31.61 

$116.62 

$118.02 

$147.53 

Li
ne

 # Carbonless Paper

16 75 M

M

19 5 M

18 5 M

17 27

21

$13.052 

$13.74 

$12.92 $13.58 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

$13.09 

$16.57 $17.60  No Bid 

$16.36 $17.38 

$110.69 

$57.62 15 M $56.40 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

$115.24  No Bid 

22 5 M $109.24 $113.87  No Bid 

20 5 M $25.83 $27.15 

$144.07  No Bid 

23

24 5 M $139.22 

5 M
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Buyer: Michelle Musick 3928 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/26/12

Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporattion Xpedx

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit PriceLi
ne

 # Carbonless Paper

20# CFB: white, 8.5x11
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: color, 8.5x11
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: white, 8.5x14
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: color, 8.5x14
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: white, 11x17
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: color, 11x17
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: white, 17.5x22.5
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: color, 17.5x22.5
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: white, 22.5x34.5
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: color, 22.5x34.5
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: white, 28.5x34.5
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CFB: color, 28.5x34.5
coated front & back carbonless 
20# CF: white, 8.5x11
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: color, 8.5x11
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: white, 8.5x14
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: color, 8.5x14
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: white, 11x17
coated front carbonless paper

$142.44 

$178.42 

$180.19 

$9.95 

$10.13 

$12.73 

$12.97 

$19.89 

$16.85 

$17.01 

$21.56 

$22.06 

$33.69 

$34.02 

$71.37 

$72.08 

$141.03 

M $18.58 

$12.43 M $11.75 

$19.43  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

38 70 M $9.45 $9.89  No Bid 

$9.71 

40 5 M $11.97 $12.66  No Bid 

39 5

 No Bid 

36 9 M $169.92 $175.96  No Bid 

35 5 $174.22 M $168.08 

M $68.01 

 No Bid 

34 5 M $135.51 $139.08  No Bid 

25 5 M

29 5 M

28 5 M  No Bid $20.17 $21.26 

 No Bid 

$16.632 

M $15.87 

27 5 M $19.96 

35

$31.43 

26

$32.90  No Bid 

30 5 M $31.75 $33.23  No Bid 

40 M $9.29 

41 5

 No Bid 

32 5 M $68.72 $70.38  No Bid 

31 5 $69.69 

 No Bid 

$16.45 

$16.61 

$15.70 

$21.05 

33 5 M $134.08 $137.72 

37
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Buyer: Michelle Musick 3928 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/26/12

Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporattion Xpedx

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit PriceLi
ne

 # Carbonless Paper

20# CF: white, 11x17
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: white, 17.5x22.5
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: color, 17.5x22.5
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: white, 22.5x34.5
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: color, 22.5x34.5
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: white, 28.5x34.5
coated front carbonless paper
20# CF: color, 28.5x34.5
coated front carbonless paper
Straight & reverse; 8.5x11
pre-coll carbonless 20# 2-part
Straight & reverse; 8.5x14
pre-coll carbonless 20# 2-part
Straight & reverse; 11x17
pre-coll carbonless 20# 2-part
Straight & reverse; 17.5x22.5
pre-coll carbonless 20# 2-part
Straight & reverse; 22.5x34.5
pre-coll carbonless 20# 2-part
Straight & reverse; 28.5x34.5
pre-coll carbonless 20# 2-part

55 2-part reverse 20#, 8.5x11 5 M $11.57 $12.05 $13.85 $12.34 
56 3-part straight 20#, 8.5x11 5 M $13.00 $13.60 $14.4511 $13.94 
57 3-part reverse 20#, 8.5x11 960 M $13.00 $13.60 $14.4511 $13.94 
58 3-part reverse 20#, 8.5x14 110 M $16.63 $17.42  No Bid $17.84 
59 3-part straight 20#, 11x17 12 M $25.81 $27.23  No Bid $27.87 
60 3-part reverse 20#, 11x17 130 M $25.81 $27.23 $60.8303 $27.87 
61 3-part straight 20#, 17.5x22.5 35 M $55.75 $57.77  No Bid $59.16 

$52.47 

$103.70 

$131.18 

$42.38 

$43.16 

$83.76 

$85.30 

$105.96 

$107.91 

$12.34 

$15.81 

$24.70 

$20.26 

$128.10  No Bid 54 5 M $124.04 

52 145 M $49.64 $51.24 

51 1,400 M $22.90 $24.11 

 No Bid 

53 5 M $97.99 $101.26  No Bid 

48 5 M $102.39 $105.38 

$27.70 

50 15

49 135 M $11.57 $12.05 $13.85 

$17.546 $15.42 M $14.70 

$81.80 

42 10 M $18.91 $19.78 

 No Bid 

47 5

 No Bid 

46 5 M $80.36 $83.30  No Bid 

 No Bid 

45 5 M $78.93 

$103.47 M $100.56 

 No Bid 

44 15 M $41.48 $42.15  No Bid 

43 5 $41.39 M $40.74 

 No Bid 
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Buyer: Michelle Musick 3928 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  03/26/12

Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporattion Xpedx

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit PriceLi
ne

 # Carbonless Paper

62 3-part reverse 20#, 17.5x22.5 235 M $55.75 $57.77  No Bid $59.16 
63 3-part straight 20#, 22.5x34.5 5 M $110.11 $114.17  No Bid $116.90 
64 3-part reverse 20#, 22.5x34.5 5 M $110.11 $114.17  No Bid $116.90 
65 3-part reverse 20#, 28.5x34.5 5 M $139.37 $144.42  No Bid $147.89 
66 4-part reverse 20#, 8.5x11 300 M $13.90 $14.54 $15.844 $14.89 
67 4-part reverse 20#, 8.5x14 42 M $17.67 $18.62  No Bid $19.06 
68 4-part straight 20#, 11x17 10 M $27.59 $29.10  No Bid $29.80 
69 4-part reverse 20#, 11x17 15 M $27.59 $29.10 $32.992 $29.80 
70 4-part reverse 20#, 17.5x22.5 5 M $59.56 $61.70  No Bid $63.19 
71 4-part reverse 20#, 17.5x22.5 45 M $59.56 $61.70  No Bid $63.19 
72 4-part straight 20#, 22.5x34.5 5 M $117.63 $121.94  No Bid $124.87 
73 4-part reverse 20#, 22.5x34.5 5 M $117.63 $121.94  No Bid $124.87 
74 5-part reverse 20#, 8.5x11 20 M $14.29 $14.94 $16.306 $15.29 
75 5-part reverse 20#, 8.5x14 5 M $18.21 $19.12  No Bid $19.58 
76 5-part reverse 20#, 11x17 5 M $28.59 $29.87  No Bid $30.59 
77 5-part reverse 20#, 17.5x22.5 10 M $61.32 $63.34  No Bid $64.89 
78 6-part reverse 20#, 8.5x11 60 M $14.71 $15.37 $19.568 $15.74 
79 Tag manilla, CF1S, 22.5x34.5 5 M $258.30 $244.11 $344.05* $249.99 
80 Tag manilla, CF1S, 28.5x34.5 5 M $333.68 $310.16 $422.875* $317.63 
81 Tag white, 7.5 pt, 28.5x34.5 5 M $327.05 $310.16  $422.875* $317.63 
82 Tag white, CF1S, 22.5x34.5 5 M $258.30 $244.11  $344.05* $249.99 
83 Carbonless fan-apart adhesive 70 QT $20.25 $21.51 $17.08 $21.64 
84 Tag manilla, CF, 7.5 pt, 8.5X11 5 M $30.36 $29.56 $43.028 $29.99 
85 Tag white, CF, 7.5 pt, 8.5x11 5 M $30.36 $29.56 $43.028 $29.99 

1% 10/Net 30 days 1% 30 days Net 30 days n/a
1 to 5 2-7 days 3-5 days 1 day

* lines 79-82 have 400 
sheets/carton

No Bid:
RR Donnelley

Quill

Payment Terms

Comments

Delivery Days ARE
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