
Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

4# 2, 4-D LV In 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       18.80  $     3,760.00  $       18.37  $    3,674.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

6# 2, 4-D LV in 30 Gal Barrel No Bid  $       23.30  $     8,737.50  $       23.54  $    8,827.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Hi-Dep (No Aubstitute) in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       21.85  $     2,185.00  $       21.09  $    2,109.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers No Bid  $       43.05  $     2,152.50  $       45.87  $    2,293.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       43.05  $     4,305.00  $       45.87  $    4,587.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, etc) 
in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       24.90  $   19,920.00  $       27.49  $  21,992.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, 
etc.) in 30 Gal Containers No Bid  $       24.90  $     7,470.00  $       27.49  $    8,247.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Cimarron, MFG by Dupont in Available 
Containers No Bid  $         4.60  $        460.00  $         4.49  $       449.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

AWARD AWARD AWARD

Chemicals
Li

ne
 #

Hi Dep 2.5 Gal.

All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 
Timberland Division

Van Diest Supply 
Company

1 200 GL

2 GL

Weedone LV 4# 2.5 Gal.

Weedone LV 6# 30 Drum

7

8

375

3

100 GL

Kearney Area

4

5

6

100 GL

50 GL

GL

300 GL

100 OZ

800

Tordon 22K 1 Gal.

Tordon 22K 1 Gal.

Grazon P&D 2.5 Gal.

Grazon P&D 30 Gal.

Escort XP 2 Oz. to 64 Oz. 
Cont.

Weedone LV4 (2.5 gal) 
Limited Supply

Corn Belt 6#LV (30's) 
Limited Supply

2.5 gal

Tordon 22K (4 x 1)

Tordon 22K (2.5 gal)

Grazon P+D (2.5 gal)

Grazon P+D (30's)

Escort (8oz or 2 oz)
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Metsulfuron Methyl in Available 
Containers No Bid  $         2.85  $        285.00  $         4.49  $       449.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $     116.00  $     1,160.00  $     115.97  $    1,159.70 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 QT 
Containers No Bid  $       56.00  $        896.00  $       39.97  $       639.52 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Methylated Seed Oil in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       10.60  $     5,300.00  $       12.97  $    6,485.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Overdrive or Generic in 7.5 LB 
Containers No Bid  $       28.90  $     4,335.00  $       29.97  $    4,495.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $     299.73  $     7,493.25  $     299.73  $    7,493.25 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 1 QT 
Containers No Bid  $       76.22  $     1,829.28  $       76.22  $    1,829.28 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       45.90  $   11,475.00  $       46.49  $  11,622.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

9 100 OZ

10 GL

11

12

13

16

500

150

10

GL

LB

QT

Metcel VMF 16 Oz. Bottle

Plateau 1 Gal. Cont.

Panoramic 1 QT Cont.

MSO (Loveland Products) 
2.5 Gal

Overdirve 7.5 LB Cont.

Escort (8oz or 2 oz)

Panoramic (1 gal)

Panoramic (qts)

Sunwet (2.5 gal)

Overdrive (7.5#)

25

24

250

GL

QT

GL

14

15

16

Milestone 2.5 Gal. 2.5 gal

Milestone 1 QT Cont. qts

Forefront 2.5 Gal. Cont. 2.5 gal
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Chaparrral, MFG by Dow in 5 LB 
Containers No Bid  $       73.85  $     1,846.25  $       74.09  $    1,852.25 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Chaparral, MFG by Dow in 1.25 LB 
Containers No Bid  $       73.85  $     1,846.25  $       74.09  $    1,852.25 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Pronone Power Pills in Available 
Containers No Bid  $       47.38  $     9,476.00  $       46.72  $    9,344.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

4# 2, 4-D LV In 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       18.80  $     3,760.00  $       18.37  $    3,674.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

6# 2, 4-D LV in 30 Gal Barrel No Bid  $       23.30  $     8,737.50  $       23.54  $    8,827.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Hi-Dep (No Substitute) in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       21.85  $     2,185.00  $       21.09  $    2,109.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers No Bid  $       43.05  $     2,152.50  $       45.87  $    2,293.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       43.05  $     4,305.00  $       45.87  $    4,587.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

25 LB

25

200

200

375

100

50

Wayne/Creston/Norfolk Area

LB

LB

GL

100

GL

GL

GL

GL

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

Chaparral 5 LB Cont. 5 #

Chaparral 1.25 LB Cont. 1.25 #

Pronone Power Pellets 5.5 
LB Cont.

5.5#

Weedone LV #4 2.5 Gal. 
Cont.

Weedone LV4 (2.5 gal) 
Limited Supply

Tordon 22K (2.5 gal)

CB 6# LV (30's)Weedone LV 6# 30 Drum

Hi Dep 2.5 Gal. Cont. 2.5 gal

Tordon 22K 1 Gal. Cont. Tordon 22K (1 gal)

Tordon 22K 2.5 Gal. Cont.
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, 
etc.) in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       24.90  $   19,920.00  $       27.49  $  21,992.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, etc) 
in 30 Gal Containers No Bid  $       24.90  $     7,470.00  $       27.49  $    8,247.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Cimarron, MFG by Dupont in Available 
Containers No Bid  $         4.60  $        460.00  $         4.49  $       449.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Metsulfuron Methyl in Available 
Containers No Bid  $         2.85  $        285.00  $         4.49  $       449.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $     116.00  $     1,160.00  $     115.97  $    1,159.70 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 QT 
Containers No Bid  $       56.00  $        896.00  $       39.97  $       639.52 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Methylated Seed Oil in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       10.60  $     5,300.00  $       12.97  $    6,485.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Overdrive or Generic in 7.5 LB 
Containers No Bid  $       28.90  $     4,335.00  $       29.97  $    4,495.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

800

300

100

100

10

GL

GL

OZ

OZ

GL

25

26

27

28

29

16

500

150

QT

GL

LB

30

31

32

Grazon P+D (2.5 gal)

Grazon P+D (30's)

Escort (8oz or 2 oz)

Grazon P&D 2.5 Gal. Cont.

Grazon P&D 30 Gal. Drum

Escort XP 2 Oz. to 64 Oz. 
Cont.

Metcel VMF 16 Oz. Cont. Escort (8oz or 2 oz)

Plateau 1 Gal. Cont.

Panoramic 1 QT Cont.

MSO (Loveland Products) 
2.5 Gal

Overdirve 7.6 LB Cont.

Panoramic (1 gal)

Panoramic (qts)

7.5 #

Sunwet (2.5 gal)
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Milestone, MFG by Dow in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $     299.73  $     7,493.25  $     299.73  $    7,493.25 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 1 QT 
Containers No Bid  $       76.22  $     1,829.28  $       76.22  $    1,829.28 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       45.90  $   11,475.00  $       46.49  $  11,622.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Chaparral, MFG by Dow in 5 LB 
Containers No Bid  $       73.85  $     1,846.25  $       74.09  $    1,852.25 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Chaparral, MFG by Dow in 1.25 LB 
Containers No Bid  $       73.85  $     1,846.25  $       74.09  $    1,852.25 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Pronone Power Pills in Available 
Containers No Bid  $       47.38  $     9,476.00  $       46.72  $    9,344.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 2.5 Gal Containers  $       60.00  $     6,000.00  $       43.05  $     4,305.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers  $       60.00  $     3,000.00  $       43.05  $     2,152.50 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

5 #Chaparral 5 LB Cont.

Chaparral 1.25 LB Cont.

Pronone Power Pellets 5.5 
LB Cont.

Tordon 22K 2.5 Gal. Cont.

Tordon 22K 1 Gal. Cont.

1.25 #

5.5 #

Milestone 2.5 Gal. Cont. 2.5 gal

Milestone 1 QT Cont. qts

Forefront 2.5 Gal. Cont. 2.5 gal

Tordon 22K

Tordon 22K

Broken Bow Area

39

40

33

34

35

36

37

38

50 GL

24 QT

25 GL

250 GL

25

GL

LB

25 LB

200 LB

100
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, 
etc.) in 2.5 Gal Containers  $       23.80  $   17,850.00  $       24.90  $   18,675.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
HI-Dep (No Substitute) in 2.5 Gal 
Containers  $       26.30  $     6,575.00  $       21.85  $     5,462.50 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 2.5 Gal 
Containers  $     300.00  $   15,000.00  $     299.73  $   14,986.50 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 1 QT 
Containers  $       76.25  $     2,135.00  $       76.22  $     2,134.16 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 Gal 
Containers  $     175.00  $     2,625.00  $     116.00  $     1,740.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 QT 
Containers  $       85.00  $     1,020.00  $       56.00  $        672.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers  $       60.00  $     4,500.00  $       45.90  $     3,442.50 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Methylated Seed Oil in 2.5 Gal 
Containers  $       33.00  $     1,650.00  $       10.60  $        530.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

50 GL48

Forefront 2.5 Gal. Cont.

MSO 2.5 Gal. Cont.

Grazon P&D 2.5 Gal. Cont.

Hi Dep 2.5 Gal. Cont.

Milestone 2.5 Gal. Cont.

Milestone 1 QT Cont.

Plateau 1 Gal. Cont.

Panoramic 1 QT Cont.

HI-Dep

Grazon P&D
41

Destiny HC

Forefront

Panoramic

Panoramic

Milestone

Milestone

46 12 QT

47 75 GL

QT

GL

42

43

44

45

750

250

50

28

15

GL

GL

GL
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Overdrive or Generic in 7.5 LB 
Containers  $       45.00  $     6,750.00  $       28.90  $     4,335.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Crossbow in 1 Gal Containers  $       42.00  $        420.00  $       36.40  $        364.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Dicamba in 2.5 Gal Containers  $       35.00  $     1,750.00  $       27.00  $     1,350.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       43.05  $     1,076.25 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers No Bid  $       43.05  $     1,076.25 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       45.90  $     1,377.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Plateau or Generic (Panoramic) in 1 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $     116.00  $     1,160.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $     299.73  $     7,493.25 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Milestone 2.5 Gal.
56 25 GL

Tordon 22K 2.5 Gal.

Tordon 22K 1 Gal.

Forefront 2.5 Gal.  

Plateau 1 Gal.  

Dicamba-WS Rifle 2.5 Gal. Cont.

Bridgeport Area

51

52

30 GL

10 GL

50 GL

25 GL

25 GL53

54

55

150 LB

10 GL
Crossbow

Overdirve 7.6 LB Cont.Overdrive

Crossbow L 1 Gal. Cont.
50

49
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Milestone, MFG by Dow in 1 QT 
Containers No Bid  $       76.22  $     2,134.16 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, 
etc.) in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       24.90  $     2,490.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Dicamba in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       27.00  $     1,350.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
HI-Dep (No Substitute) in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       21.85  $        437.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Methylated Seed Oil in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       10.60  $        212.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

2, 4-D LV in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       18.80  $        940.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Roundup or Generic in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       12.20  $     1,220.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Roundup or Generic in 1 Gal Containers No Bid  $       17.50  $        350.00 No Bid

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Milestone 1 QT Cont.

64

Grazon P&D 2.5 Gal.

Rifle 2.5 Gal. 

Hi Dep 2.5 Gal. Cont.

MSO 2.5 Gal. 

57 28

63 100 GL

61

62

GL

50 GL

50 GL

20 GL

Weedone LV 4# 2.5 Gal.

GL

59

60

QT

58 100

Mad Dog Plust 2.5 Gal.

GL
Razor PRO 1 Gal.

20

20
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       43.05  $     3,228.75  $       45.87  $    3,440.25 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Tordon 22K or Generic (Outpost, 
Triumph) in 1 Gal Containers No Bid  $       43.05  $     1,291.50  $       45.87  $    1,376.10 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
HI-Dep (No Substitute) in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       21.85  $        655.50  $       21.09  $       632.70 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Grazon P&D or Generic (Hired Hand, 
etc.) in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       24.90  $   12,450.00  $       27.49  $  13,745.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

2, 4-D LV in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       18.80  $        940.00  $       18.37  $       918.50 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Milestone, MFG by Dow in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $     299.73  $     5,994.60  $     299.73  $    5,994.60 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Milestone 2.5 Gal.

Weedone LV 4# 2.5 Gal.

GL

50 GL

20 GL70

75 GL

30 GL

30 GL

500

65

66

67

68

69

Hi Dep 2.5 Gal.

Tordon 22K 1 Gal.

McCook Area

2.5 gal

Grazon P+D (2.5 gal)

Tordon 22K 2.5 Gal. Tordon 22K (2.5 gal)

Grazon P&D 2.5 Gal.

Tordon 22K (1 gal)

4# LV

2.5 gal
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Buyer:  Ruth Gray 3923 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:    03/23/12

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

Chemicals
Li

ne
 # All Points Cooperative Crop Production Services, 

Timberland Division
Van Diest Supply 

Company

Milestone, MFG by Dow in 1 QT 
Containers No Bid  $       76.22  $     1,524.40  $       76.22  $    1,524.40 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Roundup or Generic in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       12.20  $        305.00  $       10.04  $       251.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Methylated Seed Oil in 2.5 Gal 
Containers No Bid  $       10.60  $     1,060.00  $       12.97  $    1,297.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Forefront in 2.5 Gal Containers No Bid  $       45.90  $     1,147.50  $       46.49  $    1,162.25 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding
Pronone Power Pills in Available 
Containers No Bid  $       47.38  $     2,369.00  $       46.72  $    2,336.00 

Specify Brand and Container Size 
Bidding

Comments

10

25 GL

Crop Production Services, Timberland Division's bid did not meet the Warehousing 
requirements for the Wayne/Creston/Norfolk area; therefore pricing submitted could 

not be considered for the Wayne/Creston/Norfolk area (Lines 20-38). 

Crop Production Services, Timberland Division's bid did not meet the Warehousing 
requirements for the Broken Bow area; therefore pricing submitted could not be 

considered for the Broken Bow area (Lines 38-51). 

Forefront 2.5 Gal.

MSO 2.5 Gal.
GL

25 GL

20

73

74

100

75 50 LB
Pronone Power Pellets 5.5 

LB Cont.

QT71

72
Mad Dog Plust 2.5 Gal.

Milestone 1 QT Cont.

Net 45 

5.5 #

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Lines 1-19 Hastings Area

qts

Buccaneer Plus (2.5)

Sunwet (2.5 gal)

2.5 gal

7
0

7
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