
Buyer: Michelle Musick 3918 OF

Dept of Roads
Opening Date:  03/20/12

PARTIAL 

AWARD

PARTIAL 

AWARD

PARTIAL 

AWARD
PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Dark Water 

Asphalt

Flint Hills 

Resources, LP

Hills Materials 

Company
Jebro Inc.

Martin Resource 

Management DBA 

Monarch Oil Co.

SimonContractors 

dba Mountain 

States Materials

Vance 

Brothers, 

Inc.

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1 CRS-2P DIST 1 3112.62 TN No Bid  No Bid $613.43 $729.60 $720.00 

2 CRS-2P DIST 3 6621.46 TN No Bid  No Bid $604.10  No Bid 

3 CRS-2P DIST 4 7549.38 TN $578.00  No Bid $618.00  No Bid 

4 CRS-2P DIST 6 2268.25 TN $617.00  No Bid $619.05  No Bid $637.00 

5 CRS-2P DIST 8 2444.00 TN $637.00  No Bid $618.45  No Bid 

6 CRS-2P PLANT PICK UP 50.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $625.00  No Bid $580.00 

7 CRS-2VHL DIST 5 1925.00 TN $627.93 No Bid $621.05  No Bid $704.67 $603.00 

8 CRS-2VHL DIST 7 1550.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $706.27 $626.40 $631.00 

9 CRS-2VHL PLANT PICK UP 50.00 TN $540.75 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $900.00 $569.00 

10 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 1 527.20 TN No Bid  No Bid $282.20 $287.91 

11 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 3 125.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $267.73 $287.91 

12 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 5 225.00 TN $396.18 No Bid $333.10  No Bid $366.40 $338.00 

13 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 6 331.72 TN No Bid  No Bid $323.18 $339.40 $361.00 

14 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 7 200.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $378.63 $349.40 $370.00 

15 CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT PICK UP 50.00 TN $345.82 No Bid $310.00 $300.00 $550.00 $304.00 

16 CSS-1H STRAIGHT DIST 7 75.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $662.41 $542.00 $548.00 

17 CSS-1H STRAIGHT PLANT 25.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $600.00 $600.00 $486.00 

18 HFE-150 DIST 3 50.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $534.41  No Bid 

19 HFE-150 DIST 5 950.00 TN No Bid $560.25 $602.02 No Bid

20 HFE-150 DIST 7 150.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $593.49  No Bid 

21 HFE-150 DIST 8 42.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $553.82  No Bid 

22 HFE-150 PLANT PICK UP 50.00 TN No Bid $545.00 $525.00  No Bid 

23 HFE-300 DIST 3 75.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $554.41  No Bid 

24 HFE-300 DIST 4 878.15 TN No Bid  No Bid $579.52  No Bid 

25 HFE-300 DIST 6 2560.02 TN No Bid  No Bid $607.58  No Bid 

26 HFE-300 DIST 7 1000.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $610.58  No Bid 

27 HFE-300 DIST 8 200.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $576.63  No Bid 

28 HFE-300 PLANT PICK UP 50.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $550.00  No Bid 

29 HFE-500 DIST 5 200.00 TN No Bid $636.67  No Bid  No Bid 

30 HFE-500 PLANT PICK UP 25.00 TN No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

31 HFE-1000 DIST 4 930.73 TN No Bid  No Bid $614.41  No Bid 

32 HFE-1000 DIST 5 75.00 TN No Bid $648.67 $644.34  No Bid 

33 HFE-1000 DIST 6 73.97 TN No Bid  No Bid $638.29  No Bid 
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34 HFE-1000 DIST 7 50.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $641.46  No Bid 

35 HFE-1000 DIST 8 391.68 TN No Bid  No Bid $613.65  No Bid 

36 HFE-1000 PLANT PICK UP 50.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $590.00  No Bid 

37 MC-250 DIST 4 97.36 TN No Bid  No Bid $869.74  No Bid 

38 MC-250 DIST 5 25.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $905.01  No Bid 

39 MC-250 DIST 6 120.84 TN No Bid  No Bid $887.05  No Bid 

40 MC-250 DIST 8 72.99 TN No Bid  No Bid $863.94  No Bid 

41 MC-250 PLANT PICK UP 25.00 TN No Bid  No Bid $825.00  No Bid 

42 TRMSS DIST 1 453.41 TN No Bid  No Bid $629.00  No Bid 

43 TRMSS PLANT PICK UP 25.00 TN No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

44 DEMURRAGE AFTER 3 HOURS 1.00 EA $125/hr $65.00 $90.00 $160.00 $150.00  $90/hr  $70/hr 

100% 30 days 0% 30 days 0% N/30 days
Net % 30 

days
0% 30 days 0% 30 days

1 day 1 day
Per 

Specifications
per spec 4 bus days 1 dayDelivery Days ARO

Comments

Award Explanation

Lines 3 & 4 - Low bidder took exception to Material Specifications.  Awarded to second low.

Line 7 - Low bidder took exception to the delivery time.  Awarded to second low.

Lines 30 & 43 - Lines not awarded due to no bids.

Payment Terms
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