Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 01/31/12

- Allan Baker Inc., dba Classic Optical .
ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Korrect Optical Laboratories, Inc. Express Lens Lab, Inc. Heartland Optical Inc.
=
- Description Qty |[UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Flfr)ge Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 |[SINGLE VISION LENS 45 EA | $ 18.00| $ 810.00 No Bid $ 9.00| $ 405.00] $ 18.00| $ 810.00
2 |BIFOCAL FT 28MM LENS 25 PR|$ 1900( $ 475.00 No Bid $ 11.00]| $ 275.00] $ 23.00| $ 575.00
3 |BIFOCAL FT 35MM LENS 10 PR | $ 2200 % 220.00 No Bid $ 1200]| $ 120.00| $ 28.00| $ 280.00
4 |TRIFOCAL FT 28MM LENS 10 PR|$ 2400 $ 240.00 No Bid $ 1250| $ 125.00] $ 28.00| $ 280.00
5 |TRIFOCAL FT 35MM LENS 5 PR|$ 3200 % 160.00 No Bid $ 1475| % 73.75| $ 40.00| $ 200.00
6 |PROGRESSIVE LENS 165| PR | $ 2500| $ 4,125.00 No Bid $ 2295| % 3,786.75| $ 50.00] $ 8,250.00
7 |TRANSITIONS 140 | PR | $ 40.00| $ 5,600.00 No Bid $ 3950(% 5530.00l $ 5000(% 7,000.00
8 |LIFE RX 20 PR|$ 4500( $ 900.00 No Bid $ 43.00]| $ 860.00| $ 50.00( $ 1,000.00
9 |[SOLID TINT 5 PR | $ 500( $ 25.00 No Bid $ 1.00| $ 500| $ 400 $ 20.00
10 [GRADIENT TINT 5 PR | $ 500( $ 25.00 No Bid $ 1.00| $ 500 $ 400 $ 20.00
11 [POLARIZED TINT 5 PR|$ 4000($ 200.00 No Bid $ 3725| % 186.25| $ 50.00( $ 250.00
12 [DRIVEWEAR 5 PR|$ 8500(8% 425.00 No Bid $ 3725| % 186.25| $ 75.00( $ 375.00
13 [CLEAR 180 | PR N/C No Bid N/C N/C
14 [UV COATING 260 | PR N/C No Bid N/C N/C
SCRATCH RESISTANT .
15 COATING 260 | PR N/C No Bid N/C N/C
REFLECTION FREE .
16 COATINGS 50 PR|$ 2500(9% 1,250.00 No Bid $ 2500(% 1,250.00| $ 2500 % 1,250.00
THERMAL HARD
17 |COAT/EQUIVALENT WHEN 15 PR|$ 2500( % 375.00 No Bid N/C $ 2500| $ 375.00
REQUIRED
18 [POLYCARBONATE LENS 240 | PR N/C No Bid $ 10.00| $ 2,400.00 N/C
19 [PLASTIC LENS 10 PR N/C No Bid $ 1000]| $ 100.00 N/C
20 |GLASS LENS 5 PR N/C No Bid $ 1000| $ 50.00 N/C
21 |SUNCLIPS IF AVAILABLE 15 PR|$ 19.00( $ 285.00 No Bid $ 13.00]| $ 195.00| $ 30.00| $ 450.00
SIDE SHIELDS (EXTRA
22 |PAIR) THOSE PROVIDED 25 PR | $ 350 $ 87.50 No Bid N/C $ 250( $ 62.50
AT NO CHARGE)
23 |BC102 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 2700( $ 27.00 No Bid $ 19.00| % 19.00| $ 22.00]| $ 22.00
24 |BC115 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 2700( $ 27.00 No Bid $ 19.00| % 19.00| $ 22.00]| $ 22.00
27 |DG89 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 3700( $ 37.00 No Bid $ 2600(% 26.00( $ 4200( $ 42.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear A”aéloﬁiléfgggga?ba Lgtln?)srzitcczyizt,iﬁlc. Express Lens Lab, Inc. Heartland Optical Inc.

c

- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ifr)l(cte Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
28 |EL1 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 2100]| $ 21.00 No Bid $ 1195( % 11.95( $ 20.00( $ 20.00
29 |EL3 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 2100]| $ 21.00 No Bid $ 1195( % 11.95( $ 20.00( $ 20.00
31 |EX259 TITMUS 2 EA[$ 4200]| $ 84.00 No Bid $ 38.00(% 76.00| $ 44.00( $ 88.00
33 |EX275 TITMUS 2 EA[$ 4300| $ 86.00 No Bid $ 40.00( $ 80.00| $ 46.00( $ 92.00
34 |EXT10 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 57.00| $ 57.00 No Bid $ 60009 60.00| $ 67.00( $ 67.00
35 |EXT11 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 61.00| $ 61.00 No Bid $ 6200 9% 62.00| $ 72.00( $ 72.00
36 |EXT2 TITMUS 5 EA[$ 57.00| $ 285.00 No Bid $ 6000 % 300.00| $ 67.00( $ 335.00
38 |EXT8 TITMUS 3 EA[$ 57.00| $ 171.00 No Bid $ 6000 % 180.00( $ 67.00( $ 201.00
39 |EXT9 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 57.00| $ 57.00 No Bid $ 6000($% 60.00| $ 67.00( $ 67.00
40 |EXTS1 TITMUS 8 EA[$ 59.00| $ 472.00 No Bid $ 6000 % 480.001 $ 69.00| $ 552.00
41 |EXTS2 TITMUS 2 EA[$ 59.00| $ 118.00 No Bid $ 6000 % 120.00( $ 69.00( $ 138.00
43 |FC703 TITMUS 4 EA[$ 26.00| $ 104.00 No Bid $ 17.25( % 69.00| $ 20.00( $ 80.00
44 |FC707 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 2600|$ 26.00 No Bid $ 1725 % 17.25( $ 20.00( $ 20.00
45 |FG2 HUDSON 2 EA[$ 4700]| $ 94.00 No Bid $ 36.00(9% 7200| $ 56.00( $ 112.00
46 |HD61 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 39.00| % 39.00 No Bid $ 2785($% 2785| $ 45.00( $ 45.00
47 |HD62 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 39.00| $ 39.00 No Bid $ 2785($% 2785| $ 45.00( $ 45.00
48 |0OG100 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 5200]|$ 52.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 42551 $ 60.00( $ 60.00
49 |0G103 ON GUARD 2 EA[$ 2800|$% 56.00 No Bid $ 1725 % 3450 $ 25.00( $ 50.00
50 [OG104 ON GUARD 1 EA | $ 2200( $ 22.00 No Bid $ 1125 $ 11251 $ 17.00| $ 17.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Allan Baker Inc., dba

Classic Optical

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Korrect Optical Laboratories, Inc. Express Lens Lab, Inc. Heartland Optical Inc.

c

- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ifr)l(cte Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
51 [0G109 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 5300|$% 53.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 42551 $ 62.00( $ 62.00
52 [0G113 ON GUARD 2 EA[$ 26.00|$ 52.00 No Bid $ 1595( % 3190 $ 23.00( $ 46.00
53 [OG115 ON GUARD 3 EA[$ 3400]| $ 102.00 No Bid $ 2410( % 7230 $ 34.00( $ 102.00
54 [0G116 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3400]| $ 34.00 No Bid $ 2410( % 24101 $ 34.00( $ 34.00
55 [OG135 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3300|$% 33.00 No Bid $ 2225(% 22251 $ 32.00( $ 32.00
56 [OG138 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3300|$% 33.00 No Bid $ 2325(% 2325| $ 33.00( $ 33.00
57 [OG140 ON GUARD 3 EA[$ 5300|$% 159.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 12765 $ 6200( $ 186.00
58 [OG141 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 5300|$% 53.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 42551 ¢ 62.00( $ 62.00
59 [OG151 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3300|$% 33.00 No Bid $ 2410( % 24101 $ 33.00( $ 33.00
60 [OG17 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 2700| $ 27.00 No Bid $ 1725 % 1725 $ 24.00( $ 24.00
61 [OG30 ON GUARD 2 EA[$ 3100| $ 62.00 No Bid $ 1995( % 3990| $ 29.00( $ 58.00
62 [OG301 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3300|$% 33.00 No Bid $ 2295(% 2295| $ 32.00( $ 32.00
64 [0G311 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3200]| % 32.00 No Bid $ 2195( % 2195| $ 31.00( $ 31.00
65 [0G314 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3300|$% 33.00 No Bid $ 2295(% 2295| $ 33.00( $ 33.00
66 [0G318 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3300|$% 33.00 No Bid $ 2345( % 2345| $ 33.00( $ 33.00
67 [0G321 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3300|$% 33.00 No Bid $ 2345( % 2345| $ 33.00( $ 33.00
68 [0G322 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 3300|$% 33.00 No Bid $ 2345( % 2345| $ 33.00( $ 33.00
69 [OG60 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ ©5800|$%$ 58.00 No Bid $ 4295( % 42951 $ 62.00( $ 62.00
70 [OG65 ON GUARD 2 EA[$ 2900| $ 58.00 No Bid $ 1895( % 3790| $ 27.00( $ 54.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear A”aéloﬁiléfgggga?ba Lgtln?)srzitcczyizt,iﬁlc. Express Lens Lab, Inc. Heartland Optical Inc.

c

- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ifr)l(cte Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
71 |OG69 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 2000|$ 20.00 No Bid $ 9.95( % 995| $ 9.00( $ 9.00
72 |OG70P ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 2000|$ 20.00 No Bid $ 995( % 995 $ 1400]| $ 14.00
73 |OG71 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 2000|$ 20.00 No Bid $ 9.95( % 995| $ 9.00( $ 9.00
74 |0G76 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 5300|$% 53.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 42551 ¢ 62.00( $ 62.00
75 |OG77 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 5300|$% 53.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 42551 ¢ 62.00( $ 62.00
76 |OG80 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 2800|$% 28.00 No Bid $ 1785 % 1785 $ 26.00( $ 26.00
77 |0G83 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 5300|$% 53.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 42551 ¢ 62.00( $ 62.00
78 |0G85 ON GUARD 4 EA[$ 2000|$ 80.00 No Bid $ 995( % 39.80( $ 9.00( $ 36.00
79 |0G86 ON GUARD 10 | EA | $ 3000( $ 300.00 No Bid $ 1895( % 18950 $ 28.00( $ 280.00
80 |OG90 ON GUARD 4 EA[$ 26.00| $ 104.00 No Bid $ 1895( % 75.80| $ 22.00( $ 88.00
81 |0G92 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 2000| $ 20.00 No Bid $ 9.95( % 995 $ 14.00]| $ 14.00
82 |0G93 ON GUARD 2 EA[$ 2000| $ 40.00 No Bid $ 9.95( % 19.90| $ 9.00( $ 18.00
83 |0G95 ON GUARD 1 EA[$ 2000| $ 20.00 No Bid $ 995( % 995 $ 14.00]| $ 14.00
84 |0G97 ON GUARD 2 EA[$ 5200]|$ 104.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 85.10| $ 60.00( $ 120.00
85 |0G98 ON GUARD 3 EA[$ 5300|$% 159.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 12765 $ 6200( $ 186.00
86 |0G99 ON GUARD 3 EA[$ 5300|$% 159.00 No Bid $ 4255( % 12765 $ 6200( $ 186.00
87 |PC250 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 3500|$% 35.00 No Bid $ 3010( % 30.10| $ 34.00( $ 34.00
88 |PC250SW TITMUS 4 EA[$ 3500|$% 140.00 No Bid $ 3010( $ 12040 $ 34.00( $ 136.00
89 |PC261 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 3200| % 32.00 No Bid $ 2649( % 26.49| $ 30.00( $ 30.00

Page 4 of 24




Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear A”aéloﬁiléfgggga?ba Lgtln?)srzitcczyizt,iﬁlc. Express Lens Lab, Inc. Heartland Optical Inc.

c

- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ifr)l(cte Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

90 |PC264 TITMUS 9 EA[$ 3200]| % 288.00 No Bid $ 2649( % 238.41| $ 30.00( $ 270.00
91 |PC266A TITMUS 1 EA[$ 3200| % 32.00 No Bid $ 2649( % 26.49| $ 30.00( $ 30.00
92 |PC267 TITMUS 2 EA[$ 3200| % 64.00 No Bid $ 2649( % 52.98| $ 30.00( $ 60.00
93 |PC268 TITMUS 4 EA[$ 3200]| % 128.00 No Bid $ 2649( % 10596 $ 30.00( $ 120.00
94 |SL2 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 1800| $ 18.00 No Bid $ 9.10( $ 910 $ 15.00]| $ 15.00
95 |SR10 HUDSON 2 EA[$ 4700]| $ 94.00 No Bid $ 3695(9% 7390| $ 56.00( $ 112.00
96 |SR11 HUDSON 5 EA[$ 4700]| $ 235.00 No Bid $ 3695(% 184.75( $ 56.00( $ 280.00
97 |SR12 HUDSON 6 EA[$ 4700]| $ 282.00 No Bid $ 3695(% 221.70| $ 56.00( $ 336.00
98 |SR4 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 4700]| $ 47.00 No Bid $ 3695(% 3695| $ 56.00( $ 56.00
99 |SR5 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 4700]| $ 47.00 No Bid $ 3695(9% 36.95| $ 56.00( $ 56.00
100 |SR6 HUDSON 3 EA[$ 4700]| $ 141.00 No Bid $ 3695(% 110.85( $ 56.00( $ 168.00
101 |SR9 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 4700]| $ 47.00 No Bid $ 3695(% 3695| $ 56.00( $ 56.00
102 |ST2 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 39.00| % 39.00 No Bid $ 2749( % 2749 $ 4400( $ 44.00
103 |ST3 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 39.00|$ 39.00 No Bid $ 2749( % 2749 $ 4400( $ 44.00
104 |ST4 HUDSON 3 EA[$ 3900|$ 117.00 No Bid $ 2749( % 82471 $ 4400( $ 132.00
105 |SW02 TITMUS 5 EA[$ 4200]| $ 210.00 No Bid $ 3875 % 193.75( $ 4400( $ 220.00
106 |SW03 TITMUS 2 EA[$ 4200]| $ 84.00 No Bid $ 3875(% 7750 $ 44.00( $ 88.00
107 |SW04 TITMUS 5 EA[$ 4300| $ 215.00 No Bid $ 3875(% 193.75( $ 46.00( $ 230.00
108 |TH8 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 4900]| $ 49.00 No Bid $ 3795(% 3795| $ 59.00( $ 59.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear A”aéloﬁiléfgggga?ba Lgtln?)srzitcczyizt,iﬁlc. Express Lens Lab, Inc. Heartland Optical Inc.

c

- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ifr)l(cte Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
109 |TI1 HUDSON 2 EA[$ 61.00| $ 122.00 No Bid $ 3795(% 7590( $ 76.00( $ 152.00
110 |TI2 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 61.00| $ 61.00 No Bid $ 3795(% 3795($ 76.00( $ 76.00
111 |TM10 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 26.00| $ 26.00 No Bid $ 1725 % 17251 $ 20.00| $ 20.00
113 |TR301 TITMUS 17 | EA | $ 36.00($ 612.00 No Bid $ 3095(% 526.15| $ 35.00( $ 595.00
114 |TR302 TITMUS 2 EA[$ 36.00| % 72.00 No Bid $ 3095(% 61.90( $ 3500( $ 70.00
115 |TR303 TITMUS 4 EA[$ 36.00| % 144.00 No Bid $ 3095(% 12380 $ 3500( $ 140.00
116 |TR304 TITMUS 3 EA[$ 36.00|$% 108.00 No Bid $ 3095(% 9285($ 3500( $ 105.00
118 |TR306 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 36.00| % 36.00 No Bid $ 3095(% 3095($% 3500(¢% 35.00
119 |TR308 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 36.00|$% 36.00 No Bid $ 3095(% 3095($% 3500( % 35.00
120 |TR309 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 3700| $ 37.00 No Bid $ 3195(% 3195($ 3700( $ 37.00
121 |TR310 TITMUS 1 EA[$ 3700( $ 37.00 No Bid $ 3195| % 31951 $ 37.00| % 37.00
122 |VL1 HUDSON 5 EA[$ 2500( $ 125.00 No Bid $ 16.95| $ 84751 $ 25.00| $ 125.00
123 |VL2 HUDSON 2 EA[$ 2500| % 50.00 No Bid $ 1695( % 3390($ 2500( % 50.00
124 |VL3 HUDSON 2 EA[$ 2500]| % 50.00 No Bid $ 1695( % 3390($ 2500( $ 50.00
125 |VL5 HUDSON 3 EA[$ 2700]| $ 81.00 No Bid $ 1695( % 50.85( $ 27.00( $ 81.00
126 |VL6 HUDSON 1 EA[$ 2700| $ 27.00 No Bid $ 1695( % 1695| $ 27.00| $ 27.00
Lines 25,30,32, 42,63,112,117 are discontinued

and were not included in the cost evaluation.
Lines 26 & 37 were not included in the cost
evaluation due to not all bidders providing a price
for these two lines.
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear A”aéloﬁiléfggg(':’a?ba Lgtln?)sr:t(c:)rioezt,lﬁlc. Express Lens Lab, Inc. Heartland Optical Inc.

c

- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ifr)l(cte Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
ON GUARD 016 FRAMES

127 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 50 | EA|$ 2200| % 110000| $ 2156| % 1,078.00( $ 1555| % 77750 $ 20.00( $ 1,000.00
ONLY
ON GUARD 035 FRAMES

128 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 50 | EA|$ 2300|$ 1,15000($ 2184|$ 1,09200( $ 16.95| $ 84750 $ 20.00( $ 1,000.00
ONLY
ON GUARD 042
FRAMES/58/18-140

129 DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 200 EA | $ 1500 $ 3,00000| $ 13.72| $ 2,74400| $ 1055| % 2,110.00] $ 12.00| $ 2,400.00
ONLY
ON GUARD 043S FRAMES

130 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 700 | EA | $ 9.00( $ 630000| $ 10.00( $ 7,000.00( $ 7251 % 5,07500]| $ 9.00| $ 6,300.00
ONLY
ON GUARD 069P FRAMES

131 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 525 | EA | $ 800 $ 4,20000| $ 1282| $ 6,73050( $ 985 % 5,171.25| $ 9.00| $ 4,725.00
ONLY
ON GUARD 071P FRAMES

132 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 525 | EA | $ 8.00($% 4,20000| $ 1282 $ 6,73050( $ 985| % 517125]| % 9.00| $ 4,725.00
ONLY
ON GUARD 079S FRAMES

133 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 700 | EA | $ 9.00( $ 6,30000| $ 10.00| $ 7,000.00( $ 6.95($% 4,865.00| $ 9.00| $ 6,300.00
ONLY
ON GUARD 085 FRAMES

134 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 725 | EA | $ 8.00($ 580000| % 1282 3% 9,29450( $ 985| % 7,14125]| $ 9.00| $ 6,525.00
ONLY
ON GUARD 093 FRAMES

135 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS |2525| EA | $ 8.00( $ 20,200.00| $ 1282 $ 32,37050( $ 9.85| $ 24,871.25| $ 9.00| $ 22,725.00
ONLY
SINGLE VISION LENS

136 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS ([5145| PR | $ 17.00| $ 87,465.00| $ 18.32| $ 94,256.40( $ 9.00 $ 46,305.00| $ 12.00( $ 61,740.00
ONLY
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Line #

Prescription Safety Eyewear

Allan Baker Inc., dba
Korrect Optical

Classic Optical
Laboratories, Inc.

Express Lens Lab, Inc.

Heartland Optical Inc.

Description

Qty

UOM

Unit Price Ext. Price

Ext.

Unit Price )
Price

Unit Price Ext. Price

Unit Price Ext. Price

BIFOCAL FT LENS 2610

PR

$ 17.00 44,370.00

$ 18.60[ $ 48,546.00

$ 11.00 28,710.00

$ 20.00 52,200.00

138

TRIFOCAL FT LENS 505

PR

$ 17.00 8,585.00

$ 2766 $ 13,968.30

$ 1250 6,312.50

$ 28.00 14,140.00

139

PROGRESSIVE LENS 90

PR

AP |H

$ 27.00 2,430.00

$ 31.08[$ 2,797.20

AR |H

$ 2295 2,065.50

*|en|r

$ 50.00 4,500.00

140

POLYCARBONATE LENS
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

2270

PR

$ 2.00( $ 4,540.00

$ 4.00( $ 9,080.00

$ 10.00( $ 22,700.00

N/C

141

PLASTIC LENS
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

5990

PR

N/C

N/C

$ 5.00 | $ 29,950.00

N/C

142

TRANSITIONS OR
EQUIVALENT

DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

240

PR

$ 4000 $ 9,600.00

$ 3434 $ 8,241.60

$ 3950($ 9,480.00

$ 4000 $ 9,600.00

143

SOLID TINT
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

365

PR

$ 5,00 $ 1,825.00

$ 200 $ 730.00

$ 100 $ 365.00

$ 500 $ 1,825.00

144

GRADIENT TINT
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

365

PR

$ 500 $ 1,825.00

$ 200 $ 730.00

$ 100 $ 365.00

$ 500 $ 1,825.00

145

NOSE PAD
(REPLACEMENT)

DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

155

EA

N/C

$ 046 $ 71.30

N/C

$ 025( % 38.75

146

FRAME SCREWS
(REPLACEMENT)

DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

105

EA

N/C

$ 016 $ 16.80

N/C

$ 025( % 26.25

Payment Terms

Net 30

Net 30

2% 20 Days

Net 30

Delivery Days ARO

15 Days

7 Days

7 Days

5-14-Days

Comments
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 01/31/12

. . . Private Label Enterprises, . . Safe-Lite Optical and On-

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Hi-Tech Optical, Inc. Inc Rite-Style Optical Co. Site Safety
=
- Description Qty |[UOM| Unit Price F|>Er)|((§e Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 |SINGLE VISION LENS 45 | EA No Bid $ 9.50| $ 42750 $18.00* | $ 810.00( $ 2500 $ 1,125.00
2 [BIFOCAL FT 28MM LENS 25 [ PR No Bid $ 11.70] $ 292.50| $23.00* | $ 575.00| $ 35.00( $ 875.00
3 [BIFOCAL FT 35MM LENS 10 | PR No Bid $ 13.00] $ 130.00| $35.00* | $ 350.00| $ 35.00( $ 350.00
4 |TRIFOCAL FT 28MM LENS 10 | PR No Bid $ 1400] $ 140.00| $28.00* | $ 280.00( $ 4500]| % 450.00
5 [TRIFOCAL FT 35MM LENS 5 PR No Bid $ 1450] $ 7250 | $60.00* | $ 300.00| $ 4500 $ 225.00
6 [PROGRESSIVE LENS 165 | PR No Bid $ 43.00($% 7,09500| $50.00* |$ 8,250.00( $ 5500($% 9,075.00
7 |[TRANSITIONS 140 | PR No Bid $ 4200|$ 5,880.00f $38.00*r | $ 5320.00] $ 40.00] $ 5,600.00
8 [LIFE RX 20 [ PR No Bid $ 4100] % 820.00( $45.00* | $ 900.00| $ 25.00( $ 500.00
9 |[SOLID TINT 5 PR No Bid $ 100 $ 5.00 $4.00* [ $ 20.00| $ 200( $ 10.00
10 |GRADIENT TINT 5 PR No Bid $ 100 $ 5.00 $450* [ $ 2250| $ 200( $ 10.00
11 |POLARIZED TINT 5 PR No Bid $ 43.00]| % 215.00( $60.00* | $ 300.00| $ 20.00( $ 100.00
12 |DRIVEWEAR 5 PR No Bid $ 4400 $ 220.00( $80.00* 400.00( $ 20.00| $ 100.00
13 |CLEAR 180 | PR No Bid N/C $ 18.00* 3,240.00 N/C
14 |UV COATING 260 [ PR No Bid $ 1.00 260.00 N/C $ 200 $ 520.00
15 SCRATCH RESISTANT 260 | PR No Bid $ 1.00 260.00| $ 8.00| $ 2,080.00| $ 200( $ 520.00

COATING

REFLECTION FREE .
16 COATINGS 50 | PR No Bid $ 2400| % 1,200.00f $ 2500|% 1,250.00] $ 25.00| % 1,250.00

THERMAL HARD
17 |COAT/EQUIVALENT WHEN 15 | PR No Bid $ 10.00| $ 150.001 $ 1400 $ 210.00 N/C

REQUIRED
18 |POLYCARBONATE LENS 240 [ PR No Bid $ 1100($ 264000 $18.00* |$ 432000 $ 1500 $ 3,600.00
19 |PLASTIC LENS 10 | PR No Bid $ 8.00| $ 80.00 [ $18.00* | $ 180.00( $ 10.00| $ 100.00
20 [GLASS LENS 5 PR No Bid $ 12.00] $ 60.00 | $18.00* | $ 90.00| $ 25.00| $ 125.00
21 [SUNCLIPS IF AVAILABLE 15 | PR No Bid $ 1400] $ 210.00( $ 1890 % 28350| $ 1500 $ 225.00

SIDE SHIELDS (EXTRA
22 |PAIR) THOSE PROVIDED 25 | PR No Bid N/C $ 3.00| $ 75.00 N/C

AT NO CHARGE)
23 (BC102 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2340 % 23401 $ 35.00| $ 35.00
24 (BC115 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2340 % 23401 $ 35.00| $ 35.00
27 |DG89 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3780 % 3780 $ 40.00| $ 40.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide
ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Hi-Tech Optical, Inc. Private Labler:CEnterprises, Rite-Style Optical Co. Safe-LitSeitSpSt;aelt; nd On-
c
- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Flfrfée Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
28 |EL1 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 18.00 | $ 18.00( $ 1700 $ 17.00
29 |EL3 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 18.00 | $ 18.00( $ 1700 $ 17.00
31 [EX259 TITMUS 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 $ 81.00| $ 6500]| $ 130.00
33 |EX275 TITMUS 2 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 4050 % 81.00( $ 69.00( $ 138.00
34 |EXT10 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6120 $ 61.20] $ 95.00| $ 95.00
35 |[EXT11 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 7380 % 7380| $ 95.00]| $ 95.00
36 [EXT2 TITMUS 5 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6120 $ 306.00( $ 95.00( $ 475.00
38 |EXT8 TITMUS 3 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6120 9% 18360 $ 95.00| $ 285.00
39 [EXT9 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6120 $ 6120 $ 95.00| $ 95.00
40 [EXTS1 TITMUS 8 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 7380 % 590.40( $ 95.00( $ 760.00
41 [EXTS2 TITMUS 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 7380 % 147601 $ 95.00| $ 190.00
43 [FC703 TITMUS 4 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2160 % 86.40| $ 3500]| $ 140.00
44 [FC707 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2160 $ 2160 $ 3500]| $ 35.00
45 |FG2 HUDSON 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4680 % 93.60( $ 59.00( $ 118.00
46 (HD61 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 $ 4050 $ 45.00]| $ 45.00
47 (HD62 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 $ 4050 $ 45.00]| $ 45.00
48 |0OG100 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 67.00(9% 67.00( $ 65.00( $ 65.00
49 |0G103 ON GUARD 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 30.00($% 60.00( $ 29.00( $ 58.00
50 |0G104 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 22.00(9% 2200 $ 29.00( $ 29.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide
ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Hi-Tech Optical, Inc. Private Labler:CEnterprises, Rite-Style Optical Co. Safe-LitSeitSpSt;aelt; nd On-
c
- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Flfrfée Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
51 [OG109 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6700 % 67.00| $ 75.00| $ 75.00
52 |0G113 ON GUARD 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 30.00($% 60.00( $ 29.00( $ 58.00
53 |O0G115 ON GUARD 3 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 42.00( % 126.00| $ 39.00| $ 117.00
54 |0G116 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 42.00( % 42.00| $ 39.00( $ 39.00
55 [OG135 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4000 $ 40.001 $ 35.00]| $ 35.00
56 |0G138 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 40.00( $ 40.00| $ 39.00( $ 39.00
57 |0G140 ON GUARD 3 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 67.00(9% 201.00( $ 7500( $ 225.00
58 |0G141 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 67.00(9% 67.00( $ 60.00( $ 60.00
59 [0OG151 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4000 $ 40.00| $ 35.00]| $ 35.00
60 |OG17 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 30.00($% 30.00( $ 3500( $ 35.00
61 |OG30 ON GUARD 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 33.00(9% 66.00( $ 29.00( $ 58.00
62 |OG301 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 40.00( $ 40.00| $ 35.00( $ 35.00
64 |OG311 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 40.00( $ 40.00| $ 35.00( $ 35.00
65 |0G314 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 40.00( % 40.00| $ 35.00( $ 35.00
66 |OG318 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 40.00( $ 40.00| $ 35.00( $ 35.00
67 |0G321 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 40.00( % 40.00| $ 35.00( $ 35.00
68 |0G322 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 40.00( $ 40.00| $ 35.00( $ 35.00
69 |OG60 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 67.00(9% 67.00( $ 75.00( $ 75.00
70 |OG65 ON GUARD 2 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 33.00(% 66.00( $ 29.00( $ 58.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide
ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Hi-Tech Optical, Inc. Private Labler:CEnterprises, Rite-Style Optical Co. Safe-LitSeitSpSt;aelt; nd On-
c
- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Flfrfée Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
71 |OG69 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 20.00(9% 20.00( $ 15.00( $ 15.00
72 |OG70P ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 20.00(9% 20.00( $ 15.00( $ 15.00
73 [OG71 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2000 % 20.00| $ 1500]| $ 15.00
74 |OG76 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6700 % 67.00| $ 65.00]| $ 65.00
75 [OG77 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6700 % 67.00| $ 65.00]| $ 65.00
76 |OG80 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 30.00(9% 30.00( $ 29.00( $ 29.00
77 |0G83 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 67.00(9% 67.00( $ 65.00( $ 65.00
78 |0G85 ON GUARD 4 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 20.00(9% 80.00( $ 15.00( $ 60.00
79 |0G86 ON GUARD 10 | EA No Bid Alt.** $ 33.00(% 330.00| $ 29.00( $ 290.00
80 |OG90 ON GUARD 4 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 27.00( 9% 108.00| $ 29.00| $ 116.00
81 |0G92 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 20.00($% 20.00( $ 29.00( $ 29.00
82 |0G93 ON GUARD 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 20.00($% 40.00| $ 29.00( $ 58.00
83 |0G95 ON GUARD 1 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 20.00(9% 20.00( $ 29.00( $ 29.00
84 [OG97 ON GUARD 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6700 % 134.00| $ 75.00| $ 150.00
85 |0G98 ON GUARD 3 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 67.00(9% 201.00( $ 7500( $ 225.00
86 |0G99 ON GUARD 3 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 67.00(9% 201.00( $ 7500( $ 225.00
87 |PC250 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 34201 $ 65.00]| $ 65.00
88 |PC250SW TITMUS 4 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 136.80| $ 65.00| $ 260.00
89 |PC261 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 3060(9% 3060 $ 52.00( $ 52.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Hi-Tech Optical, Inc. Private Labler:CEnterprises, Rite-Style Optical Co. Safe-LitSeitSpSt;aelt; nd On-
c

- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Flfrfée Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

90 |PC264 TITMUS 9 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 30609 27540 $ 5200( $ 468.00
91 |PC266A TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 30609 3060 $ 49.00( $ 49.00
92 |PC267 TITMUS 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 30609 61.20( $ 52.00( $ 104.00
93 |PC268 TITMUS 4 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 30609 122401 $ 52.00| $ 208.00
94 |SL2 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 1440 | $ 1440( $ 1500( $ 15.00
95 [SR10 HUDSON 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 5850 % 117.00| $ 55.00| $ 110.00
96 [SR11 HUDSON 5 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 5850 % 292501 $ 55.00( $ 275.00
97 |SR12 HUDSON 6 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 5850(% 351.00| $ 55.00( $ 330.00
98 [SR4 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 5850 % 5850| $ 55.00| $ 55.00
99 [SR5 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 5850 % 5850| $ 55.00| $ 55.00
100 |SR6 HUDSON 3 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 5850 % 175501 $ 55.00| $ 165.00
101 |SR9 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 5850 % 5850| $ 55.00| $ 55.00
102 |ST2 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 $ 4050 $ 45.00]| $ 45.00
103 |ST3 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 $ 4050 $ 45.00]| $ 45.00
104 |ST4 HUDSON 3 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 $ 121501 $ 45.00| $ 135.00
105 |SW02 TITMUS 5 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 $ 202501 $ 69.00( $ 345.00
106 |SW03 TITMUS 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 % 81.00( $ 69.00( $ 138.00
107 |SW04 TITMUS 5 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 4050 $ 202501 $ 72.00( $ 360.00
108 |TH8 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 5220 9% 5220 $ 59.00( $ 59.00

Page 13 of 24




Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide

ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Hi-Tech Optical, Inc. Private Labler:CEnterprises, Rite-Style Optical Co. Safe-LitSeitSpSt;aelt; nd On-

c

- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Flfrfée Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
109 |TI1 HUDSON 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6750 % 135.001 $ 89.00| $ 178.00
110 |TI2 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 6750 % 6750 $ 89.00| $ 89.00
111 |TM10 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2160 $ 2160 $ 59.00| $ 59.00
113 |TR301 TITMUS 17 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 581.40( $ 59.00( $ 1,003.00
114 |TR302 TITMUS 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 68.40| $ 59.00| $ 118.00
115 |TR303 TITMUS 4 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 136.80| $ 59.00| $ 236.00
116 |TR304 TITMUS 3 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 102.60| $ 59.00| $ 177.00
118 |TR306 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 34201 $ 59.00| $ 59.00
119 |TR308 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 34201 $ 59.00| $ 59.00
120 |TR309 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 34201 $ 59.00| $ 59.00
121 |TR310 TITMUS 1 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 3420 % 34201 $ 59.00| $ 59.00
122 |VL1 HUDSON 5 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2340 % 117.00| $ 19.00| $ 95.00
123 |VL2 HUDSON 2 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 2340 % 46.80( $ 19.00( $ 38.00
124 |VL3 HUDSON 2 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2340( % 46.80( $ 19.00( $ 38.00
125 |VL5 HUDSON 3 EA No Bid Alt.** $ 2340( % 70.20| $ 20.00| $ 60.00
126 |VL6 HUDSON 1 EA No Bid Alt.*x* $ 2340( 9% 23401 $ 20.00| $ 20.00
Lines 25,30,32, 42,63,112,117 are discontinued

and were not included in the cost evaluation.
Lines 26 & 37 were not included in the cost
evaluation due to not all bidders providing a price
for these two lines.
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Line #

Prescription Safety Eyewear

Hi-Tech Optical, Inc.

Private Label Enterprises,

Inc

Rite-Style Optical Co.

Safe-Lite Optical and On-
Site Safety

Description

Qty

UOM

Unit Price

Ext.
Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

127

ON GUARD 016 FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

50

EA

$ 20.70

1,035.00

$9.5%**

$ 475.00

$ 30.00

$

1,500.00

$ 29.00

$ 1,450.00

128

ON GUARD 035 FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

50

EA

$ 2098

1,049.00

$9.5***

$ 475.00

$ 30.00

1,500.00

$ 29.00

$ 1,450.00

129

ON GUARD 042
FRAMES/58/18-140

DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

200

EA

$ 14.00

2,800.00

$9.5%**

$ 1,900.00

$ 21.00

4,200.00

$ 15.00

$ 3,000.00

130

ON GUARD 043S FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

700

EA

$ 10.00

7,000.00

$7.00%+*

$ 4,900.00

$ 18.00

12,600.00

$ 13.00

$ 9,100.00

131

ON GUARD 069P FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

525

EA

$ 13.30

6,982.50

$9.5***

$ 4,987.50

$ 20.00

10,500.00

$ 15.00

$ 7,875.00

132

ON GUARD 071P FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

525

EA

$ 13.30

6,982.50

$9.5%**

$ 4,987.50

$ 20.00

10,500.00

$ 15.00

$ 7,875.00

133

ON GUARD 079S FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

700

EA

$ 10.60

7,420.00

$7.00*+*

$ 4,900.00

$ 18.00

12,600.00

$ 13.00

$ 9,100.00

134

ON GUARD 085 FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

725

EA

$ 10.60

7,685.00

$9.5%**

$ 6,887.50

$ 20.00

14,500.00

$ 17.00

$ 12,325.00

135

ON GUARD 093 FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

2525

EA

$ 1422

35,905.50

$9.5***

$ 23,987.50

$ 20.00

50,500.00

$ 17.00

$ 42,925.00

136

SINGLE VISION LENS
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

5145

PR

$ 1350

69,457.50

$ 9.50

$ 48,877.50

$ 18.00*

92,610.00

$ 25.00

$ 128,625.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3883 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 01/31/12

Prescription Safety Eyewear

Hi-Tech Optical, Inc.

Private Label Enterprises,
Inc

Rite-Style Optical Co.

Safe-Lite Optical and On-
Site Safety

Line #

Description

Qty

UOM

Unit Price

Ext.
Price

Unit Price Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price Ext. Price

BIFOCAL FT LENS 2610

PR

$ 14.00

36,540.00

$ 11.70 30,537.00

$ 23.00*

60,030.00

$ 35.00 91,350.00

138 |TRIFOCAL FT LENS 505

PR

$ 20.00

10,100.00

$ 14.00 7,070.00

$ 28.00*

14,140.00

$ 45.00 22,725.00

139 |PROGRESSIVE LENS 90

PR

$ 38.00

AP |P

3,420.00

A |H

$ 43.00 3,870.00

$ 50.00*

*|en|r

4,500.00

AR |B

$ 55.00 4,950.00

POLYCARBONATE LENS
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

140 2270

PR

N/C

$ 11.00( $ 24,970.00

$ 18.00*

$ 40,860.00

$ 15.00( $ 34,050.00

PLASTIC LENS
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

141 5990

PR

N/C

$ 8.00 | $ 47,920.00

$ 18.00*

$ 107,820.00

$ 10.00( $ 59,900.00

TRANSITIONS OR
EQUIVALENT

DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

142 240

PR

$ 45.00

10,800.00

$ 40.00($ 9,600.00

$ 38.00*

$ 9,120.00

$ 4000 $ 9,600.00

SOLID TINT
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

143 365

PR

$ 4.00

1,460.00

$ 1.00| $ 365.00

$ 4.00

$ 1,460.00

$ 200 $ 730.00

GRADIENT TINT
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

144 365

PR

$ 4.00

1,460.00

$ 1.00| $ 365.00

$ 4.50

$ 1,642.50

$ 200 $ 730.00

NOSE PAD
(REPLACEMENT)

DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

145 155

EA

$ 2.00

310.00

N/C

$ 1.50

$ 232.50

$ 700 $ 1,085.00

FRAME SCREWS
(REPLACEMENT)

DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

146 105

EA

$ 1.00

105.00

N/C

N/C

N/C

Payment Terms

Net 30

Net 30

Net 30

Delivery Days ARO

7-10 Days

7 Days

5 Working Days

5 Days

Comments

Page 16 of 24




Buyer: Mary Lanning 3883 OF Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide
AWARD

T+ Prescription Safety Eyewear Select Optical Bid Explanation
g
- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price
1 [SINGLE VISION LENS 45 EA[$ 10.00( $ 450.00 *Price Range $18.00 - $32.00
2 |BIFOCAL FT 28MM LENS 25 PR|$ 12.00]| $ 300.00 *Price Range $23.00 - $42.00
3 |BIFOCAL FT 35MM LENS 10 PR|$ 1300( $ 130.00 *Price Range $35.00 - $70.00
4 [TRIFOCAL FT 28MM LENS 10 PR|$ 1450]| $ 145.00 *Price Range $28.00 - $52.00
5 |TRIFOCAL FT 35MM LENS 5 PR|$ 1500]( $ 75.00 *Price Range $60.00 - $105.00
6 |PROGRESSIVE LENS 165 PR [ $ 3500 $ 5,775.00 *Price Range $50.00 - $90.00
7 |TRANSITIONS 140 | PR | $ 30.00| $ 4,200.00 *Price Range $38.00 - $50.00
8 |LIFE RX 20 PR|$ 3000]| $ 600.00 *Price Range $45.00 - $50.00
9 |SOLID TINT 5 | PR[$ 1.00( $ 5.00 *Multiple items at the same price
10 |GRADIENT TINT 5 | PR|[$ 1.00( $ 5.00 *Multiple items at the same price
11 [POLARIZED TINT 5 PR|$ 2500($% 125.00 *Multiple items at the same price
12 [DRIVEWEAR 5 PR|$ 3000($ 150.00 *Multiple items at the same price
13 [CLEAR 180 | PR N/C *Price Range $18.00 - $105.00
14 UV COATING 260 | PR | $ 1.00| $ 260.00 *Price Range $0.00 - $6.00

SCRATCH RESISTANT
15 COATING 260 | PR N/C

REFLECTION FREE
16 COATINGS 50 PR|$ 18.00| $ 900.00

THERMAL HARD
17 [COAT/EQUIVALENT WHEN 15 PR N/C

REQUIRED
18 |POLYCARBONATE LENS 240 | PR | $ 6.00| $ 1,440.00 *Price Range $18.00 - $105.00
19 [PLASTIC LENS 10 PR [ $ 5.00 [ $ 50.00 *Price Range $18.00 - $105.00
20 |GLASS LENS 5 PR | $ 8.00 [ $ 40.00 *Price Range $18.00 - $105.00
21 |SUNCLIPS IF AVAILABLE 15 PR|$ 1500]( $ 225.00

SIDE SHIELDS (EXTRA
22 |PAIR) THOSE PROVIDED 25 PR N/C

AT NO CHARGE)
23 |BC102 TITMUS 1 | EA|s 1782|s 1782 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce not provided on
24 |BC115 TITMUS 1 |Ea|s 1782|$  17.82 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce ot provided on
27 |DG89 HUDSON 1 |EA|$ 2201|$ 2201 ITAB'ter”ate'p”ce not provided on
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3883 OF Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide
ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Select Optical Bid Explanation
2
- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price
28 |EL1 HUDSON 1 | EA|s$s 1131|s 1131 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
29 |EL3 HUDSON 1 | EA|s 1131|s 1131 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
31 |EX259 TITMUS > | EA|$ 3465|3%  69.30 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
33 |EX275 TITMUS > | EA|$ 3634|s 7268 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
34 |EXT10 TITMUS 1 |EA|S$ b5205[$ 5205 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
35 |EXT11 TITMUS 1 |EA|S$ s5597|8% 55097 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
36 |EXT2 TITMUS 5 | EA|$ b5597|$ 27985 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
38 |EXT8 TITMUS 3 | EA|$ 5205|$ 156.15 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
39 |EXT9 TITMUS 1 |EA|S$ 5205|$ 5205 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
40 |EXTSLTITMUS 8 | EA|$ 5373|$ 42084 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
41 |EXTS2 TITMUS > | EA|$ 5373|s 107.46 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
43 |FC703 TITMUS 4 |EA|S$ 1642|$ 6568 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
44 |FC707 TITMUS 1 | EA|S$ 1642|$ 1642 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
45 |FG2 HUDSON > | EA|$ 3069|3$ 6138 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
46 |HD61 HUDSON 1 | EA|S$ 3069|3% 3069 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
47 |HD62 HUDSON 1 | EA|S$S 243a|s 2434 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
48 |0G100 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$ 3540[$ 3540 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
49 |0G103 ON GUARD > | EA|$ 1558|s 3116 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
50 |0G104 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$ 1261|838 1261 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3883 OF Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide
ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Select Optical Bid Explanation
2
- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price
51 |0G109 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$S 4400|$ 4400 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
52 |0G113 ON GUARD > | EA|$ 1718|s 3436 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
53 |0G115 ON GUARD 3 |EA|$ 2578|s  77.34 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
54 |0G116 ON GUARD 1 |EA|s 2578|s 2578 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
55 |0G135 ON GUARD 1 |EA|S$ 2375|s 2375 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
56 |0G138 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$ 2454|s 2454 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
57 |0G140 ON GUARD 3 | EA|$ 4400|$ 132.00 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
58 |0G141 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S 4400|$ 4400 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
59 |0G151 ON GUARD 1 |EA|S$ 2375|% 2375 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
60 |0G17 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$ 1846|3$ 1846 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
61 |0G30 ON GUARD > | EA|$ 2150|s 4300 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
62 |0G301 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S 2426|3 2426 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
64 |0G311 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$ 2325|% 2325 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
65 |0G314 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S 2426|3 2426 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
66 |0G318 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S 2476|3 2476 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
67 |0G321 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S 2476|3 2476 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
68 |0G322 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S 2476|3 2476 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
69 |0G60 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$S 4400|s$ 4400 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
70 |0G65 ON GUARD > | EA|$ 2021|$ 4042 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3883 OF Opening Date: 01/31/12

Statewide
ﬁ Prescription Safety Eyewear Select Optical Bid Explanation
2
- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price
71 |0G69 ON GUARD 1 |EA|$ 8008 8.00 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
72 |0G70P ON GUARD 1 |EA|S$ 8008 8.00 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
73 |0G71 ON GUARD 1 |EA|$ 8008 8.00 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
74 |0G76 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$S 4400|s$ 4400 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
75 |0G77 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$S 4400|s$ 4400 :;AB"emate'p"ce not provided on
76 |0G80 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$ 1920]% 1020 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
77 |0G83 ON GUARD 1 | EA|S$S 4400|s$ 4400 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
78 |0G85 ON GUARD 4 |EA|S$ 800|$ 3200 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
79 |0G86 ON GUARD 10 | EA|$ 2049|$ 20490 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
80 |0G90 ON GUARD 4 |EA|S$ 1666|$  66.64 I*;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
81 |0G92 ON GUARD 1 |EA|$ 8008 8.00 I*;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
82 |0G93 ON GUARD > | EaA|s 8o00|$  16.00 I*;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
83 |0G95 ON GUARD 1 |EA|$ 8008 8.00 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
84 |0G97 ON GUARD > | EA|$ 4400|3 8800 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
85 |0G98 ON GUARD 3 | EA|$ 4400|s$ 132.00 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
86 |0G99 ON GUARD 3 | EA|$ 4400|s$ 132.00 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
87 |PC250 TITMUS 1 | EA|S 2736|$  27.36 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
88 |PC250SW TITMUS 4 | EA|$ 2736|$  109.44 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
89 |PC261 TITMUS 1 | EA|S 2764|3  27.64 I*;AB'ter”ate'p"ce not provided on
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90 |PC264 TITMUS 9 EA |l s 2764|$ 24876 ::_glternate-price not provided on
91 |PC266A TITMUS 1 EA | $ 2764| 3 27 64 ::_glternate-price not provided on
92 |PC267 TITMUS 2 EA | $ 2764| 3 55 28 ::_glternate-price not provided on
93 |PC268 TITMUS 4 | Eals 2764|$ 11056 ::_glternate-price not provided on
94 |SL2 HUDSON 1 EA | $ 870! s 8.70 ::_glternate-price not provided on
95 |SR10 HUDSON 2 EA |$ 3069 $ 61.38 ::_glternate-price not provided on
96 |SR11 HUDSON 5 Ean|$ 3069|$ 15345 ::_glternate-price not provided on
97 |SR12 HUDSON 6 En | s 3069|$ 184.14 ::_glternate-price not provided on
98 |SR4 HUDSON 1 EA | $ 3069 $ 30.69 ::_glternate-price not provided on
99 |SR5 HUDSON 1 EA | $ 3069 $ 30.69 ::_glternate-price not provided on
100 |SR6 HUDSON 3 EA |$ 3069 $ 9207 ::_glternate-price not provided on
101 |SR9 HUDSON 1 EA |$ 3069 $ 30.69 ::_glternate-price not provided on
102 |ST2 HUDSON 1 | EA|S$ 2399|s 2399 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
103 |ST3 HUDSON 1 | EA|S$ 2399|s 2399 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
104 |ST4 HUDSON 3 | EA|$ 2399|s 7197 :;AB"er”ate'p"ce not provided on
105 |SWO02 TITMUS 5 EA|$ 3999|$ 199.95 ::_glternate-price not provided on
106 |SWO03 TITMUS 2 EA |$ 3999 s 79.98 ::_glternate-price not provided on
107 |SW04 TITMUS 5 EA|$ 41904|$ 20970 ::_glternate-price not provided on
108 |TH8 HUDSON 1 EA|$ 3179 s 31.79 ::_glternate-price not provided on
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109 |TI1 HUDSON > | EA|$ 4579|s o158 ITAB"emate'p”ce not provided on
110 |TI2 HUDSON 1 | EA|s 4579|s 4579 ITAB"emate'p”ce not provided on
111 |TM10 TITMUS 1 | EA|S$ 1642|3$ 1642 ITAB"emate'p”ce not provided on
113 |TR301 TITMUS 17 | EA|$ 3219|$ 547.23 ITAB"emate'p”ce not provided on
114 |TR302 TITMUS > | EA|$ 3219|3 6438 ITAB"emate'p”ce not provided on
115 |TR303 TITMUS 4 |EA|S$ 3219|$ 12876 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce not provided on
116 |TR304 TITMUS 3 | EA|$ 3219|$ 9657 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce not provided on
118 |TR306 TITMUS 1 | EA|S 32193 3219 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce not provided on
119 |TR308 TITMUS 1 | EA|S$ 32193 32190 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce not provided on
120 |TR309 TITMUS 1 | EA|S$ 3349|s 3349 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce not provided on
121 |TR310 TITMUS 1 | EA|S$ 3349|s 3349 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce not provided on
122 |VL1 HUDSON 5 | EA|$ 1431]|$ 7155 ITAB"er”ate'p”ce not provided on
123 |VL2 HUDSON > | EA|$ 14313 2862 ITAB'ter”ate'p”ce not provided on
124 |VL3 HUDSON > | EA|$ 14313 2862 ITAB'ter”ate'p”ce not provided on
125 |VL5 HUDSON 3 | EA|$ 1527|$ 4581 ITAB'ter”ate'p”ce not provided on
126 |VL6 HUDSON 1 | EA|s$ 1527|8$ 1527 ITAB'ter”ate'p”ce not provided on
Lines 25,30,32, 42,63,112,117 are discontinued

and were not included in the cost evaluation.
Lines 26 & 37 were not included in the cost
evaluation due to not all bidders providing a price
for these two lines.
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Line #

Prescription Safety Eyewear

Select Optical

Bid Explanation

Description Qty

UOM

Unit Price Ext. Price

127

ON GUARD 016 FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 50
ONLY

EA

$ 1796( $ 898.00

*** Alternate Brand

128

ON GUARD 035 FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 50
ONLY

EA

$ 18.69( $ 934.50

*** Alternate Brand

129

ON GUARD 042
FRAMES/58/18-140

DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS
ONLY

200

EA

$ 1211 $ 2,422.00

*** Alternate Brand

130

ON GUARD 043S FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 700
ONLY

EA

$ 8.56 | $ 5,992.00

*** Alternate Brand

131

ON GUARD 069P FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 525
ONLY

EA

$ 830 $ 4,357.50

*** Alternate Brand

132

ON GUARD 071P FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 525
ONLY

EA

$ 830 $ 4,357.50

*** Alternate Brand

133

ON GUARD 079S FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 700
ONLY

EA

$ 8.96| $ 6,272.00

*** Alternate Brand

134

ON GUARD 085 FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 725
ONLY

EA

$ 830 $ 6,017.50

*** Alternate Brand

135

ON GUARD 093 FRAMES
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 2525
ONLY

EA

$ 8.30 | $ 20,957.50

*** Alternate Brand

136

SINGLE VISION LENS
DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 5145
ONLY

PR

$ 5.00 | $ 25,725.00

*Price Range $18.00 - $32.00
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Statewide
++ Prescription Safety Eyewear Select Optical Bid Explanation
=
- Description Qty [UOM]| Unit Price Ext. Price
137 |BIFOCAL FT LENS 2610 PR [ $ 12.00| $ 31,320.00 *Price Range $23.00 - $70.00
138 |TRIFOCAL FT LENS 505 | PR | $ 1450| $ 7,322.50 *Price Range $28.00 - $105.00
139 |PROGRESSIVE LENS 90 | PR | $ 3500| $ 3,150.00 *Price Range $50.00 - $90.00
POLYCARBONATE LENS
140 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS ([2270| PR | $ 6.00 [ $ 13,620.00 *Price Range $18.00 - $105.00
ONLY
PLASTIC LENS
141 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS |5990| PR | $ 6.00 [ $ 35,940.00 *Price Range $18.00 - $105.00
ONLY
TRANSITIONS OR
142 [E)gg'lr\./gl;:EggRRECTIONS 240 | PR | $ 30.00| $ 7,200.00 *Price Range $38.00 - $50.00
ONLY
SOLID TINT
143 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 365 | PR | $ 1.00( $ 365.00
ONLY
GRADIENT TINT
144 |DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 365 | PR | $ 100( $ 365.00
ONLY
NOSE PAD
(REPLACEMENT)
145 DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 155 EA | $ 025 $ 38.75
ONLY
FRAME SCREWS
(REPLACEMENT)
146 DEPT. OF CORRECTIONS 1051 EA N/IC
ONLY
Payment Terms Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 15 Days

Comments
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