Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Beverage

Union Supply Company DBA Food Express USA

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)
BACK
COUNTRY
COFFEE, CAPPUCCINO, INSTANT, FRESH $1.19 15 $ 17.85 |8024049 10 OZ, CLEAR, KOSHER,
RESEALABLE POUCH OR PLASTIC, 8 OZ MAX VANILLA RESEALABLE
CAPPUCCINO
COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN- FREEZE DRIED, |FOOD
INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH OR PLASTIC |EXPRESS 100% KOSHER, Resealable, * See
CONTAINER (INCLUDE COLOMBIAN COFFEE |COLUMBIAN $1.87 60| $112.20 | 8024030 attached additional items
LOGO) COFFEE 30z
CORNERSTON
COFFEE, FOLGERS CRYSTALS - FREEZE E CLASSIC Kosher. Plastic Container. *See
DRIED, INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH OR ROAST $4.63 12 $ 55.56 | 8024060 attache,d additional items’
PLASTIC CONTAINER INSTANT
COFFEE 80z
BACK
COFFEE, DECAF, INSTANT FREEZE DRIED COUNTRY $1.27 24| $ 30.48 | 8024041 |Kosher, Clear
' ' DECAF COFFEE ' ' ’
4 0Z
SANKA
INSTANT
COFFEE
COFFEE, FOLGERS, DECAF SINGLES SINGLE $0.09 500| $ 45.00 |8024026(Sanka brand, KOSHER
SERVING, 100
CT
MAXWELL
COFFEE, MAXWELL HOUSE INSTANT POUCH |HOUSE 40Z Clear, Kosher, *See additional
- INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH INSTANT $4.11 24| $ 98.64 18024019 items
COFFEE
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Beverage

Union Supply Company DBA Food Express USA

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs

SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT i .

DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)

FOOD
DRINK MIX, LIST ALL FLAVORS, LEMONADE (E))éPLRI)EIi/ISOSN%AZDE
MUST BE INCLUDED. Drink mixes must be in a KOSHER, Resealable, Clear *See

! ) DRINK MIX $1.34 15| $ 20.10 | 8045165 i .

resealable fiber pouch or resealable plastic SUGAR attached additional items 12 oz
container SWEETENED

resealable pouch
SPORT DRINK,_ LIST ALL FLAVORS GATORADE
AVAILABLE. Drink mixes must be in resealable . .
. . . INSTANT MIX *See attached additional items
fiber pouches or resealable plastic containers. RIPTIDE RUSH $0.51 144| $ 73.44 18019052 makes 320z or 1 Quart
ACCEPTABLE BRANDS: POWER AID, ALL 212 07
SPORTS AND GATORADE )

BACK
HOT CHOCOLATE, POUCH ACCEPTABLE ggg(N);RY HOT $1.58 15| $ 23.70 | 8045170 10 OZ Resealable, Clear, Kosher,
BRANDS: NESTLES, CARNATION AND KEEFE ' ' *See attached additional items

SUPREME 10

oz

STURM'S HOT L
HOT CHOCOLATE, INDIVIDUAL PACKET, 10- COCOA MIX 10 $1.48 12| $ 17.76 | 8020013 1 OZ Pkts, Kosher, (F.’r.|0e |s.f0r
16 OZ cT 10) *See attached aditional items
HOT CHOCOLATE, PLASTIC CONTAINER No Bid $ -

STURM'S HOT L .
HOT CHOCOLATE, SUGARLESS COCOA 8 CT $1.38 12| $ 16.56 |8020012| >3 OZ PKIS (Price is for 8) *See

attached additional items

NO SUGAR
JUICE, GRAPEFRUIT No Bid $ -
JUICE, ORANGE No Bid $ -
JUICE, V8 \C/)ZB JUICE 115 $0.78 24| $ 18.72 |8052008|Kosher
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Union Supply Company DBA Food Express USA

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—:)ilal and Animal

EACH
FOOD
EXPRESS 12
OZ BREAKFAST KOSHER, Resealable, Clear *See
INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK DRINK MIX $1.38 15| $ 20.70 | 8045166 attached additional items
SUGAR
SWEETENED
FOOD
TEA BAGS, INDIVIDUAL EXPRESS 100 $1.26 36| $ 45.36 |8090022|Kosher, 100 ct
CT TEA BAGS

TEA, NESTEA TEA (POUCH), INSTANT No Bid $ -

FOOD
EXPRESS 12
TEA, SUGAR AND LEMON, INSTANT 07 ICED TEA $1.34 15| $ 20.10 [ 8045164 |Kosher, Clear, Resealable
W/LEMON
Payment Terms 030

Delivery Days ARO 5

DRINK MIX, LIST ALL FLAVORS, LEMONADE
MUST BE INCLUDED. Drink mixes must be in a
resealable fiber pouch or resealable plastic
container
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Union Supply Company DBA Food Express USA
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . .
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PITEIECE:'—I{BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—;e;lal and Animal

CONTINUED - DRINK MIX, LIST ALL
FLAVORS, LEMONADE MUST BE INCLUDED.
Drink mixes must be in a resealable fiber
pouch or resealable plastic container
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Union Supply Company DBA Food Express USA
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . .
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PITEIECE:'—I{BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—;e;lal and Animal

CONTINUED - DRINK MIX, LIST ALL
FLAVORS, LEMONADE MUST BE INCLUDED.
Drink mixes must be in a resealable fiber
pouch or resealable plastic container
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Beverage

Union Supply Company DBA Food Express USA

DESCRIPTION

SPECIFY BRAND &
SIZE BIDDING

UNIT
PRICE BY
EACH

CASE
QUANTITY

CASE
PRICE

PRODUCT
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
Free)

INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK

TEA BAGS, INDIVIDUAL
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF

BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

AWARD

Canteen Beverage

Keefe Group

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs

SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE PRODUCT . ;

DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY | PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)

Brushy Creek Clear pack-Resealable pouch
COFFEE, CAPPUCCINO, INSTANT, : o
RESEALABLE POUCH OR PLASTIC, 8 OZ MAX French V.anllla $0.93 18 $16.74 (3701 halal & kosher **Currently

Cappuccino 8 oz purchase**

0,

COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN- FREEZE DRIED, éi?:;&&?f’ Clear back-Resealable bouch
INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH OR PLASTIC Freeze Dried $1.72 24| $41.28 |7022 halal 8?kosher **Curren?l
CONTAINER (INCLUDE COLOMBIAN COFFEE ’ ’ y

Resealable wi/cl purchase**
LOGO)

panel 3 oz
COFFEE, FOLGERS CRYSTALS - FREEZE Foloers Instant
DRIED, INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH OR Jar9802 $4.96 12| $59.52 (102
PLASTIC CONTAINER

Keefe Decaf Clear pack-Resealable pouch
COFFEE, DECAF, INSTANT FREEZE DRIED resealable wiclr $2.05 $49.20 |7024 halal & kosher **Currently

panel 3 oz purchase**

Nescafe tasters Nescafe tasters choice
COFFEE, FOLGERS, DECAF SINGLES . $0.12 480| $57.60 |4452 decaffeinated stick/single 1.7

choice 1.7 grams

gram-kosher

COFFEE, MAXWELL HOUSE INSTANT POUCH |Maxwell House - 24| $62.40 2974 E;T;rgf’ig;i?ifg'jgfnﬁo”Ch
- INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH 40z ' ’ purchase** y
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF

BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

AWARD
Canteen Beverage Keefe Group
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE PRODUCT . ;
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY | PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)
DRINK MIX, LIST ALL FLAVORS, LEMONADE
MUST BE INCLUDED. Drink mixes must_ beina See attachment $ - See attachment
resealable fiber pouch or resealable plastic
container
SPORT DRINK, LIST ALL FLAVORS
AVAILABLE. Drink mixes must be in resealable
fiber pouches or resealable plastic containers. See attachment $ - See attachment
ACCEPTABLE BRANDS: POWER AID, ALL
SPORTS AND GATORADE
HOT CHOCOLATE, POUCH ACCEPTABLE Hot Choc $0.88 18| $15.84 |7039 Resealable pouch-clear panel
BRANDS: NESTLES, CARNATION AND KEEFE |resealable 100z ' ’ Kosher & Halal
HOT CHOCOLATE, INDIVIDUAL PACKET, 10- [Keefe SS Hot $0.11 300| $33.00 |114 Single serve per size spec
16 OZ Cocoa
HOT CHOCOLATE, PLASTIC CONTAINER No Bid $ - THIS WAS DISCONTINUED
Sturms Hot
HOT CHOCOLATE, SUGARLESS Cocar S/F 8CT $1.28(8ct box 12| $15.36 |6691 8 COUNT BOX 12/CS
Box
Grapefruit Juic
JUICE, GRAPEFRUIT 55 07 $0.37 48| $17.76 |442
JUICE, ORANGE Oozra”ge Juice S5 g 41 48| $19.68 441
JUICE, V8 g: (;/Zegetab'e $0.59 48| $28.32 [472 5.5 0z 8/6 packs
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF

BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

AWARD

Canteen Beverage

Keefe Group

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE PRODUCT . i
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY | PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)
INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK See attachment $ - See See attachment
attachment
See
TEA BAGS, INDIVIDUAL See attachment $ - See attachment
attachment
TEA, NESTEA TEA (POUCH), INSTANT MR el $0.40 50| $20.00 |55 Makes/gallon
inst Tea 56
Nestea w/Suagar Resealable pouch-clear pouch
TEA, SUGAR AND LEMON, INSTANT & Lemon 9 $1.15 18] $20.70 |7031 110Z *CURRENTLY
PURCHASE**
Payment Terms Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 3
DRINK MIX, LIST ALL FLAVORS, LEMONADE [Sweet Fusion
MUST BE INCLUDED. Drink mixes must_ be in a |Orange _ 144 12| $17.28 891 Clear Panel/Resealable 190z
resealable fiber pouch or resealable plastic Breakfast Drink Pouch
container Mix, 19 oz.
Sweet Fusion
w/Lemon & Clear Panel/Resealable 190z
Sugar Drink Mix, 1.48 2| ST 892 Pouch
190z. Plastic jar
Sweet Fusion
Lemonade Drink Clear Panel/Resealable 190z
Mix, 190z. Plastic 1.89 12| S22 893 Pouch
jar
Sweet Fusion
Cherry Drink Mix, 1.44 12| $17.28 g (B5E0 PEITSHRESEEERE At
L Pouch
190z. Plastic jar
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF

BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

AWARD
Canteen Beverage Keefe Group
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE PRODUCT . ;
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY | PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)
CONTINUED - DRINK MIX, LIST ALL Sweet Fusion
FLAVORS, LEMONADE MUST BE INCLUDED. |Fruit Drink Mix A 12| $17.28 805 Clear Panel/Resealable 190z
Drink mixes must be in a resealable fiber Punch, 190z. ' ’ Pouch
pouch or resealable plastic container Plastic jar
Sweet Fusion
Peach Drink Mix, 1.44 12| $17.28 gg7|Clear Panel/Resealable 190z
o Pouch
190z. Plastic jar
Sweet Fusion
UL [AES 1.93 24| $46.32 6987|Clear Panel/Resealable Halal
Tea/w lemon 10
stick pouch
Sweet Fusion
Sugar Free
Strawberry- 1.55 24| $37.20 gog1|CIear Panel/Resealable
Kosher/Halal
Watermelon 10
stick pouch
Sweet Fusion
Sugar Free Fruit Clear Panel/Resealable
Punch 10 stick L 21| BT Sl Kosher/Halal
pouch
Sweet Fusion
Sugar Free Clear Panel/Resealable
Mango-Lime 10 2.19 2 SR 6986 Kosher/Halal
stick pouch
Sweet Fusion
Sugar Free Clear Panel/Resealable
Orange Peach 1.59 20 R 6982 Kosher/Halal
10 stick pouch
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF

BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

AWARD
Canteen Beverage Keefe Group
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE PRODUCT . ;
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY | PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)
CONTINUED - DRINK MIX, LIST ALL Sweet Fusion
FLAVORS, LEMONADE MUST BE INCLUDED. |Sugar Free Clear Panel/Resealable
Drink mixes must be in a resealable fiber Pineapple- 1.74 24] $41.76 6983
. i . Kosher/Halal
pouch or resealable plastic container Cherimoya 10
stick pouch
Crystal Light
Lemonade 170z 0.27 120] $32.40 636
Crystal Light
Peach Tea 0907 0.27 120( $32.40 644
Crystal Light
Raspberry Ice 0.27 120( $32.40 646
.080z
Slpeii) Lt 0.27 120| $32.40 747
Sunrise .160z
Sugar Free
Sevilla Horchata 13 18| $23.40 30g5|Clear Panel/Resealable
Kosher/Halal
resealable
LR Uil Clear Resealable wi/clear panel
Lemonade 1.24 18| $22.32 7036 P
Kosher and Halal
Resealable 120z
Country Time
Raspberry 124 18| $22.32 71536 Clear Resealable w/clear panel
Kosher and Halal
Lemonade 120z
Fruit Punch
Gatorade 1 Qt., 0.41 144| $59.04 4468
2.12 oz
Lemon Lime
Gatorade 1 Qt., 0.41 144 $59.04 4466
2.12 oz
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF

BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

AWARD
Canteen Beverage Keefe Group
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE PRODUCT . ;
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY | PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)

Carnation lbre
NSA Chocolate 0.59 64| $37.76 9710
Carnation lbre

INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK NSA Vanilla 0.59 )] S80S 9711
Variety Carnation
Instant Breakfast 0.45 60| $27.00 536|1.260z ea 12.60z 60/cs
10ct
Keefe Tea Bags, 2.29 24| $54.96 416|Kosher
48ct
Bigelow 6
Assorted Teas 2.03 6] $12.18 428

TEA BAGS, INDIVIDUAL 18ct

Bigelow Earl
Grey Tea 2.03 6] $12.18 421
Bigelow Earl
Grey Decaf Tea 2.03 6] $12.18 423
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Maxima Supply
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PITEIECE:'—I{BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—;e)alal and Animal

COFFEE, CAPPUCCINO, INSTANT,

RESEALABLE POUCH OR PLASTIC, 8 OZ MAX No Bid $ -
COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN- FREEZE DRIED,
INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH OR PLASTIC Maxima 3.3 oz $1.84 sal 117 76 lcoras

CONTAINER (INCLUDE COLOMBIAN COFFEE
LOGO)

COFFEE, FOLGERS CRYSTALS - FREEZE
DRIED, INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH OR  |Folgers 8 oz $5.10 12| $ 61.20 [COF7
PLASTIC CONTAINER

COFFEE, DECAF, INSTANT FREEZE DRIED S;’Ston s Best3 $1.68 64| $107.52 |cOF10

COFFEE, FOLGERS, DECAF SINGLES No Bid $ -

COFFEE, MAXWELL HOUSE INSTANT POUCH

- INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH No Bid $ )
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Maxima Supply
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PITEIECE}I?Y QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—:)ilal and Animal

DRINK MIX, LIST ALL FLAVORS, LEMONADE
MUST BE INCLUDED. Drink mixes must be in a
resealable fiber pouch or resealable plastic
container

See Attachment $ -

SPORT DRINK, LIST ALL FLAVORS
AVAILABLE. Drink mixes must be in resealable
fiber pouches or resealable plastic containers. No Bid $ -
ACCEPTABLE BRANDS: POWER AID, ALL
SPORTS AND GATORADE

HOT CHOCOLATE, POUCH ACCEPTABLE

BRANDS: NESTLES, CARNATION AND KEEFE |NO B $ -

HOT CHOCOLATE, INDIVIDUAL PACKET, 10- |Better Valu 10

16 O7 pk/10 0z $1.20 12| $ 14.40 [HC150
HOT CHOCOLATE, PLASTIC CONTAINER Sturm's 16 oz $1.88 12| $ 22.56 [HC320
HOT CHOCOLATE, SUGARLESS Sturm'’s 8 pk $0.89 12| $ 10.68 [HC152
JUICE, GRAPEFRUIT Bluebird 5.5 oz $0.45 48| $ 21.60 [JC800
JUICE, ORANGE Bluebird 5.5 oz $0.49 48| $ 23.52 [JC801
JUICE, V8 V8 5.5 0z $0.60 48| $ 28.80 (JC802
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Maxima Supply
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)
INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK No Bid $ -

Eastern Tea

TEA BAGS, INDIVIDUAL 48/bx $0.80 241 $ 19.20 [TE15
TEA, NESTEA TEA (POUCH), INSTANT No Bid $ -

TEA, SUGAR AND LEMON, INSTANT Maxima 12 oz $1.19 15( $ 17.85 |DR51
Payment Terms Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 3

DRINK MIX, LIST ALL FLAVORS, LEMONADE
MUST BE INCLUDED. Drink mixes must be in a
resealable fiber pouch or resealable plastic
container
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Beverage

Maxima Supply

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . .
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PITEIECE:'—I{BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—;e)alal and Animal

CONTINUED - DRINK MIX, LIST ALL

Drink mixes must be in a resealable fiber
pouch or resealable plastic container

FLAVORS, LEMONADE MUST BE INCLUDED.
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Beverage

Maxima Supply

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE |PRODUCT . .
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PITEIECE:'—I{BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—;e)alal and Animal

CONTINUED - DRINK MIX, LIST ALL

Drink mixes must be in a resealable fiber
pouch or resealable plastic container

FLAVORS, LEMONADE MUST BE INCLUDED.
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Beverage

Maxima Supply

DESCRIPTION

SPECIFY BRAND &
SIZE BIDDING

UNIT
PRICE BY
EACH

CASE
QUANTITY

CASE
PRICE

PRODUCT
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
Free)

INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK

TEA BAGS, INDIVIDUAL
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Walkenhorst's
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE | PRODUCT . :

DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)

COFFEE, CAPPUCCINO, INSTANT, No Bid s -

RESEALABLE POUCH OR PLASTIC, 8 OZ MAX

COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN- FREEZE DRIED,

INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH OR PLASTIC No Bid '

CONTAINER (INCLUDE COLOMBIAN COFFEE

LOGO)

COFFEE, FOLGERS CRYSTALS - FREEZE Folgers Instant 8 46588-

DRIED, INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH OR o7 9 $6.20 12| $74.40 360

PLASTIC CONTAINER

COFFEE, DECAF, INSTANT FREEZE DRIED No Bid $ -

COFFEE, FOLGERS, DECAF SINGLES No Bid $ -

COFFEE, MAXWELL HOUSE INSTANT POUCH No Bid $ -

- INSTANT, RESEALABLE POUCH
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Walkenhorst's

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE | PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING Pl?éigﬁY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—;e)ilal and Animal

DRINK MIX, LIST ALL FLAVORS, LEMONADE
MUST BE INCLUDED. Drink mixes must be in a
resealable fiber pouch or resealable plastic
container

No Bid $ -

SPORT DRINK, LIST ALL FLAVORS
AVAILABLE. Drink mixes must be in resealable
fiber pouches or resealable plastic containers. No Bid $ -
ACCEPTABLE BRANDS: POWER AID, ALL
SPORTS AND GATORADE

HOT CHOCOLATE, POUCH ACCEPTABLE , 62267-
BRANDS: NESTLES, CARNATION AND KEEFE |'\€SUe'S $2.70 12| $32.40 35 10x .7 0z packets

HOT CHOCOLATE, INDIVIDUAL PACKET, 10-

16 OZ No Bid $ -

Nestle's 62267-
HOT CHOCOLATE, PLASTIC CONTAINER Nesquick 16 0z $6.30 6| $37.80 020
HOT CHOCOLATE, SUGARLESS No Bid $ -
JUICE, GRAPEFRUIT No Bid $ -
JUICE, ORANGE No Bid $ -
JUICE, V8 No Bid $ -
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Beverage

Walkenhorst's

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE | PRODUCT i i

DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free)

INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK Carnation $6.00 6/ $36.00 |  s0000|KOSher 10 ct Strawberry, Choco,

Van, Variety

TEA BAGS, INDIVIDUAL Lipton 48 ct $3.70 12| $44.40 |3111-268 |Decaf

TEA, NESTEA TEA (POUCH), INSTANT No Bid $ -

TEA, SUGAR AND LEMON, INSTANT No Bid $ -

Payment Terms 0

Delivery Days ARO 7-10

DRINK MIX, LIST ALL FLAVORS, LEMONADE
MUST BE INCLUDED. Drink mixes must be in a
resealable fiber pouch or resealable plastic
container
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Walkenhorst's
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE | PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING Pl?éicE:ﬁY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—:;lal and Animal

CONTINUED - DRINK MIX, LIST ALL
FLAVORS, LEMONADE MUST BE INCLUDED.
Drink mixes must be in aresealable fiber
pouch or resealable plastic container
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3850 OF Opening Date: 12/16/2011
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Canteen Beverage Walkenhorst's
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE | PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING Pl?éicE:ﬁY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—:;lal and Animal

CONTINUED - DRINK MIX, LIST ALL
FLAVORS, LEMONADE MUST BE INCLUDED.
Drink mixes must be in aresealable fiber
pouch or resealable plastic container
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3850 OF
BEVERAGE PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Beverage

Walkenhorst's

UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
SPECIFY BRAND & CASE CASE | PRODUCT . :
DESCRIPTION SIZE BIDDING Pl?éicE:ﬁY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Koshe;:rr,el—:;lal and Animal

INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK

TEA BAGS, INDIVIDUAL

Page 24 of 24

Award Explanation: Itis in the best interest of the State not to award two
items to a contract for Hot Chocolate (Sugarless) and Tea Bags and not to
award one item to a contract for Coffee (Folgers, Decaf, Singles). No
award will be made to bidders for Folgers/Decaf and Hot Chocolate
(Plastic Container).



