Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3849 OF Dental

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
Canteen Dental _ Comade, Inc.
SPECIEY SPECIFY
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs

BRAND, SIZE CASE CASE PRODUCT . N CASE PRODUCT : X

DESCRIPTION and COUNT PRICE BY QUANTITY PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and |PRICE BY QUANTITY CASE PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
BIDDING EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)
BIDDING
DENTURE BRUSH No Bid $ - Noved $0.16 1440 $ 230.40 |TBDEN
DENTURE CUP, INDIVIDUAL No Bid $ - DawnMist $0.17| 250 $ 4250 [ DCPC [Packed 25ea/bag, 10 bags/cs
PACKAGE
Fresh Mint

DENTURE TABLETS, GENERIC, | BoxDenture | - ¢; o714 |g 32.88 | Dentdo Freshmint| $1.38] 24 |$ 33.12 | Dent40 |40 tablets/box, 24 boxes/case
10-40 CT Cleaner

Tablets 40ct
DENTURE TABLETS - NAME .
BRAND, 40-40 CT No Bid $ :
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PASTE, . .
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE Effergrip 2.50z $4.22 12 $ 50.64 | EG01031 No Bid $ -
DENTURE ADHESIVE, . .
POWDER, GENERIC, LIST size | O Bl s No Bid $ ;
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PAD, . .
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE No Bid s No Bid $ ;
FLOSS, DENTAL TAPE, 100 . .
YARDS MAX No Bid $ - Freshmint $0.35 12 $ 4.20 | DF12 12 yards
FLOSS, DENTAL SAFETY LOOP No Bid $ - No Bid $ -
FLOSS, DENTAL, WAXED, 100 .
YARDS MAX Freshmint $0.80 72 $ 57.60 [ DF100 [100 yards
MOUTHWASH, LIST BRAND,
NON ALCOHOL, ANIMAL FREE , No Bid $ -
6-8 OZ
MOUTHWASH, NAME BRAND, No Bid $ :
NON ALCOHOL, 6-8 OZ
MOUTHWASH, GENERIC, NON . .
ALCOHOL, 6-8 07 No Bid $ - Freshmint $0.69 60 $ 41.40 | FMW4 |4 oz bottles
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3849 OF Dental

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
SPECIFY SPECIFY
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
BRAND, SIZE CASE CASE PRODUCT . N CASE PRODUCT s K

DESCRIPTION and COUNT PRICE BY QUANTITY PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and |PRICE BY QUANTITY CASE PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal

BIDDING EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)

BIDDING
TOOTHBRUSH HOLDER/CAP, Toothbrush
PLASTIC, TUBE TYPE Holder Clear $0.16 100 $ 16.00 | TBHLDR Noved $0.17 100 $ 17.00 | TBHLDR
TOOTHBRUSH, NAME BRAND, .
SOFT ONLY No Bid $ ;
Toothbrush 36

TOOTHBRUSH, GENERIC, Tuft ind $0.05| 1440 $ 72.00 | TB36 DawnMist $0.06| 1440 $ 86.40 | TB30
SOFT ONLY

bagged

N " Toothbrush
TOOTHBRUSH, 3.5 TO 4%, short handle 3 $0.03| 1440 $ 43.20 | TBSH Noved $0.04| 1440 $ 57.60 | TBSH
SAFETY "
716

TOOTHPASTE, MUST BE . .
KOSHER/ANIMAL FREE, 4-6 OZ Ultra Brite 60z $1.12 24 $ 26.88 | UB56685 No Bid $ -
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC Freshmint *See attachment for Additional
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4- Toothpaste $0.51 60 $ 30.60 | TP46 items Freshmint $0.69 60 $ 41.40 | TP46 4.60z with Flouride
6 0Z 4.60z
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND, *See attachment for Additional .
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ Closeup 40z $1.13 24 $ 27.12 | CL74242 items No Bid $ -
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC, FS’ESh_’tT_""t
SENSITIVE TEETH AND GUMS, T e;slll\;e $1.05 24 $ 25.20 | TPS43 Freshmint $1.02 24 $ 24.48 | TPS43 |Equal to Sensodyne
4-6 0Z eetn 4,502

Individual
TOOTHPASTE, SENSODYNE, 4- No Bid $ }
6 OZ
Payment Terms: 30 0.5 10
Delivery Days ARO: 7 5-10

TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-
6 0Z

TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND,
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011
Bid Tab
Canteen Dental Comade, Inc.
SPECIFY UNIT State Any Changes From Specs SBPREACI\IIFDY UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
BRAND, SIZE CASE CASE PRODUCT . X ' CASE PRODUCT s K
DESCRIPTION and COUNT PRICE BY QUANTITY PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and |PRICE BY QUANTITY CASE PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)

BIDDING BIDDING
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3849 OF Dental
Bid Tab

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Dental

Drugstore Products

DBA Food Express (Union Supply company)

SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs SPECIFY BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
DESCRIPTION SIZE and | PRICE BY QUCAANSTI?TY PCRAICS:E F;\‘RUOMDBUECRT (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal SIZE and COUNT |PRICE BY QUCAANSTI?TY PCRAICS:E F;\‘RUOMDBU;?T (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
COUNT EACH Free) BIDDING EACH Free)
BIDDING
ORAFIX
DENTURE BRUSH No Bid $ - DENTURE $0.98 72 70.56 7015003
BRUSH
ORAFIX
DENTURE CUP, INDIVIDUAL . DENTURE CUP
PACKAGE No Bid $ - 24 ct ASSORTED $0.98 24 23.52 7015002
COLORS
IODENT
DENTURE TABLETS, GENERIC, . DENTURE
10-40 CT No Bid $ CLEANER TABS $1.32 12 15.84 7015045
42 ct (COMPARE
DENTURE TABLETS - NAME Polident .
BRAND, 40-40 CT 40ct $3.13 12 $ 37.56 | #1160 No Bid -
FIXODENT 1.4
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PASTE, . OZ ORIGINAL - .
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE No Bid $ - ADHESIVE $3.29 24 78.96 7015008|See additional items
DENTURE
DENTURE ADHESIVE, . .
POWDER, GENERIC, LIST size | ° Bid s No Bid ;
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PAD, . .
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE No Bid s No Bid ;
FLOSS, DENTAL TAPE, 100 Freshmint .
YARDS MAX 100 Yds $0.935 72 $ 67.32 | #1151 No Bid -
FLOSS, DENTAL SAFETY LOOP | No Bid $ - No Bid -
TEK FLOSS 100
FLOSS, DENTAL, WAXED, 100 . YDS WAXED
YARDS MAX No Bid $ MINT FLAVOR $0.90 72 64.80 7315011
CLEAR DISP
MOUTHWASH, LIST BRAND,
NON ALCOHOL, ANIMAL FREE ,| No Bid $ - No Bid -
6-8 OZ
CREST PRO
MOUTHWASH, NAME BRAND, . HEALTH .
NON ALCOHOL, 6.8 0Z No Bid $ - MOUTHWASH $3.49 24 83.76 7046010|Animal Free
ALCOHOL FREE
SWEET TALK
'\AA&UO-I—:(\)IY_AZ’: OGZENERIC’ NON No Bid $ - ALCOHOL FREE $0.79 24 18.96 7046101
’ MOUTHWASH

Page 4 of 18




Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3849 OF Dental
Bid Tab

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Dental

Drugstore Products

DBA Food Express (Union Supply company)

SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs SPECIFY BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
DESCRIPTION SIZE and | PRICE BY US\ANSTI?TY :';\Iglé P’\‘RUOMDBUECRT (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal SIZE and COUNT |PRICE BY US\ANSTI?TY :';\Iglé T\‘RUOMDBUECJ (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
COUNT EACH Q Free) BIDDING EACH Q Free)
BIDDING
TOOTHBRUSH HOLDER/CAP, . .
PLASTIC, TUBE TYPE No Bid s - No Bid -
COLGATE FULL
TOOTHBRUSH, NAME BRAND, . HEAD CELLO - .
SOFT ONLY No Bid $ - WRAPPED SOFT $0.22 144 31.68 7015038|See additional items
TOOTHBRUSH
TEK STRAIGHT
TOOTHBRUSH, GENERIC, No Bid $ - TOOTHBRUSH $0.33 72 23.76 7015011|See additional items
SOFT ONLY
SOFT
3" SECURITY
TOOTHBRUSH, 3.5" TO 4", . TOOTHBRUSH
SAFETY No Bid $ - WHITE THUMB $0.08 720 57.60 7015043
HANDLE
TOOTHPASTE, MUST BE Ultrabrite This is the brand you awarded last COLGATE
' $1.11 24 $ 26.64 | #2440 . y CLEAR GEL $1.79 24 42.96 7075031|See additional items
KOSHER/ANIMAL FREE, 4-6 OZ 6 0z time.
TOOTHPASTE
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC FRESH MINT 4.6
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4- No Bid $ - OZ CLEAR GEL $0.68 60 40.80 7075102
6 0Z TOOTHPASTE
ULTRA BRITE
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND, see attached page for additional -, .
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ AIM 60z $0.98 24 $ 23.52 | #2400 item. TOO'I(;I—C|)PZASTE $1.16 24 27.84 7075042|See additional items
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC, COLGATE 6 OZ
SENSITIVE TEETH AND GUMS, No Bid $ - PLUS SENSITIVE $3.60 24 86.40 7075011
4-6 OZ TOOTHPASTE
SENSODYNE 4
TOOTHPASTE, SENSODYNE, 4- . 0Z MAX
602 No Bid $ - STRENGTH $5.16 12 61.92 7075039
COOL GEL
Payment Terms: 0 30
Delivery Days ARO: 5 5

TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-
6 0Z

TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND,
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ
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3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Buyer: Lisa Rolik
Bid Tab
Canteen Dental Drugstore Products DBA Food Express (Union Supply company)

SPECIFY

BRAND, UNIT CASE CASE PRODUCT Stat§ Any Changes From Spgcs SPECIFY BRAND, UNIT CASE CASE PRODUCT Stat§ Any Changes From Spgcs
DESCRIPTION SIZE and | PRICE BY QUANTITY PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal SIZE and COUNT |PRICE BY QUANTITY PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal

COUNT EACH Free) BIDDING EACH Free)

BIDDING
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3849 OF Dental

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
AWARD
Canteen Dental Keefe Group Henry Schein Inc
SPECIFY SPECIFY
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
BRAND, SIZE CASE PRODUCT ; - CASE CASE | PRODUCT - :
DESCRIPTION and COUNT PRICE BY QUANTITY CASE PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal |SIZE and [PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE | NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
BIDDING EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)
BIDDING
Grande Denture
DENTURE BRUSH Brush $1.22 6 $ 7.32 |21643 12/Bx $0.41| 12 bx/ca 102-6790
DENTURE CUP, INDIVIDUAL Sea Bond .
PACKAGE Denture Cup $1.32 12 $ 15.84 |20349 Animal Free 12/Bx $0.66| 12/bx - | 255-8753
Fresh Mint
DENTURE TABLETS, GENERIC, Denture Tablets $1.34 24 $ 32.16 |24125 Animal Free 42/Bx $0.05| 42/bx - | 114-4205
10-40 CT
40ct
Efferdent
DENTURE TABLETS - NAME Denture Tablets $4.20 6 $  25.20 |20310 90 count 40/Bx $0.09] 12/ca - | 583-0036
BRAND, 40-40 CT
90ct
Effergrup
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PASTE, R X
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE Adhesive $3.32 12 $ 39.84 |20312 Animal Free 2.4 0z $5.22| 24/case - | 165-3885
Cream 2.50z
Staydent
DENTURE ADHESIVE, .
POWDER, GENERIC, LIST SIZE De.nture $2.10 24 $ 50.40 |21596 Cream not Powder No Bid -
Adhesive 2.40z
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PAD, . .
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE No Bid $ : No Bid ;
Crawford
FLOSS, DENTAL TAPE, 100 Unwaxed .
YARDS MAX Dental Floss $0.79 12 $ 9.48 20488 Animal Free $1.04| 72/case 155-5728
100 yds
FLOSS, DENTAL SAFETY Loop | DEMalFlosser ) gy 20l 144 | 10656 [20538 No Bid -
Pick 35 pack
FLOSS, DENTAL, WAXED, 100 | Freshmint Option: 20487 Crawford Waxed
YARDS MAX Waxe;ial:(ljzss 12 $0.39 12 $ 4.68 (24227 Dental 100 yds 12/cs $.78 each 200 yds $1.19( 72/case | $85.68 |155-4658
MOUTHWASH, LIST BRAND, MHe[;:ageh
NON ALCOHOL, ANIMAL FREE , Z‘: "r‘]’als $060] 24 |$ 14.40 [22456 |Animal Free 12/ca | $2.85| 12/ca - | 321-0046
6-80Z cono
Freshmint
Heritage
48/Case
MOUTHWASH, NAME BRAND, Mouthwash .
NON ALCOHOL, 6-8 OZ Alcohol $0.60 24 $  14.40 |22456 Animal Free 16 oz $0.43| 48/ca - | 325-0041
; 6 cases
Freshmint
Heritage
MOUTHWASH, GENERIC, NON Mouthwash Non $0.82 12 $ 9.84 22457 Animal Free 240z $1.87| 12/ca - | 900-4544
ALCOHOL, 6-8 OZ Alcohol
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3849 OF Dental
Bid Tab

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Dental

Keefe Group

Henry Schein Inc

SPECIFY SPECIFY
UNIT State Any Changes From Specs BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
BRAND, SIZE CASE PRODUCT ; - CASE CASE | PRODUCT ; :
DESCRIPTION and COUNT PRICE BY QUANTITY CASE PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal |SIZE and [PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE | NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
BIDDING EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)
BIDDING
TOOTHBRUSH HOLDER/CAP Toothbrush 29
PLASTIC, TUBE TYPE Holder 2 Piece $0.24 12 $ 2.88 (20275 UPC Coded Animal Free boxe_s $ -
No Bid
Colgate Cello
TOOTHBRUSH, NAME BRAND, Wrapped Soft $0.31 144 $ 44.64 |21230 Also Tek-Pro 20480 72/cs 6/Bx $1.49| 12/ca |$ - |543-2363
SOFT ONLY
Brush
28 Tuft Nylon
TOOTHBRUSH, GENERIC, Bristle Soft $0.04 1440 $ 57.60 |20458 Animal Free 72/Bx $0.52| 6l/ca $ - |[900-4067
SOFT ONLY
Cello Wrapped
Child
TOOTHBRUSH, 3.5" TO 4", 4"Short Handle 24/Bx/
SAFETY Toothbrush $0.04 1440 $ 51.84 |32183 17 $0.97| 24/pk [$ - |110-4812
boxes
TOOTHPASTE, MUST BE See .
KOSHER/ANIMAL FREE, 4-6 OZ See Attachment Attachment $ - See Attachment No Bid $ -
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC See
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-{See Attachment $ - See Attachment No Bid $ -
Attachment
6 0Z
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND, See
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ See Attachment P —— $ = See Attachment $1.14| 24/ca |$ - |543-0023
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC, FsreSh.'tT."m
SENSITIVE TEETH AND GUMS, | _Sensttive $073| 24 |$ 1752 [24086 |Like Sensodyne No Bid $ -
Toothpaste
4-6 OZ
4.30z
TOOTHPASTE, SENSODYNE, 4| Sensodyne | g 56l 12 |$  64.20 |21480 $5.96| 12ca |$ - |915-2411
6 OZ Toothpaste 40z
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO: 3
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC Freshmint
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4- Toothpaste $0.47 60 $ 28.20 |21233
6 OZ 4.60z
Colgate Baking
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND Soda
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ w{Perpmde $2.17 24 $ 52.08 [20359 6.40z
Whitening Gel
6.40z
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3849 OF Dental

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Buyer: Lisa Rolik
Bid Tab
Canteen Dental Keefe Group Henry Schein Inc
SPECIFY UNIT State Any Changes From Specs SBF;zE:r\IJFDY UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
PRODUCT (Identif Kyosher g:—ialal and Ar;imal SIZE ané PRICE BY CASE CASE | PRODUCT (Identif Kyosher 9I1-|ala| and A'?-nmal
y J QUANTITY| PRICE | NUMBER v Fr’ee)

DESCRIPTION

BRAND, SIZE CASE
PRICE BY CASE PRICE NUMBER

and COUNT QUANTITY
BIDDING EACH

Free) COUNT EACH
BIDDING
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
AWARD
Canteen Dental ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Maxima Supply
SPECIFY SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
CASE CASE |PRODUCT ; ; BRAND, SIZE CASE CASE |PRODUCT ; :

DESCRIPTION SIZE and |PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE | NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal and COUNT PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE |nNUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal

COUNT EACH Free) BIDDING EACH Free)

BIDDING
DENTURE BRUSH F;Zi? $0.14| 144/bx |$ 20.16 |TBDEN pr. F';Sh 72| go0s8| $72.00|$ 41.76 |DB248
DENTURE CUP, INDIVIDUAL . .
PACKAGE No Bid $ - No Bid $ -
DENTURE TABLETS, GENERIC, | Fresh- T DENT .
10-40 CT Mint $0.03[ 40/bx |[$ 1.38 40 Generic 40 ct $0.41 24 $ 9.84 | PC550
DENTURE TABLETS - NAME .
BRAND, 40-40 CT No Bid $ - Efferdent 1 ct $0.04| 240 $ 9.60 | PC547
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PASTE, . Staydent 2.4
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE No Bid $ - oz $1.88 24 $ 45.12 | PH300

PASTE 2
DENTURE ADHESIVE, .
POWDER, GENERIC, LIST SIZE OZMFirr::sh- $1.82( 72/bx |[$131.04 | TDA2 No Bid $ -
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PAD, . .
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE No Bid s - No Bid $ -
FLOSS, DENTAL TAPE, 100 . Generic 12
YARDS MAX No Bid $ yards $0.35 12 $ 4.20 | FL114
FLOSS, DENTAL SAFETY LOOP | No Bid $ - No Bid $ -
FLOSS, DENTAL, WAXED, 100 |Freshmint .
YARDS MAX 100 yds $0.77| 72/cs $ 55.44 | T029B No Bid $
MOUTHWASH, LIST BRAND, 1Cs
NON ALCOHOL, ANIMAL FREE , 402 $0.39( 60/cs |[$ 23.40 | TO304 Generic 4 0z $0.29 60 $ 17.40 | PC674
6-8 OZ
MOUTHWASH, NAME BRAND, . .
NON ALCOHOL, 6-8 0Z No Bid $ - No Bid $ -
MOUTHWASH, GENERIC, NON 1Cs Sweet Talk 8
ALCOHOL, 6-8 OZ 407 $0.39( 60/cs |[$ 23.40 | TO304 oz $0.77 24 $ 18.48 | PC672

Page 10 of 18



Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
Canteen Dental ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Maxima Supply
SPECIFY SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
CASE CASE |PRODUCT s K BRAND, SIZE CASE CASE |PRODUCT s K
DESCRIPTION SIZE and |PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE | NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal and COUNT PRICE BY QuANTITY| PRICE | NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
COUNT EACH Free) BIDDING EACH Free)
BIDDING
TOOTHBRUSH HOLDER/CAP, .
PLASTIC, TUBE TYPE 1Cs $0.15( 100/cs |$ 15.00 | TBCAP Generic 1 ct. $0.14 100 $ 14.00 | PL930
TOOTHBRUSH, NAME BRAND,
SOFT ONLY Colgate $0.66| 72/cs $ 47.52 [ T555 Colgate 1 ct. $2.17 72 $156.24 | TB104
TOOTHBRUSH, GENERIC,
SOFT ONLY 1Cs $0.05( 1440/cs [$ 72.00 | TO21 Tek 1 ct. $0.29 72 $ 20.88 | TB101
TOOTHBRUSH, 3.5"TO 47, 1Cs $0.05( 1440/cs [$ 72.00 | TBSH Generic 1 ct. $0.06 72 $ 4.32 | PC606
SAFETY
TOOTHPASTE, MUST BE .
KOSHER/ANIMAL FREE, 4-6 OZ 4.6 0z $0.63 60 $ 37.80 | TO47 No Bid $ -
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC Close-Up 4
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-| 6.4 0z $0.89| 48/cs $ 42,72 [ TP64 . P $0.45 24 $ 10.80 | PC610
6 0Z
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND, Colgate See
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ 4.6 0z $2.69|  24/bx $ 6456 TO17 Attachment $ )
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC,
SENSITIVE TEETH AND GUMS, No Bid $ - Colgate 6 0z $3.47 24 $ 83.28 | PC557
4-6 OZ
TOOTHPASTE, SENSODYNE, 4- No Bid $ . No Bid $ }
6 0Z
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO: 5-7 3
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4
6 0Z
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND,
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
Canteen Dental ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Maxima Supply
?32'5::131';\( UNIT State Any Changes From Specs SPECIFY UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
DESCRIPTION SIZE an(’j PRICE BY CASE CASE |PRODUCT (Identif Kyosher gl]-|alal and A'?'limal BRAND, SIZE PRICE BY CASE CASE  |PRODUCT (Identif Kyosher gl]-|alal and A'?'limal
QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER y ’ and COUNT QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER y ’
COUNT EACH Free) EACH Free)
BIDDING BIDDING
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
Canteen Dental Union Supply Company Walkenhorst's

SPECIFY SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs

DESCRIPTION SIZE and |PRICE BY QUCAANSTI?TY PCRAI(S:E F;\‘RUOMDBU;?T (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and [PRICE BY QUCAANSTI?TY F(’:RAI(SZE F;\‘RUOMDBUECRT (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
COUNT | EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)
BIDDING BIDDING

DENTURE BRUSH $ - No Bid No Bid $ -

DENTURE CUP, INDIVIDUAL . .

PACKAGE $ - No Bid No Bid $ -

DENTURE TABLETS, GENERIC, . .

10-40 CT $ - No Bid No Bid $ -

DENTURE TABLETS - NAME . Efferdent

BRAND, 40-40 CT $ - No Bid 20 ct $3.50 6 $ 21.00 | 3112-560

DENTURE ADHESIVE - PASTE, . Poligrip

NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE $ No Bid 1407 $4.50 6 $ 27.00 | 3112-561

DENTURE ADHESIVE, . .

POWDER, GENERIC, LIST SIZE $ - | NoBid No Bid $ -

DENTURE ADHESIVE - PAD, . .

NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE $ - | NoBid No Bid $ -

FLOSS, DENTAL TAPE, 100 . .

YARDS MAX $ - No Bid No Bid $ -

FLOSS, DENTAL SAFETY LOOP $ - | NoBid Floss $2.00] 144 |s288.00 | 24668 30t

Loops 001

FLOSS, DENTAL, WAXED, 100 . .

YARDS MAX $ - No Bid No Bid $ -

MOUTHWASH, LIST BRAND,

NON ALCOHOL, ANIMAL FREE , $ - No Bid No Bid $ -

6-8 OZ

MOUTHWASH, NAME BRAND, . .

NON ALCOHOL, 6-8 0Z $ - | NoBid No Bid $ -

MOUTHWASH, GENERIC, NON . .

ALCOHOL, 6-8 OZ $ - No Bid No Bid $ -
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
Canteen Dental Union Supply Company Walkenhorst's
SPECIFY SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
DESCRIPTION SIZE and |PRICE BY US\ANSTI?TY :';\EE T\‘RUOMDBUECJ (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and [PRICE BY US\ANSTI?TY :';\EE P’\‘RUOMDBUECRT (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
count | EacH |2 Free) COUNT gacH |© Free)
BIDDING BIDDING
TOOTHBRUSH HOLDER/CAP, USG- 7499013 . . 62271-
PLASTIC, TUBE TYPE ACC $0.30 144 $43.20 Holder more variety - see attachment Generic $0.40 100 $ 40.00 015
Colgate
TOOTHBRUSH, NAME BRAND, . 18665-
SOET ONLY $ - No Bid Extra $0.65 72 $ 46.80 152
Clean
TOOTHBRUSH, GENERIC, ’ )
SOET ONLY $ - No Bid No Bid $ .
TOOTHBRUSH, 3.5" TO 4", . . "
SAFETY $ - No Bid Generic $1.25 48 $ 60.00 |54666-005 |3
TOOTHPASTE, MUST BE ’ )
KOSHER/ANIMAL FREE, 4-6 OZ $ - | NoBid No Bid s -
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC .
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4- $ - | NoBid viraBrite| g1 35| 24 | 32.0 | 18665
6 0z 004
60z
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND, ! Colgate 18665-
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ $ - | NoBid Max Fresh| S>:00| 12 |$ 3600 |07 4.6 0z
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC,
SENSITIVE TEETH AND GUMS, $ - No Bid No Bid $ -
4-6 OZ
TOOTHPASTE, SENSODYNE, 4- s - No Bid No Bid $ )
6 0z
Payment Terms: 030
Delivery Days ARO: 10-14 7-10
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-
6 0z
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND,
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik

3849 OF Dental
Bid Tab

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Dental

Union Supply Company Walkenhorst's
SPECIFY SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT CASE case |probucT Statg Any Changes From Speps BRAND, UNIT CASE case | probucT Statg Any Changes From Speps
DESCRIPTION SIZE and |PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE | NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and [PRICE BY QuanTiTy| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
COUNT EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)
BIDDING BIDDING
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
AWARD
Canteen Dental Wholesale Personal Products, Inc. DBA Plaksmacker Young PS Acquisitions
SPECIFY SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
DESCRIPTION SIZE and |PRICE BY QUCAANSTIfTY PCRAI(S:E F;\‘RUOMDBU;?T (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and |PRICE BY QUCAANSTI?TY F?’:I(S:E F;\‘RUOMDBUECRT (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
COUNT EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)
BIDDING BIDDING
DENTURE BRUSH FreshMint $0.18 144 $ 25.92 [TBDEN No Bid $ -
DENTURE CUP, INDIVIDUAL . )
PACKAGE Dawnmist $0.27( 250 $ 67.50 |DCPC No Bid $ -
DENTURE TABLETS, GENERIC, | FreshMint )
10-40 CT 20 CT $1.40 24 $ 33.60 | DENT40 No Bid $ -
DENTURE TABLETS - NAME Dawnmist )
BRAND, 40-40 CT 40 CT $1.41 24 $ 33.84 | DEN6283 No Bid $ -
Staydent-
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PASTE, ) )
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE Sheffield $1.85 24 $ 44.40 | DA8S No Bid $ -
.85 0z
DENTURE ADHESIVE, FreshMint )
POWDER, GENERIC, LIST SIZE |Tube 20z| 213 72 |$153.36 | DA2 No Bid $ -
Sea-Bond
DENTURE ADHESIVE - PAD, 30CT )
NAME BRAND, LIST SIZE lower $ 30 $10.98 60 $ 658.80 [SB0425495 No Bid $ -
CT uppers
FreshMint
FLOSS, DENTAL TAPE, 100 ! )
YARDS MAX Floss, 100 $0.84 72 $ 60.48 | DF100 No Bid $ -
yards
Loops
Safety
FLOSS, DENTAL SAFETY LOOP | Dental $1.82 144 $262.08 [SDF30 No Bid $ -
Floss 30
per pack
FreshMint
FLOSS, DENTAL, WAXED, 100 Waxed, $0.83 72 $ 59.76 | DF100 No Bid $ -
YARDS MAX
100 Yards
MOUTHWASH, LIST BRAND, FreshMint
NON ALCOHOL, ANIMAL FREE , $0.41 60 $ 24.60 [ FMW4 40z No Bid $ -
40z
6-8 OZ
Crest Pro-
MOUTHWASH, NAME BRAND, Health, )
NON ALCOHOL, 6-8 0Z 240ml (8 $4.43 6 $ 26.58 | #6961 No Bid $
0z.)
MOUTHWASH, GENERIC, NON | Dawnmist )
ALCOHOL, 6-8 0Z 407 $0.43 96 $ 41.28 | MR3350 40z No Bid $ -
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
Canteen Dental Wholesale Personal Products, Inc. DBA Plaksmacker Young PS Acquisitions
SPECIFY SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs BRAND, UNIT State Any Changes From Specs
DESCRIPTION SIZE and |PRICE BY U(;ANST?TY F():;\EE F:\‘RUOMDBUECJ (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and |PRICE BY US\ANSTI?TY PCQ(S:E P’\‘RUOMDBUECRT (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
COUNT EACH Q Free) COUNT EACH Q Free)
BIDDING BIDDING
RECTAN
GLE
TOOTHBRUSH HOLDER/CAP, . ADULT
PLASTIC, TUBE TYPE FreshMint $0.18 100 $ 18.00 | TBHLDR COVER $0.10| 1440 $ 144.00 63 63
1440
PER
ECONO
TOOTHBRUSH, NAME BRAND BRUSH
’ ’ Colgate $0.33 144 $ 47.52 | #55501 ADULT $0.22| 1440 $ 316.80 20023 20023
SOFT ONLY
WITH
SOFT
ECONO
BRUSH
TOOTHBRUSH, GENERIC, Dawnmist $0.05 144 $ 7.20 | TB30 ADULT $0.22| 1440 $316.80 20023 20023
SOFT ONLY
WITH
SOFT
TOOTHBRUSH, 3.5" TO 4", Dawnmist, .
SAFETY 4" Safety $0.05 144 $ 7.20 | TB20 No Bid $ -
TOOTHPASTE, MUST BE Aim Gel 6 .
KOSHER/ANIMAL FREE, 4-6 OZ oz $1.11 24 $ 26.64 |#5970 No Bid $ )
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC Freshmint
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4 4.6 02 $0.61 60 $ 36.60 | TP46 No Bid $ -
6 0Z ) )
Close Up
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND, |Gel 4 oz. 5598-CloseUp .
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ Aim Gel 6 $1.11 24 $ 2664 5970-Aim No Bid $ )
0Z.
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC, FreshMint
SENSITIVE TEETH AND GUMS, $0.76 24 $ 18.24 [TPS43 No Bid $ -
4.3 0z
4-6 OZ
Rite Aid
;%(;THPASTE’ SENSODYNE, 4- (Sensodyn $1.30 288 $374.40 | #3127 No Bid $ -
e) 4 oz.
Payment Terms: 0 3RD TIER 14
Delivery Days ARO: 5 14
TOOTHPASTE, GENERIC
BRAND, LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4
6 0Z
TOOTHPASTE, NAME BRAND,
LIST ALL AVAILABLE, 4-6 OZ
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3849 OF Dental Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Bid Tab
Canteen Dental Wholesale Personal Products, Inc. DBA Plaksmacker Young PS Acquisitions
SPECIFY SPECIFY
BRAND, UNIT CASE CASE PRODUCT Statg Any Changes From Speps BRAND, UNIT CASE CASE PRODUCT Stat§ Any Changes From Spgcs
DESCRIPTION SIZE and |PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal | SIZE and |PRICE BY QUANTITY| PRICE NUMBER (Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal
COUNT EACH Free) COUNT EACH Free)
BIDDING BIDDING

Award Explanation: The following items were not awarded to the lowest bidder
due to the State not wanting to award a limited number of items to a contract:
Denture Brush, Denture Cup, Denture Tablets (Generic), Denture Tablets (Name
Brand), Mouthwash (Generic), Mouthwash (Name Brand), Toothpase
(Kosher/Animal Free). Denture Adhesive awarded to Keefe due to preferred name
brand. Floss (Dental Tape) is awarded to Keefe as lowest bidder by tape length.
Floss (Dental, Waxed) is awarded to Care Supplies LLC as lowest bidder by
yardage. Mouthwash (Animal Free) is awarded to Keefe as 8oz bottle met
specifications. Toothbrush Holder/Cap is awarded to Keefe as it fits all brushes in
inventory. Toothbrush (3.5" to 4", Safety) is awarded to Keefe as it is approved for
saftety and security needs. Toothpaste (Sensodyne, 4-6 0z) was awarded to Care
Supplies LLC as lowest bidder bidding name brand as specified.
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