
Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3848 OF
CLOTHING PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Clothing

DESCRIPTION

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE 
BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

CAP, BASEBALL, GREY ONLY,  
ADJUSTABLE

Baseball 
Cap  $      2.00 1 Each  $  2.00 50111

50111010G-Heather Grey
50111010T-Khaki
50111010O-Orange

CAP, STOCKING, GRAY ONLY, NO 
LOGOS, ONE SIZE FITS ALL  

Stocking 
Cap  $      1.19 1 Each  $  1.19 50172

50172010G-Ash Grey
50172010O-Orange
50172010X-Charcoal Grey
50172010B-Black

GLOVES, WINTER, LINED, BUFF, 
BEIGE OR BROWN, NO LEATHER

Rothco 
Grey 
Wool 
Glove

 $      3.00 1 Each  $  3.00 51154 S-M-L-XL

POLISH, SHOE, PASTE, BLACK ONLY

Kiwi 
Show 
Paste 
Black 
Wax

 $      2.05 12  $24.60 20441

SADDLE SOAP No Bid  $      -   

SEWING KIT, NO SCISSORS

Singer 
Sewing 
Kit No 
Scissors

 $      0.92 12  $11.04 20501

SHOE BRUSH No Bid  $      -   

SHOELACE BLACK HEAVY DUTY, 
2/SET, 54"

Kiwi 
Black 54" 
Athletic 
Shoe 
Laces 1 
pair

 $      0.49 6  $  2.94 20451

Keefe Group
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3848 OF
CLOTHING PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Clothing Keefe Group

SHOELACE WHITE ATHLETIC, 2/SET, 
54"

Kiwi 
White 54" 
Athletic 
Shoe 
Laces 1 
pair

 $      0.49 6  $  2.94 20450

SUPPORTER, ATHLETIC, 
S,M,L,XL,XXL 3.98 each each  $  3.98 50100 S,M,L,XL

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Net 30
3
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3848 OF
CLOTHING PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Clothing

DESCRIPTION

CAP, BASEBALL, GREY ONLY,  
ADJUSTABLE

CAP, STOCKING, GRAY ONLY, NO 
LOGOS, ONE SIZE FITS ALL  

GLOVES, WINTER, LINED, BUFF, 
BEIGE OR BROWN, NO LEATHER

POLISH, SHOE, PASTE, BLACK ONLY

SADDLE SOAP

SEWING KIT, NO SCISSORS

SHOE BRUSH

SHOELACE BLACK HEAVY DUTY, 
2/SET, 54"

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE 
BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

USG-HC  $     1.81 12  $21.72 2501015 
Cotton more variety - see attachment

USC  $     1.77 12  $21.24 2501013 Grey (Blck, Navy, White also 
available)

USG  $     1.06 12  $12.72 2505008

ANGELUS  $     1.82 12  $21.84 2007034

ANGELUS  $     1.63 12  $19.56 2007032

USG  $     0.38 12  $  4.56 7524005

3  $     3.38 12  $40.56 2099001

MISSION  $     0.91 12  $10.92 2005081

Union Supply Company
AWARD
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3848 OF
CLOTHING PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Clothing

SHOELACE WHITE ATHLETIC, 2/SET, 
54"

SUPPORTER, ATHLETIC, 
S,M,L,XL,XXL
Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Union Supply Company
AWARD

KIWI / 
MISSION  $     0.64 12  $  7.68 2005003 more variety - see attachment

BIKE  $     4.37 6  $26.22 5001012

0     30
10-14
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3848 OF
CLOTHING PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Clothing

DESCRIPTION

CAP, BASEBALL, GREY ONLY,  
ADJUSTABLE

CAP, STOCKING, GRAY ONLY, NO 
LOGOS, ONE SIZE FITS ALL  

GLOVES, WINTER, LINED, BUFF, 
BEIGE OR BROWN, NO LEATHER

POLISH, SHOE, PASTE, BLACK ONLY

SADDLE SOAP

SEWING KIT, NO SCISSORS

SHOE BRUSH

SHOELACE BLACK HEAVY DUTY, 
2/SET, 54"

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE 
BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

No Bid  $      -   

Wave 
Forcer  $     1.10 50  $55.00 6014-011 2 pk

No Bid  $      -   

No Bid  $      -   

No Bid  $      -   

No Bid  $      -   

No Bid  $      -   

No Bid  $      -   

Walkenhorst's
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3848 OF
CLOTHING PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Clothing

SHOELACE WHITE ATHLETIC, 2/SET, 
54"

SUPPORTER, ATHLETIC, 
S,M,L,XL,XXL
Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Walkenhorst's

Implus  $     0.95 50  $47.50 9006-223 oval

Bike  $     3.25 3  $  9.75 18100-801
thru 805

Award Explanation:  It is in the best interest of the State to award all items to 
one contract.

0
7-10
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