
Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3847 OF
LEGAL and SCHOOL SUPPLIES

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Legal School

DESCRIPTION

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and 

Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

BINDER, THREE RING, 
FOLDER W/ POCKETS, 
PLASTIC RINGS ONLY

 $              -   No Bid No Bid Generic 1 ct. 1.92 32  $       61.44 ST810

BOOK, ADDRESS, 3 X 5, 
MAX 36 PAGES

Small 
Address 0.54 36  $        19.44 20256 Generic 1 ct. 0.31 100  $       31.00 ST846

BOOK, THEME, WIRELESS, 
1 SUBJECT, 80 PAGE 
APPROX

Wireless 
Notebook 
80ct 8x10.5

0.94 24  $        22.56 20692 Generic 80 
pg. 1.18 48  $       56.64 ST820

BOOK, THEME, WIRELESS, 
3 SUBJECT, 120 PAGE 
APPROX

Same as 
above 0.94  $        22.56 20692 80 ct pad  $            -   No Bid

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP, 6" X 9" APPROX

Manila No 
Clasp 
Envelope 
9.5x12.5

0.686 
each 500  $      343.00 20243  $            -   No Bid

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP 10" X 13" APPROX

Manila No 
Clasp 
Envelope 
9.5x12.5

.686 each 500  $      343.00 20243 9.5 X 12.5 Generic 
10"x13" 0.11 250  $       27.50 ST851

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP, 17"X22" APPROX

 $              -   No Bid No Bid No Bid  $            -   

ERASER, RUBBER, BAR 
TYPE

Eraser 
Beveled Pink 0.24 36  $          8.64 20251 Pink Pearl 1 

ct. 0.60 12  $        7.20 ST833

FILE FOLDERS, MULTI 
COLOR, 1/3 CUT, 12 PACK

 $              -   No Bid No Bid No Bid  $            -   

PAD, LEGAL, 8.5 X 11, 
WHITE, 50-100 SHEETS

White 8.5x11 
Pad of 50 
Sheets Per 
Pad

.48 each 72  $        34.56 20235 Generic 
8.5x11 0.65 72  $       46.80 ST839

PAPER, 8 1/2 X 11, BUFF, 20# 
REAM

 $              -   No Bid No Bid  $            -   No Bid

PAPER, 8 1/2 X 11, GREY, 
20# REAM

 $              -   No Bid No Bid  $            -   No Bid

PAPER, FILLER, WHITE, 
WIDE RULE 200 CT 
MAXIMUM

8x10.5 Wide 
Ruled 
Notebook 
Paper 200 ct

1.62 each 24  $        38.88 20693 Generic 200 
ct 1.84 24  $       44.16 ST817

PAPER, TYPING/COPY , 8 1/2 
X 11, 20# WEIGHT, WHITE, 
REAM

Typing Paper 
8.5x11 100 ct 
Pad

1.74 each 24  $        41.76 21283 100 ct pad  $            -   No Bid

PEN, HI-LITER, YELLOW 
BLUE AND PINK COLORS, 
INDIVIDUAL

Bic Brite 
Yellow Hi-
Liter

.33 each 12  $          3.96 20660 Yellow Only  $            -   No Bid

PEN, STICK, BLACK, 
MEDIUM

Bic Black 
Round Stic 
Pen Medium

.10 each 60  $          6.00 24191 Bic 1 ct. 0.09 12  $        1.08 ST799

PEN, STICK, BLUE, MEDIUM
Bic Blue 
Round Stic 
Pen Medium

.10 each 60  $          6.00 24193 Bic 1 ct. 0.09 12  $        1.08 ST798

Keefe Group Maxima Supply
AWARD
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3847 OF
LEGAL and SCHOOL SUPPLIES

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Legal School

DESCRIPTION

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and 

Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

Keefe Group Maxima Supply
AWARD

PENCILS, DRAWING, 
REGULAR, 12 PACK

7" Colored 
Drawing 
Pencils 12 
Count

1.15 each 12  $        13.80 20225 Generic 12 
ct. 0.73 12  $        8.76 ST804

PENCILS, LEAD, #2, 
W/ERASER, INDIVIDUAL

#2 Pencils 
w/Eraser .073 each 12  $          0.88 24573 Generic 12 

ct. 0.09 72  $        6.48 ST807

TABLET, RULED, 6 X 9, 
COLOR, MAXIMUM 120 
PAGES

Asst. Color 
6x9 Paper 
120 Count 
Pads

1.95 each 48  $        93.60 20687  $            -   No Bid

TAPE, TRANSPARENT, w/ 
DISPOSABLE DISPENSER, 
1/2 TO 3/4 " WIDTH

Scotch Tape 
1/2" .79 each 144  $      113.76 21600 .05"x36" Scotch 1 ct. 1.31 12  $       15.72 ST838

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Net 30
3

Net 30
3
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3847 OF
LEGAL and SCHOOL SUPPLIES

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Legal School

DESCRIPTION

BINDER, THREE RING, 
FOLDER W/ POCKETS, 
PLASTIC RINGS ONLY
BOOK, ADDRESS, 3 X 5, 
MAX 36 PAGES
BOOK, THEME, WIRELESS, 
1 SUBJECT, 80 PAGE 
APPROX
BOOK, THEME, WIRELESS, 
3 SUBJECT, 120 PAGE 
APPROX

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP, 6" X 9" APPROX

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP 10" X 13" APPROX

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP, 17"X22" APPROX

ERASER, RUBBER, BAR 
TYPE

FILE FOLDERS, MULTI 
COLOR, 1/3 CUT, 12 PACK

PAD, LEGAL, 8.5 X 11, 
WHITE, 50-100 SHEETS

PAPER, 8 1/2 X 11, BUFF, 20# 
REAM
PAPER, 8 1/2 X 11, GREY, 
20# REAM

PAPER, FILLER, WHITE, 
WIDE RULE 200 CT 
MAXIMUM

PAPER, TYPING/COPY , 8 1/2 
X 11, 20# WEIGHT, WHITE, 
REAM

PEN, HI-LITER, YELLOW 
BLUE AND PINK COLORS, 
INDIVIDUAL

PEN, STICK, BLACK, 
MEDIUM

PEN, STICK, BLUE, MEDIUM

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

 $               -   No Bid USG 1.85 40  $         74.00 6515022

 $               -   No Bid PIONEER 1.3 12  $         15.60 6599007

MEAD 1.47 ea 12 ea per 
Case  17.64 cs BID 09920 100 Sheets MEAD 0.99 24  $         23.76 6501011

 $               -   No Bid  $              -   No Bid

QUILL 13.09 bx
1 box of 
500 = 1 
case

 13.09 bx BID 
OE6928

Sold 500 per box, Kraft color, 
open end, gummed  $              -   No Bid

QUILL 12.98 bx
1 box of 
250 = 1 
case

 12.98 bx BID 
OE101328

Sold 250 per box, Kraft color, 
open end, gummed USG 0.24 100  $         24.00 6503101

Quility Park 12.20 bx Sold 4 bx 
= 1 case  48.80 cs BID 42356 Sold 25 per box, Kraft color, open 

end, ungummed  $              -   No Bid

Paper Mate 4.02 dz
36 packs 
of dz = 1 
case

 144.72 cs BID 
70521Q Pink Pearl large eraser USG 0.17 12  $           2.04 6515057 Beveled Eraser Pink Medium

QUILL 7.99 bx 5 boxes = 
1 case  39.95 cs BID 

740913AD **SOLD 100 ea per box  $              -   No Bid

QUILL 4.79 dz 6 dozen = 
1 case  28.74 cs BID74232

8

Sold per dozen, ruled pad 15 lb
paper, 100% groundwood free, 50

sheets per pad
USG 0.48 72  $         34.56 6515111

 $               -   No Bid  $              -   No Bid

QUILL 3.89 rm 10 REAMS 
= 1 CASE  38.90 cs BID 

720571 Sold per 500/ream  $              -   No Bid

ROARING 
SPRING 2.13 pk 24 packs = 

1 case  51.12 cs BID 20020
Sold 200 sheets per pack, 16 lb 

white paper, 8 1/2 x 11, left 
margin red rule

MEAD 1.7 24  $         40.80 6501007

QUILL 36.62 ctn 10 REAMS 
= 1 CASE  36.62 ctn BID 

720222

**VALID for only 90 days. After 
the 90 days please call for a 

quote. Sold per carton 10 (10 
reams = 1 ctn.)

USG 0.7 36  $         25.20 6515104

BIC
2.73 dz
2.73 dz
2.73 dz

18 dozen = 
1 case

 49.14 cs
 49.14 cs
 49.14 cs 

BID 
BL11YW

BID 
BL11PK

BIDBL11B
E

Sold per dozen, USG 0.66 12  $           7.92 6515002 more variety - see attachment

BIC .84 dz 36 DZ = 1 
CASE  30.24 cs BID

GSM11BK Round stick pen sold per dozen SIMLINE 0.23 100  $         23.00 6515508

BIC .84 dz 36 DZ = 1 
CASE  30.24 cs BID

GSM11BE Round stick pen sold per dozen SIMLINE 0.23 100  $         23.00 6515509

Quill Union Supply Company
AWARD
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3847 OF
LEGAL and SCHOOL SUPPLIES

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Legal School

DESCRIPTION

PENCILS, DRAWING, 
REGULAR, 12 PACK

PENCILS, LEAD, #2, 
W/ERASER, INDIVIDUAL

TABLET, RULED, 6 X 9, 
COLOR, MAXIMUM 120 
PAGES

TAPE, TRANSPARENT, w/ 
DISPOSABLE DISPENSER, 
1/2 TO 3/4 " WIDTH
Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

Quill Union Supply Company
AWARD

CRAYOLA 1.29 bx 48 boxes = 
1 casae  61.92 cs BID 

684012 Sold per 12/bx SARGENT 
ART 1.65 72  $       118.80 6515043 Sargent Art Color Pencils

QUILL .76 dz 120 dozen 
= 2 casae  91.20 cs BID 

T711212 Sold per dozen USG 0.08 18  $           1.44 6513001

QUILL 3.98 dz 6 dozen = 
1 case  23.88 cs BID SBNG

Sold per dozen, 80 sheets per
pad, green paper, gregg ruled, 

spiral binding
MEAD 1.99 48  $         95.52 6501012

SCOTCH 5.55 pk 24 packs = 
1 case  133.20 cs BID 4184 Sold 4/pk, 3/4"x850" OFFICE 

DEPOT 1.53 1  $           1.53 4099068

0    30
1-3 10-14
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3847 OF
LEGAL and SCHOOL SUPPLIES

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Legal School

DESCRIPTION

BINDER, THREE RING, 
FOLDER W/ POCKETS, 
PLASTIC RINGS ONLY
BOOK, ADDRESS, 3 X 5, 
MAX 36 PAGES
BOOK, THEME, WIRELESS, 
1 SUBJECT, 80 PAGE 
APPROX
BOOK, THEME, WIRELESS, 
3 SUBJECT, 120 PAGE 
APPROX

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP, 6" X 9" APPROX

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP 10" X 13" APPROX

ENVELOPE, MANILA, NO 
CLASP, 17"X22" APPROX

ERASER, RUBBER, BAR 
TYPE

FILE FOLDERS, MULTI 
COLOR, 1/3 CUT, 12 PACK

PAD, LEGAL, 8.5 X 11, 
WHITE, 50-100 SHEETS

PAPER, 8 1/2 X 11, BUFF, 20# 
REAM
PAPER, 8 1/2 X 11, GREY, 
20# REAM

PAPER, FILLER, WHITE, 
WIDE RULE 200 CT 
MAXIMUM

PAPER, TYPING/COPY , 8 1/2 
X 11, 20# WEIGHT, WHITE, 
REAM

PEN, HI-LITER, YELLOW 
BLUE AND PINK COLORS, 
INDIVIDUAL

PEN, STICK, BLACK, 
MEDIUM

PEN, STICK, BLUE, MEDIUM

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

Paper Mate 
White Pearl 0.60 12  $        7.20 90625-021 Latex free

 $           -   No Bid

Staples 1.20 12  $      14.40 18010-005 50 sheets

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

Sharpie 1.50 12  $      18.00 18010-108
18010-118

Yellow
Pink

Zebra 1.30 12  $      15.60 90625-014

Zebra 1.30 12  $      15.60 90625-015

Walkenhorst's

Page 5 of 6



Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3847 OF
LEGAL and SCHOOL SUPPLIES

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Legal School

DESCRIPTION

PENCILS, DRAWING, 
REGULAR, 12 PACK

PENCILS, LEAD, #2, 
W/ERASER, INDIVIDUAL

TABLET, RULED, 6 X 9, 
COLOR, MAXIMUM 120 
PAGES

TAPE, TRANSPARENT, w/ 
DISPOSABLE DISPENSER, 
1/2 TO 3/4 " WIDTH
Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

SPECIFY 
BRAND, SIZE 
and COUNT 

BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs 
(Identify Kosher, Halal and Animal 

Free)

Walkenhorst's

General's 8.00 6  $      48.00 82548-064 12 pack

Staples 0.12 72  $        8.64 18010-045

 $           -   No Bid

 $           -   No Bid

It is in the best interest of the State not to award only three items to a contract for 
Eraser, Address Book and Drawing Pencils.

It is in the best interest of the State to purchase 3 Ring Binders from an existing 
contract.

0
7-10

Award Explanation:  
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