
Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE 
BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE 

BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTIT

Y

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUC
T 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From 
Specs (Identify Kosher, Halal 

and Animal Free)

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

ADAPTER, TV No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

AIR FRESHENER, SOLID 
CONE TYPE, LIST 
FRAGRANCES, 7.5 OZ

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

AIR FRESHENER, LIST 
FRAGRANCES

Renuzit 
7.5oz 
(Super 
Odor) 
Relaxation

 $     1.47 12  $17.64 3106L No Bid  $               -   

ALARM CLOCK, BATTERY 
OPERATED, CLEAR, 
DIGITAL, BRAND NAME (NO 
LUMINARY) (SUBMIT 
SAMPLES)

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

AUDIO, HEADPHONE  
ADAPTER 1/8" TO 1/4" No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

AUDIO, HEADPHONE 
CABLE, 6' MAXIMUM, NOT 
COILED

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

AUDIO, HEADPHONE, KOSS No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

AUDIO, EARBUD, SONY No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BALL, RACQUET, CLEAR 
PLASTIC PACKAGING No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BALL, TENNIS, CLEAR 
PLASTIC PACKAGING No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, NAME BRAND, 
BLISTER PACK, 9 VOLT 
MUST HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, C 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, NAME BRAND (4 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, AA 
SIZE,MUST HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, D 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK OR 4 PACK), BLISTER 
PACK, AAA SIZE, MUST 
HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, GENERIC, 
BLISTER PACK, 9 VOLT, 
MUST HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, GENERIC (4 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, AA 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, GENERIC (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, D 
SIZE MUST HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, GENERIC (2 
PACK OR 4 PACK), BLISTER 
PACK, AAA SIZE, MUST 

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BATTERY, GENERIC  (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, C 
SIZE MUST HAVE UPC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

BULB, LIGHT, GENERIC 
ASSORTED, 30 AND 40 
WATT TO INCLUDE HI 
INTENSITY (NO HALOGEN)

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

Drugstore Products DBA Food Express Union Supply Co
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE 
BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE 

BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTIT

Y

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUC
T 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From 
Specs (Identify Kosher, Halal 

and Animal Free)

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

Drugstore Products DBA Food Express Union Supply Co

WHITENER, LAUNDRY,  
LIQUID, NO CHLORIDE, 30 
FL OZ MAX INCLUDE VEND 

No Bid  $      -   
Trend Detergent 
22oz with Bleach 
Powder HE

 $                         1.38 12  $         16.56 8040008 see attached for other 
options

WHITENER, LAUNDRY, 
POWDER, NO CHLORIDE, 32 
OZ MAXIMUM INCLUDE 
VENDING SIZE

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CABLE, COAXIAL WITH 
ENDS, FM-TO-FM SCREW 
ON, RG6 SHIELDED 6' MAX

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CABLE, SPLITTER, 
TELIVISION No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CALCULATOR, HAND HELD, 
SOLAR POWERED, CLEAR No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CARDS, GREETING, 
ASSORTED AND SEASONAL, 
NO GLITTER

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CARDS, PINOCHLE No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CARDS, POKER No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CD CLEANER No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CHECKERS SET No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CHESS SET No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CLIP, ID, IDENTIFICATION 
CARD CLIP ONLY No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

CONTAINER /W LID, 
STORAGE, PLASTIC 16 QT 
MAX

No Bid  $      -   Alladin 24oz Cereal 
Bowl  $                         0.79 48  $         37.92 5501132

CRAYONS, CRAYOLA, 16 
COUNT No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

DETERGENT, LIQUID, LIST 
BRANDS, LIST SIZES, 50 OZ 
MAX

No Bid  $      -   Era Liquid HE 2X 
Strength 16 Load  $                         3.63 6  $         21.78 8040027

DETERGENT, LIQUID, HIGH 
EFFICIENCY, LIST SIZES 50 
FL OZ MAX

No Bid  $      -   

Trend Ultra 
Concentrated 
Liquid HE Mountain 
Meadow Detergent 
50oz

 $                         2.49 6  $         14.94 8040009

DICTIONARY, POCKET SIZE, 
APPROXIMATELY 5"X8" No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

DICTIONARY, POCKET SIZE, 
SPANISH TO ENGLISH,  
APPROXIMATELY 5"X8"

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

DOMINOS, DOUBLE 9, 
IVORY & BLACK ONLY No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

FABRIC SOFTENER, DRYER 
SHEETS, 40 CT No Bid  $      -   

Cuddle Soft Dryer 
Sheets Original 
Scent 50ct

 $                         1.13 12  $         13.56 8048004 see attached for other 
options

HANGERS, PLASTIC, 
TUBULAR, WHITE ONLY, 17 
INCH

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

HEAD CLEANER, CD NO 
LIQUID, NOT TO EXCEED 
8"X10"

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

LAMP, CLIP/CLAMP ON, 
CLEAR, STANDARD BULB 
(NO HALOGEN)

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

MUG, NON INSULATED, 
PLASTIC, 12 OZ MAX No Bid  $      -   Whirley Mug Clear 

22oz  $                         1.31 32  $         41.92 5515010 see attached for other 
options

PHOTO ALBUM, PLASTIC 
SHEET TYPE, 20 PAGE 
MAXIMUM

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE 
BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE 

BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTIT

Y

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUC
T 

NUMBER

State Any Changes From 
Specs (Identify Kosher, Halal 

and Animal Free)

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

Drugstore Products DBA Food Express Union Supply Co

PINS, PUSH, CLEAR, MAX 25 
COUNT No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

POLY FIL, 20 OZ MAXIMUM 
SIZE No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

RECEIVER, AM/FM, CLEAR 
PLASTIC, LIST BRANDS, 
WARRANTY 

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

REMOTE CONTROL, TV, 
UNIVERSAL RCA, 
COMPATABLE WITH 
DIGITAL TV 

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

SURGE PROTECTOR, 6' 
LONG, 3-6 OUTLETS, NO 
METAL, WHITE OR TAN

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

SURGE 
PROTECTOR,SINGLE 
OUTLET

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

TUMBLER W/LID, SOFT 
PLASTIC, CLEAR 12-22 FL 
OZ

No Bid  $      -   
Tumbler w/lid 16oz 
clear stadium cup 
tall

 $                         0.23 500  $       115.00 551501 see attached for other 
options

WALLET, CD, 12 DISC, 
BLACK, MAX 24 No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $               -   

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

ALARM CLOCK, BATTERY 
OPERATED, CLEAR, 
DIGITAL, BRAND NAME (NO 
LUMINARY) (SUBMIT 
SAMPLES)

AUDIO, HEADPHONE, KOSS

AUDIO, HEADPHONE  
ADAPTER 1/8" TO 1/4"

AIR FRESHENER, LIST 
FRAGRANCES

5
0  30

5
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

ADAPTER, TV

AIR FRESHENER, SOLID 
CONE TYPE, LIST 
FRAGRANCES, 7.5 OZ

AIR FRESHENER, LIST 
FRAGRANCES

ALARM CLOCK, BATTERY 
OPERATED, CLEAR, 
DIGITAL, BRAND NAME (NO 
LUMINARY) (SUBMIT 
SAMPLES)

AUDIO, HEADPHONE  
ADAPTER 1/8" TO 1/4"

AUDIO, HEADPHONE 
CABLE, 6' MAXIMUM, NOT 
COILED

AUDIO, HEADPHONE, KOSS

AUDIO, EARBUD, SONY

BALL, RACQUET, CLEAR 
PLASTIC PACKAGING
BALL, TENNIS, CLEAR 
PLASTIC PACKAGING
BATTERY, NAME BRAND, 
BLISTER PACK, 9 VOLT 
MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, C 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, NAME BRAND (4 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, AA 
SIZE,MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, D 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK OR 4 PACK), BLISTER 
PACK, AAA SIZE, MUST 
HAVE UPC
BATTERY, GENERIC, 
BLISTER PACK, 9 VOLT, 
MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, GENERIC (4 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, AA 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, GENERIC (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, D 
SIZE MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, GENERIC (2 
PACK OR 4 PACK), BLISTER 
PACK, AAA SIZE, MUST 
BATTERY, GENERIC  (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, C 
SIZE MUST HAVE UPC
BULB, LIGHT, GENERIC 
ASSORTED, 30 AND 40 
WATT TO INCLUDE HI 
INTENSITY (NO HALOGEN)

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

Air Freshner Royal 
Pine Scent  $                         0.57 12  $           6.84 24652 Royal Pine Scent See Attachment  $               -   

Advance 
Translucent Led 
Digital Clock

 $                       10.32 Each  $         10.32 51553

Also:51539 Advance 
Clear Battery Alarm 
clock $2.45 each 
Currently Purchase

No Bid  $               -   

Standard & Mini  $                         0.77 Each  $           0.77 
50140
50146
50795

Standard #50140-3.5 
MM to 1/4 Mini 
#50140-1/2" to 3.5 
MM Converts Mono 
to Stero

No Bid  $               -   

6 Feet Non-Coiled 
Headphone 
Extension w/Mini 
Jack

 $                         1.30 Each  $           1.30 50829 No Bid  $               -   

Koss PTX 6  $                         4.99 Each  $           4.99 50776 Option 51089 Koss 
Pro $12.55 No Bid  $               -   

Koss CL-3  $                         2.28 Each  $           2.28 50294 Koss CL-3 Clear Ear 
Buds No Bid  $               -   

Penn Racuetballs 
3can  $                         3.15 3 Per Can  $           3.15 50198 $1.05 Each Ball No Bid  $               -   

 Wilson Tennis 
Balls 3 can  $                         3.48 3 Per Can  $           3.48 50154 $1.16 Each Ball No Bid  $               -   

Panasonic Plus 
Alkaline 9 Volt 
Blister Pack

 $                         0.14 48  $           6.72 20125 UPC 07396300064 No Bid  $               -   

Panasonic Plus 
Alkaline C size 2 
pack

 $                         1.38 48  $         66.24 20119 UPC 073096300026 No Bid  $               -   

Panasonic Plus 
Alkaline AA size 4 
Pack

 $                         0.95 72  $         68.40 21131 UPC 087381211317 No Bid  $               -   

Panasonic Plus 
Alkaline D size 2 
pack

 $                         1.38 48  $         66.24 20118 UPC 073096300019 No Bid  $               -   

Panasonic Plus 
Alkaline AAA Size 4 
Pack

 $                         0.95 72  $         68.40 21132 UPC 087381211324 No Bid  $               -   

Panasonic 9 Volt  $                         1.38 48  $         66.24 20125 UPC 073096300064 Varta  $                         1.95 10  $         19.50 BA896

Ion 3 AA Size 4 
pack  $                         0.68 50  $         34.00 21675 UPC 087381216756 Varta  $                         0.97 20  $         19.40 BA891

Panasonic D size 2 
pacl  $                         0.53 48  $         25.44 20118 UPC 073096300019 Varta  $                         1.95 10  $         19.50 BA895

Ion 3 AAA size 4 
pack  $                         0.68 50  $         34.00 21676 UPC 087381216763 Varta  $                         0.73 10  $           7.30 BA892

Panasonic Plus 
Alkaline C size 2 
pack

 $                         1.35 48  $         64.80 20119 UPC 073096300026 Varta  $                         1.60 10  $         16.00 BA894

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

Keefe Group
AWARD

Maxima Supply
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

WHITENER, LAUNDRY,  
LIQUID, NO CHLORIDE, 30 
FL OZ MAX INCLUDE VEND 
WHITENER, LAUNDRY, 
POWDER, NO CHLORIDE, 32 
OZ MAXIMUM INCLUDE 
VENDING SIZE
CABLE, COAXIAL WITH 
ENDS, FM-TO-FM SCREW 
ON, RG6 SHIELDED 6' MAX
CABLE, SPLITTER, 
TELIVISION
CALCULATOR, HAND HELD, 
SOLAR POWERED, CLEAR 
CARDS, GREETING, 
ASSORTED AND SEASONAL, 
NO GLITTER

CARDS, PINOCHLE

CARDS, POKER

CD CLEANER

CHECKERS SET

CHESS SET

CLIP, ID, IDENTIFICATION 
CARD CLIP ONLY
CONTAINER /W LID, 
STORAGE, PLASTIC 16 QT 
MAX
CRAYONS, CRAYOLA, 16 
COUNT
DETERGENT, LIQUID, LIST 
BRANDS, LIST SIZES, 50 OZ 
MAX

DETERGENT, LIQUID, HIGH 
EFFICIENCY, LIST SIZES 50 
FL OZ MAX

DICTIONARY, POCKET SIZE, 
APPROXIMATELY 5"X8"
DICTIONARY, POCKET SIZE, 
SPANISH TO ENGLISH,  
APPROXIMATELY 5"X8"
DOMINOS, DOUBLE 9, 
IVORY & BLACK ONLY

FABRIC SOFTENER, DRYER 
SHEETS, 40 CT 

HANGERS, PLASTIC, 
TUBULAR, WHITE ONLY, 17 
INCH
HEAD CLEANER, CD NO 
LIQUID, NOT TO EXCEED 
8"X10"
LAMP, CLIP/CLAMP ON, 
CLEAR, STANDARD BULB 
(NO HALOGEN)

MUG, NON INSULATED, 
PLASTIC, 12 OZ MAX

PHOTO ALBUM, PLASTIC 
SHEET TYPE, 20 PAGE 
MAXIMUM

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

Keefe Group
AWARD

Maxima Supply

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

Coaxial Cable 6"  $                         1.49 Each  $           1.49 50137060 No Bid  $               -   

Two-Way Signal 
Splitter  $                         0.97 Each  $           0.97 50131 No Bid  $               -   

Datexx Calculator 
Solar  $                         2.97 Each  $           2.97 50124 No Bid  $               -   

Gallant Greeting 
Cards Asst& 
Seasonal

 $                         0.35 6 Per Case  $           2.10 Multiple #'s See Attachment  $               -   

Aviator Pinochle 
cards  $                         0.95 12  $         11.40 20215 Maverick  $                         1.01 12  $         12.12 GM702

Aviator US Poker 
cards  $                         0.95 12  $         11.40 20211 Maverick  $                         1.01 12 12.12  GM701 

Dry Cloth CD Head 
Cleaner  $                         2.65 Each  $           2.65 50064 No Bid  $               -   

Checkers Set 
w/Board  $                         2.67 12  $         32.04 20520 Generic  $                         2.43 12  $         29.16 GM720

Chess Set w/Board  $                         3.55 12  $         42.60 20522 Generic  $                         3.58 12  $         42.96 GM721

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

Sterilite 6QT Latch 
Box Container  $                         1.69  $               -   50575 Clear-Snap Close No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

Pro Powder Liquid 
Detergent 32oz  $                         1.09 12  $         13.08 24547 Era 25 oz  $                         3.78 6  $         22.68 LC565

Trend Liquid HE 
Mountain Meadow 
50oz

 $                         1.89 6  $         11.34 26014 No Bid  $               -   

Webster II Pocket 
Dictionary  $                         2.23 40  $         89.20 24214 Webster's  $                         0.58 12  $           6.96 ST825

Websters 
Spanish/English 
Dictionary

 $                         1.13 48  $         54.24 20299 Webster's  $                         0.58 12  $           6.96 ST826

Double Six 
Dominoes  $                         1.84 12  $         22.08 20524 No Bid  $               -   

 Spring Fresh 
Fabric Softner 40ct  $                         1.13 12  $         13.56 21517 Powerhouse 40 ct  $                         0.79 12  $           9.48 LC794

17" White Plastic 
Hangers  $                         1.99 14-10pks case  $         27.86 20407 $1.99 per pack 10 

pack No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

Clear Clip on Lamp 
w/bulb  $                         7.49 Each  $           7.49 51717 No Bid  $               -   

Coffee Mug 
W/Handle Plastic 
12oz

 $                         0.43 72  $         30.96 20490 Gerneic 12 oz  $                         0.50 72  $         36.00 PL906

Large Hard Cover 
Photo Album 24 
page

 $                         1.28 36  $         46.08 22901 24 pages Generic  $                         1.39 24  $         33.36  ST842 
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

PINS, PUSH, CLEAR, MAX 25 
COUNT
POLY FIL, 20 OZ MAXIMUM 
SIZE

RECEIVER, AM/FM, CLEAR 
PLASTIC, LIST BRANDS, 
WARRANTY 

REMOTE CONTROL, TV, 
UNIVERSAL RCA, 
COMPATABLE WITH 
DIGITAL TV 
SURGE PROTECTOR, 6' 
LONG, 3-6 OUTLETS, NO 
METAL, WHITE OR TAN
SURGE 
PROTECTOR,SINGLE 
OUTLET
TUMBLER W/LID, SOFT 
PLASTIC, CLEAR 12-22 FL 
OZ
WALLET, CD, 12 DISC, 
BLACK, MAX 24
Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

ALARM CLOCK, BATTERY 
OPERATED, CLEAR, 
DIGITAL, BRAND NAME (NO 
LUMINARY) (SUBMIT 
SAMPLES)

AUDIO, HEADPHONE, KOSS

AUDIO, HEADPHONE  
ADAPTER 1/8" TO 1/4"

AIR FRESHENER, LIST 
FRAGRANCES

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

Keefe Group
AWARD

Maxima Supply

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

See Attachment  $               -   See Attachment See Attachment No Bid  $               -   

RCA RCU 300T 
Remote Control  $                         2.85 Each  $           2.85 51900 No Bid  $               -   

Clear Surge 
Protector  $                       10.40 Each  $         10.40 51529 No Bid  $               -   

Single Line Single 
Outlet Surge 
Protector

 $                         4.50 Each  $           4.50 50180 No Bid  $               -   

Tumbler w/lid clear 
22 oz  $                         0.27 350  $         94.50 21610 Generic 22 oz  $                         0.21 100  $         21.00 PL895

Clear CD Wallet  $                         1.22 Each  $           1.22 50598 No Bid  $               -   

Advance Clear 
Battery Alarm Clock 2.45 Each 51539

Also: 51539 Advance 
Clear Battery Alarm 
Clock $2.45 each - 
Currently Purchase

Koss Pro 12.55 Each 51089 Option 51089 Koss 
Pro $12.55

Net 30
3

Net 30
3
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

ADAPTER, TV

AIR FRESHENER, SOLID 
CONE TYPE, LIST 
FRAGRANCES, 7.5 OZ

AIR FRESHENER, LIST 
FRAGRANCES

ALARM CLOCK, BATTERY 
OPERATED, CLEAR, 
DIGITAL, BRAND NAME (NO 
LUMINARY) (SUBMIT 
SAMPLES)

AUDIO, HEADPHONE  
ADAPTER 1/8" TO 1/4"

AUDIO, HEADPHONE 
CABLE, 6' MAXIMUM, NOT 
COILED

AUDIO, HEADPHONE, KOSS

AUDIO, EARBUD, SONY

BALL, RACQUET, CLEAR 
PLASTIC PACKAGING
BALL, TENNIS, CLEAR 
PLASTIC PACKAGING
BATTERY, NAME BRAND, 
BLISTER PACK, 9 VOLT 
MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, C 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, NAME BRAND (4 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, AA 
SIZE,MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, D 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, NAME BRAND (2 
PACK OR 4 PACK), BLISTER 
PACK, AAA SIZE, MUST 
HAVE UPC
BATTERY, GENERIC, 
BLISTER PACK, 9 VOLT, 
MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, GENERIC (4 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, AA 
SIZE, MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, GENERIC (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, D 
SIZE MUST HAVE UPC
BATTERY, GENERIC (2 
PACK OR 4 PACK), BLISTER 
PACK, AAA SIZE, MUST 
BATTERY, GENERIC  (2 
PACK), BLISTER PACK, C 
SIZE MUST HAVE UPC
BULB, LIGHT, GENERIC 
ASSORTED, 30 AND 40 
WATT TO INCLUDE HI 
INTENSITY (NO HALOGEN)

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and 
Animal Free)

No Bid  $               -   Steren Electronics  $                         0.50 50  $         25.00 4018-007
Quick Connect - Push-
on 75-300 Ohn 
transformer

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

TREE Brand-
Cardboard  $                         0.58 24  $         13.92 6020001 more variety - see 

attachment No Bid  $               -   

Clear Tunes  $                         3.51 12  $         42.12 4038114

more variety - see 
attachment Samples 
sent to K.Jurek/DOC 
Serv

Advance LCD 
Quartz Clock  $                         5.20 6  $         31.20 1032-008

USG  $                         0.60 144  $         86.40 4001023 more variety - see 
attachment LKG.Ind.  $                         0.80 50  $         40.00 16029-010

USG  $                         1.27 200  $       254.00 4001064 DBC Dist  $                         1.50 50  $         75.00 4018-004 Straight

KOSS  $                         5.68 12  $         68.16 4020094 KOSS  $                         7.50 6  $         45.00 11010-156 PTX6

SONY  $                         6.76 12  $         81.12 4020002 No Bid  $               -   

WILSON  $                         3.56 24  $         85.44 5005018 No Bid  $               -   

WILSON  $                         3.38 24  $         81.12 5005001 No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   Duracell  $                         2.80 24  $         67.20 4030-005

No Bid  $               -   Duracell  $                         2.80 6  $         16.80 4030-002

DURACELL  $                         2.50 48  $       120.00 4010035 Duracell  $                         3.00 14  $         42.00 4030-004

No Bid  $               -   Duracell  $                         2.80 6  $         16.80 4030-001

DURACELL  $                         2.50 48  $       120.00 4010036 Duracell  $                         3.00 6  $         18.00 4030-007 4 pk

Powermax  $                         1.38 48  $         66.24 4010022 No Bid  $               -   

Powermax  $                         0.89 200  $       178.00 4010015 No Bid  $               -   

Powermax  $                         1.47 48  $         70.56 4010023 No Bid  $               -   

Powermax  $                         0.89 200  $       178.00 4010013 No Bid  $               -   

Powermax  $                         1.35 48  $         64.80 4010024 No Bid  $               -   

USG  $                         1.66 30  $         49.80 6099004 more variety - see 
attachment No Bid  $               -   

AWARDAWARD
Walkenhorst'sUnion Supply Company
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

WHITENER, LAUNDRY,  
LIQUID, NO CHLORIDE, 30 
FL OZ MAX INCLUDE VEND 
WHITENER, LAUNDRY, 
POWDER, NO CHLORIDE, 32 
OZ MAXIMUM INCLUDE 
VENDING SIZE
CABLE, COAXIAL WITH 
ENDS, FM-TO-FM SCREW 
ON, RG6 SHIELDED 6' MAX
CABLE, SPLITTER, 
TELIVISION
CALCULATOR, HAND HELD, 
SOLAR POWERED, CLEAR 
CARDS, GREETING, 
ASSORTED AND SEASONAL, 
NO GLITTER

CARDS, PINOCHLE

CARDS, POKER

CD CLEANER

CHECKERS SET

CHESS SET

CLIP, ID, IDENTIFICATION 
CARD CLIP ONLY
CONTAINER /W LID, 
STORAGE, PLASTIC 16 QT 
MAX
CRAYONS, CRAYOLA, 16 
COUNT
DETERGENT, LIQUID, LIST 
BRANDS, LIST SIZES, 50 OZ 
MAX

DETERGENT, LIQUID, HIGH 
EFFICIENCY, LIST SIZES 50 
FL OZ MAX

DICTIONARY, POCKET SIZE, 
APPROXIMATELY 5"X8"
DICTIONARY, POCKET SIZE, 
SPANISH TO ENGLISH,  
APPROXIMATELY 5"X8"
DOMINOS, DOUBLE 9, 
IVORY & BLACK ONLY

FABRIC SOFTENER, DRYER 
SHEETS, 40 CT 

HANGERS, PLASTIC, 
TUBULAR, WHITE ONLY, 17 
INCH
HEAD CLEANER, CD NO 
LIQUID, NOT TO EXCEED 
8"X10"
LAMP, CLIP/CLAMP ON, 
CLEAR, STANDARD BULB 
(NO HALOGEN)

MUG, NON INSULATED, 
PLASTIC, 12 OZ MAX

PHOTO ALBUM, PLASTIC 
SHEET TYPE, 20 PAGE 
MAXIMUM

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and 
Animal Free)

AWARDAWARD
Walkenhorst'sUnion Supply Company

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

Clear Tunes  $                         2.36 12  $         28.32 4001115
6' RG6 Shielded 
Coax. Cable W/Gold 
Quick Conncet

DBL Dist  $                         1.75 50  $         87.50 4018-051 6 ft Black
RG6 Premium

USG  $                         1.11 12  $         13.32 4001021 DBL Dist  $                         0.80 50  $         40.00 4018-020

USG  $                         1.91 12  $         22.92 4044080 No Bid  $               -   

USG-ASG  $                         0.25 6  $           1.50 6515400 more variety - see 
attachment No Bid  $               -   

MAVERICK  $                         0.89 144  $       128.16 6002005 Streamline  $                         1.45 24  $         34.80 8035-109

MAVERICK  $                         0.89 144  $       128.16 6002006 Streamline  $                         1.45 24  $         34.80 8035-110

MAXELL  $                         3.25 12  $         39.00 4001082 Dry Cloths Maxell  $                         3.60 1  $           3.60 4018-129

PRESSMAN  $                         1.63 12  $         19.56 6040003 more variety - see 
attachment Pressman  $                         3.10 12  $         37.20 16147-001

PRESSMAN  $                         2.49 12  $         29.88 6040004 more variety - see 
attachment Pressman  $                         4.40 12  $         52.80 16147-003

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

STERILITE  $                         2.98 12  $         35.76 5599010 No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   Tide 25 oz  $                         7.90 6  $         47.40 3111-972

No Bid  $               -   Cheer 40 oz  $                         8.80 6  $         52.80 3111-971

Webster's  $                         0.88 72  $         63.36 6502011 Merriam Webster  $                         4.90 24  $       117.60 13018-001 4 3/16 x 6 3/4

Webster's  $                         1.23 72  $         88.56 6099020 Merriam Webster  $                         4.90 24  $       117.60 13018-003 4 3/16 x 6 3/4

PRESSMAN  $                         5.89 6  $         35.34 6006002 No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

MERRICK  $                         1.36 18  $         24.48 6050003 8 each per pack
18 pack per case No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

WEST BEND  $                         8.25 12  $         99.00 5508014 more variety - see 
attachment American Lighting  $                         8.55 6  $         51.30 1047-005

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

PIONEER  $                         1.56 24  $         37.44 6520001 more variety - see 
attachment Pioneer  $                         1.55 24  $         37.20 16032-006
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3846 OF
HOUSEHOLD PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Household

DESCRIPTION

PINS, PUSH, CLEAR, MAX 25 
COUNT
POLY FIL, 20 OZ MAXIMUM 
SIZE

RECEIVER, AM/FM, CLEAR 
PLASTIC, LIST BRANDS, 
WARRANTY 

REMOTE CONTROL, TV, 
UNIVERSAL RCA, 
COMPATABLE WITH 
DIGITAL TV 
SURGE PROTECTOR, 6' 
LONG, 3-6 OUTLETS, NO 
METAL, WHITE OR TAN
SURGE 
PROTECTOR,SINGLE 
OUTLET
TUMBLER W/LID, SOFT 
PLASTIC, CLEAR 12-22 FL 
OZ
WALLET, CD, 12 DISC, 
BLACK, MAX 24
Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

ALARM CLOCK, BATTERY 
OPERATED, CLEAR, 
DIGITAL, BRAND NAME (NO 
LUMINARY) (SUBMIT 
SAMPLES)

AUDIO, HEADPHONE, KOSS

AUDIO, HEADPHONE  
ADAPTER 1/8" TO 1/4"

AIR FRESHENER, LIST 
FRAGRANCES

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs 

(Identify Kosher, 
Halal and Animal 

SPECIFY BRAND 
& SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE BY 
EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes 
From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and 
Animal Free)

AWARDAWARD
Walkenhorst'sUnion Supply Company

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

Clear Tunes  $                         5.88 12  $         70.56 4038100

more variety - see 
attachment
Warranty info 
enclosed

No Bid  $               -   

RCA  $                         3.96 12  $         47.52 4001109 RCA  $                       10.75 4  $         43.00 4018-112

No Bid  $               -   No Bid  $               -   

USG  $                         3.46 12  $         41.52 4001070 Eastern American  $                         1.90 24  $         45.60 5100-008

No Bid  $               -   Zyliss 16 oz  $                         3.40 6  $         20.40 99985-001

SENTRY  $                         0.92 12  $         11.04 4001079 No Bid  $               -   

Scented Tree Air 
Freshener Boquet 0.58 6020002 76171101020

Scented Tree Air 
Freshener Cherry 0.58 6020003 76171103116

Scented Tree Air 
Freshener Jasmine 0.58 6020004 76171104335

Scented Tree Air 
Freshener Vanilla 0.58 6020005 76171101051

Scented Tree Air 
Freshener Forest 0.58 6020006 76171101099

Scented Tree Air 
Freshener Spice 0.58 6020007 76171101037

Scented Tree Air 
Freshener 
Strawberry

0.58 6020008 76171101037

Headphone 
Adapter - 1/8" Mini 
Stereo to 1/4" 

0.6 4001024 45215101050

0
7-10

Award Explanation:  The products Whitener and Detergent (liquid) have been identified as no longer being needed by the
canteen supervisors.  Fabric Softener and Tumbler have been awarded to the next lowest bidder as to not create a 
contract for two line items.  Air Freshener was awarded to Union Supply due to the variety of scents offered.  Battery (9 
volt and C size) were awarded to Keefe to keep all batteries on one contract.  Calculator was awarded to Keefe due to 
product having memory functions. Container (w/lid) awarded to Union Supply as product is approved for safety and 
security by NSP Warden. Both Dictionary line items awarded to Keefe for higher quality for use with law library. Dominos 
awarded to Union Supply as line item was bid Double 9 as needed.  

0 30
10-14
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