
Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION
SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

AFTERSHAVE, 
GENERIC, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

AFTERSHAVE, NAME 
BRAND, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ANTACID, TABLET, 
ROLAIDS OR TUMS, 
ROLL OR POUCH

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
BARRETTES, PLASTIC 
WITH METAL CLIPS, 3", 
4 PACK

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
CLINCHER COMBS, 5" No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
SIDE COMBS, 2 PACK No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
STRETCHER COMBS No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .35 OZ MAX No Bid  $      -   Carmex  $     1.13 24  $     27.12 1724

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, MEDICATED, 
SUN PROTECTION, .35 
OZ MAX

No Bid  $      -   

Vasaline 
Lip 
Therapy 
.35oz

 $     0.88 72  $     63.36 1732
This is the brand you last 
awarded but it doesn't contain 
sun protection.

BOBBY PINS, BLACK 
OR BROWN No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

BUF-PUF No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

Athlete's Needs, Inc. Drugstore Products

AWARD

1 of 40



Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION
SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Athlete's Needs, Inc. Drugstore Products

AWARD

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

COUGH DROPS, 
GENERIC, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, SUGAR 
FREE, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 CT MAX

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

DOO RAGS, WHILE 
ONLY, INDIVIDUAL No Bid  $      -   Doo Rag 

White  $     0.70 12  $       8.40 

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
FRESH SCENT No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
VINEGAR No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

EMERY BOARDS, 10 
PACK No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

No Bid  $      -   Dep 12oz  $     2.35 6  $     14.10 1552 12oz
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION
SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Athlete's Needs, Inc. Drugstore Products

AWARD

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX No Bid  $      -   Lucky 

16oz  $     2.59 12  $     31.08 1556 16oz

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
NON ALCOHOL, 4 OZ No Bid  $      -   Ampro 

6oz  $     0.96 12  $     11.52 1304 6oz

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, GENERIC, 5-
7 OZ

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, NAME 
BRAND, 5-7 OZ

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

INSOLE, FOOT, 
GENERIC, NO GEL No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

INSOLE, FOOT, NAME 
BRAND, NO GEL No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

PONY TAIL HOLDERS, 
ELASTIC ONLY, BLACK No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION
SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Athlete's Needs, Inc. Drugstore Products

AWARD

POWDER, BABY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

POWDER, BODY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

POWDER, BODY, GOLD 
BOND, 8 OZ No Bid  $      -   Gold 

bond 4oz  $     3.17 24  $     76.08 1767C 4oz Gold bond

POWDER, FOOT, 
MEDICATED, 3 OZ No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

PUFF BALLS, PLASTIC 
BAG, 100 COUNT No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ROLLERS, HAIR,  
BRUSH,  LARGE No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ROLLERS, HAIR, 
BRUSH MEDIUM No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
LARGE No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
MEDIUM No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

SHAMPOO, TAR No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION
SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Athlete's Needs, Inc. Drugstore Products

AWARD

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

SWABS, COTTON, 
APPROX 80-100 No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

SWEAT BAND, HEAD,  
WHITE ONLY, 
INDIVIDUAL

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

FOOT OINTMENT, 
BRAND NAME, 
ANTIFUNGUL, .5 OZ

No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

VAPOR RUB, NAME 
BRAND, 1.5 OZ No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

VAPOR RUB, GENERIC, 
1.5 OZ No Bid  $      -   No Bid  $          -   

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM, 50 - 100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  3.19 24  $76.56 

665BP - 
Pouch 
665B 
Bottle

Advanced Ultrex Plus - Same 
formula as Centrum. Clear 
Stand Up Pouch or Clear 
Bottle.

Centrum 
100ct  $     7.70 12  $     92.40 2800E the Manufacture disc the 50ct

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM SILVER, 50 - 
100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  3.69 24  $88.56 688B
Ultrex Mature - Same type 
formula as Centrum Silver. 
Clear Bottle Packaging.

Centrum 
Silver 
60ct

 $     7.88 12  $     94.56 2800D

VITAMIN, MULTI , ONE-
A-DAY, 50 - 100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  1.59 24  $38.16 

444AP - 
Pouch 
444A 
Bottle

Multiple Vitamin Plus - 
Available in Clear Stand-Up 
Pouch or Clear Bottle 
Packaging.

One-A-
Day 60ct.  $     5.90 24  $   141.60 2804
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION
SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Athlete's Needs, Inc. Drugstore Products

AWARD

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
GENERIC, WITH 
CALCIUM, 50 - 100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  1.59 24  $38.16 

444AP - 
Pouch 
444A 
Bottle

Multiple Vitamin Plus - 
Available in Clear Stand-Up 
Pouch or Clear Bottle 
Packaging.

No Bid  $          -   

VITAMIN, A , GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  3.49 24  $83.76 101A 10,000 - IU. Clear Bottle 
Packaging. No Bid  $          -   

VITAMIN, B, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  1.99 24  $47.76 150B
Clear Bottle Packaging. See 
attached paged for optional 
product.

No Bid  $          -   

VITAMIN, C, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  2.09 24  $50.16 

110BP - 
Pouch 
110B - 
Bottle

Available in Clear Stand-Up 
Pouch or Clear Bottle 
Packaging.

No Bid  $          -   

VITAMIN, E, GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  2.19 24  $52.56 116AP

Available in Clear Stand-Up 
Pouch or Clear Bottle 
Packaging. See attached page 
for optional size.

No Bid  $          -   

VITAMIN, MULTI  A/D 
COMBO, GENERIC, 50 - 
100 CT

Natural 
Choice 
100 ct

 $  3.49 24  $83.76 101A
A - 10,000, D - 400 IU. Clear 
Bottle Packaging. See 
Attached for optional product.

No Bid  $          -   

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

N/A

5 5
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION
SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Athlete's Needs, Inc. Drugstore Products

AWARD

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .15 OZ MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION
SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Athlete's Needs, Inc. Drugstore Products

AWARD

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

AFTERSHAVE, 
GENERIC, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

AFTERSHAVE, NAME 
BRAND, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

ANTACID, TABLET, 
ROLAIDS OR TUMS, 
ROLL OR POUCH

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
BARRETTES, PLASTIC 
WITH METAL CLIPS, 3", 
4 PACK

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
CLINCHER COMBS, 5"

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
SIDE COMBS, 2 PACK

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
STRETCHER COMBS
BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .35 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, MEDICATED, 
SUN PROTECTION, .35 
OZ MAX

BOBBY PINS, BLACK 
OR BROWN

BUF-PUF

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Ocean 
Clear 
Alcohol 
Free After 
Shave 
7oz

 $     0.98 12  $  11.76 7006001 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Afta 
Aftershav
e Original 
Scent 3oz

 $     2.03 24  $  48.72 7006002 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Tums 
Asstd 
Fruit Xtra 
3 pk

 $     1.73 12  $  20.76 7001004 See additional items No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Balm 
.15oz 
clear tube 
medicate
d 15 spf

 $     0.65 12  $    7.80 7003100 See additional items  $  1.44  $             -   756-8593 Chapstick Regular Vendor# 
406157

Carmex 
lip balm 
stick 
original 
spf 15

 $     1.13 24  $  27.12 7003010 See additional items  $  2.12  $             -   756-5780 Chapstick SPF30 Vendor# 
399063

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

DBA Food Express Union Supply Company Henry Schein, Inc.

AWARD
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX
COUGH DROPS, 
GENERIC, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, SUGAR 
FREE, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 CT MAX

DOO RAGS, WHILE 
ONLY, INDIVIDUAL

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
FRESH SCENT

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
VINEGAR

EMERY BOARDS, 10 
PACK

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

DBA Food Express Union Supply Company Henry Schein, Inc.

AWARD

Halls bag 
mentholy
ptus 30pc

 $     1.65 12  $  19.80 7005010 See additional items  $  1.55  $             -   515-0001 Ludens 30/bag
Honey Lemon

Smith 
Brothers 
30ct wild 
cherry 
cough 
drops

 $     0.96 12  $  11.52 7005016 See additional items No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Good 
Sense 
sugar free 
Black 
Cherry 
cough 
Drops

 $     1.08 24  $  25.92 7005250  $  1.97 248-0378 Halls SF Black Cherry 25/Bag

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Good 
Sense 
Xtra 
Clean 
Douche 
Twin Pack 
2-4.5 oz

 $     1.38 12  $  16.56 7030500 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Personal 
Care 16oz 
Spike It 
Extreme 
Hair

 $     0.99 12  $  11.88 7065121 (16 oz size) See additional 
items No Bid  $             -   No Bid
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
NON ALCOHOL, 4 OZ

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, GENERIC, 5-
7 OZ

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, NAME 
BRAND, 5-7 OZ

INSOLE, FOOT, 
GENERIC, NO GEL

INSOLE, FOOT, NAME 
BRAND, NO GEL

PONY TAIL HOLDERS, 
ELASTIC ONLY, BLACK

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

DBA Food Express Union Supply Company Henry Schein, Inc.

AWARD

Softee 
African 
4oz 
Crown 
Hair 
Dress

 $     1.58 12  $  18.96 7110012 See additional items No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Blue 
Magic 
Hair 
Dressing 
4oz

 $     1.58 12  $  18.96 7126006 See additional items No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Lusti Curl 
Activator 
10oz 
Clear 
Alcohol 
Free

 $     1.12 24  $  26.88 7104102 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Aussie 
Aussome 
Volume 
Spray 
6.8oz

 $     3.81 12  $  45.72 7365010 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

POWDER, BABY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ

POWDER, BODY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ

POWDER, BODY, GOLD 
BOND, 8 OZ

POWDER, FOOT, 
MEDICATED, 3 OZ

PUFF BALLS, PLASTIC 
BAG, 100 COUNT
ROLLERS, HAIR,  
BRUSH,  LARGE
ROLLERS, HAIR, 
BRUSH MEDIUM

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
LARGE

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
MEDIUM

SHAMPOO, TAR

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

DBA Food Express Union Supply Company Henry Schein, Inc.

AWARD

Personal 
Care 
Baby 
Powder 
15oz

 $     0.96 12  $  11.52 7007105 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Personal 
Care Bath 
& Shower 
Talc 13oz

 $     0.98 12  $  11.76 7007108 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid
Gold 
Bond 
10oz

 $  6.09  $             -   659-4228 Chattan Gold Bond 10oz

Dr Foot 
3oz 
Antibac 
Foot 
Powder 
1% 
Tolnaftate

 $     1.24 24  $  29.76 7338016 See additional items No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid 100/bag  $  1.02  $             -   780-17.1.0 US Cot CKPB100WRY

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Neutroge
na T-Gel 
Shampoo 
4.4oz

 $     5.84 24  $140.16 7055011 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

12 of 40



Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

SWABS, COTTON, 
APPROX 80-100 

SWEAT BAND, HEAD,  
WHITE ONLY, 
INDIVIDUAL

FOOT OINTMENT, 
BRAND NAME, 
ANTIFUNGUL, .5 OZ

VAPOR RUB, NAME 
BRAND, 1.5 OZ

VAPOR RUB, GENERIC, 
1.5 OZ

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM, 50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM SILVER, 50 - 
100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI , ONE-
A-DAY, 50 - 100 CT

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

DBA Food Express Union Supply Company Henry Schein, Inc.

AWARD

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Ocean 
Clear 
100ct 
Cotton 
Swabs 
Paper 
Stick

 $     0.73 96  $  70.08 7099019 100/pk  $  0.79  $             -   101-9879 HSI #56100

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Tolnaftate 
Cream 
1% - 
Antifungal 
1 oz

 $     0.96 24  $  23.04 7338010 See additional items No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Personal 
Care 
Medicate
d Chest 
Rub 4oz

 $     1.08 12  $  12.96 7345118 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

50 Ct 
Simline 
Vitamin 
Sentry 
Tablet(Ge
neric

 $     2.96 12  $  35.52 7090019 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

50Ct 
Simline 
Vitamin 
one Daily 
Essential

 $     2.73 12  $  32.76 7090022 100/Bt  $  1.54  $             -   423-3982 GERi-P #501-01
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
GENERIC, WITH 
CALCIUM, 50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, A , GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, B, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, C, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, E, GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI  A/D 
COMBO, GENERIC, 50 - 
100 CT

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

DBA Food Express Union Supply Company Henry Schein, Inc.

AWARD

50Ct 
Simline 
Vitamin 
Calcium+
D 600 mg 
Caplet

 $     2.73 12  $  32.76 7090020 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid  $  3.45  $             -   114-1752 Nx generation #11550

50ct 
Simline 
Vitamin B 
Complex 
Clear 
Bottle

 $     2.73 12  $  32.76 7090015 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

50ct 
Simpline 
Vitamin C 
500 mg 
Tablets 
Clear 
Bottle

 $     2.73 12  $  32.76 7090018 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

Simline 
Vitamin E 
400 
Softgels 
Clear 
Bottle

 $     2.73 12  $  32.76 7090017 No Bid  $             -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $             -   No Bid

0 30 days

5

Net 30

5 to 7
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .15 OZ MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

DBA Food Express Union Supply Company Henry Schein, Inc.

AWARD

Blistex 
Original 
Lip Balm 
Medicate
d 15 spf

1.28 24  $  30.72 7003003 Animal Free

Halls Bag 
mentholy
ptus

1.65 12  $  19.80 7005010 Animal Free

Halls Bag 
Cherry 1.65 12  $  19.80 7005010 Animal Free

Level 10 
Ultimate 
Styling 
Gel 
Alcohol 
Free

1.48 12  $  17.76 7065501 Animal Free

Blue 
Magic  
Hair 
Dressing

1.58 12  $  18.96 7126006 Animal Free

Royal 
Crown 
Hair 
Dressing

1.62 12  $  19.44 7126004 Animal Free

Murray's 
Pomade 2.14 24  $  51.36 7118001 Animal Free
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT PRICE 
BY EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

DBA Food Express Union Supply Company Henry Schein, Inc.

AWARD
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

AFTERSHAVE, 
GENERIC, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

AFTERSHAVE, NAME 
BRAND, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

ANTACID, TABLET, 
ROLAIDS OR TUMS, 
ROLL OR POUCH

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
BARRETTES, PLASTIC 
WITH METAL CLIPS, 3", 
4 PACK

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
CLINCHER COMBS, 5"

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
SIDE COMBS, 2 PACK

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
STRETCHER COMBS
BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .35 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, MEDICATED, 
SUN PROTECTION, .35 
OZ MAX

BOBBY PINS, BLACK 
OR BROWN

BUF-PUF

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Freshsce
nt 4oz  $  0.71 60  $  42.60 FAS-4

See 
Attachme
nt

 $       -   See 
Attachment See Attachment

No Bid  $       -   

Mennen 
Afta 
Freshsce
nt 3oz

 $  1.84 24  $  44.16 20049

Medi First 
50/2pk  .18 ea 50  $    9.00 80233

Tums 
Original 
Peppermi
nt 3-roll

 $  1.56 12  $  18.72 20497 Can not get Rolaids until June

No Bid  $       -   

Goody 2" 
Staytite 
Barrettes 
Tortise 
4pk

 $  0.92 72  $  66.24 22695 2"

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   

Plastic 
Side 
Comb 2pk 
Tortise

 $  0.69 6  $    4.14 20355

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   Clear 
Vinyl Bag  $  3.69 1 EA  $    3.69 51155

Clear Vinyl Bag w/Black handle 
& Zipper 9x7x4

Chapet 
.15oz  $  0.80 12  $    9.60 T1153OR

Vaseline 
Lid 
Therapy 
.35oz

 $  0.99 72  $  71.28 20368 Blister pack

No Bid  $       -   
See 
Attachme
nt

 $       -   See 
Attachment See Attachment

No Bid  $       -   Bobby 
Pins 2"  $  0.60 6  $    3.60 20357 60/pk

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

AWARD

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc Keefe Group
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX
COUGH DROPS, 
GENERIC, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, SUGAR 
FREE, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 CT MAX

DOO RAGS, WHILE 
ONLY, INDIVIDUAL

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
FRESH SCENT

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
VINEGAR

EMERY BOARDS, 10 
PACK

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

AWARD

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc Keefe Group

Halls 
9ct/stick  1/stk 12  $  12.00 56784

Halls 9 
Per roll 
Individuall
y 
Wrapped

 $  0.75 2/20ct. 
Case  $  30.00 

20244-Cherry
20234-
Mentholyptus
20405-Black

Sepa 
Soothe 
50/2 pk

 .12 per 
pk 50  $    6.00 18033

Goodsens
e Cough 
Drops 
30CT 
Resealea
ble

 $  0.62 24  $  14.88 
24122-Honey 
Lemon 20545-
Cherry

No Bid  $       -   

Goodsens
e Sugar 
Free 
Black 
Cherry 
25ct

 $  0.98 24  $  23.52 22681

No Bid  $       -   
Doo-Rag 
White 
Package

 $  1.68 EACH  $    1.68 50586 100% Nylon

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   

Massengil
l Extra 
Cleansin 
& Douche

 $  1.72 12  $  20.64 24196 2PK 6OZ Bottles

1 cs 
10/pk

 .64 per 
pk 

10 
pk/cs  $    6.40 T085

Emery 
Boards 
4bxs of 6 
cards

 $  0.30 24  $    7.20 20294 4 1/2 Standard length-6 count

No Bid  $       -   

Elements 
Firm Hold 
Styling 
Gel 
w/Aloe 
Vera

 $  1.15 12  $  13.80 24941 New Firm Hold Styling Gel Aloe 
Vera Animal Free-NOT DEP
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
NON ALCOHOL, 4 OZ

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, GENERIC, 5-
7 OZ

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, NAME 
BRAND, 5-7 OZ

INSOLE, FOOT, 
GENERIC, NO GEL

INSOLE, FOOT, NAME 
BRAND, NO GEL

PONY TAIL HOLDERS, 
ELASTIC ONLY, BLACK

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

AWARD

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc Keefe Group

No Bid  $       -   
See 
Attachme
nt

 $       -   See 
Attachment See Attachment

No Bid  $       -   
See 
Attachme
nt

 $       -   See 
Attachment See Attachment

No Bid  $       -   

Elements 
Firm Hold 
Styling 
Gel 
w/Aloe 
Vera

 $  1.15 12  $  13.80 24941 New Firm Hold Styling Gel Aloe 
Vera Animal Free-NOT DEP

No Bid  $       -   

Heritage 
Alcohol 
Free Hair 
Spray 8oz

 $  1.19 12  $  14.28 21543 8oz

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   

FT 
Freshner 
Shoe 
Insole 
Comfort 1 
pair

 $  1.30 12  $  15.60 20638

No Bid  $       -   

Cabin 
Brand 
Casual 
Insoles 
2pair

 $  1.37 12  $  16.44 21064

1 cs 
18/pkg  $  3.60 50 

pkgs  $180.00 MPH18

Braided 
Elastic 
Pony 
Tailers 
Black 18 
per pack

 $  0.57 6  $    3.42 20362
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

POWDER, BABY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ

POWDER, BODY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ

POWDER, BODY, GOLD 
BOND, 8 OZ

POWDER, FOOT, 
MEDICATED, 3 OZ

PUFF BALLS, PLASTIC 
BAG, 100 COUNT
ROLLERS, HAIR,  
BRUSH,  LARGE
ROLLERS, HAIR, 
BRUSH MEDIUM

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
LARGE

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
MEDIUM

SHAMPOO, TAR

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

AWARD

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc Keefe Group

Fresh 
scent 
14oz

 $  1.17 24/cs  $  28.08 BP14

New Day 
Baby 
Powders 
15oz

 $  0.67 12  $    8.04 22375

No Bid  $       -   

New Day 
Bath&Sho
wer 
Powder 
13oz

 $  0.82 12  $    9.84 22377 13oz

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

Quinsana 
3oz  $  4.43 12/cs  $  53.16 T075AF

Heritage 
Medicate
d Anti-
Fungal 
Powder 
3oz

 $  0.94 24  $  22.56 20329

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   

Goody 
Large 
Green 
Foam 
Rollers 10 
per pack

 $  0.95 6  $    5.70 20351

No Bid  $       -   

Goody 
Medium 
Green 
Foam 
Rollers 12

 $  0.95 6  $    5.70 20350

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   

Wayfarer 
Sunglass
es Non-
Mirror

 $  1.19 1ea  $    1.19 50833
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

SWABS, COTTON, 
APPROX 80-100 

SWEAT BAND, HEAD,  
WHITE ONLY, 
INDIVIDUAL

FOOT OINTMENT, 
BRAND NAME, 
ANTIFUNGUL, .5 OZ

VAPOR RUB, NAME 
BRAND, 1.5 OZ

VAPOR RUB, GENERIC, 
1.5 OZ

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM, 50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM SILVER, 50 - 
100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI , ONE-
A-DAY, 50 - 100 CT

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

AWARD

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc Keefe Group

No Bid  $       -   

Clip-on 
Sunglass
es Clip-on 
Non 
Mirror

 $  2.95 1ea  $    2.95 50816

No Bid  $       -   

New Day 
Cotton 
Swabs 
100ct bag

 $  0.45 24  $  10.80 21952

No Bid  $       -   

Headban
d White 
94% 
cotton 6% 
Elastic

 $  0.95 1ea  $    0.95 50208010W

Tolnaftate 
.5oz  $  1.89 12/cs  $  22.68 AF5

Athlete 
Foot 
Cream 
1% 15gm 
.5oz

 $  0.85 72  $  61.20 24126

No Bid  $       -   

Vicks 
Vaporub 
1.76oz 
Jar

 $  3.69 36  $132.84 22180 1.76oz Jar

No Bid  $       -   

Medicate
d Chest 
Rub 
3.53oz

 $  1.17 12  $  14.04 21762 3.5oz

No Bid  $       -   
Multi 50 
Vitamin 
50ct

 $  3.67 12  $  44.04 21339 Naturalist Brand

No Bid  $       -   

1-Day 
Vitamin 
W/O Iron 
90ct

 $  1.52 12  $  18.24 21337 Naturalist Brand

No Bid  $       -   

1-Day 
Vitamin 
W/Iron 
90ct

 $  1.79 12  $  21.48 21336 Naturalist Brand
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
GENERIC, WITH 
CALCIUM, 50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, A , GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, B, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, C, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, E, GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI  A/D 
COMBO, GENERIC, 50 - 
100 CT

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

AWARD

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc Keefe Group

No Bid  $       -   
Pure C 
500MG 
100/ct

 $  2.00 12  $  24.00 21341 Also 21336 Daily Multi Vitamin 
w/Iron

No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid  $       -   No Bid No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $       -   No Bid

Net 30 days

5-7

Net 30 days

3

22 of 40



Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .15 OZ MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

AWARD

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc Keefe Group

Softee 
Curl 
Activator 
Gel 8oz

0.8 12  $    9.60 22953
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

AWARD

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc Keefe Group
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

AFTERSHAVE, 
GENERIC, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

AFTERSHAVE, NAME 
BRAND, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

ANTACID, TABLET, 
ROLAIDS OR TUMS, 
ROLL OR POUCH

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
BARRETTES, PLASTIC 
WITH METAL CLIPS, 3", 
4 PACK

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
CLINCHER COMBS, 5"

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
SIDE COMBS, 2 PACK

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
STRETCHER COMBS
BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .35 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, MEDICATED, 
SUN PROTECTION, .35 
OZ MAX

BOBBY PINS, BLACK 
OR BROWN

BUF-PUF

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Freshsce
nt 4 oz  $  0.62 60  $37.20 PC613 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

Tums Roll 
12 ct  $  0.72 12  $  8.64 RD445 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG-
Goody  $  1.06 72  $  76.32 7520044 more variety - see attachment

No Bid  $     -   USG-
Goody  $  1.80 72  $129.60 7520043

No Bid  $     -   USG-
Goody  $  0.82 72  $  59.04 7505014

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG-ACC  $  0.75 144  $108.00 7599100 more variety - see attachment

Lip-Ex 
.15oz  $  0.37 24  $  8.88 PC715 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

Chap Ice 
.10oz  $  0.31 50  $15.50 PC707 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG-
Goody  $  0.62 72  $  44.64 7520018

No Bid  $     -   USG-ACC  $  0.63 50  $  31.50 7099025 Body Puff

Maxima Supply Union Supply Company

AWARD AWARD
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX
COUGH DROPS, 
GENERIC, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, SUGAR 
FREE, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 CT MAX

DOO RAGS, WHILE 
ONLY, INDIVIDUAL

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
FRESH SCENT

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
VINEGAR

EMERY BOARDS, 10 
PACK

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Maxima Supply Union Supply Company

AWARD AWARD

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG  $  0.68 12  $    8.16 7520087

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG-
TRIM  $  0.48 24  $  11.52 7510002

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
NON ALCOHOL, 4 OZ

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, GENERIC, 5-
7 OZ

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, NAME 
BRAND, 5-7 OZ

INSOLE, FOOT, 
GENERIC, NO GEL

INSOLE, FOOT, NAME 
BRAND, NO GEL

PONY TAIL HOLDERS, 
ELASTIC ONLY, BLACK

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Maxima Supply Union Supply Company

AWARD AWARD

Lusti 10oz  $  0.83 24  $19.92 EC589 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

Dep 2oz  $  0.64 36  $23.04 PC644 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG  $  1.19 144  $171.36 2001040 Court Line Odor Stopper

No Bid  $     -   Odor 
Eater  $  2.96 24  $  71.04 7499110

Generic 
18ct  $  0.53 12  $  6.36 HC961 USG-ACC  $  0.60 72  $  43.20 7520201 No Metal Holders
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

POWDER, BABY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ

POWDER, BODY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ

POWDER, BODY, GOLD 
BOND, 8 OZ

POWDER, FOOT, 
MEDICATED, 3 OZ

PUFF BALLS, PLASTIC 
BAG, 100 COUNT
ROLLERS, HAIR,  
BRUSH,  LARGE
ROLLERS, HAIR, 
BRUSH MEDIUM

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
LARGE

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
MEDIUM

SHAMPOO, TAR

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Maxima Supply Union Supply Company

AWARD AWARD

Personal 
Care 15oz  $  0.78 12  $  9.36 PC669 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

Personal 
Care 13oz  $  0.78 12  $  9.36 PC694 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

Per Cara 
10oz  $  0.78 12  $  9.36 PC454 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG-
Goody  $  1.19 72  $  85.68 7520033

No Bid  $     -   USG-
Goody  $  1.19 72  $  85.68 7520036

Generic 
12 ct  $  0.64 12  $  7.68 HC936 USG-

Goody  $  1.08 72  $  77.76 7520029

Generic 
12 ct  $  0.64 12  $  7.68 HC935 USG-

Goody  $  1.08 72  $  77.76 7520031

Major 
Thera-Gel 
8.5 oz

 $  2.81 12  $33.72 PC435 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG  $  1.92 12  $  23.04 4510043
more variety - see attachment 
Samples sent to K.Jurek/DOC 
Serv.
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

SWABS, COTTON, 
APPROX 80-100 

SWEAT BAND, HEAD,  
WHITE ONLY, 
INDIVIDUAL

FOOT OINTMENT, 
BRAND NAME, 
ANTIFUNGUL, .5 OZ

VAPOR RUB, NAME 
BRAND, 1.5 OZ

VAPOR RUB, GENERIC, 
1.5 OZ

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM, 50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM SILVER, 50 - 
100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI , ONE-
A-DAY, 50 - 100 CT

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Maxima Supply Union Supply Company

AWARD AWARD

No Bid  $     -   USG  $  1.92 12  $  23.04 4510036
more variety - see attachment 
Samples sent to K.Jurek/DOC 
Serv.

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   USG  $  1.00 12  $  12.00 5020001

Dr. 
Sheffield 
.5oz

 $  0.94 24  $22.56 PH301 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
GENERIC, WITH 
CALCIUM, 50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, A , GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, B, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, C, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, E, GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI  A/D 
COMBO, GENERIC, 50 - 
100 CT

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Maxima Supply Union Supply Company

AWARD AWARD

Generic 
100 ct  $  1.76 12  $21.12 PH404 No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

No Bid  $     -   No Bid  $       -   No Bid

10-14

Net 30 days

3

0 30
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .15 OZ MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Maxima Supply Union Supply Company

AWARD AWARD

Large 
Clear 
Toiletries 
Bag

1.76 6010002 744234600697

Kicker 
Sunglass
es

1.92 1540049 744234401621
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY

 CASE 
PRICE 

PRODUCT 
NUMBER

State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 
Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Maxima Supply Union Supply Company

AWARD AWARD

Sunglass
es Clip-on 
Small 
Frame 
Amber 
Lense

1.92 4510037 744234402000
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

AFTERSHAVE, 
GENERIC, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

AFTERSHAVE, NAME 
BRAND, NON-
ALCOHOL, 2-4 OZ

ANTACID, TABLET, 
ROLAIDS OR TUMS, 
ROLL OR POUCH

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
BARRETTES, PLASTIC 
WITH METAL CLIPS, 3", 
4 PACK

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
CLINCHER COMBS, 5"

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
SIDE COMBS, 2 PACK

ACCESSORIES, HAIR, 
STRETCHER COMBS
BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .35 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, MEDICATED, 
SUN PROTECTION, .35 
OZ MAX

BOBBY PINS, BLACK 
OR BROWN

BUF-PUF

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Freshsce
nt  $  0.75 60  $  45.00 62271-002 4 oz

Gillette  $  3.00 6  $  18.00 70785-664 2.5 oz

No Bid  $       -   

Vidal 
Sassoon  $  1.35 6  $    8.10 8026-002

No Bid  $       -   

Goody  $  1.00 6  $    6.00 34667-010

No Bid  $       -   

Gerber 
Inc  $  2.90 6  $  17.40 78263-002

Carmex  $  1.10 12  $  13.20 18106-010 .15 oz

Chapstick 
Medic  $  1.90 24  $  45.60 3112-084 .5 oz

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

Walkenhorst's
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX
COUGH DROPS, 
GENERIC, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, SUGAR 
FREE, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 CT MAX

DOO RAGS, WHILE 
ONLY, INDIVIDUAL

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
FRESH SCENT

DOUCHE, DISPOSABLE, 
VINEGAR

EMERY BOARDS, 10 
PACK

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Walkenhorst's

Halls  $  2.20 12  $  26.40 3112-167 25 ct

No Bid  $       -   

Halls  $  2.20 12  $  26.40 3112-172 25 ct

First Line  $  1.40 12  $  16.80 6014-003

No Bid  $       -   

Massengil
l  $  2.20 12  $  26.40 3112-427 2 pk

Trim  $  0.50 6  $    3.00 3112-274 7 pk

No Bid  $       -   
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
NON ALCOHOL, 4 OZ

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, GENERIC, 5-
7 OZ

HAIR SPRAY, NON-
AEROSOL, NON-
ALCOHOL, NAME 
BRAND, 5-7 OZ

INSOLE, FOOT, 
GENERIC, NO GEL

INSOLE, FOOT, NAME 
BRAND, NO GEL

PONY TAIL HOLDERS, 
ELASTIC ONLY, BLACK

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Walkenhorst's

Ampro  $  2.60 12  $  31.20 1799-012 15 oz

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

Sof-Sole  $  7.00 1  $    7.00 1610
Sizes 7-8.5
5-7.5   9-10.5
8-11   11-12.5

Vidal 
Sassoon  $  1.35 6  $    8.10 8026-033 3 pk
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

POWDER, BABY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ

POWDER, BODY, LIST 
BRANDS, 15 OZ

POWDER, BODY, GOLD 
BOND, 8 OZ

POWDER, FOOT, 
MEDICATED, 3 OZ

PUFF BALLS, PLASTIC 
BAG, 100 COUNT
ROLLERS, HAIR,  
BRUSH,  LARGE
ROLLERS, HAIR, 
BRUSH MEDIUM

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
LARGE

ROLLERS, HAIR, FOAM, 
MEDIUM

SHAMPOO, TAR

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Walkenhorst's

Perfect 
Purity  $  1.30 12  $  15.60 1799-004 14 oz

No Bid  $       -   

Gold 
Bond  $  6.90 24  $165.60 18382-020 10 oz

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

Vidal 
Sassoon  $  0.85 6  $    5.10 8026-018 10 pk

Vidal 
Sassoon  $  0.85 6  $    5.10 8026-016 12 pk

No Bid  $       -   

Cougar  $  1.70 12  $  20.40 3067-010
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

SWABS, COTTON, 
APPROX 80-100 

SWEAT BAND, HEAD,  
WHITE ONLY, 
INDIVIDUAL

FOOT OINTMENT, 
BRAND NAME, 
ANTIFUNGUL, .5 OZ

VAPOR RUB, NAME 
BRAND, 1.5 OZ

VAPOR RUB, GENERIC, 
1.5 OZ

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM, 50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
CENTRUM SILVER, 50 - 
100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI , ONE-
A-DAY, 50 - 100 CT

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Walkenhorst's

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

ProFeet 
Inc  $  2.50 6  $  15.00 50266-020

No Bid  $       -   

Vicks  $  4.75 12  $  57.00 3112-076 1.76 oz

No Bid  $       -   

Centrum  $12.50 6  $  75.00 3112-721 100 ct

No Bid  $       -   

One-A-
Day  $  8.20 6  $  49.20 3112-719 Men's 60 tabs
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

VITAMIN, MULTI , 
GENERIC, WITH 
CALCIUM, 50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, A , GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, B, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, C, GENERIC,  
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, E, GENERIC, 
50 - 100 CT

VITAMIN, MULTI  A/D 
COMBO, GENERIC, 50 - 
100 CT

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Walkenhorst's

Nature's 
Bounty  $  3.60 3  $  10.80 62108-025 100 tabs

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

No Bid  $       -   

0

7-10
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BALM, LIP, BRAND 
NAME, .15 OZ MAX

COUGH DROPS, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED, NAME 
BRAND, ASSORTED 
FLAVORS, 30 COUNT 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
DEP, #8 EXTRA HOLD, 
NON ALCOHOL, 15 OZ 
MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 15 OZ MAX

GEL, HAIR, STYLING, 
ETHNIC, 4 OZ MAX

BAG, 
MAKEUP/SHAVING, 
CLEAR PLASTIC

SUNGLASSES, NON-
MIRROR, PLASTIC 
LENS - (SEND SAMPLE 
OF SUNGLASSES 

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Walkenhorst's
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Buyer: Lisa Rolik 3845 OF
HEALTH and BEAUTY PRODUCTS

Opening Date: 12/16/2011

Canteen Health & 
Beauty

DESCRIPTION

SUNGLASSES, CLIP 
ON, NON-MIRROR, 
PLASTIC LENS - (SEND 
SAMPLE OF 
SUNGLASSES W/BID)

SPECIFY 
BRAND & 

SIZE BIDDING

UNIT 
PRICE BY 

EACH

CASE 
QUANTITY  CASE PRICE PRODUCT 

NUMBER
State Any Changes From Specs (Identify 

Kosher, Halal and Animal Free)

Walkenhorst's

The State will award Sunglasses which have been approved for safety and security 
to Union Supply.  
The State will award Gel (Hair, Styling, DEP, #8 Extra Hold, Non Alcohol, 15 oz 
max to two vendors due to preference.

Award Explanation:

The State will not award Puff Balls and Hair Spray (non-aerosol, non-alcohol, name 
brand, 5-7 oz).

It is in the State's best interest to award all vitamins to one contract.  Vitamins 
have been verified to be the same basic formulation as Centrum and are packaged 
in a security friendly resealable clear plastic pouch.  

The State will award Vaseline (Balm, Lip, Brand), Softee (Gel, Hair, Styling, 
Ethnic), and Odor Eaters (Insole, Foot, Brand) due to preference.
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