Buyer: Connie Heinrichs

Partial Award

3842 OF
Department of Roads

Partial Award

Opening Date: 11/29/11

Chemung Supply

Midwest Service &

Sioux City Foundry

Valk Manufacturing

3+
v Grader & Snow Plow Blades Corp. Kennametal, Inc.. Sales Co. NMC, Inc. Co. Company
= Description Qty |U/M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
45-04610 plow blade 1300| ea [ $ 36.99 No Bid $ 31.18 N/A $ 36.24| $ 33.00
1 |Make Evolution Edges S Clir?‘t: SERES Esco Valk
Model 1265Rev PBA4606049 6444-500 1/2/x6/x5'
45-04615 plow blade  [1300] ea | $ 43.11 No Bid $ 37.52 N/A $ 43.49] $ 39.60
2 [Make Evolution Edges e (I:neg B Esco Valk
Model 1267Rev PBA4607249 6444-600 1/2X6X6'
45-04830 carbide blade [1300| ea | $ 129.87| $ 19199 $ 137.55 179.21 No Bid $ 134.22
3 Make Evolution Edges Kennametal Black (ljnact Blades Cat Valk
Model ECB36 PB236 CIAT663644JJ 275-2478 3/4X6X3'
45-04835 carbide blade [2500( ea | $ 173.16 | $ 253.19| $ 183.40 238.93 No Bid $ 178.96
4 Make Evolution Edges Kennametal Black (ljnact Blades Cat Valk
Model ECB48 PB248 CIAT6648443J 264-2215 3/4X6X4'
45-04840 carbide blade [1000| ea | $ 129.87| $ 186.00| $ 137.55 153.13 No Bid $ 130.56
5 Make Evolution Edges Kennametal Black (ljnact Blades Cat Valk
Model ECB34536 PB436 CIAT653644 198-2635 3/4X5X3'
45-04845 carbide blade [2000| ea | $ 173.16 | $ 245.43| $ 183.40 189.07 No Bid $ 174.08
6 Make Evolution Edges Kennametal Black (ljnact Blades Cat Valk
Model ECB34548 PB448 CIAT654844 198-2659 3/4X5X4'
7 |Additional Delivery Cost| | Incl. None** $120.00* N/A
Outside Lincoln Area
Payment Terms 1/2% 10 days N/A N30 Net 30 30% 30 days 0% 0 days Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 40 30-60 45 approx. 120 0
**Ereight

Comments

Prepaid/Allowed
when shipping within
the State of
Nebraska
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