@ Carlos Castillo, Jr.
AdministrativeServices Director
Dave Heineman, Governor

Rejection of Bids

Date: December 23, 2011
To: All Bidders
From: Julie Dabydeen, Buyer

AS State Purchasing

RE: Invitation to Bid (ITB) 3831 OF

The State of Nebraska is rejecting all bids received on the above referenced Invitation to Bid for
Meat and Meat Products.

Your firm will be given the opportunity to participate when new proposals are solicited.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with the State of Nebraska.

Steve Sulek * Administrator
Materiel Division ¢ 301 Centennial Mall South * PO. Box 94847 ¢ Lincoln, Nebraska 68509-4847 + Phone: 402-471-2401 « Fax: 402-471-2089



Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3831 OF Opening Date: 11/18/2011
DHHS
ALTERNATE BID: COST PLUS BID
12 MONTH VENDORS PRICE PER PERCENT PROCESSING COST| TOTAL COST TO
NAMP NUMBER DESCRIPTION USAGE PURCHASE
LB * MARKUP * * STATE *
PRICE
1| 136 |Ground Beef Regular. Packed in 5 Ib. bags. Frozen 4500 Ibs 1.714 6% 1.821b
2| 1100 |Cubed Steaks cut in 4 oz portions from USDA choice bottom round flats. Packed by] 4400 Refer to Frozen State State ID# 4.099
each side. Frozen ealpieces Contract Contract 130270C
3] 170 |Bottom Round Roasts-USDA choice roasts cut from the bottom round. Packedin | 10000 Ibs 2.426 6% 2571b
package from 2Ib-12lb. Frozen
4] 135 |Beef Cubes - USDA choice beef cut from the bottom rounds. Package in 5 Ib. 1400 Ibs Refer to Frozen State State ID# 4.020
packages. Frozen. Contract Contract 130270C
5] 612 |Beef Fajita Strips - USDA choice beef cut form the bottom rounds. Packed in 5 Ib. 400 lbs 3.45 15% 3.971b
Packages. Frozen.
6] 703 |Beef Liver - USDA choice, Grade A. Package 10 Ib. box. Frozen 400 |bs Refer to Frozen State State ID# 4.067
Contract Contract 130270C
7] 1412 |Chops, Center Cut, 4 ounce portions, unless otherwise noted. Selection #1 USDA 2,400 3.003 15% 3451b
Inspected. Ordered by the each. Frozen. ealpieces
8] 423 |Country Style Spare Ribs - Country style ribs shall be prepared form the extra 1,200 17 15% 1.96 b
tender square cut pork shoulder butt. Selection 1 USDA inspected. Ordered by the| ea/pieces
each. Frozen
9] 1402 |Pork Cutlets - Selection 1 USDA inspected. Cut from boneless pork sirloin ends in 1,000 2.57 15% 2.96 Ib
4 oz portions. Packaged by each Frozen. ealpieces
10 501 [Ham, shor shank, Regular (cured and smoked) Range A: 10-12 Ibs. USDA 500 Ibs. No Bid
inspected Selection #1. Frozen Purchased by the each.
11| 508 [Ham, Bonelss, Skinned, (Cured) Pressed fully cooked, moist heat. Selection #1 2,200 Ibs 2.88 12% 3.231b
USDA inspected. 5-7 Ibs. Each. Frozen.
12| 413  |Pork Loin Boneless. Selection #1 USDA inspected. 10-12 Ibs. Each. Frozen. 400 |bs Refer to Frozen State State ID# 4.079
Contract Contract 130270C
13| 539 [Bacon, (Sliced), (Cured and Smoked). Selection #1 USDA inspected. Layer 1600 lbs 2.82 10% 31lb
packed separated by sheets of waxed paper in 10 |b. Boxes. Frozen.
14] 406A |Boston Butt, Boned and Tied. Selection No. 1. The Boston Butt Shall be tied 800 Ibs 151 10% 1.66 I
girthwise. 6-8 Ib. (individually wrapped) each. Frozen.
15[ 550A [Canadian Style Bacon USDA inspected. Range C: 8-10. Packaged in 10 Ib. 100 Ibs. 2.645 15% 3.041b
boxes. Frozen.




Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3831 OF Opening Date: 11/18/2011
DHHS
ALTERNATE BID: COST PLUS BID
12 MONTH VENDORS PRICE PER PERCENT PROCESSING COST| TOTAL COST TO
NAMP NUMBER DESCRIPTION USAGE PURCHASE
LB * MARKUP * * STATE *
PRICE

16| 802 |[Style "C"- Pork Sausage, Links 300 Ibs 2.17 15% 251b
17 802 |[Style "F"- Bulk, 5,6,8, or 10 Ib. 600 Ibs 2.38 15% 2.741b
18| P1005 [Chicken, Fryers US Grade A. USDA inspected. No parts missing. Weight 3-4 Ibs. | 4,800 Ibs 0.91 6% 0.96 Ib

Each. Frozen (8 piece cut) unless otherwise specified. 8 piece tray pack. Frozen
19 P1100 [Chicken Roasters. US Grade A. USDA inspected. Each bird shall weigh over 3 1/2| 1200 Ibs 0.91 6% 0.96 Ib

Ibs. Frozen. Packaged six (6) in a case.
20| P2101 |Turkey, ovenready. US Grade A USDA Inspected. No parts missing. 18-22 Ib. 3,000 Ibs 1.19 10% 1311b

Weight. Cry- O - Vac'd IQF.
21| 803 |Liver Sausage, (Braunschweiger). Style A; artificial casting. Frozen 70 Ibs Refer to Frozen State State ID# 4.091

Contract Contract 130270C
22| 804 |Salami, cooked. Formula A; pork and beef. Frozen 200 |bs 3.6 15% 4.141b
23] 808 |Dry Salami. Formula "C", Style "B". Frozen. (5-10 pounds) 200 |bs No Bid
24] Hormel |Little Smokie Sausage, smoked cooked Beef & Pork 300 |bs 2.86 15% 3.291b
25| 813 |Polish Sausage. Formula A; pork, Style D; collagen casing 6 links to the Ib. 200 |bs Refer to Frozen State State ID# 4.073
Contract Contract 130270C

26] 814 |MeatLoaves (Ham) Formula'Y 300Ibs No Bid
27] 815 |Meat Food Product Loaves. Formula B; pickle pimento. Class B; unsmoked. 200 Ibs No Bid

Shape A; baked. Wrapped in grease and moisture resistant paper or plastic film.

Frozen. 5-10 pounds
28] 818 |[ltalian Sausage, 4 per pound. 200 Ibs No Bid
29] 5201 |Spiced luncheon Loaf. USDA inspected 9/1 Ib. Tins/case. Chilled 200 |bs No Bid
30] 805 |Hormel Chopped Ham Luncheon Loaf. USDA inspected. Approx. 10# loafs. 200 |bs 1.81 15% 2.08 b

Hormel Honey Loaf Luncheon Meat. Good quality
31 Hormel Honey Loaf Luncheon Meat. Good quality representative of manufacturer's [ 200 Ibs No Bid

first or top quality USDA inspected. Approx. 7 Ib loafs. Hormel Deli Style Turkey

Breast Luncheon Meat.
32 Hormel Deli Style Turkey Breast Luncheon Meat. Good quality representative of 200 |bs 3.29 15% 3.781b

manufactures first or top quality products. USDA inspected. Approx. 19 Ib per

case.




Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3831 OF Opening Date: 11/18/2011
DHHS
ALTERNATE BID: COST PLUS BID
12 MONTH VENDORS PRICE PER PERCENT PROCESSING COST| TOTAL COST TO
NAMP NUMBER DESCRIPTION USAGE PURCHASE
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33| 822 |Hillshire Bratwurst 12-18 7 0z. pkg. Per cs. A fresh sausage made of coarsely 500 Ibs No Bid
ground beef and pork, zestily seasoned. Lg links about 1 3/8 inches in diameter. 6-
77 links per pound. Must be thoroughly cooked. Seasonings shall include;
coriander, ginger, mustard, pepper, sage, salt, sugar or thyme.
34] 611 |Pastrami. USDA inspected. Smoked and Cooked Seasonings to include; Allspice, 70 Ibs 424 10% 4.66 Ib
Cinnamon, Cloves, Cumin Seed, Garlic, Red Pepper, Salt, Sugar. 10 Ibs.
35| 821 |Pepperoni. USDA meat 10 Ibs. package 70 Ibs Refer to Frozen State State ID# 4.071
Contract Contract 130270C

* VENDORS PRICE PER LB - Vendors invoice price, including freight, verified by actual invoice.

* PERCENT MARKUP - Vendors markup to the State.

* PROCESSING COST - Percent or charge for processing meat, eg. Cost to grind beef for ground beef.
* TOTAL COST TO STATE - Price State will be charged based on actual invoice price, including freight, plus markup on each delivery.
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