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Opening Date: 10/26/11

All Agencies
PRIMARY SECONDARY
AWARD AWARD
** 2012 or Current Production Year Anderson Chrysler Husker Auto Performance Sid Dillon Chev Sid Dillon Ford
2 | 1/2 TON CREW CAB 4 DOOR 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK Ford Center Group Dodge Buick Lincoln Mercury
— [Description Y [ M | UNIT PRICE| UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1/2 Ton Crew Cab 4 Dr 4x4 Pickup Truck $ 26,789.00| $ 24,570.00( $ 23,499.00| $ 24,101.00| $ 23,830.00| $ 26,873.00
Make: Ford Ram Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Ford
Model: F150 1500 Silverado Ram Silverado F150
GVWR;: 7350 6800 7000 6800 7000 7300
1 1 | Ea WIE, 507A, 1500-CK10543- 1500 CC 'SLT Super Crew, WIE,
Series, Code, Trim Level: XLT SLT LT 'DS6H98' 1500, CK10543, LT XLT
Engine: 5.0L V8 4.7L V8 L20-4.8L V8 4.7L V-8 FFV 4.8L V8-FFV 5.0L V8-FFV
14 City/19
EPA: highway 13/19 C13/H18 13-18 13 city - 18 Hwy 14 city - 19 Hwy
(#/days): 90-120 90-120 35/120 90-120 40-120 40-120
Truck $ 26,789.00| $ 24,570.00( $ 23,499.00| $ 24,101.00| $ 23,830.00| $ 26,873.00
Engine: 5.0L V8 4.7LV8 L20-4.8L V8 4.7LV-8 FFV 4.8L V8-FFV 5.0L V8-FFV
Make: Ford Ram Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Ford
Model: F150 1500 Silverado Ram Silverado F150
> |GVWR: 1 | EA 7350 6800 7000 6800 7000 7300
WIE, 507A, 1500-CK10543- 1500 CC 'SLT" Super Crew, WIE,
Series, Code, Trim Level: XLT SLT LT 'DS6H98' 1500, CK10543, LT XLT
10 city/14
EPA: highway 13/19 C13/H18 13-18 13 city - 18 Hwy 14 city - 19 Hwy
(#/days): 90-120 90-120 35/120 90-120 40-120 40-120
OPTION BID LIST
3 Engine (other gas). $ 750.00] $ 1,200.00 LC9$1295.00 | $ 1,114.00| $ 1,319.00| $ 1,116.00
Specify Engine Size: 3.5L 5.7L Hemi V8| 5.3L V8 Vortec 5.7L V-8 Hemi 5.3L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost
Engine (other diesel), mgludmg block N/A LOH $2495.00 N/A NA N/A
4 |heater, factory or dealer installed.
Specify Engine Size: 6.2 V8 Vortec
40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ lumbar
5 support (vinyl) (deduct). N/A N/A NA N/A NA NA
6 [Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering. N/A N/A NA N/A NA NA
7 |Bucket type seats - Cloth wivinyl trim. $ 300.00| $ 950.00 | $ 1,295.00| $ 786.00 | $ 995.00| $ 549.00
8 |Electronic compass/temp display. STD STD $559 Dealer STD $ 180.00 | $ 160.00
Heavy duty highest output alternator from
9 |standard equipment. N/A STD = g NA NA
Bidder state amps: 160 145 160 AMP STD
10 [No sliding rear-vision window (deduct). $ (122.00) STD in $ (109.00) STD $ (152.00)| $ (208.00)
11 [Second Power Outlet. STD STD Std STD STD STD
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** 2012 or Current Production Year Anderson Chrysler Husker Auto Performance Sid Dillon Chev Sid Dillon Ford
2 |1/2 TON CREW CAB 4 DOOR 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK Ford Center Group Dodge Buick Lincoln Mercury
— [Description Y | M | UNIT PRICE| UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Increased pickup box length of $  300.00 N/A NA N/A NA $ 552.00
12 |approximately 8 feet with corresponding
Bidder state wheelbase: 157" 157"
13 [Trailer towing package (deduct). $ (300.00)| $ (500.00)| $ (247.00) STD (268.00)| $ (284.00)
14 |Cargo light. $ 99.00 STD $ 99.00 STD 95.00| $ 95.00
Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as STD see NC see attached
15 No Additional Cost Paints. Y attached N/C for details see attached see attached see attached
For Department of Roads Use: Yellow
16 |color of: Dodge #PY5269, Ford #84S53, N/C N/A $ 299.00 N/A NC NC
Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code (9W3).
Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identi $395 see $499 See
17 as Extra Cost Paints. i attached NIA attached for N/A see attached see attached
18 |Additional remote fob from manufacturer. $ 145.00| $ 150.00 [ $ 129.00| 3incin bid $110 168.00 | $ 185.00
19 Non-standard gear ratio(s). N/A $ 60.00 NA $ 43.00 N/A $ 130.00
Indicate: 3.92 3.92 3.55
Two wheel drive model (to include all
20 season tires) (deduct). $ (2,125.00)| $ (4,000.00)| $ (1,099.00)| $ (2,520.00) (1,258.00)| $ (2,195.00)
On/Off road mud and snow all terrain tires $219 P265/70R-
and spare (can be steel rim). Tire size 17 4 ply
must meet the minimum wheel size bid on $ 300.001 $ 275.00 $327 LT245/70RA N/A 268.00| $ 390.00
21 |this specification. 17 load range C
State size and ply rating:
P265/70R17 | LT265/70R17 P265 70R17 LT245/75R17E
RE OWL
29 Dealer installed integrated brake controller STD per $ 200.00 $277 Dealer STD N/A N/A
system. spec/Factory
23 |Dealer or Factory installed rearview $ 495.00| $ 250.00 $699 Dealer No Bid 2,250.00 | $ 1,153.00
24 |Dealer or Factory installed tailgate step. $ 375.00| $ 370.00 $199 Dealer No Bid N/A $ 375.00
25 |Trailer sway control system if not STD STD Std w/Z82 STD N/A STD
26 Keyless remote entry locking system if not STD STD Std STD 190.00| $ 180.00
standard.
27 |Factory bedliner for vehicle box. $ 350.00| $ 500.00 | $ 495.00 Spray In $404 $385 Drop in $385 Drop in
Reverse sensing alarm system. Dealer $371.00 factory
28 |installation is acceptable if not available $ 250.00( $ 275.00 $699 Dealer No Bid 881.00 o
from the manufacturer. installed
29 Deduct for smaller tank size. N/A $ 60.00 NA N/A N/A N/A
Specify size 26 gallon
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2 |1/2 TON CREW CAB 4 DOOR 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK Ford Center Group Dodge Buick Lincoln Mercury
— [Description Y [ M | UNIT PRICE| UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
30 |TOWing package upgrade: Specify N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A
equipment, hitch class and maximum
31 |Front end attached towing hooks if STD Incl'd $ 89.00 Inc in Bid STD on 4x4 STD on 4x4
available from factory.
3 |EQUiPMent & engine service repair $ 39500 see attached | $ 299.00| NJA at this time 39500 $390.00 when
manual. available
33 Equipment & engine service repair manual N/A see attached $699 when N/A at this time NA $390.QO when
on CD ROM. available available
34 [Equipment & engine parts manual. $ 395.00| see attached | $ 399.00 N/A at this time NA NA
35 E?\U“'fmem & engine parts manual on CD N/A see attached | $ 299.00( N/A at this time NA NA
Additional costs for warranties from $ 2,595.001 $ 2,940.00 NC No Bid Call for options Call for options
manufacturer.
36 |State Years: Miles: 5/100,000 7 years
Premium | 100,000 | > 10%222 Pwr
Care miles 100
Additional costs of charges for vehicle
drop shipment outside the Lincoln area. $395/$100 to
37 |Drop shipment charges would be for $ 450.00| $ 400.00 400.00 400.00 | $ 400.00
. o o Omaha
vehicles bought by political entities and
other Divisions of Government.
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY
Factory or dealer disconnect of daylight
38 [running lights if factory equipped (Law $ 95.00| $ 50.00| $ 199.00( N/A at this time 290.00| $ 190.00
enforcement only)
39 |Disconnect of factory dome light or $ os00| dver g 129.00 190.00 | $ 190.00
courtesy lamps. poerated
20 Heaviest duty alternator available. N/A STD Std N/A N/A
Indicate Amps: 160 145
Alternating headlight flasher wig-wag
module with flasher override for optional
41 |override at night installed with activation
lead tagged as such and terminating in or
near the passenger compartment. $ 199.00 N/A $ 250.00 249.00| $ 249.00
100 WATT siren speaker installed behind
42 |front grill with leads tagged as such that
terminate in or near the passenger $ 359.00( $ 275.00| $ 360.00 299.00| $ 299.00
Pro-Gard X Push bumper with installation
#3 |on front of venicle. $ 1599.00( $ 1,550.00($ 660.00 N/A N/A
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— [Description Y [ M | UNIT PRICE| UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Roof mounted antenna. Located ten (10)
inches forward from the rear of cab by
44 lwwelve (12) inches left from roof center
line._ NMO mount with RG58 cable ran $ 139.00| $  125.00]$ 250.00 $ 195.00 | $ 195.00
Roof mounted blue tree antenna.
Centered on roof ten (10) inches forward
from the rear of cab. Cables ran into
center console area. Make:
45 [Antennaplus. Model: AP85/18GPS-QS22. $ 250.00( $ 660.00 $ 310.00| $ 350.00
Tri-Mode Cellular/PCS/GPS Black
Antenna. 824-896 MHz, 1885-1990 MHz.
1575 MHz. Connectors SMA on Cell/lPCS
& SMA on GPS. Foam Pad & Threaded $ 249.00
46 |No rear seat (deduct). N/A N/A NA N/A N/A
47 |No center console (deduct). N/A N/A NA N/A N/A
Payment Terms 0% 30 0% 30 days 0% 15 0% 30 0% 30
Delivery Days ARO 90-120 90-120 35-120 40-120 40-120
$920 dual battery
seperator system
$309 LED strobes $699 Setina
mounted on push PB400
bumper $899 (4) corner
$329 LED strobes strobes
Comments mounted by license | $329 LED strobes
plate mounted by
$699 Setina PB400 license plate

push bumper
$215 dome light
$899 (4) corner
strobes

$309 LED strobes
mounted on push
bumper
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