Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3802 OF Opening Date: 10/21/2011
Statewide
PRIMARY | SECONDARY
AWARD AWARD E85 ONLY
H+ 2012 or Current Prqductlon _Year Anderson Performance | Performance Sid Dillon Sid D_|Ilon Ford Tekamah
Compact Sport Utility Vehicle Gene Steffy . Lincoln .
Q Ford Dodge-Jeep | Dodge- Jeep Chev Buick Ford Lincoln
5 4 Passenger Mercury
Description QTY|UOM| Unit Price Unit price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Compact SUV 4 Passenger $ 20,780.00 [ $ 17,94400|$ 17,254.00| $ 17,406.00 | $ 21,193.00 [ $ 19,630.00 | $ 21,535.00
4x4 or AWD: 4X4 4X4 4X4 4X4 AWD 4X4 4X4
Make: Ford Jeep Jeep Jeep Chevrolet Ford Ford
) Compass . .
Model: Escape MKJE49 Patriot Compass Equinox Escape Escape
Sport Sport
1 |Series, Code, Trim Level: 1 | EA 101%9(;& Sport SuV SuvV AWDI’_ISLGZG’ U9C, XL XLT
' MKJE74 MKJE49
. 2.4 14 16V 2.414 16V
Engine: 2.5L 14 2.4L WT WT 2.4L 2.4L 2.5L 14
EPA: 20 city 21 city 21 city 20 city 20 city 20 city
' 27 highway 26 highway 26 highway 29 highway 26 highway 27 highway
z&‘/&g‘;ig time after receipt of order 90-120 90-120 90-120 90-120 40-120 40-120 45-120
E85 Compact SUV 4 Passenger $ 23,775.00 No Bid N/A N/A $ 21,193.00| $ 22,433.00 | $ 22,635.00
Engine: 3.0L V6 2.4L 3.0L 3.0L V6
4x4 or AWD: 4x4 AWD 4x4 4x4
Make: Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model: Escape Equinox Escape Escape
2| | 1 | EA U9D A,
Series, Code, Trim Level: ILG26, uoD, XLT XLT
200A, XLT LS
EPA: 13 city 20 city 18 city 18 city
] 17 highway 29 highway 23 highway 23 highway
Delivery time after receipt of order 90-120 40-120 20-120 45-120
(#/days).
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Statewide
H+ 2012 or Current Prqductlon _Year Anderson Performance | Performance Sid Dillon Sid D_|Ilon Ford Tekamah
Compact Sport Utility Vehicle Gene Steffy . Lincoln .
Q Ford Dodge-Jeep | Dodge- Jeep Chev Buick Ford Lincoln
5 4 Passenger Mercury
Description |QTY| UOM| Unit Price Unit price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
OPTION BID LIST
Engine (other). $ 2,995.00 N/A N/A N/A $ 2,999.00|$ 1,100.00
3 3.0L V6,
Specify Engine Size 3.0L V6 requires XLT 3.0L V6
trim level
4 |Heavy duty split vinyl front seat W/ lumbar support N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
5 [40-40 power bucket electric seats. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A STD Drivers
6 Factory Installed Console between front seats N/A STD STD N/A N/A N/A
(deduct).
" $110.00 $110.00
7 |Additional remote fob from manufacturer. $ 155.00 Inc. inbid @) | Inc. in bid (3) $ 127.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 125.00
Standard Paint- Attach list and identify as No STD
8 Additional Cost Paints. See Attached See Attached | See Attached | See Attached | See Attached STD
9 Extra CQSt Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra N/C N/A N/A See Attached | See Attached Attached
Cost Paints.
Running Boards: Side step, mounted between front
and rear wheels at bottom of rocker panel; both $ 395.00 N/A N/A $ 680.00 | $ 395.00 | $ 345.00
10{sides. Factory installation if available.
If dealer installed, specify brand and model: Ford Molded
11 Second Power Outlet. STD N/A N/A STD STD STD
Trailer towing package (deduct). N/A N/A N/A $ 397.00 N/A $ (395.00)
12 Class Il Hitch, Receiver
Please specify equipment included: 4 wire Hitch
connector
13 Stability tracuon_control system (if not available STD STD STD STD STD STD
as standard equipment).
14 Two wheel drive model (deduct). $ (1,157.00) $ (576.00)( $ (462.00)[ $ (1,010.00)] $ (1,057.00)| $ (1,800.00)
Specify FWD or RWD: FWD FWD FWD FWD FWD FWD
15 |Protective safety cage behind drivers seat. $ 595.00 N/A N/A $ 695.00 | $ 695.00 | $ 675.00
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which may be awarded to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model meeting
specification and an E85 Award which is awarded to the lowest responsible E85 bidder meeting

specification.
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Statewide
H+ 2012 or Current Prqductlon _Year Anderson Performance | Performance Sid Dillon Sid D_|Ilon Ford Tekamah
Compact Sport Utility Vehicle Gene Steffy . Lincoln .
Q Ford Dodge-Jeep | Dodge- Jeep | Chev Buick Ford Lincoln
5 4 Passenger Mercury
Description |QTY| UOM| Unit Price Unit price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Additional cost for warranties from $  2.195.00 No Bid No Bid Ca!l for CaI_I for
manufacturer. Options Options
16 5 years
State: Years: Miles: 100,000 miles
Premium Care
17 ]Ic?everse sensing system if available from N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
actory.
18 Key_Iess remote entry lock system if not standard STD STD STD $ 190.00 | $ 190.00 STD
equipment.
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop
shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment $395.00
19 . L $100.00 to $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 350.00
charges would be for vehicles bought by political omah
entities and other Divisions of the Government. maha
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY
oo |Factory or dealer disconnect of Daylight Running | 95.00 No Bid NoBid |$ 19500|$  190.00|$  100.00
Lights (law enforcement only).
21 |Courtesy signal or Internal light inoperable. $ 95.00 No Bid No Bid $ 145.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 100.00
Payment Terms: 030 030 0 0 030 030 030
Delivery Days ARO: 90-120 90-120 40-120 40-120
Comments: $185.00 $85.00
' Block Heater | Block Heater
Due to build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles may consist of a Primary Award
which is awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specification and a Secondary Award No Bid
0 Bi

Husker Auto Group




