Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3760 OF Opening Date: 09/19/11
Statewide
PRIMARY SECONDARY
AWARD AWARD E85 AWARD
3 | 2012 or Current Production Year 3/4 Ton Diesel Anderson Gene Steffy Husker Auto | Performance Sid Dillon Sid Dillion Ford Tekamah
_g Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup Truck Ford Chrysler Center Group Dodge Chev Buick | Lincoln Mercury | Ford Lincoln
— |Description QTY|UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
?F’,/iiJlJ ‘;” Diesel Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door $ 3352800|$ 36,794.00|$ 34,766.00| $ 36,510.00 | $ 34,993.00 33,685.00 |  34,506.00
Make: Ford Ram Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model: F250 DJ7H91 Silverado Ram Silverado F-250 F-250
GVWR: 10,000 Ib 8,800 10,000 8,800 10,000 10,000 10,000
Series, Code, Trim Level: Crew, 603A, SLT 2500- 2500, SLT, 2500HD, F-250, WZB, XLT
XLT CK20743-LT DJ7H92 CK20743, LT XLT
1 — 1 EA
Engine: LML 6.6L 6.7L 16
6.7L Diesel 6.7L Diesel ’ Cummins 6.6L 6.7L 6.7L
Duramax .
Turbo Diesel
EPA: N/A N/A NA @ this N/A N/A N/A
time
Delivery time after receipt of order
. 90-120 90-120 35-120 90-120 40-120 40-120 90-145
(#/days):
E85 3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door $28,177.00
Pickup $ 28,658.00 N/A AWD Model N/A $  27.993.00 28,616.00 29,406.00
Engine: 6.2L V8 196 6.0L 6.0L 6.2L 6.2L
Vortec
Make: Ford Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model: F250 Silverado Silverado F-250 F-250
2 |GVWR: 1 EA 10,000 Ib 9,500 9,500 10,000 10,000
Series, Code, Trim Level: Crew, 603A, 2500-CK 2500HD, F-250, WZB, XLT
XLT 20743 LT CK20743, LT XLT
EPA: N/A NA @ this N/A N/A N/A
time
Dellvery.t|me after receipt of order 90-120 35-120 40-120 40-120 90-145
(#/days):
OPTIONS BID LIST
Engine (other gas). $ (4,870.00) $ 8,114.00({ § (5,995.00)| $§ (9,151.00) N/A N/A $ (5,100.00)
3 |Specify Engine Size: . L96 6.0L 5.7L V-8
6.2L V8 5.7L V8 Hemi Vortec 360HP Hemi 6.2L
4 Engine (other gas). N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Specify Engine Size:
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3 | 2012 or Current Production Year 3/4 Ton Diesel Anderson Gene Steffy Husker Auto | Performance Sid Dillon Sid Dillion Ford Tekamah
_g Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup Truck Ford Chrysler Center Group Dodge Chev Buick | Lincoln Mercury | Ford Lincoln
— |Description [QTY|]UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Engine (other dle.sel), including block heater, N/A N/A $ 77.00 N/A N/A
factory or dealer installed.
If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer:
Model: Engine block
5
heater
Warranty:
Specify Engine Size: 5.7L.V-8
Hemi
Automatic to Manual Four-Speed Transmission $(935.00)
6 (deduct). N/A $ (935.00) N/A (6 SPD) N/A N/A N/A
7 40-?0-40 or 60-40 Bench Seat W/lumbar support N/A $ (765.00) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
w/vinyl (deduct).
Bucket type seats-Cloth w/vinyl trim. $995.00
8 e ° 925.001 1,095.00 NIA $ 995.00| requires carpet | $ 700.00
9 |Rear seat (deduct). N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
10 'SI'V\?//i(r)]:Iectric remote controlled outside mirrors, N/A STD STD STD N/A N/A N/A
11 Camper type, extended arm, min. 7"x10" (deduct). N/A N/A $3a4d0d.00 Not Bid N/A N/A N/A
12 |Right and left telescopic mirrors, minimum 6"x 8". $ 165.00 STD $ 340.00 N/A $ 244.00 | $ 195.00 STD
Second Power Outlet.
13 Std STD STD STD STD sTD| $ 200.00
14 |Cargo light. Std STD $ 99.00 STD $ 95.00 | $ 95.00 STD
Keyless remote entry locking system (if not
1 t TD TD TD TD
5 |standard). Std S S S $  195.00 3 19500 | S
16 |Deduct for no remote FOB. N/A N/A N/A STD N/A N/A N/A
17 Stanard Pamt-Attgch List and Identify as No see attached N/C N/C see See attached | See Attached | See Attached STD
Additional Cost Paints. attached
For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of:
18 [Dodge #PY5269, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/ GMC N/C $ 450.00| $ 199.00| See attached N/C N/C N/C
#WA-253A code (9W3).
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3 | 2012 or Current Production Year 3/4 Ton Diesel Anderson Gene Steffy Husker Auto | Performance Sid Dillon Sid Dillion Ford Tekamah
_g Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup Truck Ford Chrysler Center Group Dodge Chev Buick | Lincoln Mercury | Ford Lincoln
— |Description [QTY|]UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Extra Cost Paint-Attach List and Identify as Extra $397.00 SEO
19 |Cost Paints. N/A Attached see attached | See attached | See Attached [ See Attached N/A
for details
Two wheel drive model (to include all season tires)
20 (deduct) $ (2,125.00)| $ (4,514.00)| $ (1,099.00)( $ (5,148.00)| $ (1,533.00)( $ (1,695.00)[ $ (1,900.00)
Increased pickup box length of approximately 8
Bidder state wheelbase: 172" 149.5 167.7" 169" Bid 167.7 172 172"
Snow plow attachment of pickup manufacturer's $4.680.00 $4,680.00
(Western, Boss and Meyer brands with power 8': Bos.s 8' Boss Steel
angling, 8-foot bolt on blade, plow head and turn $4.415.00 Requires the Super Duty.
22 [lights, snow deflector, blade markers). ’ ’ $ 3,999.00| $ 4,499.00 No Bid q Requires the
Boss snow plow i
addition of snow
prep package
for $ 185.00 plow prep for
: $185.00 $ 4,780.00
23 |No sliding rear-vision window (deduct). $ (199.00) STD $ (109.00) STD $ (152.00)| $ (148.00)| $  (100.00)
Chassis with eight foot Utility Body for single )
wheel. See attachment. $ 6,395.00( $ 6,500.00( $ 6,499.00 No Bid $ 6,546.00| $ 6,230.00 | $ 43,426.00
24 |State make and model: Omaha Std. Knaphiede Omaha .
96V or 696J on Standard 96v Omaha Knapheide
; N/A : Standard 96v or |796J, 5965 or
Knapheide Omaha Std or Knapheide Knapheide 6964 696J
696J 96V 696J P
Color of Utility Body to match manufacturer color .
25 |charts N/C Inc'd $ 499.00 No Bid $ 700.00
] $ 395.00 | $ 395.00
26 |No lid on Utility Body (deduct). $ (599.00)| $ (715.00)| $ (550.00) No Bid $ (600.00)| $ (600.00)| $ (1,321.00)
Deduction for minimum 7,200 pound GVWR for
basic unit with LT225/75R16D tires, rear springs of )
27 minimum 4,500 pounds, 60-amp alternator, 500 N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A N/A N/A
CCA battery and minimum 4.3L gasoline engine.
Electronic compass/temperature display system
28 N/A Inc'd N/A STD N/A N/A STD

(deduct).
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— |Description [QTY|]UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Dealer or Factory installed rearview camera. ?:330 $2433.00 $1265.00
29 $ R R 590.00 $2499.00 $ 209100 ilr::tcatl(ljgj Factory installed
Factory $ 715.00
Dealer or Factory installed tailgate step. $199.00
30 $ 375.00 | $ 370.00 y No Bid $ 375.00| $ 350.00
Dealer installed N/A
Dealer or Factory installed dual alternators. $370.00 $370.00 $385.00
31 $ 380.00 N/A Factory N/A Diesel Only Diesel Only $ 380.00
Equipment & engine service repair manual. N/A at this
32 $ 395.00 $ 299.00 time $ 295.00 $ 420.00( $ 400.00
Equipment & engine parts manual on CD Rom. $699.00 )
33 N/A When available N/A $ 650.00
$ 390.00
34 |Equipment & engine parts manual. N/A $ 399.00 " N/A N/A $ 450.00
35 |Equipment & engine parts on CD Rom. N/A $ 299.00 " N/A N/A N/A
Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer. $  2.660.00 N/C No Bid cf;aﬁl:):]osr Call for options
36 |State YEARS MILES 5/100,000 5
Premium Care 100,000
See attached Pwr Train
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop
shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment $350.00
37 charges would be for vehicles bought by political ToOmaha- | $ 450.00( $ 400.00( $ 400.00( $ 400.00( $ 400.00( $ 400.00
entities and other Divisions of Government. $100.00
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY
Factory or dealer disconnect of daylight running .
38 lights if factory equipped (Law enforcement only). $ 95.00( $ 65.00| $ 199.00 No Bid $ 290.00( $ 195.00( $ 100.00
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— [Description [QTY|]UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
39 |Disconnect of factory dome light or courtesy lamps. | § 95.00( $ 65.00| $ 129.00 No Bid $ 240.00( $ 240.00| $ 100.00
Dome Light or Courtesy Lamp: To be centered not
more than approximately 4" to 8" from the top of
the wind-shield to light the driver's area. Controlled
40 |by rotating headlamp switch to maximum position | ¢ 195.00 STD $ 215.00 No Bid $ 285.00| $ 285.00( $  310.00
or by a separate switch. This may require adding
an additional light. Dealer installation is acceptable
if not available from the factory.
Auxiliary Battery (Largest available battery) with
Dual Battery Separater for accessory equipment. )
Installation also to include battery tray and bracket, | 820.00 N/A $ 820.00 No Bid $ 920.00| 3 920.00 STD
41 heavy duty fuse, 1 gauge or larger cable.
Indicate CCA: oA 550 ~ 730 cca No Bid 750 coa 750 cca 750 coa
Alternator with Highest Output available. $ 95.00| $ 250.00] $ 175.00 No Bid $ 570.00| $ 162.00 STD
42 (Indicate Amps: 200 AMP 180 160- Requires |\, gig Ja- 200 amp
6.0 L Vortec gas engine Diesel Only
Reverse sensing alarm system. Dealer installation $390.00 $871.00 $871.00
43 |is acceptable if not available from the $ 295.00( $ 271.00| Dealer Install No Bid dealer dealer installed
manufacturer. $960.00 installed $ 245.00
Alternating headlight flasher wig-wag module with
flasher override for optional override at night
44 (installed with activation lead tagged as such and $ 199.00 N/A $ 250.00 No Bid $ 199.00 | § 176.00
terminating in or near the passenger compartment. $ 199.00
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Buyer: Connie Heinrichs

PRIMARY
AWARD

3760 OF
Statewide

SECONDARY
AWARD

E85 AWARD

Opening Date:

09/19/11

Line #

2012 or Current Production Year 3/4 Ton Diesel
Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup Truck

Anderson
Ford

Gene Steffy
Chrysler Center

Husker Auto
Group

Performance
Dodge

Sid Dillon
Chev Buick

Sid Dillion Ford
Lincoln Mercury

Tekamah
Ford Lincoln

Description [QTY|]UOM

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Two (2) Clear/White LED Modules. Vertical
mounted at a 45 degree angle to front of vehicle on
push bumper. Black Bezel with clear lenses.
Shock and water resistant. Leads tagged as such
that terminate in center console area. LED's meet
SAE J845, Class 1 specifications. Minimum of

289.00

$ 209.00

$ 330.00

No Bid

$ 299.00

$ 299.00

$ 362.00

46

Two (2) Clear/White LED Mdules. Mounted on
either side of rear license plate on a license plate
bracket for Two (2) lightheads. Black Bezel with
clear lenses. Shock and water resistant. Leads
tagged as such that terminate in center console
area. LED's meet SAE J845, Class 1
specifications. Minimum of three (3) LED in each

299.00

$ 229.00

$ 330.00

No Bid

$ 319.00

$ 319.00

$ 362.00

47

100 WATT siren speaker installed behind front grill
with vehicle specific mounting bracket. Leads
tagged as such that terminate in or near the
passenger compartment.

359.00

$ 259.00

$ 360.00

No Bid

$ 329.00

$ 329.00

$ 495.00

48

Pro-Gard X Push bumper with installation on front
of vehicle.

N/A

N/A

N/A-
for GM Trucks

No Bid

N/A

N/A

N/A

49

Setina PB 400 Push Bumper with installation on
front of vehicle.

659.00

$ 559.00

$ 660.00

No Bid

$ 659.00

$ 659.00

$ 623.00

50

Roof mounted antenna. Located ten (10) inches
forward from the rear of cab by twelve (12) inches
left from roof center line. NMO mount with RG58
cable ran into rear seating area.

139.00

$ 114.00

$ 250.00

No Bid

$ 165.00

$ 165.00

$ 249.00

51

Roof mounted blue tree antenna. Centered on roof
ten (10) inches forward from the rear of cab.
Cables ran into center console area. Make:
Antennaplus. Model: AP85/18GPS-QS22. Tri-
Mode Cellular/PCS/GPS Black Antenna. 824-896
MHz, 1885-1990 MHz. 1575 MHz. Connectors
SMA on Cell/PCS & SMA on GPS. Foam Pad &
Threaded Bolt. Web site www.antennaplus.com

249.00

$ 210.00

$ 250.00

No Bid

$ 290.00

$ 290.00

$ 255.00
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Buyer: Connie Heinrichs

3760 OF Opening Date:  09/19/11
Statewide
PRIMARY SECONDARY
AWARD AWARD E85 AWARD
3 | 2012 or Current Production Year 3/4 Ton Diesel Anderson Gene Steffy Husker Auto | Performance Sid Dillon Sid Dillion Ford Tekamah
2 Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Pickup Truck Ford Chrysler Center Group Dodge Chev Buick | Lincoln Mercury | Ford Lincoln
— [Description [QTY|]UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Payment Terms 0 30 0 30 015 0 030 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 90-120 90-120 35-120 40-120 40-120
Comments

Due to build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles may consist of a Primary Award which
is awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specification and a Secondary Award which may
be awarded to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model meeting specification.
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