Buyer: Robert Thompson

3759 OF

Opening Date: 09/20/2011

All Agencies
AWARD - SEE EXPLANATION
Water Softener Salt Culligan of Kearne
3 -
. ; . Additional Charge
I - Estimated Unit Extended Product Bag Size | Bags per >~ | Bags per | Truckload
£
3 |Facility Name & Address Grade/Type Usage UoM Price Price Name/Brand | in pounds | Pallet e ST QU Truckload | Bag Price
Purchase*
Lincoln Regional Center
1 [2705 Folsom st Sg'rarsg"l"s't' 295 BG
Lincoln NE y
Nebraska Dept. of Roads
2 |5001 S 14th St Pellets 100 BG
Lincoln NE
Cornhusker State Industries Extra
3 |800 Pioneers Blvd 98 BG
. Coarse
Lincoln NE
DCS Multiple Locations:
State Penitentiary, Lincoln
Correctional Center, Lincoln Extra
4 Community Correctional Center, Lincoln Coarse 1375 BG
Diagnostic & Evaluation Center, Lincoln
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Community Correctional Center, Omaha
2320 Avenue J
5 Omaha NE Pellets 250 BG
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Omaha Correctional Center
2323 Avenue J
6 Omaha NE Pellets 445 BG
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Eastern Nebraska Veterans Home Solar Salt,
7 (12505 S 40th St Extra 50 BG
Bellevue NE Coarse
North Omaha Readiness Center Solar Salt,
8 111650 Rainwood Road Extra 50 BG
Omaha NE Coarse
Correctional Youth Facility
2610 N 20th St
9 Omaha NE Pellets 50 BG
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Camp Ashland
10 NE National Guard Training Site Sogtialt, 250 BG
220 County RD A
Coarse

Ashland NE
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Buyer: Robert Thompson

3759 OF

Opening Date: 09/20/2011

All Agencies
Water Softener Salt Culligan of Kearney
3+ "
e . Estimated Unit Extended Product Bag Size | Bags per ARGITOTEL Charge Bags per | Truckload
5 |Facility Name & Address Grade/Type Usage UOM Price Price Name/Brand | in pounds Pallet e SPnJiILg:;nt'ty Truckload | Bag Price
Tecumseh State Correctional Institution
11 iiﬁu':'n':;‘gsg Pellets 3530 | BG
Hours: 8:00 to 4:00 M-F
Tecumseh State Correctional Institution
CSI Laundry Shop
Extra
1212725 N Hwy 50 Coarse 3300 BG
Techumseh NE
Hours: 8:00 to 4:00 M-F
Beatrice State Development Center
133000 E Lincoln Blvd Coarse 690 BG
Beatrice NE
Beatrice AFRC Solar Salt,
1411400 W Scott Road Extra 100 BG
Beatrice NE Coarse
Kearney Youth Development Center Extra
152802 30th Avenue 665 BG | $4.75 | $ 3,158.75 | Culligan Salt 50 49 .50 per bag 931 $ 450
Coarse
Kearney NE
McCook AFRC Solar Salt,
16138709 US Highway 6 Extra 50 BG
McCook NE Coarse
Facilities Maintenance Shop 7 Extra
1711707 N Airport Road Ste B Coarse 100 BG
Norfolk NE
Columbus AFRC Solar Salt,
1812018 Armory Dr Extra 50 BG
Columbus NE Coarse
Totals $ 3,158.75

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

Comments

*Indicate if an additional amount will be charged if less than a pallet is ordered.
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Buyer: Robert Thompson

3759 OF

Opening Date: 09/20/2011

All Agencies
AWARD - SEE EXPLANATION
Water Softener Salt Culligan Water Conditioning
3 -
. . . Additional Charge
I - Estimated | Unit Extended Product Bag Size | Bags per | Bags per | Truckload
£
3 |Facility Name & Address Grade/Type Usage Price Price Name/Brand | in pounds | Pallet LelfSuts IV Truckload | Bag Price
Purchase*
Lincoln Regional Center
1 [2705 Folsom st Sg'rarsglas't' 295 No Bid
Lincoln NE y
Nebraska Dept. of Roads
2 |5001 S 14th St Pellets 100 No Bid
Lincoln NE
Cornhusker State Industries Extra
3 |800 Pioneers Blvd 98 No Bid
. Coarse
Lincoln NE
DCS Multiple Locations:
State Penitentiary, Lincoln
Correctional Center, Lincoln Extra .
4 Community Correctional Center, Lincoln Coarse 1375 No Bid
Diagnostic & Evaluation Center, Lincoln
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Community Correctional Center, Omaha
2320 Avenue J .
5 Omaha NE Pellets 250 No Bid
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Omaha Correctional Center
2323 Avenue J .
6 Omaha NE Pellets 445 No Bid
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Eastern Nebraska Veterans Home Solar Salt,
7 (12505 S 40th St Extra 50 No Bid
Bellevue NE Coarse
North Omaha Readiness Center Solar Salt,
8 111650 Rainwood Road Extra 50 No Bid
Omaha NE Coarse
Correctional Youth Facility
2610 N 20th St .
9 Omaha NE Pellets 50 No Bid
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
(l\:lgnl]\lpaﬁc?:ﬁrguard Training Site Solar Sat,
10 220 County RD A Extra 250 No Bid
Coarse

Ashland NE
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Buyer: Robert Thompson

3759 OF

Opening Date: 09/20/2011

All Agencies
Water Softener Salt Culligan Water Conditioning
H* -
I . Estimated | Unit Extended Product Bag Size | Bags per AULILTTII Charge Bags per | Truckload
5 |Facility Name & Address Grade/Type Usage Price Price Name/Brand | in pounds Pallet e SF,T?JLS:;MW Truckload | Bag Price
;’s;gr&sgt\;;?ée Correctional Institution N. American N/A
11 Pellets 3530 $5.25 | $ 18,532.50 SureSoft 50# 49 Truck load 882 $ 525
Techumseh NE Pellets Pricing only
Hours: 8:00 to 4:00 M-F
Tecumseh State Correctional Institution
CSI Laundry Shop Extra N. American N/A
12 {2725 N Hwy 50 3300 $7.30 | $ 24,090.00 . 80# 30 Truck load 540 $ 7.30
Coarse (Pro-Soft) -
Techumseh NE Pricing only
Hours: 8:00 to 4:00 M-F
Beatrice State Development Center N. American 1.00
133000 E Lincoln Blvd Coarse 690 $4.90 | $ 3,381.00 ) 50# 49 ) 294 $ 475
. (Pro-Soft) per bag
Beatrice NE
Beatrice AFRC Solar Salt, N. American 1.00
14 11400 W Scott Road Extra 100 $490 ( $ 490.00 (.Pro Soft) 50# 49 perI bag
Beatrice NE Coarse
Kearney Youth Development Center Extra
152802 30th Avenue 665 No Bid
Coarse
Kearney NE
McCook AFRC Solar Salt,
16138709 US Highway 6 Extra 50 No Bid
McCook NE Coarse
Facilities Maintenance Shop 7 Extra
1711707 N Airport Road Ste B Coarse 100 No Bid
Norfolk NE
Columbus AFRC Solar Salt,
1812018 Armory Dr Extra 50 No Bid
Columbus NE Coarse
Totals $ 46,493.50
Payment Terms 030
Delivery Days ARO 10
Comments

*Indicate if an additional amount will be charged if less than a pallet is ordere
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Buyer: Robert Thompson

3759 OF

Opening Date: 09/20/2011

All Agencies
AWARD - SEE EXPLANATION
Water Softener Salt Wichita Water Conditioning
H* -
. . . Additional Charge
2 o Estimated | Unit Extended Product Bag Size | Bags per - | Bags per | Truckload
£
3 |Facility Name & Address Grade/Type Usage Price Price Name/Brand | in pounds | Pallet e ST QU Truckload | Bag Price
Purchase*
Lincoln Regional Center .
Solar Salt, Culligan 0-20 $6.45
1 2705 Folsom St Crystals 295 $555( % 1,637.25 Solar Salt 50# 49 21-48 $5.95 N/A N/A
Lincoln NE
Nebraska Dept. of Roads .
Culligan 0-20 $6.95
2 5_001 S 14th St Pellets 100 $6.05| $ 605.00 Pellet 50# 49 21-48 $6.45 N/A N/A
Lincoln NE
Cornhusker State Industries .
3 800 Pioneers Bivd Extra 98 |$555|$ sa390| Culigan 50# 49 0-20 $6.45 N/A N/A
. Coarse Solar Salt 21-48 $5.95
Lincoln NE
DCS Multiple Locations:
State Penitentiary, Lincoln
Correctional Center, Lincoln Extra Culligan 0-20 $6.45 4.85/
4 Community Correctional Center, Lincoln Coarse 1375 $5.55($ 7,631.25 Solar Salt 50 49 21-48 $5.95 882 Pallet
Diagnostic & Evaluation Center, Lincoln
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Community Correctional Center, Omaha
2320 Avenue J Culligan 0-20 $6.95
5 Omaha NE Pellets 250 $6.05[$ 1,512.50 Pellet 50# 49 21-48 $6.45 N/A N/A
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Omaha Correctional Center
2323 Avenue J Culligan 0-20 $6.95
6 Omaha NE Pellets 445 $6.05| % 2,692.25 Pellet 50# 49 21-48 $6.45 N/A N/A
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Eastern Nebraska Veterans Home Solar Salt, .
7 |12505 S 40th St Extra 50 $555|¢ 27750 | Culligan 50# 49 0-20 $6.45 N/A N/A
Solar Salt 21-48 $5.95
Bellevue NE Coarse
North Omaha Readiness Center Solar Salt, .
8 |11650 Rainwood Road Extra 50 $555|¢ 27750 | Culigan 50# 49 0-20 $6.45 N/A N/A
Solar Salt 21-48 $5.95
Omaha NE Coarse
Correctional Youth Facility
2610 N 20th St Culligan 0-20 $6.95
9 Omaha NE Pellets 50 $6.05] $ 302.50 Pellet 50# 49 21-48 $6.45 N/A N/A
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
(IslaErTlllpaﬁc?:;?rguard Training Site Solar Salt, Culligan 0-20 $7.35
10 220 County RD A Extra 250 $595|$ 1,487.50 Solar Salt 50# 49 21-48 $6.85 N/A N/A
Coarse
Ashland NE
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Buyer: Robert Thompson

3759 OF

Opening Date: 09/20/2011

All Agencies
Water Softener Salt Wichita Water Conditioning
** -
2 o Estimated | Unit Extended Product Bag Size | Bags per Gt Charge Bags per | Truckload
5 |Facility Name & Address Grade/Type Usage Price Price Name/Brand | in pounds Pallet e SPnJiILg:;nt'ty Truckload | Bag Price
Tecumseh State Correctional Institution
11 iif}’u'\r'n':;‘ﬁ’ I\El’g Pellets 3530 | $5.35| $ 18,885.50 CI‘DJ!'I?E"’:” 504 49 N/A 882 ;5:""2‘:’
Hours: 8:00 to 4:00 M-F
Tecumseh State Correctional Institution
CSI Laundry Shop Extra Culligan $4.85
12 (2725 N Hwy 50 3300 $4.85| $ 16,005.00 | Extra Coarse 50# 49 N/A 882 '
Coarse pallet
Techumseh NE Salt
Hours: 8:00 to 4:00 M-F
Beatrice State Development Center
133000 E Lincoln Blvd Coarse 690
Beatrice NE
Beatrice AFRC Solar Salt,
1411400 W Scott Road Extra 100
Beatrice NE Coarse
Kearney Youth Development Center Extra
152802 30th Avenue 665
Coarse
Kearney NE
McCook AFRC Solar Salt,
16138709 US Highway 6 Extra 50
McCook NE Coarse
Facilities Maintenance Shop 7 Extra
1711707 N Airport Road Ste B Coarse 100
Norfolk NE
Columbus AFRC Solar Salt,
1812018 Armory Dr Extra 50
Columbus NE Coarse
Totals $ 51,857.65

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

Comments

*Indicate if an additional amount will be charged if less than a pallet is ordere
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Buyer: Robert Thompson

3759 OF

Opening Date: 09/20/2011

All Agencies
AWARD - SEE EXPLANATION
Water Softener Salt Glenwood Feed & Industrial Supply
£33 "
I - Estimated Unit Extended Product Bag Size | Bags per ARGIHETE Charge Bags per | Truckload
5 |Facilty Name & Address Grade/Type Usage Price Price Name/Brand | in pounds | Pallet e ST QU Truckload | Bag Price
Purchase*
Lincoln Regional Center Solar Salt American
1 2705 Folsom St ’ 295 $ 540($ 1,593.00 Shur Soft 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 515
. Crystals
Lincoln NE Solar
Nebraska Dept. of Roads D%?rz%l!d
2 |5001 S 14th St Pellets 100 $ 595( 9% 595.00 Crystal 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 5.70
Lincoln NE
Pellets
Cornhusker State Industries Extra American
3 |800 Pioneers Blvd 98 $ 540 % 529.20 | Shur Soft 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 515
. Coarse
Lincoln NE Solar
DCS Multiple Locations:
State Penitentiary, Lincoln .
Correctional Center, Lincoln Extra e
4 . ! . 1375 $ 540 9$ 7,425.00 Shur Soft 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 5.15
Community Correctional Center, Lincoln Coarse Solar
Diagnostic & Evaluation Center, Lincoln
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F
Community Correctional Center, Omaha Cargill
5 2320 Avenue J Pellets 250 |$ 595|s 148750 Diamond | g4y, 49 $1.00/bag 490 |$ 570
Omaha NE ‘ S Crystal ’ ’
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F Pellets
Omabha Correctional Center Cargill
6 éﬁihg"zg”e J Pellets 445 |$ 595|8$ 264775 D(':?y";‘t’;d 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 |$ 570
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F Pellets
Eastern Nebraska Veterans Home Solar Salt, American
7 112505 S 40th St Extra 50 $ 540 % 270.00 Shur Soft 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 515
Bellevue NE Coarse Solar
North Omaha Readiness Center Solar Salt, American
8 111650 Rainwood Road Extra 50 $ 540 % 270.00 Shur Soft 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 515
Omaha NE Coarse Solar
Correctional Youth Facility Cargill
9 é%gh':l ZNoéh St Pellets 50 |$ 625|% 31250 Déar"yns‘:;d 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 |$ 6.00
Hours: 8:00 to 3:00 M-F Pellets
Camp Ashland .
NE Npational Guard Training Site Solar Sat, American
10 Extra 250 $ 645 % 1,612.50 Shur Soft 501b 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 6.20
220 County RD A
Coarse Solar
Ashland NE
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Buyer: Robert Thompson

3759 OF

Opening Date: 09/20/2011

All Agencies
Water Softener Salt Glenwood Feed & Industrial Supply
H* "
I . Estimated Unit Extended Product Bag Size | Bags per Gt Charge Bags per | Truckload
5 |Facility Name & Address Grade/Type Usage Price Price Name/Brand | in pounds Pallet e SPnJiILg:;nt'ty Truckload | Bag Price
Tecumseh State Correctional Institution Cargill
11 iiﬁu'\r‘n';g]y,\lsg Pellets 3530 |$ 5.95|$ 21,003.50 D(':"’:;‘t’;d 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 |$ 570
Hours: 8:00 to 4:00 M-F Pellets
Tecumseh State Correctional Institution
CSI Laundry Shop Extra American
12 {2725 N Hwy 50 3300 $ 540| $ 17,820.00 Shur Soft 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 515
Coarse
Techumseh NE Solar
Hours: 8:00 to 4:00 M-F
Beatrice State Development Center American
1313000 E Lincoln Blvd Coarse 690 $ 540 % 3,726.00 Shur Soft 50 Ib 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 5.15
Beatrice NE Solar
Beatrice AFRC Solar Salt, American
1411400 W Scott Road Extra 100 $ 540($ 540.00 [ Shur Soft 50 1b 49 $1.00/bag 490 $ 5.15
Beatrice NE Coarse Solar
Kearney Youth Development Center Extra
152802 30th Avenue 665 No bid
Coarse
Kearney NE
McCook AFRC Solar Salt,
16138709 US Highway 6 Extra 50 No bid
McCook NE Coarse
Facilities Maintenance Shop 7 Extra
1711707 N Airport Road Ste B Coarse 100 No bid
Norfolk NE
Columbus AFRC Solar Salt,
1812018 Armory Dr Extra 50 No bid
Columbus NE Coarse
Totals $ 59,831.95
Payment Terms 00

Delivery Days ARO

Comments

*Indicate if an additional amount will be charged if less than a pallet is ordere
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