
Buyer: Mary Lanning 3736 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 08/30/2011 

Award

3M Company
Allan Baker 
Inc., d/b/a 

Korrect Optical

Classic Optical 
Laboratories, Inc.

Heartland 
Optical

Hi-Tech Optical 
Inc.

Express Lens 
Lab, Inc

Rite-Style 
Optical Co.

BSA Industries, 
Inc., dba Select 

Optical
Description QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1 Hudson Frames (All Styles) 50 EA See Price List See Price List  See Price List
N/A 

 See Price List See Price List See Price List See Price List See Price List

2 On Guard Frames (All Styles) 70 EA See Price List See Price List  See Price List
N/A See Price List See Price List See Price List See Price List See Price List

3 UVEX/Titmus Frames (All 
Styles) 120 EA See Price List See Price List  See Price List

N/A See Price List See Price List See Price List See Price List See Price List

4 3-M Frames (All styles 200 EA See Price List

 See Price List
Substituting 
Wolverine 
Frames 

 See Price List
N/A 

 See Price List
No Bid 

 See Price List
No Bid See Price List See Price List See Price List

5 Other ANSI Z-87.1-2010 MFG 200 EA  See Price List
N/A 

 See Price List
Offering Wiley 

X Frames 

 See Price List
N/A 

 See Price List
No Bid 

 See Price List
No Bid 

 See Price List
(Not found on 
bid response) 

See Price List See Price List

6 Single Vision Lens 45 EA 17.00$           18.00$           N/A 14.00$             20.30$             11.50$             18.00$             10.00$              

7 Bifcofal FT 28MM Lens 25 EA 27.00$           19.00$           N/A 23.00$             22.30$             22.75$             23.00$             12.00$              

8 Bifcofal FT 35MM Lens 10 EA 27.00$           22.00$           N/A 28.00$             28.30$             22.75$             35.00$             13.00$              

9 Trifocal FT 28MM Lens 10 EA 27.00$           24.00$           N/A 28.00$             26.30$             22.75$             28.00$             14.50$              

10 Trifocal FT 35MM Lens 5 EA 27.00$           32.00$           N/A 40.00$             28.30$             22.75$             60.00$             15.00$              

11 Progressive Lens 165 EA 45.00$           25.00$           N/A 50.00$             38.25$             56.25$             50.00$             45.00$              

12 Transitions 140 EA 55.00$           40.00$           N/A 50.00$             44.00$             43.00$             50.00$             45.00$              

Li
ne

 # Prescription Safety Eyewear
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13 Life RX 20 EA 55.00$           45.00$           N/A 50.00$             50.00$             43.00$             50.00$             45.00$              

14 Solid Tint 5 EA 5.00$             5.00$             N/A 4.00$               1.00$               3.50$               4.00$               1.00$                

15 Gradient Tint 5 EA 5.00$             5.00$             N/A 4.00$               1.00$               3.50$               4.50$               1.00$                

16 Polarized Tint 5 EA 55.00$           40.00$           N/A 50.00$             38.00$             43.00$             60.00$             45.00$              

17 Drivewear 5 EA 100.00$         85.00$           N/A 75.00$             38.00$             50.00$             80.00$             45.00$              

18 Clear 180 EA -$               N/C N/A
 Included in 

basic-
lens cost 

Included N/C N/C 2.00$                

19 UV Coating 260 EA -$               N/C N/A
 Included in 

basic-
lens cost 

3.00$               N/C 6.00$               NC

20 Scratch Resistant Coating 260 EA -$               N/C N/A
 Included in 

basic-
lens cost 

3.00$               N/C 8.00$               NC

21 Reflection Free Coating 50 EA 25.00$           $25.00 N/A 25.00$             25.00$             See Price List 25.00$             25.00$              

22 Thermal Hard Coat/Equivalent
when Required 15 EA 18.00$           N/C N/A 25.00$             20.00$             N/C 14.00$             NC

23 Polycardonate Lens 240 EA -$               N/C N/A
 Included in 

basic-
lens cost 

Included N/C N/C 12.00$              

24 Plastic Lens 10 EA -$               N/C N/A
 Included in 

basic-
lens cost 

Included N/C 23.00$             10.00$              
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25 Glass Lens 5 EA 10.00$           N/C N/A No Bid Included N/C 42.00$             12.00$              

26 Other ANSI Approved 
Materials 5 EA See Price List

$        20.00
Offering Trivex 

Only
N/A No Bid 40.00$              See 3M 

Price List N/C 30.00$              

27 Sunclips If Available 15 EA 6.50$             19.00$           N/A 30.00$             35.00$             20.00$             18.90$             15.00$              

28 Side Shields (Extra Pair)
Those Provided At No Charge 25 EA 2.50$             3.50$             N/A 2.50$               2.50$               2.00$               N/C NC

29 On Guard Frames 016 Frames
Dept. of Corrections Only 50 EA 45.00$           27.00$           18.62$                          19.00$             26.80$             20.95$             30.00$             16.96$              

30 On Guard 035 Frames
Dept of Corrections Only 50 EA 45.00$           27.00$           18.18$                          21.00$             27.96$             21.85$             30.00$             17.69$              

31 On Guard 042 Frames/58/18-
140 Dept. of Corrections Only 200 EA 40.00$           21.00$           11.66$                          13.00$             17.56$             13.75$             21.00$             11.11$              

32 On Guard 043S Frames
Dept. of Corrections Only 700 EA 20.00$           17.00$           8.32$                            9.00$               11.96$             9.00$               18.00$             7.56$                

33 On Guard 069P Frames
Dept. of Corrections Only 525 EA 35.00$           20.00$           11.08$                          8.00$               15.96$             12.50$             20.00$             10.10$              

34 On Guard 071P Frames
Dept. of Corrections Only 525 EA 35.00$           20.00$           11.08$                          8.00$               15.96$             12.50$             20.00$             10.10$              

35 On Guard 079S Frames
Dept. of Corrections Only 700 EA 20.00$           17.00$           8.32$                            9.00$               11.96$             8.75$               18.00$             7.96$                

36 On Guard 085 Frames
Dept. of Corrections Only 725 EA 35.00$           20.00$           11.08$                          8.00$               15.96$             13.75$             20.00$             10.10$              
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37 On Guard 093 Frames
Dept. of Corrections Only 2525 EA 35.00$           20.00$           11.08$                          8.00$               15.96$             13.75$             20.00$             10.10$              

38 Single Vision Lens
Dept. of Corrections Only 5145 EA 17.00$           13.00$           12.76$                          14.00$             20.30$             11.50$             18.00$             10.00$              

39 Bifocal FT Lens
Dept. of Corrections Only 2610 EA 27.00$           14.00$           20.06$                          22.00$             22.30$             22.75$             23.00$             14.00$              

40 Trifocal FT Lens
Dept. of Corrections Only 505 EA 27.00$           19.00$           27.66$                          28.00$             26.30$             22.75$             35.00$             14.75$              

41 Progressive Lens
Dept. of Corrections Only 90 EA 45.00$           20.00$           51.12$                          50.00$             38.25$             56.25$             60.00$             45.00$              

42 Polycardonate Lens
Dept. of Corrections Only 2270 EA -$               N/C 4.00$                            

 Included in 
basic-

lens cost 
Included N/C 50.00$             12.00$              

43 Plastic Lens
Dept. of Corrections Only 5990 EA -$               N/C N/C

 Included in 
basic- 

lens cost 
Included N/C 10.00$              

44 Transitions or Equivalent
Dept. of Corrections Only 240 EA 55.00$           40.00$           48.34$                          50.00$             38.25$             43.00$             38.00$             45.00$              

45 Solid Tint
Dept. of Corrections Only 365 EA 5.00$             5.00$             3.34$                            4.00$               3.00$               3.50$               4.00$               1.00$                

46 Gradient Tint
Dept. of Corrections Only 365 EA 5.00$             5.00$             3.34$                            4.00$               3.00$               3.50$               4.50$               1.00$                

47 Nose Pad (Replacement)
Dept. of Corrections Only 155 EA -$               N/C 1.84$                            0.25$               2.00$               N/C  $        1.50/pr NC

48 Frame Screws (Replacement)
Dept. of Corrections Only 105 EA -$               N/C 0.48$                            0.25$               21.40$             N/C -$                 NC

Page 4 of 5



Buyer: Mary Lanning 3736 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 08/30/2011 

3M Company
Allan Baker 
Inc., d/b/a 

Korrect Optical

Classic Optical 
Laboratories, Inc.

Heartland 
Optical

Hi-Tech Optical 
Inc.

Express Lens 
Lab, Inc

Rite-Style 
Optical Co.

BSA Industries, 
Inc., dba Select 

Optical
Description QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Prescription Safety Eyewear

0% Net 30 Net% 30 0% 30 0% 30 1.0% 30 0% 30 0% 30

<10 7 7 14 7 7 5 working 15

All frame 
prices include 
one pair of clip-

on or 
permanent 

side shields.
All lenses & 

lens add-on's 
priced per pair 
(two lenses)

N/C = No 
Charge

Line 42 - Our pricing in line 
items 38, 39, 40, and 41 are for 
plastic lenses.  The price 
offered for polycarbonate 
lenses in line item 42 is in 
addition to the base lens prices 
offered in line items 38-41.  
(For example, the price for a 
single vision polycarbonate 
lens it the combination of line 
items 38 and 42; the price for a 
bifocal polycarbonate lens is 
the combination of line items 
39 and 42; the price for a 
trifocal polycarbonate lens is 
the combination of line items 
40 and 42; and the price for a 
progressive polycarbonate lens 
is the combination on line items 
41 and 42.
Line 43 - Given that our pricing 
in line items 38, 39, 40 and 41 
are complete prices for all 
avialable styles of plastic 
lenses, we offer this line item at 
$0 and anticipate that any 
orders for  a plastic lens will be 
placed at the prices offered in 
lines 38-41.

Lines 12-17, 19-
22, and 40 - 

Add on to Base 
Lens Price

N/C = No 
Charge

Comments

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

Awarded as a 
total low
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