Buyer: Suzanne Siemer

3720 OF Polymer Modified Asphalt Pavement Repair Mastic

Opening Date: 07/19/2011

All Agencies
PARTIAL AWARD - see note

H* Polymer Modified Asphalt Pavement Repair Mastic Crafco, Inc. LOGAN CONTRACTORS MAXWELL PRODUCTS, INC.

® SUPPLY INC

'5 - Unit Ext Unit Ext Unit Ext
Description QTY |UOM Price Price Price Price Price Price
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

1 |D-1 Lincoln, Superior Street Meltable Block | 44,800 | LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 0.44 | $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

2 |D-1 Lincoln, Superior Street Cardboard Box | 44,800 [ LB 0.493 [ $ 22,086.40 $0.475 | $ 21,280.00 0.44 | $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

3 [D-1 Seward Meltable Block 44,800 [ LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 044 |$ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair, Mastic,

4 |D-1 Seward Cardboard Box 44,800 | LB 0.493 [ $ 22,086.40 $0.475] $ 21,280.00 0.441$ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

5 [D-1 Greenwood Meltable Block 44,800 ( LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 044 |$ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

6 [D-1 Greenwood Cardboard Box 44,800 | LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 $0.475| $ 21,280.00 0.44 | $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

7 |D-6 North Platte Meltable Block 44,800 | LB 0.493 [ $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 0.44]|$ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

8 [D-6 North Platte Cardboard Box 44,800 | LB 0.493 [ $ 22,086.40 $0.475] $ 21,280.00 0.441$ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

9 |D-6 Broken Bow Meltable Block 44,800 [ LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 044 |$ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

10|D-6 Broken Bow Cardboard Box 44,800 | LB 0.493 [ $ 22,086.40 $0.475] $ 21,280.00 0.441$ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

11{D-6 Mullen Meltable Block 89,600 | LB 0.493 [ $ 44,172.80 NO BID NO BID 0.44 | $ 39,424.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
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Buyer: Suzanne Siemer
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Opening Date: 07/19/2011

All Agencies

H* Polymer Modified Asphalt Pavement Repair Mastic Crafco, Inc. LOGAN CONTRACTORS MAXWELL PRODUCTS, INC.

® SUPPLY INC

5 i, Unit Ext Unit Ext Unit Ext
Description QTY |UOM Price Price Price Price Price Price
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

12|D-6 Mullen Cardboard Box 89,600 | LB 0.493 [ $ 44,172.80 $0.475] $ 42,560.00 0.44| $ 39,424.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

13|D-6 Gothenburg Meltable Block 44,800 | LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 0.44] $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

14|D-6 Gothenburg Cardboard Box 44,800 | LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 $0.475| $ 21,280.00 0.44] $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

15|D-7 Holdredge Meltable Block 44,800 | LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 0.44] $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

16|D-7 Holdredge Cardboard Box 44,800 | LB 0.493 [ $ 22,086.40 $0.475] $ 21,280.00 0.44| $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

17|D-7 McCook Meltable Block 44,800 | LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 0.44( $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

18|D-7 McCook Cardboard Box 44,800 | LB 0.493 [ $ 22,086.40 $0.475] $ 21,280.00 0.44| $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

19|D-7 Imperial Meltable Block 44,800 | LB 0.493 | $ 22,086.40 NO BID NO BID 0.44] $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

20(D-7 Imperial Cardboard Box 44,800 | LB 0.493 [ $ 22,086.40 $0.475] $ 21,280.00 0.44| $ 19,712.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

21)|D-8 Ainsworth Meltable Block 89,600 | LB 0.493 [ $ 44,172.80 NO BID NO BID 0.44| $ 39,424.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

22|D-8 Ainsworth Cardboard Box 89,600 | LB 0.493 [ $ 44,172.80 $0.475] $ 42,560.00 0.44| $ 39,424.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,

23|D-8 O'Neill Meltable Block 89,600 | LB 0.493 [ $ 44,172.80 NO BID NO BID 0.44| $ 39,424.00

Brand Bidding:

Deery Level & Go

NUVO

Page 2 of 3




Buyer: Suzanne Siemer 3720 OF Polymer Modified Asphalt Pavement Repair Mastic Opening Date: 07/19/2011

All Agencies
H* Polymer Modified Asphalt Pavement Repair Mastic Crafco, Inc. LOGAN CONTRACTORS MAXWELL PRODUCTS, INC.
© SUPPLY INC
5 - Unit Ext Unit Ext Unit Ext
Description QTY (UOM Price Price Price Price Price Price
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,
24|D-8 O'Neill Cardboard Box 89,600 | LB 0.493 | $ 44,172.80 $0.475[ $ 42,560.00 0.44] $ 39,424.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,
25|D-8 Valentine Meltable Block 89,600 | LB 0.493 | $ 44,172.80 NO BID NO BID 0.44] $ 39,424.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go NUVO
Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic,
26(D-8 Valentine Cardboard Box* 89,600 ( LB 0.493 | $ 44,172.80 $0.475| $ 42,560.00 | $ 0.44 | $ 39,424.00
Brand Bidding: Deery Level & Go CRAFCO MASTIC 1 ELASTO FLEX
Payment Terms: 0% 30 DAYS NET% 30 DAYS 0% 0 DAYS
Delivery Days ARO: 30 30 30
*Note: Correction has been made to the description on line 26, the correct description is
Comments: "Polymer Modified Pavement Repair Mastic"

Note: The Nebraska Department of Roads will not be awarding lines: 2, 4, 6, 8, 10, 12, 14, 16,
18, 20, 22, 24, and 26.
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