
Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3708 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/29/11
Li

ne
 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify Model 

#

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please 

Specify Brand

Please 
Specify Model 

#

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand
Please Specify 

Model #

1 .45 Caliber 
Duty

230 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber 230 grain Index 
#GSB45APB, Winchester 
Bonded Round RA45B, 
Winchester Round RA45TP, or 
EQUIVALENT.

40 M  No Bid  $         632.70  $     25,308.00  Speer Gold 
Dot 53966  No Bid 

2 .40 Caliber 
Duty

180 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index #GSB40SWB, 
Winchester RA40B, or 
EQUIVALENT

27 M  No Bid  $         577.60  $     15,595.20  Speer Gold 
Dot 53962  No Bid 

3 9 mm Duty

124 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index #GSB9MMD, 
Winchester RA9BA, or 
EQUIVALENT

10 M  No Bid  $         536.60  $       5,366.00  Speer Gold 
Dot 53618  No Bid 

4 9 mm Duty

147 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index   #GS9MMC or 
EQUIVALENT

5 M  No Bid  $         536.60  $       2,683.00  Speer Gold 
Dot 53619  No Bid 

5 .45 Caliber 
Practice

230 Grain Full Metal Jacket; 
Speer 53653 or EQUIVALENT 300 M $299.00  $  89,700.00  BVAC  BV45A-12N  $         432.30  $   129,690.00  Speer   53653  $         321.00  $    96,300.00 Grace Ammo LEN45230

6 .40 Caliber 
Practice

180 Grain Full Metal Jacket; 
Speer 53652 or EQUIVALENT 39 M $247.00  $    9,633.00  BVAC  BV40-2N  $         370.90  $     14,465.10  Speer 53652  $         280.00  $    10,920.00 Grace Ammo LEN40180

7 9 mm 
Practice

124 Grain Ball Ammunition; 
Winchester R9MM2, Speer 
53651 or EQUIVALENT

80 M $199.00  $  15,920.00  BVAC  BV9-4N  $         281.80  $     22,544.00  Speer 53651  $         240.00  $    19,200.00 Grace Ammo LEN9124

8 9 mm 
Practice

147 Grain Ball Ammunition; 
Winchester USA9MM1, Speer 
53620, or     EQUIVALENT

10 M  No Bid  $         281.80  $       2,818.00  Speer 53620  $         246.00  $      2,460.00 Grace Ammo LEN9147

Li
ne

 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify Model 

#

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please 

Specify Brand

Please 
Specify Model 

#

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand
Please Specify 

Model #

9 .223 Cal 
Practice

55 Grain Full Metal Jacket, New 
Casings; Hornady #9754 or 
EQUIVALENT

433 M $250.00  $108,250.00 BVAC BV223-1N  $         667.40  $   288,984.20 Federal AE223  $         335.00  $  145,055.00 Grace Ammo LEN22355

10 .223 Caliber 
Duty

55 Grain, Ballistic Tip, New 
Casings; Federal T223F, 
Hornady TAP Urban #83276 or 
EQUIVALENT

55 M $400.00  $  22,000.00 BVAC BV223-5N  $         952.10  $     52,365.50 Federal T223F  $         380.00  $    20,900.00 Grace Ammo LEN22355VMA
X

Ammunition

BVAC Inc. G T Distributors, Inc. Grace Ammo, LLC

Rifle Ammunition Rifle Ammunition Rifle Ammunition

Pistol Ammunition Pistol Ammunition Pistol Ammunition
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3708 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/29/11

BVAC Inc. G T Distributors, Inc. Grace Ammo, LLC

11 .223 Caliber 
Duty

55 Grain, Pointed Soft Point, 
New   Casings; Winchester 
RA223R-PSP, Federal T223A, 
or EQUIVALENT

30 M $335.00  $  10,050.00 BVAC BV223-2N  $         762.50  $     22,875.00 Federal T223A  $         340.00  $    10,200.00 Grace Ammo LEN22355PSP

Li
ne

 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify Model 

#

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please 

Specify Brand

Please 
Specify Model 

#

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand
Please Specify 

Model #

12 Bird Shot
7.5 OR 8 Shot, Winchester 
TRGT127,    48VIXJ31, Federal 
T223A or    EQUIVALENT

18 M $194.00  $    3,492.00 RIO TLT327  $         426.00  $       7,668.00 Federal T1158  No Bid 

13 00 BUCK 9 Pellet Duty, Federal IE127-00 
or EQUIVALENT 22 M $330.00  $    7,260.00 RIO RB129  $         596.50  $     13,123.00 Federal LE12700  No Bid 

14 00 BUCK
9 Pellet, Practice, Reduced Coil, 
3DREQ, Federal LE13200, or 
EQUIVALENT

40 M $330.00  $  13,200.00 RIO RBLR129  $         561.70  $     22,468.00 Federal LE13200  No Bid 

15 #1 BUCK 16 Pellet, Winchester XB121 or 
EQUIVALENT 2 M  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

16 Rifled Slug
1 oz Hollow Point, Winchester 
RA12R515, Federal F127RS or 
EQUIVALENT

4 M $480.00  $    1,920.00 RIO RSL12  $         890.90  $       3,563.60 Federal F127RS  No Bid 

Delivery Days ARO 30 180 10 to 45
Comments

Payment Terms Net 30 0    30

Shotgun Ammunition Shotgun Ammunition Shotgun Ammunition Shotgun Ammunition
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3708 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/29/11
Li

ne
 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

1 .45 Caliber 
Duty

230 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber 230 grain Index 
#GSB45APB, Winchester 
Bonded Round RA45B, 
Winchester Round RA45TP, or 
EQUIVALENT.

40 M

2 .40 Caliber 
Duty

180 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index #GSB40SWB, 
Winchester RA40B, or 
EQUIVALENT

27 M

3 9 mm Duty

124 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index #GSB9MMD, 
Winchester RA9BA, or 
EQUIVALENT

10 M

4 9 mm Duty

147 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index   #GS9MMC or 
EQUIVALENT

5 M

5 .45 Caliber 
Practice

230 Grain Full Metal Jacket; 
Speer 53653 or EQUIVALENT 300 M

6 .40 Caliber 
Practice

180 Grain Full Metal Jacket; 
Speer 53652 or EQUIVALENT 39 M

7 9 mm 
Practice

124 Grain Ball Ammunition; 
Winchester R9MM2, Speer 
53651 or EQUIVALENT

80 M

8 9 mm 
Practice

147 Grain Ball Ammunition; 
Winchester USA9MM1, Speer 
53620, or     EQUIVALENT

10 M

Li
ne

 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

9 .223 Cal 
Practice

55 Grain Full Metal Jacket, New 
Casings; Hornady #9754 or 
EQUIVALENT

433 M

10 .223 Caliber 
Duty

55 Grain, Ballistic Tip, New 
Casings; Federal T223F, 
Hornady TAP Urban #83276 or 
EQUIVALENT

55 M

Ammunition

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 No Bid  $           510.08  $    20,403.20 Winchester RA45TP  No Bid 

 No Bid  $           538.84  $    14,548.68 Winchester RA40B  No Bid 

 No Bid  $           504.00  $      5,040.00 Winchester RA9BA  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $          324.00  $   97,200.00 American 
Bullet 45TP230-1000  $           342.81  $  102,843.00 HSM 45A-12RN  No Bid 

 $          298.00  $   11,622.00 American 
Bullet 40TP180-1000  $           332.30  $    12,959.70 HSM 40-2RN  No Bid 

 $          269.00  $   21,520.00 American 
Bullet 9TP124-1000  $           281.47  $    22,517.60 HSM 9mm-4RN  No Bid 

 $          274.00  $     2,740.00 American 
Bullet 9TP147-1000  $           278.16  $      2,781.60 HSM 9mm-5RN  No Bid 

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 No Bid  $           422.46  $  182,925.18 HSM 223-1N  $         244.20  $105,738.60 Hornady 9754EL

 No Bid  $           486.61  $    26,763.55 HSM 223-15N  $         528.50  $  29,067.50 Hornady TAP 83276

Hornady Mfg. Co.The Hunting Shack, Inc.High Point Manufacturing

Pistol Ammunition

PARTIAL AWARD - See Explanation

Rifle Ammunition Rifle Ammunition

Pistol Ammunition Pistol Ammunition

Rifle Ammunition
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3708 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/29/11

11 .223 Caliber 
Duty

55 Grain, Pointed Soft Point, 
New   Casings; Winchester 
RA223R-PSP, Federal T223A, 
or EQUIVALENT

30 M

Li
ne

 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

12 Bird Shot
7.5 OR 8 Shot, Winchester 
TRGT127,    48VIXJ31, Federal 
T223A or    EQUIVALENT

18 M

13 00 BUCK 9 Pellet Duty, Federal IE127-00 
or EQUIVALENT 22 M

14 00 BUCK
9 Pellet, Practice, Reduced Coil, 
3DREQ, Federal LE13200, or 
EQUIVALENT

40 M

15 #1 BUCK 16 Pellet, Winchester XB121 or 
EQUIVALENT 2 M

16 Rifled Slug
1 oz Hollow Point, Winchester 
RA12R515, Federal F127RS or 
EQUIVALENT

4 M

Delivery Days ARO
Comments

Payment Terms

Shotgun Ammunition

Hornady Mfg. Co.The Hunting Shack, Inc.High Point Manufacturing

PARTIAL AWARD - See Explanation

 No Bid  $           610.00  $    18,300.00 Winchester RA223-PSP  No Bid 

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 No Bid  $           365.81  $      6,584.58 Winchester TRGT127  No Bid 

 No Bid  $           590.96  $    13,001.12 Winchester RA1200HD  No Bid 

 No Bid  $           591.02  $    23,640.80 Winchester RA1200  No Bid 

 No Bid  $           784.39  $      1,568.78 Winchester XB121  No Bid 

 No Bid  $           669.78  $      2,679.12 Winchester RA12RS15  No Bid 

Net 30
30 90

2 % 10

Shotgun Ammunition Shotgun Ammunition Shotgun Ammunition
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3708 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/29/11
Li

ne
 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

1 .45 Caliber 
Duty

230 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber 230 grain Index 
#GSB45APB, Winchester 
Bonded Round RA45B, 
Winchester Round RA45TP, or 
EQUIVALENT.

40 M

2 .40 Caliber 
Duty

180 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index #GSB40SWB, 
Winchester RA40B, or 
EQUIVALENT

27 M

3 9 mm Duty

124 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index #GSB9MMD, 
Winchester RA9BA, or 
EQUIVALENT

10 M

4 9 mm Duty

147 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index   #GS9MMC or 
EQUIVALENT

5 M

5 .45 Caliber 
Practice

230 Grain Full Metal Jacket; 
Speer 53653 or EQUIVALENT 300 M

6 .40 Caliber 
Practice

180 Grain Full Metal Jacket; 
Speer 53652 or EQUIVALENT 39 M

7 9 mm 
Practice

124 Grain Ball Ammunition; 
Winchester R9MM2, Speer 
53651 or EQUIVALENT

80 M

8 9 mm 
Practice

147 Grain Ball Ammunition; 
Winchester USA9MM1, Speer 
53620, or     EQUIVALENT

10 M

Li
ne

 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

9 .223 Cal 
Practice

55 Grain Full Metal Jacket, New 
Casings; Hornady #9754 or 
EQUIVALENT

433 M

10 .223 Caliber 
Duty

55 Grain, Ballistic Tip, New 
Casings; Federal T223F, 
Hornady TAP Urban #83276 or 
EQUIVALENT

55 M

Ammunition

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand
Please Specify 

Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please 

Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 No Bid  $           415.00  $   16,600.00 Remington GSB45APB  $         549.00  $    21,960.00 Winchester RA45B

 No Bid  $           344.00  $     9,288.00 Remington GSB40SWB  $         499.00  $    13,473.00 Winchester RA40B

 No Bid  $           327.00  $     3,270.00 Remington GSB9MMD  $         469.00  $      4,690.00 Winchester RA9BA

 No Bid  $           310.00  $     1,550.00 Remington GS9MMC  $         395.00  $      1,975.00 Winchester RA9T

 No Bid  $           330.00  $   99,000.00 Remington L45AP4  $         475.00  $  142,500.00 Winchester Q4170

 No Bid  $           245.00  $     9,555.00 Remington L40SW3  $         375.00  $    14,625.00 Winchester Q4238

 No Bid  $           225.00  $   18,000.00 Remington L9MM2  $         295.00  $    23,600.00 Winchester USA9MM

 No Bid  $           212.00  $     2,120.00 Remington L9MM9  $         295.00  $      2,950.00 Winchester USA9MM1

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand
Please Specify 

Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please 

Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 $         257.49  $  111,493.17 Hornady #9754EL  $           299.00  $ 129,467.00 Remington L223R3  $         429.00  $  185,757.00 Winchester USA223R1

 $         540.70  $    29,738.50 Hornady #83276  $           500.00  $   27,500.00 Remington PRA223RC  $         929.00  $    51,095.00 Winchester RA223BSTA

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. OMB Guns Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.

Rifle Ammunition

Pistol Ammunition Pistol Ammunition Pistol Ammunition

Rifle Ammunition Rifle Ammunition
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3708 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/29/11

11 .223 Caliber 
Duty

55 Grain, Pointed Soft Point, 
New   Casings; Winchester 
RA223R-PSP, Federal T223A, 
or EQUIVALENT

30 M

Li
ne

 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

12 Bird Shot
7.5 OR 8 Shot, Winchester 
TRGT127,    48VIXJ31, Federal 
T223A or    EQUIVALENT

18 M

13 00 BUCK 9 Pellet Duty, Federal IE127-00 
or EQUIVALENT 22 M

14 00 BUCK
9 Pellet, Practice, Reduced Coil, 
3DREQ, Federal LE13200, or 
EQUIVALENT

40 M

15 #1 BUCK 16 Pellet, Winchester XB121 or 
EQUIVALENT 2 M

16 Rifled Slug
1 oz Hollow Point, Winchester 
RA12R515, Federal F127RS or 
EQUIVALENT

4 M

Delivery Days ARO
Comments

Payment Terms

Shotgun Ammunition

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. OMB Guns Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.

 No Bid  $           425.00  $   12,750.00 Remington L223R1  $         565.00  $    16,950.00 Winchester RA223R

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please Specify 

Brand
Please Specify 

Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)
Extended Price Please 

Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 No Bid  $           280.00  $     5,040.00 Remington GC12L8  $         310.00  $      5,580.00 Winchester TRGT127

 No Bid  $           450.00  $     9,900.00 Remington SPL1200  $         519.00  $    11,418.00 Winchester RA1200

 No Bid  $           420.00  $   16,800.00 Remington RR12B00  $         519.00  $    20,760.00 Winchester RA1200

 No Bid  $           435.00  $        870.00 Remington 12B1  $         690.00  $      1,380.00 Winchester XB121

 No Bid  $           410.00  $     1,640.00 Remington SP12RS  $         589.00  $      2,356.00 Winchester RA12RS15

Net 30
As specified in bid specs.

Net 30
30-90

Shotgun Ammunition Shotgun Ammunition Shotgun Ammunition
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3708 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/29/11
Li

ne
 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

1 .45 Caliber 
Duty

230 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber 230 grain Index 
#GSB45APB, Winchester 
Bonded Round RA45B, 
Winchester Round RA45TP, or 
EQUIVALENT.

40 M

2 .40 Caliber 
Duty

180 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index #GSB40SWB, 
Winchester RA40B, or 
EQUIVALENT

27 M

3 9 mm Duty

124 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index #GSB9MMD, 
Winchester RA9BA, or 
EQUIVALENT

10 M

4 9 mm Duty

147 Grain Brass Jacketed 
Hollow Point; Remington Golden 
Saber Index   #GS9MMC or 
EQUIVALENT

5 M

5 .45 Caliber 
Practice

230 Grain Full Metal Jacket; 
Speer 53653 or EQUIVALENT 300 M

6 .40 Caliber 
Practice

180 Grain Full Metal Jacket; 
Speer 53652 or EQUIVALENT 39 M

7 9 mm 
Practice

124 Grain Ball Ammunition; 
Winchester R9MM2, Speer 
53651 or EQUIVALENT

80 M

8 9 mm 
Practice

147 Grain Ball Ammunition; 
Winchester USA9MM1, Speer 
53620, or     EQUIVALENT

10 M

Li
ne

 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

9 .223 Cal 
Practice

55 Grain Full Metal Jacket, New 
Casings; Hornady #9754 or 
EQUIVALENT

433 M

10 .223 Caliber 
Duty

55 Grain, Ballistic Tip, New 
Casings; Federal T223F, 
Hornady TAP Urban #83276 or 
EQUIVALENT

55 M

Ammunition

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 $       384.00  $  15,360.00 Winchester RA45B  $       359.00  $  14,360.00 Speer GDHP 53966

 $       321.00  $    8,667.00 Winchester RA40B  $       309.00  $    8,343.00 Speer GDHP 53962

 $       322.00  $    3,220.00 Winchester RA9BA  $       299.00  $    2,990.00 Speer GDHP 53618

 $       256.00  $    1,280.00 Winchester RA9T  $       299.00  $    1,495.00 Speer GDHP 53619

 $       245.00  $  73,500.00 Winchester Q4170  $       229.00  $  68,700.00 Speer 
Lawman 53653

 $       214.00  $    8,346.00 Winchester Q4238  $       185.40  $    7,230.60 
Speer 

Lawman or 
Federal AE

53652 or 
AE40R1

 $       199.00  $  15,920.00 Winchester RA9124N  $       164.80  $  13,184.00 Speer or 
Federal

53651 OR 
AE9AP

 $       198.00  $    1,980.00 Winchester USA9MM1  $       170.00  $    1,700.00 Speer or 
Federal

53620 or 
AE9FP

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 $       335.00  $145,055.00 Winchester Q3131  $       247.00  $106,951.00 Federal AE223

 $       641.00  $  35,255.00 Winchester RA223BSTA  $       504.00  $  27,720.00 Federal T223F

Ultramax AmmunitionSimmons Gun Specialties

Rifle Ammunition

PARTIAL AWARD - See Explanation

Rifle Ammunition

Pistol Ammunition Pistol Ammunition

PARTIAL AWARD - See Explanation
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3708 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/29/11

11 .223 Caliber 
Duty

55 Grain, Pointed Soft Point, 
New   Casings; Winchester 
RA223R-PSP, Federal T223A, 
or EQUIVALENT

30 M

Li
ne

 #

Product Description
Est. 

Annual 
Usage

UOM 
(M)

12 Bird Shot
7.5 OR 8 Shot, Winchester 
TRGT127,    48VIXJ31, Federal 
T223A or    EQUIVALENT

18 M

13 00 BUCK 9 Pellet Duty, Federal IE127-00 
or EQUIVALENT 22 M

14 00 BUCK
9 Pellet, Practice, Reduced Coil, 
3DREQ, Federal LE13200, or 
EQUIVALENT

40 M

15 #1 BUCK 16 Pellet, Winchester XB121 or 
EQUIVALENT 2 M

16 Rifled Slug
1 oz Hollow Point, Winchester 
RA12R515, Federal F127RS or 
EQUIVALENT

4 M

Delivery Days ARO
Comments

Payment Terms

Shotgun Ammunition

Ultramax AmmunitionSimmons Gun Specialties

PARTIAL AWARD - See Explanation PARTIAL AWARD - See Explanation

 $       474.00  $  14,220.00 Winchester RA223R  $       437.00  $  13,110.00 Federal T223A

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

Unit Price (M; 
PerThousand 

Rounds)

Extended 
Price

Please 
Specify Brand

Please 
Specify 
Model #

 $       240.00  $    4,320.00 Winchester TRGT127  $       196.00  $    3,528.00 Federal TGL12

 $       383.00  $    8,426.00 Winchester RA1200HD  $       396.00  $    8,712.00 Federal LE12700

 $       383.00  $  15,320.00 Winchester RA1200  $       372.00  $  14,880.00 Federal LE13200

 $       548.00  $    1,096.00 Winchester XB121  No Bid 

 $       438.00  $    1,752.00 Winchester X12R515  $       436.00  $    1,744.00 Federal LE127RS

30
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X % 30
180
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AWARD EXPLANATION: 
Award was made to the apparent lowest responsible bidder for lines 2, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 15, and 
16. 
 
Lines 1 and 3:   
Lines 1 and 3 were grouped/awarded together due to the need to ensure weapons are firing the 
same consistent make and model of ammunition that would give the same wound channeling 
and ballistic characteristics 
 
1st Apparent Lowest Bidder – Accuracy, DBA Ultramax Ammunition: 

 Ultramax Ammunition failed to meet the minimum specifications of N.6., under Duty, i.e. 
“ .45 Caliber of Minimum 875 feet per second muzzle velocity.” 

 
2nd Apparent Lowest Bidder – Simmons Gun Specialties – AWARD 
 
Lines 10 and 11: 
Lines 10 and 11 were grouped/awarded together to match brands due to the need to maintain 
consistency in ammunition on these lines both lines.   
 
1st Apparent Lowest Bidder – Grace Ammunition  

 Ammunition samples received from Grace Ammunition for line 10 failed to meet the 
minimum specifications of D.1. in the Specifications and Special Terms and Conditions 
of 3708 OF, as remanufactured brass was provided as samples for the requested .223 
Caliber Practice Ammunition bid for line 10.   
 

2nd Apparent Lowest Bidder – BVAC  
 The ammunition samples that were received from BVAC for line 10 were not deemed an 
equivalent as the samples that were provided in response to line 10 from BVAC had no 
cantilever around the bullets and were deemed to not be an equivalent to Federal T223F 
or Hornady TAP Urban 83276 as specified in 3708 OF. 

 
3rd Apparent Lowest Bidder – OMB Guns  

 Did not satisfactorily meet the specifications and quality standards required as the 
samples received for line 10 failed to meet the minimum specifications of D.1. in the 
Specifications and Special Terms and Conditions of 3708 

 remanufactured brass was sent as samples 
 
4TH Apparent Lowest Bidder –  Accuracy, DBA Ultramax Ammunition - AWARD 
 
Lines 12, 13, and 14: 
Lines 12, 13, 14 were grouped/awarded together due to the need to maintain consistency in 
ammunition on these lines. 
 
1st Apparent Lowest Bidder – BVAC 

 Ammunition samples received from BVAC for lines 13 and 14 did not meet the testing 
protocol performance requirements and therefore were not deemed as equivalents to 
lines 13 and 14. 
 

2nd Apparent Lowest Bidder – Accuracy, DBA Ultramax Ammunition - Award 
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