
Buyer: Ruth Gray  3681OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:  06/09/11

Description QTY UOM Unit
 Price

Ext
 Price
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Ext
 Price
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 Price

Unit
 Price
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Unit
 Price

Ext
 Price

1
Freedom Scientific Jaws Professional V12 

License, Product No. 340026-001 60 EA -$             NO BID no bid no bid 995.00$              59,700.00$        995.00$       59,700.00$    

2
Freedom Scientific Jaws Professional V12 
Service Maintenance Agreement SJNT 60 EA -$             NO BID no bid no bid 199.00$              11,940.00$        199.00$       11,940.00$    

3
Cambium Learning Tech Kurzweil 1000 
V12, License, Product No. 289617 60 EA -$             NO BID no bid no bid 750.00$              45,000.00$        750.00$       45,000.00$    

4
AI Squared Zoomtext Magni RDR V 9.1 
License Part No. ZT-MR-I 60 EA -$             NO BID 299.00$       17,940.00$  392.00$              23,520.00$        392.00$       23,520.00$    

5
AI Squared Zoomtext Enhance Support 
Plan ESP-MRI (Covers 2 Upgrades) 60 EA -$              NO BID 170.00$       10,200.00$  198.00$              11,880.00$        198.00$       11,880.00$    

6

Nuance - Dragon Naturally Speaking V. 11 
Professional Government License, A-
209A-G00-11.0 60 EA 599.99$       35,999.40$  493.15$         29,589.00$                         330.00$       19,800.00$  ** $          439.00 $26,340.00 498.00$       29,880.00$    

7
Cambium Learning Tech V12 Upgrade 
Assurance for K1000, 3 Year #295401 60 EA -$             NO BID no bid no bid 199.00$              11,940.00$        199.00$       11,940.00$    

35,999.40$  29,589.00$                         47,940.00$  190,320.00$      193,860.00$  

7-14

*In stock Items - 94% shipped same day as 
order
**Out of stock Items - 2-10 days ARO, 
subject to availability

2-10**
DELIVERY:

Accessibility dot Net, Inc.

-- %  -- DAYS
Totals
Payment Terms N/A%  NET 30 DAYS

Speaking Solutions, Inc. CDW Government, LLC Boundless AT

Delivery Days ARO
Comments

Software Licenses and Maintenance Agreements

Li
ne

 # Accessibility dot Net, Inc.

-- %  -- DAYS
7-14

*Alternate Bid: A-209A-S00-11.0

-- %  -- DAYS
5
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