
Buyer: Robert Thompson  3673 OF Bid Opening: 06/02/11

Soft Up to 5 
Hardness Medium Hard Very hard

1 Type II Detergent, Powder, 9# 930 Solid Power XL 6100185 4-9 lb  $       79.80 .025 oz .030 oz .035 oz
2 Type II Solid Detergent, 6.75# 4 Apex Power 17062 6-6.75 lb  $     131.25 .05 oz .07 oz .09 oz
3 Heavy Duty Liquid Detergent, Gallon 7 Super Trump 12740 4-1 gal  $       71.07 .21 oz .31 oz .4 oz
4 Low Temperature Dish Machine Wash, 5 Gallon 46 ET Ultra Klene 12716 5 gal  $       79.00 .15 oz .25 oz .35 oz
5 Low Temperature Dish Machine Rinse, 5 Gallon 56 Rinse Dry 10934 5 gal  $       94.23 .75 mL/rack 1 mL/rack 1.5 mL/rack
6 Type III Liquid, Rinse Additive, Gallon 5 Rinse Dry 10942 4-1 gal  $       77.60 .75 mL/rack 1 mL/rack 1.5 mL/rack
7 Type III Solid Rinse Dishmachine Additive, 2.5# 20 Apex Rinse Add 16811 2-2.5 lb  $     156.47 .1 gram .15 gram .2 gram
8 Type III Rinse Additive, Capsules, 2.5# 192 Solid Brilliance 25395 2-2.5 lb  $     152.64 .1 gram .15 gram .2 gram
9 Type III Liquid Rinse Additive, 5 Gallon 75 Rinse Dry 10934 5 gal  $       94.23 .75 mL/rack 1 mL/rack 1.5 mL/rack

10 Warewashing Solid Rinse, 2# 2 No Bid
11 Rinse Additive, 77 oz 23 Fast Drying Rinse 6100118 2-5 qt  $     167.95 .25 mL/rack .5 mL/rack 1 mL/rack
12 Type IVA Pot & Pan Detergent Recirculation Sink, 5 Gallon 2 Monsoon 13505 5 gal  $       98.65 .4 oz .6 oz .9 oz
13 Type IVA Pot & Pan Washing Detergent, Solid, 9# 29 Solid Metal Pro 10751 4-8 lb  $       64.10 .13 oz .25 oz .35 oz
14 Pot Washing Detergent, Gallon 68 Pantastic 12963 4-1 gal  $       55.30 .06 oz .1 oz .25 oz
15 Max Strength Manual Pot Wash Detergent, 5 Gallon 100 Pantastic 12971 5 gal  $       65.72 .06 oz .1 oz .25 oz
16 Type V Sanitizer Concentrate, 2.5 Gallon 124 Oasis 146 MultiQuat 17708 2.5 gal  $       45.31 .25 oz .25 oz .25 oz
17 Powdered Chlorine Sanitizer, 1 oz Packet 5 Triplet Plus 17380 50-1 oz  $       39.26 1 pkt/2.5 gal  - -  - -
18 Type VI Lime Solvent, Gallon 168 Limeaway 18700 4-1 gal  $       34.20 .5 oz .75 oz 1 oz
19 Type VII Manual Detergent, Capsules, 5# 69 Solitaire 17301 4-5 lb  $       92.18 .037 oz .05 oz .08 oz
20 Type VIII Automatic Hood Cleaner/Degreaser, Gallon 20 Greasestrip Plus 19505 4-1 gal  $       52.10 RTU - - - -
21 Type VIII Degreaser & Cleaner, Gallon 22 Greasecutter Plus 19513 4-1 gal  $       33.25 RTU - - - -
22 Type X All Purpose Cleaner/Degreaser, 2.5 Gallon 75 Oasis 133 APC 14175 2.5 gal  $       49.89 1 oz 1.5 oz 2 oz
23 Type X Neutral Cleaner/Disinfectant Aconcentrate, 2.5 Gallon 14 Nuetral Dis. CLNR 14542 2.5 gal  $       89.92 .5 oz
24 Type X Sanitizer Low Temperature, Gallon 13 EcoScan 13979 4-1 gal  $       23.28 .15 oz
25 Type X Silverware Pre-Soak, 8# 2 Solid Silver Power 12922 2-8 lb  $       60.30 .4 oz
26 Laundry Builder, 55 Gal 2 Turbo Charge II NP 74207 55 gal  $     468.62 3 oz/100 lbs 4 oz/100 lbs 5 oz/100 lbs
27 Laundry Detergent, 2.5 Gallon 3 Tri-Star Surlite 10258 2.5 gal  $       74.01 3 oz/100 lbs 4 oz/100 lbs 5 oz/100 lbs
28 Concentrated Laundry Detergent, 5 Gallon 58 Tri-Star SolarBrite 6100106 5 gal  $     130.41 5 oz/100 lbs 7 oz/100 lbs 9 oz/100 lbs
29 Concentrated Laundry Softener, 5 Gallon 35 Tri-Star AquaSoft NP 12081 5 gal  $     122.98 3 oz/100 lbs 3.5 oz/100 lbs 4 oz/100 lbs
30 Concentrated Laundry Bleach, 5 Gallon 60 Laundri Destainer 15982 5 gal  $       49.72 3 oz/100 lbs 3.5 oz/100 lbs 4 oz/100 lbs
31 Floor Cleaner & Degreaser, 2.5 Gallon 66 Oasis 115 XP 10625 2.5 gal  $       60.70 2 oz - - - -
32 All Purpose Cleaner, Concentrate, 2.5 Gallon 13 Oasis 100 Neutral 14522 2.5 gal  $       81.93 2 oz - - - -
33 Glass Cleaner, Concentrated, 2.5 Gallon 2 Oasis 255 SF 11227 2.5 gal  $       74.87 8 oz - - - -
34 Antibacterial Foam Hand Soap, 750 ml 8 DigiClean AB Foam 23672 6-750 mL  $       77.86 RTU - - - -
35 High Temp Grill Cleaner, 32 oz 7 GreaseExpress HTGC 10127 6-32 oz  $       52.35 RTU - - - -
36 Griddle Polishing Pads, 4" x 5.25" 4 No Bid
37 Sanitizing Test Strips, Chlorine, 100/Vial 250 Chlor Test Strips 20311-01-11 100 ct  $         5.32 - - - - - -

Indicate any Minimum Shipping Weight, Assorted or Singular Applicable to FOB Price includes shipping with 2 Case Minimum Order of any product combination
Payment Terms:
Delivery Days ARO:

***Item #11 specifies Poly Dry 2-77oz/case, but this has been replaced by Fast Drying Rinse Addative in 2-5qt/case.  
***Item #16 Specifies and Idophor Sanitizer.  Most surface and 3-comp sanitizing is now accomplished through the use of a 
***Item #35 is a no bid as we are not the current supplier of this item to the State and do not manufacturer it.

***Item #10 is a no bid as Ecolab doesn't have a 2 lb solid rinse product.

3-5

***Item #1 Solid Power XL is the replacement product for Solid Power and Solid Power Plus.  See included cat sheet for 
Comments: ***Highlighted items are exceptions to specified products on the bid solication.

Description Estimated 
Usage Brand & Product Name  Product 

Number 
 Price Per 

Unit 

Recommended Product Usage/Gallon of Water
Container/ 

Package Size

Ecolab, Inc.

Type

Warewashing and Laundry Chemicals
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Buyer: Robert Thompson  3673 OF Bid Opening: 06/02/11

1 Type II Detergent, Powder, 9# 930
2 Type II Solid Detergent, 6.75# 4
3 Heavy Duty Liquid Detergent, Gallon 7
4 Low Temperature Dish Machine Wash, 5 Gallon 46
5 Low Temperature Dish Machine Rinse, 5 Gallon 56
6 Type III Liquid, Rinse Additive, Gallon 5
7 Type III Solid Rinse Dishmachine Additive, 2.5# 20
8 Type III Rinse Additive, Capsules, 2.5# 192
9 Type III Liquid Rinse Additive, 5 Gallon 75

10 Warewashing Solid Rinse, 2# 2
11 Rinse Additive, 77 oz 23
12 Type IVA Pot & Pan Detergent Recirculation Sink, 5 Gallon 2
13 Type IVA Pot & Pan Washing Detergent, Solid, 9# 29
14 Pot Washing Detergent, Gallon 68
15 Max Strength Manual Pot Wash Detergent, 5 Gallon 100
16 Type V Sanitizer Concentrate, 2.5 Gallon 124
17 Powdered Chlorine Sanitizer, 1 oz Packet 5
18 Type VI Lime Solvent, Gallon 168
19 Type VII Manual Detergent, Capsules, 5# 69
20 Type VIII Automatic Hood Cleaner/Degreaser, Gallon 20
21 Type VIII Degreaser & Cleaner, Gallon 22
22 Type X All Purpose Cleaner/Degreaser, 2.5 Gallon 75
23 Type X Neutral Cleaner/Disinfectant Aconcentrate, 2.5 Gallon 14
24 Type X Sanitizer Low Temperature, Gallon 13
25 Type X Silverware Pre-Soak, 8# 2
26 Laundry Builder, 55 Gal 2
27 Laundry Detergent, 2.5 Gallon 3
28 Concentrated Laundry Detergent, 5 Gallon 58
29 Concentrated Laundry Softener, 5 Gallon 35
30 Concentrated Laundry Bleach, 5 Gallon 60
31 Floor Cleaner & Degreaser, 2.5 Gallon 66
32 All Purpose Cleaner, Concentrate, 2.5 Gallon 13
33 Glass Cleaner, Concentrated, 2.5 Gallon 2
34 Antibacterial Foam Hand Soap, 750 ml 8
35 High Temp Grill Cleaner, 32 oz 7
36 Griddle Polishing Pads, 4" x 5.25" 4
37 Sanitizing Test Strips, Chlorine, 100/Vial 250

Indicate any Minimum Shipping Weight, Assorted or Singular Applicable to FOB 
Payment Terms:
Delivery Days ARO:
Comments:

Description Estimated 
UsageType

Warewashing and Laundry Chemicals

Soft Up to 5 
Hardness

Medium 
Hard Very Hard

Sunburst Chemicals - Concert SB-6148S4  4 X 6#  $      54.96 2.90 g 3.87 g 4.83 g
Sunburst Chemicals - Applause SB-61354  4 X 8#  $      78.50 2.96 g 5.92 g 8.87 g

Sunburst Chemicals - Result 100 SB-620201  4 X 1 gal  $      64.47 4.63 mL 9.26 mL 13.88 mL
Sunburst Chemicals - Result 100 SB-620205  5 gal  $      80.58 4.63 mL 9.26 mL 13.88 mL

Sunburst Chemicals - XP Sunshine SB-683505  5 gal  $      96.12 1.67 mL 2.5 mL 3.33 mL
Sunburst Chemicals - XP Sunshine SB-683501  4 X 1 gal  $      57.68 1.67 mL 2.5 mL 3.33 mL

Sunburst Chemicals - Clarity SB-6827S1  1 X 5#  $    111.73 .29 g .43 g .57 g
Sunburst Chemicals - Clarity SB-6827S1  1 X 5#  $    111.73 .29 g .43 g .57 g

Sunburst Chemicals - XP Sunshine SB-683505  5 gal  $      96.12 1.67 mL 2.5 mL 3.33 mL
Sunburst Chemicals - Clarity SB-6827S1  1 X 5#  $    111.73 .29 g .43 g .57 g

Sunburst Chemicals - XP Sunshine SB-683501  4 X 1 gal  $      57.68 1.67 mL 2.5 mL 3.33 mL
Sunburst Chemicals - Lo Foam SB-63804  4 X 1 gal  $      90.41 
Sunburst Chemicals - Encore SB-6160S4  4 X 8#  $      85.30 2.92 g 3.90 g 4.87 g

Eagle - Lotion Dish Soap EN-9212  4 X 1 gal  $      56.41 1 oz 2 oz 3 oz
Sunburst Chemicals - Preem SB-60015  5 gal  $      72.50 .1 oz .22 oz .33 oz

Sunburst Chemicals - Quicksan 10 SB-5875X2  2 X 1 gal  $      46.21 .25 oz .5 oz 1 oz
Steramine - Quat Packets ST-767  100 x .75 oz  $      27.80 

Sunburst Chemicals - Lime Be Gone SB-663001  4 X 1 gal  $      31.67 
Sunburst Chemicals - Delight SB-6045S1  1 X 4#  $      22.34 

Sunburst Chemicals - Hoodwash SB-642801  4 X 1 gal  $      40.93 2 oz 5 oz 8 oz
Sunburst Chemicals - Cut SB-610501  4 X 1 gal  $      33.92 1 oz 3 oz 5 oz

Sunburst Chemicals - Brute SB-10004  4 X 1 gal  $      50.89 
Betco - PH7q Ultra BT-Z32547  4 X 2 L  $      62.19 

Sunburst Chemicals - Sunsan 2 SB-55004  4 X 1 gal  $      23.75 
Sunburst Chemicals - Beacon SB-6015S1  1 X 4.75#  $      30.76 

Sunburst Chemicals - Conquest SB-700355  55 gal  $    455.23 2.25 oz 5 oz 8 oz
Sunburst Chemicals - Reliance SB-784205  5 gal  $      75.50 2.25 oz 7.25 oz 5 oz

Sunburst Chemicals - Golden Brite SB-783605  5 gal  $      97.94 4 oz 6 oz 8 oz
Sunburst Chemicals - Complete SB-78705  5 gal  $    125.44 2 oz 2.5 oz 3 oz

Eagle - Eagle Brite 12% EN-Z9905  5 gal  $      50.72 2 oz 5 oz 8 oz
Sunburst Chemicals - HD Kitch Degreaser SB-61104  4 X 1 gal  $      61.92 

Betco - GE Daily Floor Cleaner BT-53647  4 X 2 L  $      71.59 
Betco - Deep Blue BT-18147  4 X 2 L  $    101.03 

Betco - Clario "UltraBlue" Antibacterial BT-75929  6 X 1000 mL  $      79.42 
Sunburst Chemicals - Attack SB-610032  4 X 32 oz  $      27.38 

Stainless Steal Scouring Pads LA-PAD35  75/cs  $      59.84 
Franklin Machine Products - Test Strips FS-142-1362  100/Vial  $        4.18 Per Vial

Per Case

.01 oz / gal

.01 oz / gal

1 oz / gal to Full Strength
.03 oz / gal

none %  none DAYS
5

 Price Per 
Unit 

Recommended Product Usage/Gallon 
of Water

.33 oz / gal

1 Packet / 3 gal
1 oz / gal to Full Strength

.04 oz

Egan Supply Company

Brand & Product Name  Product 
Number 

Container/ 
Package Size

1 oz / gal  
.03 oz / gal

.12 oz / gal
1330 Hand Washings

Full Strength
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Buyer: Robert Thompson  3673 OF Bid Opening: 06/02/11

1 Type II Detergent, Powder, 9# 930
2 Type II Solid Detergent, 6.75# 4
3 Heavy Duty Liquid Detergent, Gallon 7
4 Low Temperature Dish Machine Wash, 5 Gallon 46
5 Low Temperature Dish Machine Rinse, 5 Gallon 56
6 Type III Liquid, Rinse Additive, Gallon 5
7 Type III Solid Rinse Dishmachine Additive, 2.5# 20
8 Type III Rinse Additive, Capsules, 2.5# 192
9 Type III Liquid Rinse Additive, 5 Gallon 75

10 Warewashing Solid Rinse, 2# 2
11 Rinse Additive, 77 oz 23
12 Type IVA Pot & Pan Detergent Recirculation Sink, 5 Gallon 2
13 Type IVA Pot & Pan Washing Detergent, Solid, 9# 29
14 Pot Washing Detergent, Gallon 68
15 Max Strength Manual Pot Wash Detergent, 5 Gallon 100
16 Type V Sanitizer Concentrate, 2.5 Gallon 124
17 Powdered Chlorine Sanitizer, 1 oz Packet 5
18 Type VI Lime Solvent, Gallon 168
19 Type VII Manual Detergent, Capsules, 5# 69
20 Type VIII Automatic Hood Cleaner/Degreaser, Gallon 20
21 Type VIII Degreaser & Cleaner, Gallon 22
22 Type X All Purpose Cleaner/Degreaser, 2.5 Gallon 75
23 Type X Neutral Cleaner/Disinfectant Aconcentrate, 2.5 Gallon 14
24 Type X Sanitizer Low Temperature, Gallon 13
25 Type X Silverware Pre-Soak, 8# 2
26 Laundry Builder, 55 Gal 2
27 Laundry Detergent, 2.5 Gallon 3
28 Concentrated Laundry Detergent, 5 Gallon 58
29 Concentrated Laundry Softener, 5 Gallon 35
30 Concentrated Laundry Bleach, 5 Gallon 60
31 Floor Cleaner & Degreaser, 2.5 Gallon 66
32 All Purpose Cleaner, Concentrate, 2.5 Gallon 13
33 Glass Cleaner, Concentrated, 2.5 Gallon 2
34 Antibacterial Foam Hand Soap, 750 ml 8
35 High Temp Grill Cleaner, 32 oz 7
36 Griddle Polishing Pads, 4" x 5.25" 4
37 Sanitizing Test Strips, Chlorine, 100/Vial 250

Indicate any Minimum Shipping Weight, Assorted or Singular Applicable to FOB 
Payment Terms:
Delivery Days ARO:
Comments:

Description Estimated 
UsageType

Warewashing and Laundry Chemicals

Soft Up to 5 
Hardness Medium Hard Very Hard

Solid Power XL 6100185 4-9 lb  $        79.80 .025 oz .030 oz .035 oz
Apex Power 17062 6-6.75 lb  $      131.05 .05 oz .07 oz .09 oz
Super Trump 12740 4-1 gal  $        71.00 .21 oz .31 oz .4 oz

ET Ultra Klene 12716 5 gal  $        79.00 .15 oz .25 oz .35 oz
Rinse Dry 10934 5 gal  $        94.23 .75 mL/rack 1 mL/rack 1.5 mL/rack
Rinse Dry 10942 4-1 gal  $        77.60 .75 mL/rack 1 mL/rack 1.5 mL/rack

Apex Rinse ADD 16811 2-2.5 lb  $      156.47 .1 gram .15 gram .2 gram
Solid Brilliance 25395 2-2.5 lb  $      152.64 .1 gram .15 gram .2 gram

Rise Dry 10934 5 gal  $        94.23 .75 mL/rack 1 mL/rack 1.5 mL/rack
No Bid

Fast Drying Rinse 6100118 2-5 qt  $      167.95 .25 mL/rack .5 mL/rack 1 mL/rack
Monsoon 13505 5 gal  $        98.00 .4 oz .6 oz .9 oz

Solid Metal Pro 10751 4-8 lb  $        64.10 .13 oz .25 oz .35 oz
Pantastic 12963 4-1 gal  $        55.30 .06 oz .1 oz .25 oz
Pantastic 12971 5 gal  $        65.72 .06 oz .1 oz .25 oz

Oasis 146 MultiQuat 17708 2.5 gal  $        45.31 .25 oz .25 oz .25 oz
Triplet Plus 17380 50-1 oz  $        39.26 1 pkt-2.5 gal same same
Lime-A-Way 18700 4-1 gal  $        34.20 .5 oz .75 oz 1 oz

Solitaire 17301 4-5 lb  $        92.18 .037 oz .05 oz .08 oz
Grease Strip Plus 19505 4-1 gal  $        52.10 

Grease Cutter Plus 19513 4-1 gal  $        33.25 
Oasis 133 APC 14175 2.5 gal  $        49.89 1 oz 1.5 oz 2 oz

Nuetral Disinf. Cleaner 14542 2.5 gal  $        89.92 .5 oz .5 oz .5 oz
EcoSan 13979 4-1 gal  $        23.28 .15 oz .15 oz .15 oz

Solid Silver Power 12922 2-8 lb  $        60.30 .4 oz .4 oz .4 oz
Turbo Charge II NP 74207 55 gal  $      468.62 3 oz/100 lbs 4 oz/100 lbs 5 oz/100 lbs

Tri-Star SurLite 10258 2.5 gal  $        73.90 3 oz/100 lbs 4 oz/100 lbs 5 oz/100 lbs
Tri-Star Solarbrite 6100106 5 gal  $      130.38 5 oz/100 lbs 7 oz/100 lbs 9 oz/100 lbs

Tri-Star Aqua Soft NP 12081 5 gal  $      122.95 3 oz/100 lbs 3.5 oz/100 lbs 4 oz/100 lbs
LAUNDRI Destainer 15982 5 gal  $        49.72 3 oz/100 lbs 3.5 oz/100 lbs 4 oz/100 lbs

Oasis 115 XP 10625 2.5 gal  $        60.60 2 oz 2 oz 2 oz
Oasis 100 Nuetral 14522 2.5 gal  $        81.93 2 oz 2 oz 2 oz

Oasis 255 SF 11227 2.5 gal  $        74.87 8 oz 8 oz 8 oz
DigiClean AB Foam 23672 6-750 mL  $        77.80 

GreaseExpress HTGC 10127 6-32 oz  $        52.35 
3M Griddle Polish Pad # 46 cs (60)  $        46.14 - - - - - -

Chlor Test Strips 20311-01-11 100 ct  $          5.32 - - - - - -

AWARD

Please note pricing includes Freight with a minimum of 2 cases.  These items can be included & shipped with Contract # 2973 OF 

***Item #10 is a no bid as Ecolab doesn't have a 2 lb solid rinse product
***Item #11 specifies Poly Dry 2-77oz/case, but this has been replaced by Fast Drying Rinse Addative in 2-5 qt/case.  Improved 

***Please note pricing includes Freight with a minimum of 2 cases.  These items can be included & shipped with Contract # 2973 OF 

0 % Net 21 Days
5

***Item #1 Solid Power XL is the replacement product for Solid Power and Solid Power Plus.  See included cat sheet for 50% higher 
***Highlighted Items are exceptions to specified products on the bid solicitation.

***Item #16 Specifies and Idophor Sanitizer.  Most surface and 3-comp sanitizing is now accomplished through the use of a Ammonia 

 Price Per 
Unit Brand & Product Name  Product 

Number 

National Paper & Sanitary Supply

Container/ 
Package Size

Recommended Product Usage/Gallon of Water

Ready to use
Ready to use

Ready to use
Ready to use
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Buyer: Robert Thompson  3673 OF Bid Opening: 06/02/11

1 Type II Detergent, Powder, 9# 930
2 Type II Solid Detergent, 6.75# 4
3 Heavy Duty Liquid Detergent, Gallon 7
4 Low Temperature Dish Machine Wash, 5 Gallon 46
5 Low Temperature Dish Machine Rinse, 5 Gallon 56
6 Type III Liquid, Rinse Additive, Gallon 5
7 Type III Solid Rinse Dishmachine Additive, 2.5# 20
8 Type III Rinse Additive, Capsules, 2.5# 192
9 Type III Liquid Rinse Additive, 5 Gallon 75

10 Warewashing Solid Rinse, 2# 2
11 Rinse Additive, 77 oz 23
12 Type IVA Pot & Pan Detergent Recirculation Sink, 5 Gallon 2
13 Type IVA Pot & Pan Washing Detergent, Solid, 9# 29
14 Pot Washing Detergent, Gallon 68
15 Max Strength Manual Pot Wash Detergent, 5 Gallon 100
16 Type V Sanitizer Concentrate, 2.5 Gallon 124
17 Powdered Chlorine Sanitizer, 1 oz Packet 5
18 Type VI Lime Solvent, Gallon 168
19 Type VII Manual Detergent, Capsules, 5# 69
20 Type VIII Automatic Hood Cleaner/Degreaser, Gallon 20
21 Type VIII Degreaser & Cleaner, Gallon 22
22 Type X All Purpose Cleaner/Degreaser, 2.5 Gallon 75
23 Type X Neutral Cleaner/Disinfectant Aconcentrate, 2.5 Gallon 14
24 Type X Sanitizer Low Temperature, Gallon 13
25 Type X Silverware Pre-Soak, 8# 2
26 Laundry Builder, 55 Gal 2
27 Laundry Detergent, 2.5 Gallon 3
28 Concentrated Laundry Detergent, 5 Gallon 58
29 Concentrated Laundry Softener, 5 Gallon 35
30 Concentrated Laundry Bleach, 5 Gallon 60
31 Floor Cleaner & Degreaser, 2.5 Gallon 66
32 All Purpose Cleaner, Concentrate, 2.5 Gallon 13
33 Glass Cleaner, Concentrated, 2.5 Gallon 2
34 Antibacterial Foam Hand Soap, 750 ml 8
35 High Temp Grill Cleaner, 32 oz 7
36 Griddle Polishing Pads, 4" x 5.25" 4
37 Sanitizing Test Strips, Chlorine, 100/Vial 250

Indicate any Minimum Shipping Weight, Assorted or Singular Applicable to FOB 
Payment Terms:
Delivery Days ARO:
Comments:

Description Estimated 
UsageType

Warewashing and Laundry Chemicals

Soft up to 5 
Hardness Medium Hard Very Hard

US Chemical Fail Safe 60525  4/8 lb  $       62.14 1 oz/ 10 gal 1 oz/8 gal 1 oz/ 7 gal
US Chemical Fail Safe 60525  4/8 lb  $       62.14 1 oz/ 10 gal 1 oz/8 gal 1 oz/ 7 gal

US Chemical HD Detergent 57704  4/1 gal  $       92.48 2 cc 2.5 cc 3 cc
US Chemical NU Champ 57657  5 gal  $       59.01 2 cc 2.5 cc 3 cc
US Chemical Temp Rinse 60549  5 gal  $       68.42 2 cc 2 cc 3 cc
US Chemical Temp Rinse 57500  4/1 gal  $       55.45 2 cc 2 cc 3 cc
US Chemical Temp Rinse 57500  4/1 gal  $       55.45 2 cc 2 cc 3 cc
US Chemical Temp Rinse 57500  4/1 gal  $       55.45 2 cc 2 cc 3 cc
US Chemical Temp Rinse 60549 mm  5 gal  $       68.42 2 cc 2 cc 3 cc
US Chemical Temp Rinse 57500  4/1 gal  $       55.45 2 cc 2 cc 3 cc
US Chemical Temp Rinse 57500  4/1 gal  $       55.45 2 cc 2 cc 3 cc

US Chemical Ease 57085  2/10 lb  $       71.30 1 oz 1 oz 1 oz 
US Chemical Fury 57081  4/8 lb  $       78.99 1 oz/ 10 gal 1 oz/ 8 gal 1 oz/ 7 gal

Chemical Universe The Sink 5200-4  4/1 gal  $       25.18 1/4  oz 1/4 oz 1/4 oz
Chemical Universe Superior P&P 5220-5  5 gal  $       43.39 1/4  oz 1/4 oz 1/4 oz

Chemical Universe There 5245-25  2.5 gal  $       31.79 1/4  oz 1/4 oz 1/4 oz
US Chemical Chlor-BAC 57252  72/.33 oz  $       32.95 1 pk/ 1 1 pk/ 1 1 pk/ 1
US Chemical Lime Blast 60540  4/1 gal  $       34.41 4 oz 4 oz 4 oz

US Chemical Crystal 60588  4/6 lb  $     123.95 1 oz/ 10 1 oz/ 10 1 oz/ 10
Chemical Universe The Grill 5020-4  4/1 gal  $       32.57 4 oz 4 oz 4 oz

Chemical Universe This 6120-4  4/1 gal  $       29.12 2 oz 2 oz 2 oz
Chemical Universe IT 6125-25  2.5 gal  $       16.39 2 oz 2 oz 2 oz

Chemical Universe Swiss 1000-25  2.5 gal  $       12.94 1 oz 1 oz 1 oz
US Chemical Sanitizer ES 57443  4/1 gal  $       35.50 50 ppm 50 ppm 50 ppm

US Chemical Marquis 60586  4/8 lb  $       93.65 1 oz/ 6 1 oz/ 6 1 oz/ 6
US Chemical Builder Plus 57710  55 gal  $     604.72 3 oz/ 18 3 oz/ 18 3 oz/ 18

US Chemical Compac 57695  2.5 gal  $       49.44 3 oz/ 18 3 oz/ 18 3 oz/ 18
US Chemical Combo 57457  5 gal  $     140.05 2/ 18 2/ 18 2/ 18

US Chemical Sour-Soft 57689  5 gal  $       59.23 1/ 18 1/ 18 1/ 18
US Chemical Destainer 60398  5 gal  $       46.19 2/ 18 2/ 18 2/ 18

Chemical Universe Blast Degreaser 6120-25  2.5 gal  $       18.87 2 oz 2 oz 2 oz
Chemical Universe IT 6125-25  2.5 gal  $       16.39 2 oz 2 oz 2 oz

Chemical Universe Ultra Glass 1120-25  2.5 gal  $       22.91 6 oz 6 oz 6 oz
Kutol 5065  12/800 mL 

US Chemical Quickline TKO 3183738  6/32 oz  $       17.55 RTU RTU RTU
NA

Test Strips 143332  30' Roll  $         4.99 

0% Net 10 days
21

Award Explanation
Award is based on the cost of diluted product per gallon of soft water.

The Thompson Co LLC

Brand & Product Name Container/ 
Package Size

 Price Per 
Unit 

Recommended Product Usage/gallon of 
water Product 

Number 
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